
Project Name:  DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID (DEF) AND DEF DISPENSING SYSTEMS Solicitation #:  2019-1310

Bid Opening Date:  SEPTEMBER 17, 2019 STREETS AND MAINTENANCE

$313.50 $10,972.50 $32,917.50 $338.78 $11,857.30 $35,571.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid

bidder's price bidder's price

$11,857.23 $35,571.69 

$52.25 $7,315.00 $21,945.00 $108.38 $15,173.20 $45,519.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid

bidder's price bidder's price

$15,173.62 $45,520.86 

bidder's price

bidder's price

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

(Annual  Amount     

x   3    Years)

(Annual Amount   

x   3 Years)

(Annual Amount   

x   3 Years)

$27,030.85

$54,862.50 

LEFT BLANK

ANNUAL 

ESTIMATED 

QUANTITY

GROUP I:  3 - YEAR TOTAL                                                                   

( LINES 1 - 2 ) 

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

C&R DISTRIBUTING, LLC                            

EL PASO, TX

BREWER OIL COMPANY         

ALBUQUERQUE, NM

C&L PUMP SERVICE, INC.              

EL PASO, TX

Group I: DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID (DEF)

PURUS VBDEF  MANUFACTURER / BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER 

35

ITEM

NO.

MUSKET DEF

LEFT BLANK

ESTIMATED 3 

YEAR TOTAL 

ESTIMATED 3 

YEAR TOTAL 

2

ESTIMATED 3 

YEAR TOTAL 

1

  MANUFACTURER / BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER MUSKET DEF PURUS VBDEF

GROUP I:  ANNUAL TOTAL                                                             

( LINES 1 - 2 )

$18,287.50 $27,030.50 NO BID

$81,091.50 NO BID

$81,092.55

DESCRIPTION

DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID                               

330 GALLON TOTE                      

(Specifications Page 22)

140

COST PER 

ITEM

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID                               

55 GALLON BARREL                        

(Specifications Page 22)

COST PER 

ITEM

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

COST PER 

ITEM

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

APPROVED BY:      __/s/_        

DATE:      9/24/2019______     2019-1310 DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID (DEF) AND DEF DISPENSING SYSTEMS 1



Project Name:  DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID (DEF) AND DEF DISPENSING SYSTEMS Solicitation #:  2019-1310

Bid Opening Date:  SEPTEMBER 17, 2019 STREETS AND MAINTENANCE

(Annual Amount x 3 

Years)

(Annual Amount x 3 

Years)

(Annual Amount x 3 

Years)

$1,318.47 $1,318.47 $3,955.41 $937.00 $937.00 $2,811.00 $2,369.00 $2,369.00 $7,107.00

$995.00 $995.00 $2,985.00 $780.00 $780.00 $2,340.00 $297.00 $297.00 $891.00

$1,050.00 $3,150.00 $9,450.00 $1,007.00 $3,021.00 $9,063.00 $1,237.20 $3,711.60 $11,134.80

$995.00 $2,985.00 $8,955.00 $780.00 $2,340.00 $7,020.00 $297.00 $891.00 $2,673.00

bidder's price

bidder's price

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT

ANNUAL ESTIMATED 

QUANTITY

1
DEF DISPENSING SYSTEM 330 GALLON 

TOTE  (Specifications Page 22)

DESCRIPTION

REPLACEMENT PUMP FOR DISPENSING 

SYSTEM 330 GALLON TOTE  

(Specifications Page 22)

1

MANUFACTURER / BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

$34,108.85

MANUFACTURER / BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER TECLAEMIT- HORNET W-85
SAMSON CORP 750 256 - 560 304E - 910 311P - 910 

313-910 314

ESTIMATED 3 

YEAR TOTAL
ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT

COST PER 

ITEM

COST PER 

ITEM

ANNUAL TOTAL (Group I and II )
$26,735.97 

$102,326.55

$8,448.47 $7,078.00 $7,268.60 

$102,325.50 LEFT BLANK

ANNUAL TOTAL GROUP II:  (Items 1 -4 )

$34,108.50 LEFT BLANK

3 YEAR TOTAL GROUP II:  (Items 1 -4 ) $21,805.80 

3

2.

MANUFACTURER / BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER

1.

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

BREWER OIL COMPANY         

ALBUQUERQUE, NM

C&L PUMP SERVICE, INC.              

EL PASO, TX

SAMSON CORP 560 304F PIUSI F00101A0A

PIUSI F00201AL0

GROUP II: BARREL/DRUM AND TOTE DISPENSING SYSTEMS(S) AND PUMP(S) 

ITEM

NO.

ESTIMATED 3 

YEAR TOTAL

C&R DISTRIBUTING, LLC                            

EL PASO, TX

TECLAEMIT- HORNET W-85 SAMSON CORP 750 256 - 560 304E - 910 311P

COST PER 

ITEM

4 3
DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID 55 GALLON 

TOTE  (Specifications Page 22)

PIUSI F00101A0A

MANUFACTURER / BRAND PRODUCT NUMBER TECLAEMIT- HORNET W-85 SAMSON CORP 560 304E PIUSI F00203100

DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID 55 GALLON 

TOTE  (Specifications Page 22)
3

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

ESTIMATED 3 

YEAR TOTAL

TECLAEMIT- HORNET W-85

3 YEAR TOTAL ( Group I and II )
$80,207.91 

$25,345.41 $21,234.00 

APPROVED BY:      __/s/_        

DATE:      9/24/2019______     2019-1310 DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID (DEF) AND DEF DISPENSING SYSTEMS 2



Project Name:  DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID (DEF) AND DEF DISPENSING SYSTEMS Solicitation #:  2019-1310

Bid Opening Date:  SEPTEMBER 17, 2019 STREETS AND MAINTENANCE

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION  

TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT,  BY GIVING THE  

CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD  

NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS  

CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE  SELECTIONS  

BELOW AND  UNDER THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY

MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE 

TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),  

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION 

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

NO OPTION OFFERED

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

BIDS SOLICITED:   5      LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED:  3           BIDS RECEIVED:      3        LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED:      2       NO BID:  0

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

WITHIN ___________ CONSECUTIVE CALENDAR DAYS
2 3 30

C&R DISTRIBUTING, LLC                            

EL PASO, TX

BREWER OIL COMPANY         

ALBUQUERQUE, NM

C&L PUMP SERVICE, INC.              

EL PASO, TX

WITHIN ___________ HOURS OR OVERNIGHT AFTER RECEIPT OF 

VERBAL ORDER IN CASES OF EMERGENCY
48 4 NO BID

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION 

OF THE BID.

PAYMENT TERMS: .005 NET - 10 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

X

APPROVED BY:      __/s/_        

DATE:      9/24/2019______     2019-1310 DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID (DEF) AND DEF DISPENSING SYSTEMS 3


