
BID NO:  2019-466

BID DATE:  12/05/2018 DEPARTMENT: LIBRARY

COLUMN - A COLUMN C COLUMN E COLUMN B COLUMN D COLUMN F COLUMN B COLUMN D COLUMN F

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

$8.33 $12,145.14 

$22.98 $285,503.52 

ANNUAL TOTAL

$86,741.82 

DISCOUNT PRICE

20%

$29,659.68 42.0%

$131,072.04 

42.0%

JUVENILE HARDCOVER

20%

ADULT TRADE HARDCOVER NON-

FICTION

ADULT TRADE PAPERBACK 

FICTION

YA TRADE PAPERBACK 20% $11.50 

$9.58 

1,856

$17.18 

$13.54 

1,458

3,402

17,544

3,096

20%

20%

$21.63 $27.04 

$19.40 

$14.37 

$6.98 

$11.98 

6,171

BID TABULATION FORM

$62,860.05 

CATEGORY
AVERAGE 

PRICE

ATLANTA, GA

PART A - BOOKS (PRICING OF MATERIALS)

BTAC ACQUISITION CORP. DBA BAKER & TAYLOR, LLC

CHARLOTTE, NC

BARNES & NOBLE BOOKSELLERS, INC.

42.0%

42.0% $12.45 

DISCOUNT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL

$185,241.84 $14.91 

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

12,424 20%

% DISCOUNT 

OFFERED

48.1%

48.1%

BID TITLE:  BOOKS AND MEDIA IN ENGLISH AND SPANISH FOR ADULTS, YOUNG ADULTS AND JUVENILES

$9.81 

$21.24 $26.55 20%

$10.07 

$5.06 

$47,730.06 

$8.72 1,500

$15.52 $176,668.08 

$73,585.26 

$16,767.00 42.0%

$14.03 

$10,470.00 

$272,282.88 

48.1%

48.1%

YA TRADE HARDCOVER

CITY OF EL PASO

$7,590.00 
ADULT MASS MARKET 

PAPERBACKS

$85,036.38 $13.78 

20%

ADULT TRADE PAPERBACK NON-

FICTION
$21.47 

% DISCOUNT 

OFFERED

20%

ADULT TRADE HARDCOVER 

FICTION

$16.92 

5,049

$25,130.24 $18,207.36 

$28.73 

JUVENILE TRADE PAPERBACK $21,517.20 $6.95 

Approved By:                
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BID NO:  2019-466

BID DATE:  12/05/2018 DEPARTMENT: LIBRARY

COLUMN - A COLUMN C COLUMN E COLUMN B COLUMN D COLUMN F COLUMN B COLUMN D COLUMN F

$3.10 

UNIT*

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

1,490

ANNUAL COST OF MATERIALS 
54,000

ANNUAL COST

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

BID TITLE:  BOOKS AND MEDIA IN ENGLISH AND SPANISH FOR ADULTS, YOUNG ADULTS AND JUVENILES

BARNES & NOBLE BOOKSELLERS, INC. BTAC ACQUISITION CORP. DBA BAKER & TAYLOR, LLC

ATLANTA, GA CHARLOTTE, NC

PART A - BOOKS (PRICING OF MATERIALS)

CATEGORY
AVERAGE 

PRICE

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

% DISCOUNT 

OFFERED
DISCOUNT PRICE

$623,311.11 

$1,869,933.33 

THREE (3) YEAR COST 

(ANNUAL COST X 3 = 3 YEAR 

COST)

ANNUAL TOTAL COST

PHYSICAL PROCESSING (PRINT ONLY) SERVICE NOT OFFERED $154,008.00 

N/A
INCLUDED IN 

BLENDED PRICE
ORIGINAL CATALOGING (PRINT ONLY) SERVICE NOT OFFERED $0.00 

3 YEAR COST

COLUMN A 

$939,912.44 

BIDDER'S PRICE $939,912.40

$2,819,737.32 

0.00%

42.00%

% DISCOUNT 

OFFERED
ANNUAL TOTAL

$0.00 $0.00 

1,500 20% $5.80 $8,700.00 

BIDDER'S PRICE $2,819,737.00

DISCOUNT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL

$0.00 

COLUMN A 

ANNUAL 

NUMBER OF 

ITEMS

PER ITEM PER ITEM

49,680 N/A

$0.00 

JUVENILE MASS MARKET 

PAPERBACK
$7.25 $4.21 $6,315.00 

FREIGHT, SHIPPING (ALL ITEMS) 54,000 0%

ANNUAL TOTAL COST

PART A CONT. - PRICING OF SHELF READY SERVICES COLUMN B COLUMN C COLUMN C 

Approved By:                
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BID NO:  2019-466

BID DATE:  12/05/2018 DEPARTMENT: LIBRARY

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

N/A

N/A

$154,008.00 

$462,024.00 

PER ITEM ANNUAL TOTAL COST

BTAC ACQUISITION CORP. DBA BAKER & TAYLOR, LLC

ATLANTA, GA

$2,331,957.33 

(49,680)

ANNUAL COST

ADDED COPY CATALOGING (PRINT ONLY) 48,190 N/A NO SERVICE OFFERED
INCLUDED IN 

BLENDED PRICE
$0.00 

ANNUAL COST OF SELF-READY SERVICES

3 YEAR COST
THREE (3) YEAR COST 

(ANNUAL COST X 3 = 3 YEAR COST)

TOTAL THREE (3) YEAR COST (PART A) N/A

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

BID TITLE:  BOOKS AND MEDIA IN ENGLISH AND SPANISH FOR ADULTS, YOUNG ADULTS AND JUVENILES

BARNES & NOBLE BOOKSELLERS, INC.

PART A CONT. - PRICING OF SHELF READY SERVICES COLUMN B COLUMN A COLUMN C COLUMN A COLUMN C 

ANNUAL 

NUMBER OF 

ITEMS

PER ITEM ANNUAL TOTAL COST

CHARLOTTE, NC

PART A - BOOKS (PRICING OF MATERIALS)

Approved By:                
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BID NO:  2019-466

BID DATE:  12/05/2018 DEPARTMENT: LIBRARY

COLUMN - A COLUMN C COLUMN E COLUMN B COLUMN D COLUMN F COLUMN B COLUMN D COLUMN F

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

$422,947.62 $491,731.05 

FREIGHT, SHIPPING (ALL ITEMS) $0.00 

30.0% $12.86 $81,365.22 

$140,982.54 

20% $14.35 $25,499.95 46.0% $9.69 $17,219.13 

FREE OF CHARGE 

RUSH ORDERS 

EXCLUDED

$163,910.35 

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

BID TITLE:  BOOKS AND MEDIA IN ENGLISH AND SPANISH FOR ADULTS, YOUNG ADULTS AND JUVENILES

BARNES & NOBLE BOOKSELLERS, INC. BTAC ACQUISITION CORP. DBA BAKER & TAYLOR, LLC

ATLANTA, GA

MUSIC CDs (ALL AGES) $9.33 915 $6.81 

THREE (3) YEAR COST 

(ANNUAL COST X 3 = 3 YEAR 

COST)

PART B - ANNUAL COST OF 

MATERIALS 

$36,167.04 $38,577.60 25.0% $41.86 

$6,825.90 

$0.00 

FREIGHT PREPAID, 

FOB DESTINATION, 

SHIPPING FREE 

UNLESS RUSH IS 

REQUESTED

27.0%20% $7.46 $6,231.15 

$0.00 9,883 0%

PLAYAWAYS (ALL AGES) $55.81 864 20%

CHARLOTTE, NC

PART B - MEDIA (DVDs, PLAYAWAYS, AUDIOBOOKS, MUSIC CD's)

CATEGORY
AVERAGE 

PRICE

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

% DISCOUNT 

OFFERED
DISCOUNT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL

% DISCOUNT 

OFFERED
DISCOUNT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL

DVDs (ALL AGES) $18.37 6327 20% $14.70 $93,006.90 

AUDIO BOOK ON CD (ALL AGES) $17.94 1777

$44.65 

9,883

ANNUAL COST

3 YEAR COST

Approved By:                
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BID NO:  2019-466

BID DATE:  12/05/2018 DEPARTMENT: LIBRARY

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION 

TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT,  BY GIVING THE 

CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED 

ON  THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT  

SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER 

THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS.THE CITY MANAGER OR  

DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE 

TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),  
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION 
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

BID TITLE:  BOOKS AND MEDIA IN ENGLISH AND SPANISH FOR ADULTS, YOUNG ADULTS AND JUVENILES

BARNES & NOBLE BOOKSELLERS, INC. BTAC ACQUISITION CORP. DBA BAKER & TAYLOR, LLC

ATLANTA, GA

PAYMENT TERMS: 0% - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

CHARLOTTE, NC

10
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

WITHIN___CONSECUTIVE CALENDAR DAYS

WITHIN____HOURS OR OVERNIGHT AFTER RECEIPT OF VARBAL 

ORDER IN CASES OF EMERGENCY

AMENDMENTS ACKNOWLEDGED: YES YES

NO OPTION OFFERED

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

X X

Approved By:                
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BID NO:  2019-466

BID DATE:  12/05/2018 DEPARTMENT: LIBRARY

COLUMN - A COLUMN C COLUMN E COLUMN B COLUMN D COLUMN F COLUMN B COLUMN D COLUMN F

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

JUVENILE TRADE PAPERBACK $11.98 3,096 41.6% $7.00 $21,672.00 41.8% $6.97 $21,579.12 

JUVENILE HARDCOVER $19.40 17,544 47.6% $10.16 $178,247.04 48.4% $10.01 $175,615.44 

YA TRADE PAPERBACK $14.37 1,458 41.6% $8.39 $12,232.62 41.8% $8.36 $12,188.88 

YA TRADE HARDCOVER $27.04 3,402 47.6% $14.17 $48,206.34 48.4% $13.95 $47,457.90 

ADULT MASS MARKET 

PAPERBACKS
$8.72 1,500 41.6% $5.09 $7,635.00 41.8% $5.08 $7,620.00 

ADULT TRADE PAPERBACK NON-

FICTION
$21.47 5,049 41.6% $12.54 $63,314.46 41.8% $12.50 $63,112.50 

ADULT TRADE PAPERBACK 

FICTION
$16.92 1,856 41.6% $9.88 $18,337.28 41.8% $9.85 $18,281.60 

ADULT TRADE HARDCOVER NON-

FICTION
$26.55 6,171 47.6% $13.91 $85,838.61 48.4% $13.70 $84,542.70 

ADULT TRADE HARDCOVER 

FICTION
$28.73 12,424 47.6% $15.05 $186,981.20 48.4% $14.82 $184,123.68 

BID TABULATION FORM

BID TITLE:  BOOKS AND MEDIA IN ENGLISH AND SPANISH FOR ADULTS, YOUNG ADULTS AND JUVENILES

BRODART CO.
INGRAM INDUSTRIES INC. DBA INGRAM LIBRARY 

SERVICES LLC

WILLIAMSPORT, PA NASHVILLE, TN

PART A - BOOKS (PRICING OF MATERIALS)

CATEGORY
AVERAGE 

PRICE

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

% DISCOUNT 

OFFERED
DISCOUNT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL

% DISCOUNT 

OFFERED
DISCOUNT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL

CITY OF EL PASO

Approved By:                
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BID NO:  2019-466

BID DATE:  12/05/2018 DEPARTMENT: LIBRARY

COLUMN - A COLUMN C COLUMN E COLUMN B COLUMN D COLUMN F COLUMN B COLUMN D COLUMN F

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

PHYSICAL PROCESSING (PRINT ONLY) 49,680 $3.50 $173,880.00 $3.49 $173,383.20 

ORIGINAL CATALOGING (PRINT ONLY) 1,490 $0.00**
INCLUDED IN 

ABOVE
$0.00 $0.00**

**INCLUDED IN 

PHYSICAL 

PROCESSING 

CHARGE

PART A CONT. - PRICING OF SHELF READY SERVICES COLUMN B COLUMN A COLUMN C COLUMN A COLUMN C 

ANNUAL 

NUMBER OF 

ITEMS

PER ITEM ANNUAL TOTAL COST PER ITEM ANNUAL TOTAL COST

ANNUAL COST OF MATERIALS 
54,000

ANNUAL COST
$628,809.55 $620,851.82 

THREE (3) YEAR COST 

(ANNUAL COST X 3 = 3 YEAR 

COST)

3 YEAR COST $1,886,428.65 $1,862,555.46 

FREIGHT, SHIPPING (ALL ITEMS) 54,000 0.00% $0.00 0.00% $0.00 $0.00 

JUVENILE MASS MARKET 

PAPERBACK
$7.25 1,500 41.6% $4.23 $6,345.00 41.8% $4.22 $6,330.00 

CATEGORY
AVERAGE 

PRICE

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

% DISCOUNT 

OFFERED
DISCOUNT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL

% DISCOUNT 

OFFERED
DISCOUNT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

BID TITLE:  BOOKS AND MEDIA IN ENGLISH AND SPANISH FOR ADULTS, YOUNG ADULTS AND JUVENILES

BRODART CO.
INGRAM INDUSTRIES INC. DBA INGRAM LIBRARY 

SERVICES LLC

WILLIAMSPORT, PA NASHVILLE, TN

PART A - BOOKS (PRICING OF MATERIALS)

Approved By:                
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BID NO:  2019-466

BID DATE:  12/05/2018 DEPARTMENT: LIBRARY

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

THREE (3) YEAR COST 

(ANNUAL COST X 3 = 3 YEAR COST)
3 YEAR COST $521,640.00 $520,149.60 

TOTAL THREE (3) YEAR COST (PART A) $2,408,068.65 $2,382,705.06 

ADDED COPY CATALOGING (PRINT ONLY) 48,190 $0.00**
INCLUDED IN 

ABOVE
$0.00 

ANNUAL COST OF SELF-READY SERVICES
(49,680)

ANNUAL COST
$173,880.00 $173,383.20 

$0.00**

**INCLUDED IN 

PHYSICAL 

PROCESSING 

CHARGE

PART A CONT. - PRICING OF SHELF READY SERVICES COLUMN B COLUMN A COLUMN C COLUMN A COLUMN C 

ANNUAL 

NUMBER OF 

ITEMS

PER ITEM ANNUAL TOTAL COST PER ITEM ANNUAL TOTAL COST

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

BID TITLE:  BOOKS AND MEDIA IN ENGLISH AND SPANISH FOR ADULTS, YOUNG ADULTS AND JUVENILES

BRODART CO.
INGRAM INDUSTRIES INC. DBA INGRAM LIBRARY 

SERVICES LLC

WILLIAMSPORT, PA NASHVILLE, TN

PART A - BOOKS (PRICING OF MATERIALS)

Approved By:                
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BID NO:  2019-466

BID DATE:  12/05/2018 DEPARTMENT: LIBRARY

COLUMN - A COLUMN C COLUMN E COLUMN B COLUMN D COLUMN F COLUMN B COLUMN D COLUMN F

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

ANNUAL COST OF MATERIALS 
9,883

ANNUAL COST
$156,100.95 $138,655.47 

THREE (3) YEAR COST 

(ANNUAL COST X 3 = 3 YEAR 

COST)

3 YEAR COST $468,302.85 $415,966.41 

FREIGHT, SHIPPING (ALL ITEMS) 9,883 $0.00 $0.00 

MUSIC CDs (ALL AGES) $9.33 915 12.0% $8.21 $7,512.15 25.0% $7.00 $6,405.00 

PLAYAWAYS (ALL AGES) $55.81 864 25.5% $41.58 $35,925.12 25.0% $41.86 $36,167.04 

AUDIO BOOK ON CD (ALL AGES) $17.94 1,777 45.5% $9.78 $17,379.06 46.5% $9.60 $17,059.20 

DVDs (ALL AGES) $18.37 6,327 18.0% $15.06 $95,284.62 32.0% $12.49 $79,024.23 

BID TITLE:  BOOKS AND MEDIA IN ENGLISH AND SPANISH FOR ADULTS, YOUNG ADULTS AND JUVENILES

BRODART CO.
INGRAM INDUSTRIES INC. DBA INGRAM LIBRARY 

SERVICES LLC

WILLIAMSPORT, PA NASHVILLE, TN

PART B - MEDIA (DVDs, PLAYAWAYS, AUDIOBOOKS, MUSIC CD's)

CATEGORY
AVERAGE 

PRICE

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

% DISCOUNT 

OFFERED
DISCOUNT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL

% DISCOUNT 

OFFERED
DISCOUNT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Approved By:                
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BID NO:  2019-466

BID DATE:  12/05/2018 DEPARTMENT: LIBRARY

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION 

TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT,  BY GIVING THE 

CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED 

ON  THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT  

SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER 

THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS.THE CITY MANAGER OR  

DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE 

TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),  
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION 
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

AMENDMENTS ACKNOWLEDGED: YES YES

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

WITHIN___CONSECUTIVE CALENDAR DAYS
* 15

WITHIN____HOURS OR OVERNIGHT AFTER RECEIPT OF VARBAL 

ORDER IN CASES OF EMERGENCY

** N/A

**Expedited shipping provided at customer's expense
24

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

BID TITLE:  BOOKS AND MEDIA IN ENGLISH AND SPANISH FOR ADULTS, YOUNG ADULTS AND JUVENILES

NO OPTION OFFERED

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

BRODART CO.
INGRAM INDUSTRIES INC. DBA INGRAM LIBRARY 

SERVICES LLC

WILLIAMSPORT, PA NASHVILLE, TN

X X

Approved By:                
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BID NO:  2019-466

BID DATE:  12/05/2018 DEPARTMENT: LIBRARY

COLUMN - A COLUMN C COLUMN E COLUMN B COLUMN D COLUMN F COLUMN B COLUMN D COLUMN F

$15,717.24 

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$20,951.46 

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

JUVENILE TRADE PAPERBACK $11.98 3,096 25% $8.99 $27,833.04 NO BID NO BID $0.00 

JUVENILE HARDCOVER $19.40 17,544 25% $14.55 $255,265.20 NO BID NO BID $0.00 

YA TRADE PAPERBACK $14.37 1,458 25% $10.78 NO BID NO BID $0.00 

YA TRADE HARDCOVER $27.04 3,402 25% $20.28 $68,992.56 NO BID NO BID $0.00 

ADULT MASS MARKET 

PAPERBACKS
$8.72 1,500 25% $6.54 $9,810.00 NO BID NO BID $0.00 

ADULT TRADE PAPERBACK NON-

FICTION
$21.47 5,049 25% $16.11 $81,339.39 NO BID NO BID $0.00 

ADULT TRADE PAPERBACK 

FICTION
$16.92 1,856 25% $12.69 $23,552.64 NO BID NO BID $0.00 

ADULT TRADE HARDCOVER NON-

FICTION
$26.55 6,171 25% $19.92 $122,926.32 NO BID NO BID $0.00 

ANNUAL TOTAL

ADULT TRADE HARDCOVER 

FICTION
$28.73 12,424 25% $21.53 $267,488.72 NO BID NO BID $0.00 

PART A - BOOKS (PRICING OF MATERIALS)

CATEGORY
AVERAGE 

PRICE

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

% DISCOUNT 

OFFERED
DISCOUNT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL

% DISCOUNT 

OFFERED
DISCOUNT PRICE

BURNSVILLE, MN HOLLAND, OH

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

BID TITLE:  BOOKS AND MEDIA IN ENGLISH AND SPANISH FOR ADULTS, YOUNG ADULTS AND JUVENILES

MACKIN BOOK COMPANY DBA MACKIN EDUCATIONAL 

RESOURCES
MIDWEST TAPE, LLC

Approved By:                
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BID NO:  2019-466

BID DATE:  12/05/2018 DEPARTMENT: LIBRARY

COLUMN - A COLUMN C COLUMN E COLUMN B COLUMN D COLUMN F COLUMN B COLUMN D COLUMN F

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

$881,085.11 

BIDDER'S PRICE $1,042,962.65

PHYSICAL PROCESSING (PRINT ONLY) 49,680
FREE OPTIONS 

BELOW
NO BID $0.00 

ORIGINAL CATALOGING (PRINT ONLY) 1,490 FREE $0.00 NO BID $0.00 

$0.00 

(*BIDDER'S NOTE* Depends on processing 

selected)

PART A CONT. - PRICING OF SHELF READY SERVICES COLUMN B COLUMN A COLUMN C COLUMN A COLUMN C 

ANNUAL 

NUMBER OF 

ITEMS

PER ITEM ANNUAL TOTAL COST PER ITEM ANNUAL TOTAL COST

ANNUAL COST OF MATERIALS 
54,000

ANNUAL COST
$0.00 

THREE (3) YEAR COST 

(ANNUAL COST X 3 = 3 YEAR 

COST)

3 YEAR COST $0.00 
BIDDER'S PRICE $3,128,887.95

$2,643,255.33 

FREIGHT, SHIPPING (ALL ITEMS) 54,000 NO BID $0.00 NO BID NO BID $0.00 

JUVENILE MASS MARKET 

PAPERBACK
$7.25 1,500 25% $5.44 $8,160.00 NO BID NO BID $0.00 

CATEGORY
AVERAGE 

PRICE

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

% DISCOUNT 

OFFERED
DISCOUNT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL

% DISCOUNT 

OFFERED
DISCOUNT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

BID TITLE:  BOOKS AND MEDIA IN ENGLISH AND SPANISH FOR ADULTS, YOUNG ADULTS AND JUVENILES

MACKIN BOOK COMPANY DBA MACKIN EDUCATIONAL 

RESOURCES
MIDWEST TAPE, LLC

BURNSVILLE, MN HOLLAND, OH

PART A - BOOKS (PRICING OF MATERIALS)

Approved By:                
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BID NO:  2019-466

BID DATE:  12/05/2018 DEPARTMENT: LIBRARY

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

THREE (3) YEAR COST 

(ANNUAL COST X 3 = 3 YEAR COST)
3 YEAR COST NO BID

TOTAL THREE (3) YEAR COST (PART A) NO BID

$0.00 

AMENDMENTS NOT ACKNOWLEDGED

$2,643,255.33 

BIDDER'S PRICE $0 (*BIDDER'S NOTE* depends on 

processing selected)

ADDED COPY CATALOGING (PRINT ONLY) 48,190 FREE $0.00 NO BID $0.00 

ANNUAL COST OF SELF-READY SERVICES
(49,680)

ANNUAL COST
NO BID

$0.00 

AMENDMENTS NOT ACKNOWLEDGED

PART A CONT. - PRICING OF SHELF READY SERVICES COLUMN B COLUMN A COLUMN C COLUMN A COLUMN C 

ANNUAL 

NUMBER OF 

ITEMS

PER ITEM ANNUAL TOTAL COST PER ITEM ANNUAL TOTAL COST

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

BID TITLE:  BOOKS AND MEDIA IN ENGLISH AND SPANISH FOR ADULTS, YOUNG ADULTS AND JUVENILES

MACKIN BOOK COMPANY DBA MACKIN EDUCATIONAL 

RESOURCES
MIDWEST TAPE, LLC

BURNSVILLE, MN HOLLAND, OH

PART A - BOOKS (PRICING OF MATERIALS)

Approved By:                
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BID NO:  2019-466

BID DATE:  12/05/2018 DEPARTMENT: LIBRARY

COLUMN - A COLUMN C COLUMN E COLUMN B COLUMN D COLUMN F COLUMN B COLUMN D COLUMN F

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

ANNUAL COST OF MATERIALS 
9,883

ANNUAL COST
$146,666.17 

THREE (3) YEAR COST 

(ANNUAL COST X 3 = 3 YEAR 

COST)

3 YEAR COST $439,998.51 

FREIGHT, SHIPPING (ALL ITEMS) 9,883 $0.00 FREE $0.00 

AMENDMENTS NOT ACKNOWLEGED

AMENDMENTS NOT ACKNOWLEGED

$8,536.95 30% $6.53 $5,974.95 

PLAYAWAYS (ALL AGES) $55.81 864 NO BID NO BID $0.00 25% $41.86 $36,167.04 

MUSIC CDs (ALL AGES) $9.33 915 0% $9.33 

AUDIO BOOk ON CD (ALL AGES) $17.94 1,777 0% $17.94 $31,879.38 20% $14.35 $25,499.95 

DVDs (ALL AGES) $18.37 6,327 0% $18.37 $116,226.99 32% $12.49 $79,024.23 

BID TITLE:  BOOKS AND MEDIA IN ENGLISH AND SPANISH FOR ADULTS, YOUNG ADULTS AND JUVENILES

MACKIN BOOK COMPANY DBA MACKIN EDUCATIONAL 

RESOURCES
MIDWEST TAPE, LLC

BURNSVILLE, MN HOLLAND, OH

PART B - MEDIA (DVDs, PLAYAWAYS, AUDIOBOOKS, MUSIC CD's)

CATEGORY
AVERAGE 

PRICE

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

% DISCOUNT 

OFFERED
DISCOUNT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL

% DISCOUNT 

OFFERED
DISCOUNT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Approved By:                
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BID NO:  2019-466

BID DATE:  12/05/2018 DEPARTMENT: LIBRARY

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION 

TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT,  BY GIVING THE 

CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED 

ON  THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT  

SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER 

THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS.THE CITY MANAGER OR  

DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE 

TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),  
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION 
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

MACKIN BOOK COMPANY DBA MACKIN EDUCATIONAL 

RESOURCES
MIDWEST TAPE, LLC

BURNSVILLE, MN HOLLAND, OH

BIDS SOLICITED:    34     LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED:    5      BIDS RECEIVED:     6       LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED:       0       NO BID:    0

AMENDMENTS ACKNOWLEDGED: NO YES

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

WITHIN___CONSECUTIVE CALENDAR DAYS
28-45 5-7 DAYS

WITHIN____HOURS OR OVERNIGHT AFTER RECEIPT OF VARBAL 

ORDER IN CASES OF EMERGENCY
LEFT BLANK 48

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

BID TITLE:  BOOKS AND MEDIA IN ENGLISH AND SPANISH FOR ADULTS, YOUNG ADULTS AND JUVENILES

NO OPTION OFFERED

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

X X

Approved By:                
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