



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES
BID DATE: JULY 17, 2019

SOLICITATION: 2019-942
DEPARTMENT: ANIMAL SERVICES

	AOSS Medical Supply Monroe, LA	Butler Animal Health Holding Company, LLC DBA Henry Schein Animal Health/Butler Animal Health Supply LLC Dallas, TX	Intervet Inc DBA Merck Animal Health Omaha, NE
--	---	--	---

SAMPLE PRICING

	DESCRIPTION	Cephalexin 500 mg/tabs/ 500 tab/bottle	Cephalexin 500 mg/tabs/ 500 tab/bottle	Cephalexin 500 mg/tabs/ 500 tab/bottle
ITEM 1.	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	7	7	7
	UNIT OF MEASURE	BOTTLES	BOTTLES	BOTTLES
	BIDDER'S BRAND	No Bid	Lupin Pharmaceutical	Left Blank
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	No Bid	\$37.07	Left Blank
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	No Bid	\$32.39	Left Blank
	DESCRIPTION	Doxycycline 100 mg/tabs/ 500 tabs/bottle	Doxycycline 100 mg/tabs/ 500 tabs/bottle	Doxycycline 100 mg/tabs/ 500 tabs/bottle
ITEM 2.	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	20	20	20
	UNIT OF MEASURE	BOTTLES	BOTTLES	BOTTLES
	BIDDER'S BRAND	No Bid	Harris Pharmaceutical	Left Blank
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	No Bid	\$37.91	Left Blank
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	No Bid	\$31.25	Left Blank
	DESCRIPTION	Metronidazole 250 mg/tab 500 tab/bottle	Metronidazole 250 mg/tab 500 tab/bottle	Metronidazole 250 mg/tab 500 tab/bottle
ITEM 3.	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	10	10	10
	UNIT OF MEASURE	BOTTLES	BOTTLES	BOTTLES
	BIDDER'S BRAND	No Bid	Heritage Pharmaceutical	Left Blank
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	No Bid	\$15.87	Left Blank
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	No Bid	\$13.84	Left Blank

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_____
DATE: 07/26/19



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES

SOLICITATION: 2019-942

BID DATE: JULY 17, 2019

DEPARTMENT: ANIMAL SERVICES

	AOSS Medical Supply Monroe, LA	Butler Animal Health Holding Company, LLC DBA Henry Schein Animal Health/Butler Animal Health Supply LLC Dallas, TX	Intervet Inc DBA Merck Animal Health Omaha, NE
--	---	--	---

SAMPLE PRICING

	DESCRIPTION	Enrofloxin (Baytril) tablets 68 mg.	Enrofloxin (Baytril) tablets 68 mg.	Enrofloxin (Baytril) tablets 68 mg.
ITEM 4.	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	15	15	15
	UNIT OF MEASURE	BOTTLES	BOTTLES	BOTTLES
	BIDDER'S BRAND	No Bid	Vedco	Left Blank
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	No Bid	\$277.79	Left Blank
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	No Bid	\$277.79 *Restricted pricing	Left Blank
ITEM 5.	DESCRIPTION	Anesthesia bags .5, 1, 2 & 3 liter	Anesthesia bags .5, 1, 2 & 3 liter	Anesthesia bags .5, 1, 2 & 3 liter
	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	5	5	5
	UNIT OF MEASURE	EACH	EACH	EACH
	BIDDER'S BRAND	No Bid	Animal Health Logistics	Left Blank
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	No Bid	\$24.20	Left Blank
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	No Bid	\$18.42	Left Blank
ITEM 6.	DESCRIPTION	Isoflurane gas 250 ml/bottle	Isoflurane gas 250 ml/bottle	Isoflurane gas 250 ml/bottle
	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	240	240	240
	UNIT OF MEASURE	BOTTLES	BOTTLES	BOTTLES
	BIDDER'S BRAND	No Bid	Piramal Critical Care	Left Blank
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	No Bid	\$27.83	Left Blank
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	No Bid	\$20.49	Left Blank

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/ _____
DATE: 07/26/19



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES **SOLICITATION: 2019-942**
BID DATE: JULY 17, 2019 **DEPARTMENT: ANIMAL SERVICES**

	AOSS Medical Supply Monroe, LA	Butler Animal Health Holding Company, LLC DBA Henry Schein Animal Health/Butler Animal Health Supply LLC Dallas, TX	Intervet Inc DBA Merck Animal Health Omaha, NE
--	---	--	---

SAMPLE PRICING

	DESCRIPTION	Ketamine 100 mg/ml 10 ml/bottle	Ketamine 100 mg/ml 10 ml/bottle	Ketamine 100 mg/ml 10 ml/bottle
ITEM 7.	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	750	750	750
	UNIT OF MEASURE	BOTTLES	BOTTLES	BOTTLES
	BIDDER'S BRAND	No Bid	Vedco	Left Blank
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	No Bid	\$6.12	Left Blank
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	No Bid	\$4.71	Left Blank
ITEM 8.	DESCRIPTION	Soda lime bag 3 lbs/bag	Soda lime bag 3 lbs/bag	Soda lime bag 3 lbs/bag
	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	50	50	50
	UNIT OF MEASURE	BAGS	BAGS	BAGS
	BIDDER'S BRAND	No Bid	Jorgensen Labs	Left Blank
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	No Bid	\$7.80	Left Blank
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	No Bid	\$5.91	Left Blank
ITEM 9.	DESCRIPTION	Xylazine 100 mg/ml 50 ml/bottle	Xylazine 100 mg/ml 50 ml/bottle	Xylazine 100 mg/ml 50 ml/bottle
	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	30	30	30
	UNIT OF MEASURE	BOTTLE	BOTTLE	BOTTLE
	BIDDER'S BRAND	No Bid	Bimeda Animal Health	Left Blank
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	No Bid	\$17.85	Left Blank
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	No Bid	\$15.24	Left Blank

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_____
 DATE: 07/26/19



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES **SOLICITATION: 2019-942**
BID DATE: JULY 17, 2019 **DEPARTMENT: ANIMAL SERVICES**

	AOSS Medical Supply Monroe, LA	Butler Animal Health Holding Company, LLC DBA Henry Schein Animal Health/Butler Animal Health Supply LLC Dallas, TX	Intervet Inc DBA Merck Animal Health Omaha, NE
--	---	--	---

SAMPLE PRICING				
ITEM 10.	DESCRIPTION	Bordetella 26 doses/tray (Nabivac Intra Trac, ADT)	Bordetella 26 doses/tray (Nabivac Intra Trac, ADT)	Bordetella 26 doses/tray (Nabivac Intra Trac, ADT)
	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	300	300	300
	UNIT OF MEASURE	BOTTLE	BOTTLE	BOTTLE
	BIDDER'S BRAND	No Bid	Elanco	Mobivac
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	No Bid	151.79	\$5.95 *150x0.5ml /dose \$432.00/tray 25x0.5ml \$6.05/dose
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	No Bid	\$68.31 *Restricted pricing	\$2.88 *\$72.00/tray
ITEM 11.	DESCRIPTION	Feline Nobivac HCPCH 25 doses/tray	Feline Nobivac HCPCH 25 doses/tray	Feline Nobivac HCPCH 25 doses/tray
	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	400	400	400
	UNIT OF MEASURE	TRAYS	TRAYS	TRAYS
	BIDDER'S BRAND	No Bid	Elanco	Mobivac
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	No Bid	120.77	\$4.85 /dose
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	No Bid	\$54.35 *Restricted pricing	\$1.72 /dose *\$43.00/tray
ITEM 12.	DESCRIPTION	K9 Nobivac DAPPV 25 doses/tray	K9 Nobivac DAPPV 25 doses/tray	K9 Nobivac DAPPV 25 doses/tray
	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	1000	1000	1000
	UNIT OF MEASURE	TRAYS	TRAYS	TRAYS
	BIDDER'S BRAND	No Bid	Elanco	Mobivac
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	No Bid	148.95	\$6.00 /dose
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	No Bid	\$67.03 *Restricted pricing	\$2.95 /dose *\$73.75/tray

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_____
 DATE: 07/26/19 _____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES **SOLICITATION: 2019-942**
BID DATE: JULY 17, 2019 **DEPARTMENT: ANIMAL SERVICES**

	AOSS Medical Supply Monroe, LA	Butler Animal Health Holding Company, LLC DBA Henry Schein Animal Health/Butler Animal Health Supply LLC Dallas, TX	Intervet Inc DBA Merck Animal Health Omaha, NE	
SAMPLE PRICING				
ITEM 13.	DESCRIPTION	RAB K9 RABVAC 3 50 doses/tray	RAB K9 RABVAC 3 50 doses/tray	RAB K9 RABVAC 3 50 doses/tray
	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	700	700	700
	UNIT OF MEASURE	TRAYS	TRAYS	TRAYS
	BIDDER'S BRAND	No Bid	Elanco	*Mobivac Rabies Mobivac *3 year
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	No Bid	\$132.25	\$2.75 /dose
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	No Bid	\$59.51 *Restricted pricing	\$1.08 /dose *\$54.00
ITEM 14.	DESCRIPTION	Parvo Test Kits	Parvo Test Kits	Parvo Test Kits
	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	100	100	100
	UNIT OF MEASURE	BOXES	BOXES	BOXES
	BIDDER'S BRAND	No Bid	Abatis	Left Blank
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	No Bid	\$266.00	Left Blank
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	No Bid	\$239.40	Left Blank
ITEM 15.	DESCRIPTION	Covenia inj. 10 ml/bottle	Covenia inj. 10 ml/bottle	Covenia inj. 10 ml/bottle
	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	100	100	100
	UNIT OF MEASURE	BOTTLES	BOTTLES	BOTTLES
	BIDDER'S BRAND	No Bid	Zoetis	Left Blank
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	No Bid	\$308.90	Left Blank
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	No Bid	\$308.90 *Restricted pricing	Left Blank

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_____
 DATE: 07/26/19 _____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES **SOLICITATION: 2019-942**
BID DATE: JULY 17, 2019 **DEPARTMENT: ANIMAL SERVICES**

	AOSS Medical Supply Monroe, LA	Butler Animal Health Holding Company, LLC DBA Henry Schein Animal Health/Butler Animal Health Supply LLC Dallas, TX	Intervet Inc DBA Merck Animal Health Omaha, NE
--	---	--	---

SAMPLE PRICING				
ITEM 16.	DESCRIPTION	Lactated Ringers IV bags, 1 liter 24/case	Lactated Ringers IV bags, 1 liter 24/case	Lactated Ringers IV bags, 1 liter 24/case
	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	5	5	5
	UNIT OF MEASURE	CASES	CASES	CASES
	BIDDER'S BRAND	No Bid	Baxter Healthcare Fluids	Left Blank
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	No Bid	\$81.49	Left Blank
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	No Bid	\$65.95	Left Blank
ITEM 17.	DESCRIPTION	Rimadyl 75 mg/tab 180 tabs/bottle	Rimadyl 75 mg/tab 180 tabs/bottle	Rimadyl 75 mg/tab 180 tabs/bottle
	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	10	10	10
	UNIT OF MEASURE	BOTTLES	BOTTLES	BOTTLES
	BIDDER'S BRAND	No Bid	Zoetis	Left Blank
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	No Bid	\$171.90	Left Blank
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	No Bid	\$171.90 *Restricted pricing	Left Blank
ITEM 18.	DESCRIPTION	Autoclave indicator tape 1"	Autoclave indicator tape 1"	Autoclave indicator tape 1"
	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	40	40	40
	UNIT OF MEASURE	ROLLS	ROLLS	ROLLS
	BIDDER'S BRAND	AT-2003 Mydent	Henry Schein Inc	Left Blank
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	\$5.60	\$5.52	Left Blank
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	\$224.00	\$3.76	Left Blank

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_____
 DATE: 07/26/19 _____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES		SOLICITATION: 2019-942		
BID DATE: JULY 17, 2019		DEPARTMENT: ANIMAL SERVICES		
		AOSS Medical Supply Monroe, LA	Butler Animal Health Holding Company, LLC DBA Henry Schein Animal Health/Butler Animal Health Supply LLC Dallas, TX	Intervet Inc DBA Merck Animal Health Omaha, NE
SAMPLE PRICING				
ITEM 19.	DESCRIPTION	Autoclave indicator strips 100/box	Autoclave indicator strips 100/box	Autoclave indicator strips 100/box
	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	100	100	100
	UNIT OF MEASURE	BOXES	BOXES	BOXES
	BIDDER'S BRAND	SCK Crosstex	Propper Manufacturing Company	Left Blank
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	\$11.15	\$17.77	Left Blank
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	\$1,115.00	\$11.71	Left Blank
ITEM 20.	DESCRIPTION	Electric clipper blade #40	Electric clipper blade #40	Electric clipper blade #40
	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	5	5	5
	UNIT OF MEASURE	BLADES	BLADES	BLADES
	BIDDER'S BRAND	No Bid	Sunbeam Products	Left Blank
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	No Bid	\$27.15	Left Blank
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	No Bid	\$20.64	Left Blank
ITEM 21.	DESCRIPTION	Elizabeth collar size 20	Elizabeth collar size 20	Elizabeth collar size 20
	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	20	20	20
	UNIT OF MEASURE	PIECES	PIECES	PIECES
	BIDDER'S BRAND	No Bid	Animal Health Logistics	Left Blank
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	No Bid	\$17.45	Left Blank
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	No Bid	\$10.92	Left Blank

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/ _____
DATE: 07/26/19 _____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES		SOLICITATION: 2019-942		
BID DATE: JULY 17, 2019		DEPARTMENT: ANIMAL SERVICES		
	AOSS Medical Supply Monroe, LA	Butler Animal Health Holding Company, LLC DBA Henry Schein Animal Health/Butler Animal Health Supply LLC Dallas, TX	Intervet Inc DBA Merck Animal Health Omaha, NE	
SAMPLE PRICING				
ITEM 22.	DESCRIPTION	IV Admin Set (length, drops, # of sites or a manufacturer and P/N of what is preferred)	IV Admin Set (length, drops, # of sites or a manufacturer and P/N of what is preferred)	IV Admin Set (length, drops, # of sites or a manufacturer and P/N of what is preferred)
	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	100	100	100
	UNIT OF MEASURE	EACH	EACH	EACH
	BIDDER'S BRAND	Amsino #AA3101	Practivet	Left Blank
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	\$1.20	\$1.90	Left Blank
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	\$120.00	\$1.22	Left Blank
ITEM 23.	DESCRIPTION	IV catheter 22 gage	IV catheter 22 gage	IV catheter 22 gage
	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	20	20	20
	UNIT OF MEASURE	PIECES	PIECES	PIECES
	BIDDER'S BRAND	C3050	Vedco	Left Blank
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	\$1.49	\$1.58	Left Blank
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	\$29.80	\$1.06	Left Blank
ITEM 24.	DESCRIPTION	Non-woven sponges 4x4 4000/case	Non-woven sponges 4x4 4000/case	Non-woven sponges 4x4 4000/case
	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	36	36	36
	UNIT OF MEASURE	CASES	CASES	CASES
	BIDDER'S BRAND	Aoss Brand	Henry Schein Inc	Left Blank
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	\$36.00	\$4.65	Left Blank
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	\$1,296.00	\$2.54	Left Blank

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/ _____
DATE: 07/26/19 _____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES **SOLICITATION: 2019-942**
BID DATE: JULY 17, 2019 **DEPARTMENT: ANIMAL SERVICES**

	AOSS Medical Supply Monroe, LA	Butler Animal Health Holding Company, LLC DBA Henry Schein Animal Health/Butler Animal Health Supply LLC Dallas, TX	Intervet Inc DBA Merck Animal Health Omaha, NE	
SAMPLE PRICING				
ITEM 25.	DESCRIPTION	Surgical gloves latex/PF 4 box/case	Surgical gloves latex/PF 4 box/case	Surgical gloves latex/PF 4 box/case
	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	80	80	80
	UNIT OF MEASURE	CASES	CASES	CASES
	BIDDER'S BRAND	IHC Innovative Healthcare	Henry Schein Inc	Left Blank
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	\$89.00	\$35.20	Left Blank
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	\$7,120.00	\$21.50	Left Blank
ITEM 26.	DESCRIPTION	Suture Sorbocryl 3/0 FS-2, 36", 12 CT/Box NFS-2	Suture Sorbocryl 3/0 FS-2, 36", 12 CT/Box NFS-2	Suture Sorbocryl 3/0 FS-2, 36", 12 CT/Box NFS-2
	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	900	900	900
	UNIT OF MEASURE	BOXES	BOXES	BOXES
	BIDDER'S BRAND	NO BID	CP Medical	Left Blank
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	NO BID	\$59.71	Left Blank
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	NO BID	\$46.84	Left Blank
ITEM 27.	DESCRIPTION	Suture Sorbocryl 2/0 FS-2, 36", 12 CT/Box	Suture Sorbocryl 2/0 FS-2, 36", 12 CT/Box	Suture Sorbocryl 2/0 FS-2, 36", 12 CT/Box
	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	350	350	350
	UNIT OF MEASURE	BOXES	BOXES	BOXES
	BIDDER'S BRAND	NO BID	CP Medical	Left Blank
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	NO BID	\$59.71	Left Blank
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	NO BID	\$52.67	Left Blank

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_____
 DATE: 07/26/19 _____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES **SOLICITATION: 2019-942**
BID DATE: JULY 17, 2019 **DEPARTMENT: ANIMAL SERVICES**

	AOSS Medical Supply Monroe, LA	Butler Animal Health Holding Company, LLC DBA Henry Schein Animal Health/Butler Animal Health Supply LLC Dallas, TX	Intervet Inc DBA Merck Animal Health Omaha, NE	
SAMPLE PRICING				
ITEM 28.	DESCRIPTION	Syringes 3 ml, 21G, 100 CT/box 1" needle	Syringes 3 ml, 21G, 100 CT/box 1" needle	Syringes 3 ml, 21G, 100 CT/box 1" needle
	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	450	450	450
	UNIT OF MEASURE	BOXES	BOXES	BOXES
	BIDDER'S BRAND	Nipro JD03L2125	Jiangsu Caina Medical	Left Blank
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	\$5.80	\$7.50	Left Blank
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	\$2,610.00	\$5.13	Left Blank
ITEM 29.	DESCRIPTION	Vetbond-3M Surgical glue 3 ml/bottle	Vetbond-3M Surgical glue 3 ml/bottle	Vetbond-3M Surgical glue 3 ml/bottle
	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	300	300	300
	UNIT OF MEASURE	BOTTLES	BOTTLES	BOTTLES
	BIDDER'S BRAND	No Bid	3M	Left Blank
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	No Bid	\$17.29	Left Blank
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	No Bid	\$13.75	Left Blank
TOTAL COST (ITEMS 1-29):		\$12,290.80 Bidder's Price \$12,514.80	\$1,600.29 Bidder's Price \$392,738.12	\$8.63 Bidder's price: Left Blank

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_____
 DATE: 07/26/19 _____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES BID DATE: JULY 17, 2019		SOLICITATION: 2019-942 DEPARTMENT: ANIMAL SERVICES	
	AOSS Medical Supply Monroe, LA	Butler Animal Health Holding Company, LLC DBA Henry Schein Animal Health/Butler	Intervet Inc DBA Merck Animal Health Omaha, NE
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT			
THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.			
BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:			
TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),			
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.			
<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
NO OPTION OFFERED			
<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	
PAYMENT TERMS:	0% - 30 Days	Net - 30 Days	0% - 10 Days 0% - 20 Days
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:			
Within ___ consecutive calendar days	2	1 - 3	7
Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in cases of emergency.	24	24	Left Blank
IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.			
AMENDMENT ACKNOWLEDGED:	Yes	Yes	Yes

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____ /s/ _____
 DATE: 07/26/19 _____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES **SOLICITATION: 2019-942**
BID DATE: JULY 17, 2019 **DEPARTMENT: ANIMAL SERVICES**

	Miller Veterinary Supply Co., Inc. Fort Worth, TX	MVI Veterinary Supply Co dba. MWI Animal Health Boise, ID	
--	--	--	--

SAMPLE PRICING				
ITEM 1.	DESCRIPTION	Cephalexin 500 mg/tabs/ 500 tab/bottle	Cephalexin 500 mg/tabs/ 500 tab/bottle	
	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	7	7	
	UNIT OF MEASURE	BOTTLES	BOTTLES	
	BIDDER'S BRAND	Vedco	AUROB	
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	\$39.59	\$36.05	
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	\$34.34	\$33.15 EACH	
ITEM 2.	DESCRIPTION	Doxycycline 100 mg/tabs/ 500 tabs/bottle	Doxycycline 100 mg/tabs/ 500 tabs/bottle	
	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	20	20	
	UNIT OF MEASURE	BOTTLES	BOTTLES	
	BIDDER'S BRAND	Bloodworth	NA	
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	\$38.88	NA	
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	\$33.73	NA	
ITEM 3.	DESCRIPTION	Metronidazole 250 mg/tab 500 tab/bottle	Metronidazole 250 mg/tab 500 tab/bottle	
	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	10	10	
	UNIT OF MEASURE	BOTTLES	BOTTLES	
	BIDDER'S BRAND	Vedco	UNICH	
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	\$19.79	\$16.18	
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	\$17.17	\$15.80 EACH	

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_____
 DATE: 07/26/19 _____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES **SOLICITATION: 2019-942**
BID DATE: JULY 17, 2019 **DEPARTMENT: ANIMAL SERVICES**

	Miller Veterinary Supply Co., Inc. Fort Worth, TX	MVI Veterinary Supply Co dba. MWI Animal Health Boise, ID	
--	--	--	--

SAMPLE PRICING

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE	BIDDER'S BRAND	
4.	DESCRIPTION	15	BOTTLES	Enrofloxin (Baytril) tablets 68 mg.	
	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	15	BOTTLES	Enrofloxin (Baytril) tablets 68 mg.	
	UNIT OF MEASURE				
	BIDDER'S BRAND			Dechra *50 tab/bottle	
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	\$64.77			MAND
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	\$58.29			MAND
5.	DESCRIPTION	5	EACH	Anesthesia bags .5, 1, 2 & 3 liter	
	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	5	EACH	Anesthesia bags .5, 1, 2 & 3 liter	
	UNIT OF MEASURE				
	BIDDER'S BRAND			Jorvet	
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	\$27.00			.05-\$6.15 1-\$23.66 2-\$23.66 3-26.02
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	\$21.69			.05-\$4.80 1-\$18.49 2-\$18.49 3-\$21.83
6.	DESCRIPTION	240	BOTTLES	Isoflurane gas 250 ml/bottle	
	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	240	BOTTLES	Isoflurane gas 250 ml/bottle	
	UNIT OF MEASURE				
	BIDDER'S BRAND			Vedco	
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	\$29.65			NA
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	\$25.00			NA

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____ /s/ _____
 DATE: 07/26/19



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES

SOLICITATION: 2019-942

BID DATE: JULY 17, 2019

DEPARTMENT: ANIMAL SERVICES

	Miller Veterinary Supply Co., Inc. Fort Worth, TX	MVI Veterinary Supply Co dba. MWI Animal Health Boise, ID	
--	--	--	--

SAMPLE PRICING

	DESCRIPTION	Ketamine 100 mg/ml 10 ml/bottle	Ketamine 100 mg/ml 10 ml/bottle	
ITEM 7.	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	750	750	
	UNIT OF MEASURE	BOTTLES	BOTTLES	
	BIDDER'S BRAND	Dechra	VETONE	
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	\$5.99	\$5.52	
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	\$5.00	\$4.89 EACH	
	ITEM 8.	DESCRIPTION	Soda lime bag 3 lbs/bag	Soda lime bag 3 lbs/bag
ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY		50	50	
UNIT OF MEASURE		BAGS	BAGS	
BIDDER'S BRAND		Jorvet	VETONE	
PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):		\$7.80	\$7.22	
CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):		\$6.27	\$5.95 EACH	
ITEM 9.	DESCRIPTION	Xylazine 100 mg/ml 50 ml/bottle	Xylazine 100 mg/ml 50 ml/bottle	
	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	30	30	
	UNIT OF MEASURE	BOTTLE	BOTTLE	
	BIDDER'S BRAND	Bimeda	VETONE	
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	\$19.73	\$17.69	
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	\$17.83	\$16.79 EACH	

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/ _____
DATE: 07/26/19 _____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES **SOLICITATION: 2019-942**
BID DATE: JULY 17, 2019 **DEPARTMENT: ANIMAL SERVICES**

	Miller Veterinary Supply Co., Inc. Fort Worth, TX	MVI Veterinary Supply Co dba. MWI Animal Health Boise, ID	
--	--	--	--

SAMPLE PRICING

	DESCRIPTION	Bordetella 26 doses/tray (Nabivac Intra Trac, ADT)	Bordetella 26 doses/tray (Nabivac Intra Trac, ADT)	
ITEM 10.	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	300	300	
	UNIT OF MEASURE	BOTTLE	BOTTLE	
	BIDDER'S BRAND	Elanco	MERCK	
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	\$151.79	MAND	
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	\$68.31	MAND	
	DESCRIPTION	Feline Nobivac HCPCH 25 doses/tray	Feline Nobivac HCPCH 25 doses/tray	
ITEM 11.	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	400	400	
	UNIT OF MEASURE	TRAYS	TRAYS	
	BIDDER'S BRAND	Elanco	MERCK	
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	\$139.99	MAND	
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	\$62.99	MAND	
	DESCRIPTION	K9 Nobivac DAPPV 25 doses/tray	K9 Nobivac DAPPV 25 doses/tray	
ITEM 12.	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	1000	1000	
	UNIT OF MEASURE	TRAYS	TRAYS	
	BIDDER'S BRAND	Elanco	MERCK	
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	\$148.95	MAND	
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	\$67.03	MAND	

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_____
 DATE: 07/26/19



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES **SOLICITATION: 2019-942**
BID DATE: JULY 17, 2019 **DEPARTMENT: ANIMAL SERVICES**

	Miller Veterinary Supply Co., Inc. Fort Worth, TX	MVI Veterinary Supply Co dba. MWI Animal Health Boise, ID	
--	--	--	--

SAMPLE PRICING

	DESCRIPTION	RAB K9 RABVAC 3 50 doses/tray	RAB K9 RABVAC 3 50 doses/tray	
ITEM 13.	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	700	700	
	UNIT OF MEASURE	TRAYS	TRAYS	
	BIDDER'S BRAND	Elanco	ELANCO	
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	\$132.25	MAND	
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	\$59.51	MAND	
	DESCRIPTION	Parvo Test Kits	Parvo Test Kits	
ITEM 14.	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	100	100	
	UNIT OF MEASURE	BOXES	BOXES	
	BIDDER'S BRAND	Abaxis	ABAXIS	
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	\$143.00	MAND	
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	\$128.70	MAND	
	DESCRIPTION	Covenia inj. 10 ml/bottle	Covenia inj. 10 ml/bottle	
ITEM 15.	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	100	100	
	UNIT OF MEASURE	BOTTLES	BOTTLES	
	BIDDER'S BRAND	No Bid	ZOETIS	
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	No Bid	MAND	
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	No Bid	MAND	

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_____
 DATE: 07/26/19 _____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES

SOLICITATION: 2019-942

BID DATE: JULY 17, 2019

DEPARTMENT: ANIMAL SERVICES

	Miller Veterinary Supply Co., Inc. Fort Worth, TX	MVI Veterinary Supply Co dba. MWI Animal Health Boise, ID	
--	--	--	--

SAMPLE PRICING

	DESCRIPTION	Lactated Ringers IV bags, 1 liter 24/case	Lactated Ringers IV bags, 1 liter 24/case	
ITEM 16.	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	5	5	
	UNIT OF MEASURE	CASES	CASES	
	BIDDER'S BRAND	Dechra	VETONE	
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	\$139.68	MAND	
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	\$125.72	MAND	
	DESCRIPTION	Rimadyl 75 mg/tab 180 tabs/bottle	Rimadyl 75 mg/tab 180 tabs/bottle	
ITEM 17.	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	10	10	
	UNIT OF MEASURE	BOTTLES	BOTTLES	
	BIDDER'S BRAND	Novox	ZOETIS	
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	\$55.44	MAND	
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	\$48.49	MAND	
	DESCRIPTION	Autoclave indicator tape 1"	Autoclave indicator tape 1"	
ITEM 18.	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	40	40	
	UNIT OF MEASURE	ROLLS	ROLLS	
	BIDDER'S BRAND	3M	3M	
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	\$6.90	\$6.44	
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	\$5.82	\$5.77 EACH	

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_____
DATE: 07/26/19 _____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES **SOLICITATION: 2019-942**
BID DATE: JULY 17, 2019 **DEPARTMENT: ANIMAL SERVICES**

	Miller Veterinary Supply Co., Inc. Fort Worth, TX	MVI Veterinary Supply Co dba. MWI Animal Health Boise, ID	
--	--	--	--

SAMPLE PRICING

	DESCRIPTION	Autoclave indicator strips 100/box	Autoclave indicator strips 100/box	
ITEM 19.	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	100	100	
	UNIT OF MEASURE	BOXES	BOXES	
	BIDDER'S BRAND	Vedco	PROPP	
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	\$19.53	\$14.32	
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	\$18.12	\$12.34 EACH	
	DESCRIPTION	Electric clipper blade #40	Electric clipper blade #40	
ITEM 20.	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	5	5	
	UNIT OF MEASURE	BLADES	BLADES	
	BIDDER'S BRAND	Oster	OSTER	
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	\$37.49	\$24.18	
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	\$21.13	\$20.29 EACH	
	DESCRIPTION	Elizabeth collar size 20	Elizabeth collar size 20	
ITEM 21.	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	20	20	
	UNIT OF MEASURE	PIECES	PIECES	
	BIDDER'S BRAND	5 Star	VETONE	
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	\$1.47	\$2.75	
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	\$1.28	\$2.06 EACH	
	DESCRIPTION	Elizabeth collar size 20	Elizabeth collar size 20	

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____ /s/ _____
 DATE: 07/26/19



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES

SOLICITATION: 2019-942

BID DATE: JULY 17, 2019

DEPARTMENT: ANIMAL SERVICES

	Miller Veterinary Supply Co., Inc. Fort Worth, TX	MVI Veterinary Supply Co dba. MVI Animal Health Boise, ID	
--	--	--	--

SAMPLE PRICING

	DESCRIPTION	IV Admin Set (length, drops, # of sites or a manufacturer and P/N of what is preferred)	IV Admin Set (length, drops, # of sites or a manufacturer and P/N of what is preferred)	
ITEM 22.	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	100	100	
	UNIT OF MEASURE	EACH	EACH	
	BIDDER'S BRAND	Omniset	NA	
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	\$1.63	NA	
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	\$1.37	NA	
	DESCRIPTION	IV catheter 22 gage	IV catheter 22 gage	
ITEM 23.	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	20	20	
	UNIT OF MEASURE	PIECES	PIECES	
	BIDDER'S BRAND	Jorvet	TERUM	
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	\$1.20	\$1.11	
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	\$0.96	\$0.98 EACH	
	DESCRIPTION	Non-woven sponges 4x4 4000/case	Non-woven sponges 4x4 4000/case	
ITEM 24.	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	36	36	
	UNIT OF MEASURE	CASES	CASES	
	BIDDER'S BRAND	Dukal	NA	
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	\$46.80	NA	
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	\$36.60	NA	

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____ /s/ _____
DATE: 07/26/19



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES **SOLICITATION: 2019-942**
BID DATE: JULY 17, 2019 **DEPARTMENT: ANIMAL SERVICES**

	Miller Veterinary Supply Co., Inc. Fort Worth, TX	MVI Veterinary Supply Co dba. MWI Animal Health Boise, ID	
--	--	--	--

SAMPLE PRICING

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	Surgical gloves latex/PF 4 box/case	Surgical gloves latex/PF 4 box/case	
25.	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	80	80	
	UNIT OF MEASURE	CASES	CASES	
	BIDDER'S BRAND	Ansell	NA	
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	\$171.44	NA	
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	\$144.56	NA	
26.	DESCRIPTION	Suture Sorbocryl 3/0 FS-2, 36", 12 CT/Box NFS-2	Suture Sorbocryl 3/0 FS-2, 36", 12 CT/Box NFS-2	
	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	900	900	
	UNIT OF MEASURE	BOXES	BOXES	
	BIDDER'S BRAND	Vedco	NA	
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	\$49.40	NA	
CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	\$44.67	NA		
27.	DESCRIPTION	Suture Sorbocryl 2/0 FS-2, 36", 12 CT/Box	Suture Sorbocryl 2/0 FS-2, 36", 12 CT/Box	
	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	350	350	
	UNIT OF MEASURE	BOXES	BOXES	
	BIDDER'S BRAND	Vedco	NA	
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	\$49.40	NA	
CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	\$44.67	NA		

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____ /s/ _____
 DATE: 07/26/19



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES **SOLICITATION: 2019-942**

BID DATE: JULY 17, 2019 **DEPARTMENT: ANIMAL SERVICES**

	Miller Veterinary Supply Co., Inc. Fort Worth, TX	MVI Veterinary Supply Co dba. MVI Animal Health Boise, ID	
SAMPLE PRICING			
ITEM 28.	DESCRIPTION	Syringes 3 ml, 21G, 100 CT/box 1" needle	Syringes 3 ml, 21G, 100 CT/box 1" needle
	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	450	450
	UNIT OF MEASURE	BOXES	BOXES
	BIDDER'S BRAND	Nipro	CARDL
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	\$6.39	\$12.59
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	\$5.77	\$12.02 EACH
ITEM 29.	DESCRIPTION	Vetbond-3M Surgical glue 3 ml/bottle	Vetbond-3M Surgical glue 3 ml/bottle
	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	300	300
	UNIT OF MEASURE	BOTTLES	BOTTLES
	BIDDER'S BRAND	3M	3M
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP):	\$17.29	\$16.59
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or MARK-UP or NET):	\$14.58	\$14.30
TOTAL COST (ITEMS 1-29):		\$1,119.60 Bidder's Price: \$ 259,050.00	\$144.34 Bidder's Price: \$18,508.25 *MAND items not included in total

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/ _____
DATE: ___07/26/19_____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES **SOLICITATION: 2019-942**
BID DATE: JULY 17, 2019 **DEPARTMENT: ANIMAL SERVICES**

	Miller Veterinary Supply Co., Inc. Fort Worth, TX	MVI Veterinary Supply Co dba. MWI Animal Health Boise, ID	
<u>OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT</u>			
THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.			
BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:			
TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
NO OPTION OFFERED	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
PAYMENT TERMS:	Net - 30 Days	Net - 30 Days	
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:			
Within ___ consecutive calendar days	2	3	
Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in cases of emergency.	24	Left Blank	
IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.			
AMENDMENT ACKNOWLEDGED:	No	No	
BIDS SOLICITED: 7 LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED: 1 BIDS RECEIVED: 5 LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED: 0 NO BID: 0			

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_____
 DATE: ___07/26/19_____