
PROJECT NAME: Medical Waste Collection and Disposal Services

(C) (C)
Total Annual 

Cost
Total Annual 

Cost
(Formula: A X B 

X 12 = Total 
Cost)

(Formula: A X 
B X 12 = Total 

Cost)

$132.00 $6,336.00 $19,008.00 $75.00 $3,600.00 $10,800.00

Per Month Bidder's Price 
$1,584.00

Bidder's Price 
$4,752.00

Bidder's Price 
$900.00

Bidder's Price 
$2,700.00

$66.00 $1,584.00 $4,752.00 $75.00 $1,800.00 $5,400.00

Per Month Bidder's Price 
$792.00

Bidder's Price 
$2,376.00

Bidder's Price 
$900.00

Bidder's Price 
$2,700.00

$25.00 $300.00 $900.00 $37.50 $450.00 $1,350.00

Per Month

$66.00 $1,584.00 $4,752.00 $75.00 $1,800.00 $5,400.00

Per Month Bidder's Price 
$792.00

Bidder's Price 
$2,376.00

Bidder's Price 
$900.00

Bidder's Price 
$2,700.00

$132.00 $6,336.00 $19,008.00 $37.50 $1,800.00 $5,400.00

Per Month Bidder's Price 
$1,584.00

Bidder's Price 
$4,752.00

Bidder's Price 
$450.00

Bidder's Price 
$1,350.00

$33.00 $396.00 $1,188.00 $37.50 $450.00 $1,350.00

Per Month

44 gal., 100 
pounds

44 gal., 25-40 
pounds

44 gal., 25-40 
pounds

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

44 gal., 40-100 
pounds

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

ITEM
NO.

1.

Location / Address

Henderson Immunization 
721 S Mesa, El Paso, TX 
79901

3. Rawlings Dental 3301 
Pera, El Paso, TX 79905

6.
HIV Prevention
701 Texas, El Paso, TX 
79902

syringes, needles, cotton balls, 
bloody gauze pads

scalpels, needles, glass slides, 
etc.

Needles, syringes, speculums, 
urine cups, cotton swabs, 

gloves, etc.

syringes, needles, cotton balls, 
bloody gauze pads

4. Lab Annex 4505 Alberta, 
El Paso, TX 79905

5.
Family Planning  5115 El 
Paso Dr., El Paso, TX 
79905

BID OPENING DATE:  November 27, 2019
BID NO: 2020-023

DEPARTMENT: Health and Fire

Stericycle, Inc.
Bannockburn, IL

PART A: Group 1 Health (Estimated 715 pounds per month from all locations)  

Mediwaste Disposal, LLC
El Paso, TX

(A)
Estimated 

Pickups per 
Month

Description

8 Qt. containers with syringes, 
needles, cotton balls, gauze 

pads, alcohol prep pads, band-
aids, etc.

Container, 
Estimated 

Weight

44 gal., 25-40 
pounds

SAME DESCRIPTION
Ysleta Immunization 110 
Candelaria Rd., El Paso, 
TX 79907

(B)
Monthly Fee

3 Year Total
(Formula:  C X 

3 years = 3 
year Total)

(B)
Monthly Fee

3 Year Total
(Formula:  C X 

3 years = 3 year 
Total)

28 gal., 19-24 
pounds2.

4

2

1

2

4

1

APPROVED BY: ___/s/____
DATE:  _ _12/19/2019____  2020-023 Medical Waste Collection and Disposal Services 1



PROJECT NAME: Medical Waste Collection and Disposal Services

(C) (C)

Total Annual 
Cost

Total Annual 
Cost

(Formula: A X B 
X 12 = Total 

Cost)

(Formula: A X 
B X 12 = Total 

Cost)

$25.00 $300.00 $900.00 $37.50 $450.00 $1,350.00

Per Month

$25.00 $300.00 $900.00 $37.50 $450.00 $1,350.00

Per Month

$25.00 $300.00 $900.00 $37.50 $450.00 $1,350.00

Per Month

$25.00 $300.00 $900.00 $37.50 $450.00 $1,350.00

Per Month

$25.00 $300.00 $900.00 $37.50 $450.00 $1,350.00

Per Month

$25.00 $300.00 $900.00 $37.50 $450.00 $1,350.00

Per Month

(B)
Monthly Fee

3 Year Total
(Formula:  C X 

3 years = 3 
year Total)

(B)
Monthly Fee

3 Year Total
(Formula:  C X 

3 years = 3 year 
Total)

DEPARTMENT: Health and Fire

Mediwaste Disposal, LLC
El Paso, TX

Stericycle, Inc.
Bannockburn, IL

PART A: Group 1 Health (Estimated 715 pounds per month from all locations)  

TB Clinic 5115 El Paso 
Dr., El Paso, TX 79905

scalpels, needles, glass slides, 
etc.

BID NO: 2020-023
BID OPENING DATE:  November 27, 2019

28 gal., 
20-40 pounds

8.
Administration 5115 El 
Paso Dr., El Paso, TX 
79905

Lancets, gloves, gauze, Alcohol 
prep pads, capillary tubes and 

tube holders, Hematacheck 
controls

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

7.

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Location / Address Description
Container, 
Estimated 

Weight

(A)
Estimated 

Pickups per 
Month

ITEM
NO.

12. Fort Bliss 51 Slater Rd, 
El Paso, TX 79906 SAME DESCRIPTION

28 gal., 
25 pounds

10.
North Loop 1080 North 
Loop Dr, El Paso, TX 
79915

SAME DESCRIPTION
28 gal., 

25 pounds

11. Pershing 3707 Pershing, 
El Paso, TX 79930 SAME DESCRIPTION

28 gal., 
20 pounds

9. Canutillo 300 Farm Rd., 
Canutillo, TX 79832 SAME DESCRIPTION

28 gal., 
15 pounds

28 gal., 
15 pounds

1

1

1

1

1

1

APPROVED BY: ___/s/____
DATE:  _ _12/19/2019____  2020-023 Medical Waste Collection and Disposal Services 2



PROJECT NAME: Medical Waste Collection and Disposal Services

(C) (C)
Total Annual 

Cost
Total Annual 

Cost
(Formula: A X B 

X 12 = Total 
Cost)

(Formula: A X 
B X 12 = Total 

Cost)

$25.00 $300.00 $900.00 $37.50 $450.00 $1,350.00

Per Month

$25.00 $300.00 $900.00 $37.50 $450.00 $1,350.00

Per Month

$25.00 $300.00 $900.00 $37.50 $450.00 $1,350.00

Per Month

$25.00 $300.00 $900.00 $37.50 $450.00 $1,350.00

Per Month

$25.00 $300.00 $900.00 $37.50 $450.00 $1,350.00

Per Month

$25.00 $300.00 $900.00 $37.50 $450.00 $1,350.00

Per Month

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

(B)
Monthly Fee

3 Year Total
(Formula:  C X 

3 years = 3 
year Total)

(B)
Monthly Fee

3 Year Total
(Formula:  C X 

3 years = 3 year 
Total)

Mediwaste Disposal, LLC
El Paso, TX

Stericycle, Inc.
Bannockburn, IL

PART A: Group 1 Health (Estimated 715 pounds per month from all locations)  

ITEM
NO. Location / Address Description

Container, 
Estimated 

Weight

(A)
Estimated 

Pickups per 
Month

DEPARTMENT: Health and FireBID OPENING DATE:  November 27, 2019
BID NO: 2020-023

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

28 gal., 
25 pounds

16.
Montana Vista 14612 
Gregg Dr, El Paso, TX 
79938

SAME DESCRIPTION
28 gal., 

15 pounds

13.
George Dieter 1757 
George Dieter, El Paso, 
TX 79936

SAME DESCRIPTION
28 gal., 

10 pounds

14. Henderson WIC 721 S 
Mesa, El Paso, TX 79901 SAME DESCRIPTION

28 gal., 
15 pounds

15.
Lee Trevino 1840 N Lee 
Trevino, El Paso, TX 
79935

SAME DESCRIPTION

17.
San Elizario 12004 
Socorro Rd, El Paso, TX 
79849

SAME DESCRIPTION
28 gal., 

25 pounds

18. Sunrise 8500 Dyer #54, El 
Paso, TX 79904 SAME DESCRIPTION

28 gal., 
15 pounds

1

1

1

1

1

1

APPROVED BY: ___/s/____
DATE:  _ _12/19/2019____  2020-023 Medical Waste Collection and Disposal Services 3



PROJECT NAME: Medical Waste Collection and Disposal Services

(C) (C)

Total Annual 
Cost

Total Annual 
Cost

(Formula: A X B 
X 12 = Total 

Cost)

(Formula: A X 
B X 12 = Total 

Cost)

$25.00 $300.00 $900.00 $37.50 $450.00 $1,350.00
Per Month

$25.00 $300.00 $900.00 $37.50 $450.00 $1,350.00

Per Month

$25.00 $300.00 $900.00 $37.50 $450.00 $1,350.00

Per Month

$21,036.00 $26,436.00 $16,650.00 $24,750.00

Bidder's Price 
$9,948

Bidder's Price 
$29,844.00

Bidder's Price 
$10,800.00

Bidder's Price 
$32,400.00

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

(B)
Monthly Fee

3 Year Total
(Formula:  C X 

3 years = 3 
year Total)

PART A: Group 1 Health (Estimated 715 pounds per month from all locations)  

ITEM
NO. Location / Address Description

Container, 
Estimated 

Weight

(A)
Estimated 

Pickups per 
Month

19. Westside 5195 Mace, El 
Paso, TX 79932 SAME DESCRIPTION

28 gal., 
15 pounds

(B)
Monthly Fee

3 Year Total
(Formula:  C X 

3 years = 3 year 
Total)

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

BID NO: 2020-023
BID OPENING DATE:  November 27, 2019 DEPARTMENT: Health and Fire

Mediwaste Disposal, LLC
El Paso, TX

Stericycle, Inc.
Bannockburn, IL

Sub-Total Group 1 (Items 1-21)

21. Americas 10039 North 
Loop, Socorro, TX 79927 SAME DESCRIPTION

28 gal., 
25 pounds

20.
Ysleta WIC 110 
Candelaria Rd., El Paso, 
TX 79907

SAME DESCRIPTION
28 gal., 

25 pounds
1

1

1

APPROVED BY: ___/s/____
DATE:  _ _12/19/2019____  2020-023 Medical Waste Collection and Disposal Services 4



PROJECT NAME: Medical Waste Collection and Disposal Services

(B) (B)
Total Annual 

Cost
Total Annual 

Cost
 (Formula: A X 

12 = Total 
Annual Cost)

(Formula: A X 
12 = Total 

Annual Cost)

$29.00 $348.00 $1,044.00 $37.50 $450.00 $1,350.00

Per Month

$29.00 $348.00 $1,044.00 $37.50 $450.00 $1,350.00

Per Month

$29.00 $348.00 $1,044.00 $37.50 $450.00 $1,350.00

Per Month

$29.00 $348.00 $1,044.00 $37.50 $450.00 $1,350.00

Per Month

$29.00 $348.00 $1,044.00 $37.50 $450.00 $1,350.00

Per Month

$29.00 $348.00 $1,044.00 $37.50 $450.00 $1,350.00

Per Month

BID NO: 2020-023

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

BID OPENING DATE:  November 27, 2019 DEPARTMENT: Health and Fire

Mediwaste Disposal, LLC
El Paso, TX

Stericycle, Inc.
Bannockburn, IL

Group 2: Fire Department (Estimated 280 pounds per month from all locations)  

ITEM
NO.

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

3 Year Total
(Formula:  B X 

3 years = 3 Year 
Total)

1. Fire Station 7 3200 
Pershing Dr. 79903

BVMs, sharps, masks, glucose 
strips, suction bottles, tubing 

and othe miscellaneous 
infectious medical waste items 

40 gal.
25-45 lbs

2. Fire Station 11 314 S. 
Leon 79901 SAME DESCRIPTION

40 gal.
25-45 lbs

Location / Address Description
Container, 
Estimated 

Weight

Estimated 
Pickups per 

Month

(A)
Monthly Fee

3 Year Total
(Formula:  B X 

3 years = 3 
Year Total)

(A)
Monthly Fee

1

1

3. Fire Station 18 7901 San 
Jose Rd. 79915 SAME DESCRIPTION

40 gal.
25-45 lbs

4. Fire Station 22 6500 N. 
Mesa 79912 SAME DESCRIPTION

40 gal.
25-45 lbs

1

1

5. Fire Station 23 5315 
Threadgill Ave. 79924 SAME DESCRIPTION

40 gal.
25-45 lbs

Fire Station 29 11977 
Pellicano Dr. 79925 SAME DESCRIPTION

40 gal.
25-45 lbs6.

1

1

APPROVED BY: ___/s/____
DATE:  _ _12/19/2019____  2020-023 Medical Waste Collection and Disposal Services 5



PROJECT NAME: Medical Waste Collection and Disposal Services

(B) (B)

Total Annual 
Cost

Total Annual 
Cost

 (Formula: A X 
12 = Total 

Annual Cost)

(Formula: A X 
12 = Total 

Annual Cost)

$29.00 $348.00 $1,044.00 $37.50 $450.00 $1,350.00

Per Month

$2,436.00 $7,308.00

Bidder's Price 
$2,352.00

Bidder's Price 
$7,056.00

$23,472.00 $33,744.00 $19,800.00 $34,200.00

Bidder's Price 
$12,300.00

Bidder's Price 
$36,900.00

Bidder's Price 
$13,950.00

Bidder's Price 
$41,850.00

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

BID NO: 2020-023
BID OPENING DATE:  November 27, 2019 DEPARTMENT: Health and Fire

Mediwaste Disposal, LLC
El Paso, TX

Stericycle, Inc.
Bannockburn, IL

Group 2: Fire Department (Estimated 280 pounds per month from all locations) 

ITEM
NO. Location / Address Description

Container, 
Estimated 

Weight

(A)
Estimated 

Pickups per 
Month

Sub-Total Group 2 (Items 1-7) $3,150.00 $9,450.00

(A)
Monthly Fee

3 Year Total
(Formula:  B X 

3 years = 3 
Year Total)

(A)
Monthly Fee

3 Year Total
(Formula:  B X 

3 years = 3 Year 
Total)

7. Fire Station 35 12230 
Pine Springs Dr. 79936 SAME DESCRIPTION

40 gal.
25-45 lbs

1

Total Part A (Group 1 & 2)

APPROVED BY: ___/s/____
DATE:  _ _12/19/2019____  2020-023 Medical Waste Collection and Disposal Services 6



PROJECT NAME: Medical Waste Collection and Disposal Services

(C) (D) (C) (D)

Annual Total 
Cost

3 Year Total 
Cost

Annual Total 
Cost

3 Year Total 
Cost

(AxB=C) (Cx3 Years=D) (AxB=C) (Cx3 Years=D)

$20.00 $560.00 $1,680.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bidder's Note: 
Estimated Annual 

Ammount 11,940 (in 
pounds)

$29.00 $145.00 $435.00 $0.72 $3.60 $10.80
Bidder's Note: Total 

Monthly Weight - 995
Bidder's Price 

$8,596.80
Bidder's Price 
$25,790.40

$0.25 $7.00 $21.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bidder's Price 

$2.00
Bidder's Price 

$6.00

$1.00 $5.00 $15.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

$717.00 $2,151.00 $3.60 $10.80

Bidder's Price $ 
$712.00

Bidder's Price 
$2,136.00

Bidder's Price 
$8,596.80

Bidder's Price 
$25,790.00

$24,189.00 $35,895.00 $19,803.60 $34,210.80

Bidder's Price $ 
$13,013.00

Bidder's Price 
$39,036.00

Bidder's Price 
$22,546.80

Bidder's Price 
$67,640.40

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

Mediwaste Disposal, LLC
El Paso, TX

Stericycle, Inc.
Bannockburn, IL

Part B Collection Containers

ITEM
NO.

(B)
Unit Price 

(B)
Unit Price 

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

BID NO: 2020-023
BID OPENING DATE:  November 27, 2019 DEPARTMENT: Health and Fire

Description
(A)

Estimated Annual Amount  

285 Gallon Container

30. 40 Gallon Container 5

31. 5 Gallon Replacement Liner 28

29.

32. 40 Gallon Replacement Liner 5

Sub-Total Part B 

Grand Total (Part A and B)

APPROVED BY: ___/s/____
DATE:  _ _12/19/2019____  2020-023 Medical Waste Collection and Disposal Services 7



PROJECT NAME: Medical Waste Collection and Disposal Services

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION X
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.
BIDS SOLICITED:  8                 LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED:  3                      BIDS RECEIVED:   2                               BIDS LOCAL:  1                                    NO BID:  0        
NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

Within __________ consecutive calendar days

AMENDMENT ACKNOWLEDGED

Within __________ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in cases of 
emergency 24 72

Net - 30 Days Net - 30 Days

1 3

Yes Yes

PAYMENT TERMS:

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

BID NO: 2020-023
BID OPENING DATE:  November 27, 2019 DEPARTMENT: Health and Fire

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

Mediwaste Disposal, LLC
El Paso, TX

Stericycle, Inc.
Bannockburn, IL

X

APPROVED BY: ___/s/____
DATE:  _ _12/19/2019____  2020-023 Medical Waste Collection and Disposal Services 8


