
BID ITEM:  AMMUNITION BID # 2020-415
DEPARTMENT: Police

NET NET NET
ITEM     - __50__ % DISCOUNT      __51__ % DISCOUNT       ____ % DISCOUNT

1:   +       _ % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)

List Number_____________________
Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER
DISTRIBUTOR
JOBBER
DEALER
RETAILER
OTHER_____________________ ___________Retail MSRP for Law 

Enforcement
Suggested Retail_

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

BID DATE: November 27, 2019

G T Distibutors, Inc. 
Austin, TX

Precision Delta Corporation  
Ruleville, MS

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

Ammunition

Vista LE (Federal, Speer/CCI/Blazer, 
FOF) Winchester      Price List or Catalog

__2019 LE GOLD PRICE LIST___ Winchester Law Enforcement MSRP _____
_03/05/2019__ __2019___ _____

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

X

X X

X

APPROVED BY:         /s/     _  

DATE: __12/10/2019_____  2020-415 AMMUNITION 1



BID ITEM:  AMMUNITION BID # 2020-415
DEPARTMENT: Police

NET NET NET
ITEM     - __43__ % DISCOUNT      ____ % DISCOUNT       ____ % DISCOUNT

2:   +       _ % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)

List Number_____________________
Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER
DISTRIBUTOR
JOBBER
DEALER
RETAILER
OTHER_____________________ __________ ___________MSRP

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

__2019 Domestic Price List___ _____ _____
_05/10/2019____ _____ _____

Ammunition

Hornady                   Price List or Catalog

NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

BID DATE: November 27, 2019

G T Distibutors, Inc. 
Austin, TX

Precision Delta Corporation  
Ruleville, MS

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION

X

X

APPROVED BY:         /s/     _  

DATE: __12/10/2019_____  2020-415 AMMUNITION 2



BID ITEM:  AMMUNITION BID # 2020-415
DEPARTMENT: Police

NET NET NET
ITEM     - __5__ % DISCOUNT      ____ % DISCOUNT       ____ % DISCOUNT

3:   +       _ % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)

List Number_____________________
Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER
DISTRIBUTOR
JOBBER
DEALER
RETAILER
OTHER_____________________     MSRP  __________ ___________

BID DATE: November 27, 2019

G T Distibutors, Inc. 
Austin, TX

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING
NET OR % DISCOUNT

                   Price List or Catalog

Precision Delta Corporation  
Ruleville, MS

NET OR % DISCOUNT

Ammunition

ITEM DESCRIPTION
NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP

2019 FULL LINE DISTRIBUTOR 
PRICE LIST _____ _____

OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

_____

Defense Technology

P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

11/30/2018 _____

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

X

X

APPROVED BY:         /s/     _  

DATE: __12/10/2019_____  2020-415 AMMUNITION 3



BID ITEM:  AMMUNITION BID # 2020-415
DEPARTMENT: Police

NET NET NET
ITEM     - ____ % DISCOUNT      ____ % DISCOUNT       ____ % DISCOUNT

4:   +       _ % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)

List Number_____________________
Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER
DISTRIBUTOR
JOBBER
DEALER
RETAILER
OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ ___________

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

_____

NET OR % DISCOUNT
OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

_____ _____ _____

NET OR % DISCOUNT

BID DATE: November 27, 2019

G T Distibutors, Inc. 
Austin, TX

Precision Delta Corporation  
Ruleville, MS

ITEM DESCRIPTION
NET OR % DISCOUNT

                   Price List or Catalog

Ammunition

_____ _____

APPROVED BY:         /s/     _  

DATE: __12/10/2019_____  2020-415 AMMUNITION 4



BID ITEM:  AMMUNITION BID # 2020-415
DEPARTMENT: Police

Bidder's Desription: .308 
Caliber 168 Grain

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

1. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $182.67

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 
2. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 
3. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

4. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $139.31

No Bid 

$284.30

$2,189.16
$1,094.58

$10,236.00
$5,834.52

$892.50
$446.25

Hornady 8270

FC-P4HST3

.50 Caliber 647 Grain

Federal P40HST3 JHP Duty Winchester RA40TA

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

FC-GM338LM

G T Distibutors, Inc. 
Austin, TX

$765.02
$382.51

$372.80

PART B:  SAMPLE PRICING

DESCRIPTION: .308 Caliber 165 Grain

Precision Delta Corporation  
Ruleville, MS

DESCRIPTION: .338 Caliber 250 Grain .338 Caliber 250 Grain

Federal LE 308T1

BID DATE: November 27, 2019

No Bid

Winchester S 308M

.40 Caliber 165 Grain .40 Caliber 165 GrainDESCRIPTION:

HORNADY-8270-BX

.50 Caliber 647 GrainDESCRIPTION:

Federal GM338LM

FC-LE308T1 S308M

.308 Caliber 165 Grain

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

RA40TA

 per 200 Rds/case

 per 500 Rd/case

APPROVED BY:         /s/     _  

DATE: __12/10/2019_____  2020-415 AMMUNITION 5



BID ITEM:  AMMUNITION BID # 2020-415
DEPARTMENT: Police

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

5. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 
6. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

7. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

8. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

$6.75
$6.41

DESCRIPTION: DT- 1210 Def-Tec #35 Launch Cort DT- 1210 Def-Tec #35 Launch Cort
DefTech 1210 No Bid 

$26.10
$24.80

DESCRIPTION: DT- 6064 Foam Rubber Baton 40 mm DT- 6064 Foam Rubber Baton 40 mm

DefTech 6064 No Bid 

DESCRIPTION: DT- 1026 Def-Tec Mod 4Cs Charger DT- 1026 Def-Tec Mod 4Cs Charger
DefTech 1026 No Bid 

DT- 1210 Def-Tec #35 Launch Cort DT- 1210 Def-Tec #35 Launch Cort
DefTech 1210 No  Bid

$6.75
$6.41

BID DATE: November 27, 2019

G T Distibutors, Inc. 
Austin, TX

Precision Delta Corporation  
Ruleville, MS

PART B:  SAMPLE PRICING
DESCRIPTION:

DT-6064

DT-1210

$44.90
$42.66

DT-1026

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

DT-1210

APPROVED BY:         /s/     _  

DATE: __12/10/2019_____  2020-415 AMMUNITION 6



BID ITEM:  AMMUNITION BID # 2020-415
DEPARTMENT: Police

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

9. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

10. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 
11. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 
12. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)

FC-F127RS

$212.80
$104.27

$251.50
$123.24

$318.50

CCI Blazer 3589

$637.00

$353.95

RA12RS15 

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

$325.00
$162.50

12 ga Slug 12 ga Slug
Federak F127 RS Winchester RA12RS15

Winchester USA40SW 
CCI-3589 USA40SW

FOF-FF9B2

$594.66

Force on Force FF9B2 No Bid 

DESCRIPTION: .40 Cal Practice .40 Cal Practice
$297.33

FOF-FF556B1

DESCRIPTION: FOF- FF9B2 Force on Force Ammo 9mm 
Blue

FOF- FF9B2 Force on Force Ammo 9mm 
Blue

$707.90

DESCRIPTION: FOF-FF556BI Force on Force Ammo 5.56 
Blue

FOF-FF556BI Force on Force Ammo 
5.56 Blue
No Bid 

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

G T Distibutors, Inc. 
Austin, TX

Precision Delta Corporation  
Ruleville, MS

BID DATE: November 27, 2019

Force on Force FF556B1

DESCRIPTION:

PART B:  SAMPLE PRICING

APPROVED BY:         /s/     _  

DATE: __12/10/2019_____  2020-415 AMMUNITION 7



BID ITEM:  AMMUNITION BID # 2020-415
DEPARTMENT: Police

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

13. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

14. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBE  

15. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

16. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)

$128.23
$261.70

Hornady-90225 RA9T

$900.40

$25.20
$23.94

$44.90

DT-1082

DefTech 1082 No Bid 

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

DT-1026

$42.66

No BidDefTech 1026
DESCRIPTION: Tripe Chaser Grenades Continuous 

Discharge CS
Tripe Chaser Grenades Continuous 

Discharge CS

DESCRIPTION: Riot Control Grenade CS Riot Control Grenade CS

$32.35
$30.73

DefTech 1260 No Bid

DT-1260

DESCRIPTION: 40mm Ferret OC, CS and Powder CS 40mm Ferret OC, CS and Powder CS

$513.23

DESCRIPTION: 9 mm Duty 9 mm Duty
Hornady-90225 Winchester RA9T

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

G T Distibutors, Inc. 
Austin, TX

Precision Delta Corporation  
Ruleville, MS

PART B:  SAMPLE PRICING

BID DATE: November 27, 2019

APPROVED BY:         /s/     _  

DATE: __12/10/2019_____  2020-415 AMMUNITION 8



BID ITEM:  AMMUNITION BID # 2020-415
DEPARTMENT: Police

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

17. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

18. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $31.87

$33.55

$0.00 $0.00$17,499.69 $9,642.82 $1,383.10

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

DT-6173

40 mm Skat Shell Saf-Smoke Product

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

BID DATE: November 27, 2019

DESCRIPTION: 40 mm Skat Shell Saf-Smoke Product
DefTech 6173 No Bid 

DefTech8901 No Bid 

DT-8901

$29.97

DESCRIPTION: Distraction Device Reloads- 15 Gram Distraction Device Reloads- 15 Gram

$31.55

G T Distibutors, Inc. 
Austin, TX

Precision Delta Corporation  
Ruleville, MS

PART B:  SAMPLE PRICING

Total (items 1-18) $677.72

APPROVED BY:         /s/     _  

DATE: __12/10/2019_____  2020-415 AMMUNITION 9



BID ITEM:  AMMUNITION BID # 2020-415
DEPARTMENT: Police

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT
SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND
 UNDERTHE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY 
MANAGER ORDESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION X
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
Within ___ consecutive calendar days.
Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal
order in cases of emergency

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

BIDS SOLICITED:  30         LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED:   4          BIDS RECEIVED:  2               LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED:  2                 NO BID:   0 

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

G T Distibutors, Inc. 
Austin, TX

Precision Delta Corporation  
Ruleville, MS

90 DAYS 30-90 days 

*PLEASE SEE BELOW** 1-2+ days 

N/A N/A

NET-30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

AMENDMENTS ACKNOWLEGED:

BID DATE: November 27, 2019

PAYMENT TERMS:

X

APPROVED BY:         /s/     _  

DATE: __12/10/2019_____  2020-415 AMMUNITION 10


