
APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          

DATE: _ 6/23/2020                ____  2020-559 Zoo Veterinary Medical Supplies 1

BID ITEM: Zoo Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-559
DEPARTMENT: ZOO

NET NET NET

ITEM     - ____ % DISCOUNT     - ____ % DISCOUNT     - __ % DISCOUNT

1:   +       _ % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)

List Number_____________________
Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER
DISTRIBUTOR
JOBBER
DEALER
RETAILER
OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

LEFT BLANK                   Price List or Catalog

LEFT BLANK _____
_____

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

_____
_____

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

BID DATE: June 10, 2020

Butler Animal Health Holding 
Company, LLC dba Covetrus 
North America/Butler Animal 

Health Supply, LLC                                              
Chicago, IL

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

Medical Supply Catalog



APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          

DATE: _ 6/23/2020                ____  2020-559 Zoo Veterinary Medical Supplies 2

BID ITEM: Zoo Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-559
DEPARTMENT: ZOO

NET NET NET

ITEM     - ____ % DISCOUNT     - ____ % DISCOUNT     - ____ % DISCOUNT

1:   +         % MARKUP   +         % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)

List Number_____________________
Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER
DISTRIBUTOR
JOBBER
DEALER
RETAILER
OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

Medical Supply Catalog

                   Price List or Catalog

NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

ITEM DESCRIPTION
OR MARKUP

NET OR % DISCOUNT

BID DATE: June 10, 2020

LEFT BLANK

_____
LEFT BLANK _____

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

Butler Animal Health Holding 
Company, LLC dba Covetrus 
North America/Butler Animal 

Health Supply, LLC                                              
Chicago, IL

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.



APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          

DATE: _ 6/23/2020                ____  2020-559 Zoo Veterinary Medical Supplies 3

BID ITEM: Zoo Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-559
DEPARTMENT: ZOO

NET NET NET

ITEM     - ____ % DISCOUNT     - ____ % DISCOUNT     - ____ % DISCOUNT

1:   +   _      % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)

List Number_____________________
Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER
DISTRIBUTOR
JOBBER
DEALER
RETAILER
OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

_____

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING

ITEM DESCRIPTION
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP

                   Price List or Catalog

P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

LEFT BLANK

OR MARKUP

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

LEFT BLANK

Medical Supply Catalog

BID DATE: June 10, 2020

Butler Animal Health Holding 
Company, LLC dba Covetrus 
North America/Butler Animal 

Health Supply, LLC                                              
Chicago, IL

OR MARKUP

_____

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.



APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          

DATE: _ 6/23/2020                ____  2020-559 Zoo Veterinary Medical Supplies 4

BID ITEM: Zoo Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-559
DEPARTMENT: ZOO

Group I:  Veterinary Medications

BRAND: 
GENERIC/BRAND SUBSTITUTION ALLOWED (Y/N) NO
BIDDER'S BRAND:
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $241.50

CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $241.50

BRAND: 

GENERIC/BRAND SUBSTITUTION ALLOWED (Y/N) YES
BIDDER'S BRAND:
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $9.97
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $9.97

BRAND: 
GENERIC/BRAND SUBSTITUTION ALLOWED (Y/N) YES
BIDDER'S BRAND:
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $196.20

CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $196.20

Butler Animal Health Holding 
Company, LLC dba Covetrus 
North America/Butler Animal 

Health Supply, LLC                                              
Chicago, IL

Generic - Bluepoint 
Pharmacies

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

ITEM
1.

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

ITEM
2.

Bloodworth Wholesale

Merial Limited

DESCRIPTION: Gabapentin Tablets 800mg, 100 
count

BID DATE: June 10, 2020

Zoetis Inc.

DESCRIPTION: Buprenorphine* injection 1.8mg/ml, 
10 ml

DESCRIPTION: Firocoxib Chewable Tablets 57mg, 
180 Count

Previcox - Merial

Simbadol - Zoetis

ITEM
3.



APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          

DATE: _ 6/23/2020                ____  2020-559 Zoo Veterinary Medical Supplies 5

BID ITEM: Zoo Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-559
DEPARTMENT: ZOO

BRAND: 
GENERIC/BRAND SUBSTITUTION ALLOWED (Y/N) YES

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $70.50
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $54.57

BRAND: 

GENERIC/BRAND SUBSTITUTION ALLOWED (Y/N) YES
BIDDER'S BRAND:
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $7.88
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $7.88

BRAND: 

GENERIC/BRAND SUBSTITUTION ALLOWED (Y/N) YES
BIDDER'S BRAND:
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $10.13
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $10.13

Generic - Sun 
Pharmaceuticals

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

Cardinal Health

Metacam - Merial

Norbrook Laboratories 
Limited

Generic - Zydus 
Pharmaceuticals

DESCRIPTION: Tramadol Hydrochloride* Tablets 
50mg, 500 count

DESCRIPTION: Meloxicam Injectable 5mg/ml, 10ml

BID DATE: June 10, 2020

Butler Animal Health Holding 
Company, LLC dba Covetrus 
North America/Butler Animal 

Health Supply, LLC                                              
Chicago, IL

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

Meloxicam Tablet 15mg, 500 count

ITEM
4.

ITEM
5.

Cardinal Health

DESCRIPTION:

ITEM
6.



APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          

DATE: _ 6/23/2020                ____  2020-559 Zoo Veterinary Medical Supplies 6

BID ITEM: Zoo Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-559
DEPARTMENT: ZOO

BRAND: 
GENERIC/BRAND SUBSTITUTION ALLOWED (Y/N) YES
BIDDER'S BRAND:
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)

BRAND: 
GENERIC/BRAND SUBSTITUTION ALLOWED (Y/N) YES

BIDDER'S BRAND:
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $106.09
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $106.09

BRAND: 
GENERIC/BRAND SUBSTITUTION ALLOWED (Y/N) NO
BIDDER'S BRAND:
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $210.57
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $210.57

NO BID
NO BID

Butler Animal Health Holding 
Company, LLC dba Covetrus 
North America/Butler Animal 

Health Supply, LLC                                              
Chicago, IL

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

ITEM
8.

ITEM
9.

ITEM
7. NO BID

DESCRIPTION: Tiletamine-Zolazepam* 500mg/bottle
Telazol - Zoetis

Tazicef - Hospira

Sagent Pharmaceuticals Inc

Ceftiofur Crystalline Free Acid 
200mg/ml, 100ml

Ceftazidime Injection 2gm/vial

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

BID DATE: June 10, 2020

Excede - Zoetis

Zoetis Inc.

DESCRIPTION:

DESCRIPTION:



APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          

DATE: _ 6/23/2020                ____  2020-559 Zoo Veterinary Medical Supplies 7

BID ITEM: Zoo Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-559
DEPARTMENT: ZOO

BRAND: 
GENERIC/BRAND SUBSTITUTION ALLOWED (Y/N) YES
BIDDER'S BRAND:
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $75.95
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $64.56

BRAND: 
GENERIC/BRAND SUBSTITUTION ALLOWED (Y/N) YES
BIDDER'S BRAND:
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) NO BID 

CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) NO BID 

BRAND: 
GENERIC/BRAND SUBSTITUTION ALLOWED (Y/N) NO
BIDDER'S BRAND:
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)

NO BID 
NO BID 

Vedco Inc.

Cefpoderm - Dechra

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

Polysulfated Glycisaminoglycan 
Sterile Injection 50 mg/ml, 5ml

NO BID 

BID DATE: June 10, 2020

Butler Animal Health Holding 
Company, LLC dba Covetrus 
North America/Butler Animal 

Health Supply, LLC                                              
Chicago, IL

DESCRIPTION: Cefpodoxime Proxetil Tablets 
200mg 100 count

Generic - Strides Pharma

ITEM
10.

ITEM
11.

ITEM
12.

Adequan Canine - American 
Regent (Formerly Luitpold)

NO BID 

DESCRIPTION: Buspirone Tablets 15mg, 60 count

DESCRIPTION:



APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          

DATE: _ 6/23/2020                ____  2020-559 Zoo Veterinary Medical Supplies 8

BID ITEM: Zoo Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-559

DEPARTMENT: ZOO

BRAND: 
GENERIC/BRAND SUBSTITUTION ALLOWED (Y/N) YES
BIDDER'S BRAND:
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $81.49
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $72.90

BRAND: 
GENERIC/BRAND SUBSTITUTION ALLOWED (Y/N) YES
BIDDER'S BRAND:
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $158.67
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $130.90

BRAND: 
GENERIC/BRAND SUBSTITUTION ALLOWED (Y/N) NO
BIDDER'S BRAND:
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $324.35
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $324.35

BRAND: 
GENERIC/BRAND SUBSTITUTION ALLOWED (Y/N) YES
BIDDER'S BRAND:
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $57.75
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $46.20

Baxter Healthcare Fluids

Generic Vet One

DESCRIPTION:

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

Butler Animal Health Holding 
Company, LLC dba Covetrus 
North America/Butler Animal 

Health Supply, LLC                                              
Chicago, IL

Vedco Inc.

ITEM
14.

Clindamycin Periodontal Filler. 
Prefilled Syringe, 0.5g
Clindoral - Vedco

ITEM
15.

DESCRIPTION: Cefovecin Sodium Injection, 10 ml

DESCRIPTION: Saline Solution, 0.9% NaCl injection, 
1000 ml bag, case of 12 

BID DATE: June 10, 2020

ITEM
13.

Convenia - Zoetis

Zoetis Inc.

ITEM
16.

DESCRIPTION: Euthanasia Solution* 
(Pentobarbital/Phenytoin) 440 

Euthasol - Virbac

Vedco Inc.



APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          

DATE: _ 6/23/2020                ____  2020-559 Zoo Veterinary Medical Supplies 9

BID ITEM: Zoo Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-559
DEPARTMENT: ZOO

BRAND: 

GENERIC/BRAND SUBSTITUTION ALLOWED (Y/N) YES
BIDDER'S BRAND:
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $22.08
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $18.70

BRAND: 
GENERIC/BRAND SUBSTITUTION ALLOWED (Y/N) NO
BIDDER'S BRAND:
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $109.99
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $109.99

BRAND: 
GENERIC/BRAND SUBSTITUTION ALLOWED (Y/N) NO
BIDDER'S BRAND: NO BID
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) NOBID

BRAND: 

GENERIC/BRAND SUBSTITUTION ALLOWED (Y/N) YES
BIDDER'S BRAND:
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $26.05
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $26.05

Vetera - Boehringer-Ingelheim

ITEM
18.

DESCRIPTION: Equine ASU Joint Health 
Cosequin - Nutramax

Nutramax Laboratories

Boehringer Ingelheim

ITEM
20.

DESCRIPTION: EWT + WNV Vaccine, Killed Virus, 
10 ml

Wellactin - Nutramax

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

BID DATE: June 10, 2020

Butler Animal Health Holding 
Company, LLC dba Covetrus 
North America/Butler Animal 

Health Supply, LLC                                              
Chicago, IL

ITEM
17.

DESCRIPTION: Flurbiprofen 0.03%, 2.5ml
Generic - Amici 

Pharmaceuticals

Amici Pharmaceuticals LLC

ITEM
19.

DESCRIPTION: Canine Omega-3 Supplement 



APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          

DATE: _ 6/23/2020                ____  2020-559 Zoo Veterinary Medical Supplies 10

BID ITEM: Zoo Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-559

DEPARTMENT: ZOO

BRAND: 
GENERIC/BRAND SUBSTITUTION ALLOWED (Y/N) NO
BIDDER'S BRAND:
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $166.00
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $166.00

BRAND: 
GENERIC/BRAND SUBSTITUTION ALLOWED (Y/N) NO
BIDDER'S BRAND:
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) NO BID

BRAND: 
ITEM GENERIC/BRAND SUBSTITUTION ALLOWED (Y/N) YES

1 BIDDER'S BRAND:
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $34.02
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $34.02

Group II: Veterinary Supplies

TOTAL COST (ITEMS 1 – 22) $1,769.56

ITEM
21.

Ferret Distemper Vaccine, Live 
Canarypox Vector, 10 x 1ml

Merical Limited

Cardinal Health 

DESCRIPTION:

PureVax Ferret - Merial

ITEM
22.

DESCRIPTION: Feline FVRCP - KILLED Virus, 10 x 
Fel-O-Vax IV + Calicivax - 

NO BID

DESCRIPTION: Clear Hydrogel Dressing, 4"x4" 
(each)

CarraDres - Medline 
Industries 

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

BID DATE: June 10, 2020

Butler Animal Health Holding 
Company, LLC dba Covetrus 
North America/Butler Animal 

Health Supply, LLC                                              
Chicago, IL



APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          

DATE: _ 6/23/2020                ____  2020-559 Zoo Veterinary Medical Supplies 11

BID ITEM: Zoo Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-559
DEPARTMENT: ZOO

BRAND: 
ITEM GENERIC/BRAND SUBSTITUTION ALLOWED (Y/N) YES

2 BIDDER'S BRAND:
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) NO BID

BRAND: 
ITEM GENERIC/BRAND SUBSTITUTION ALLOWED (Y/N) YES

3 BIDDER'S BRAND:
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $7.62
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $5.87

BRAND: 
ITEM GENERIC/BRAND SUBSTITUTION ALLOWED (Y/N) YES

4 BIDDER'S BRAND:
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) NO BID

BRAND: 
GENERIC/BRAND SUBSTITUTION ALLOWED (Y/N) YES
BIDDER'S BRAND:
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $4.78
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $3.12

DESCRIPTION: Suture - Absorbable Monofilament 
Polydioxanone, 4/0, 30", 12/box

DESCRIPTION:

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

NO BID

ITEM
5

DESCRIPTION: Non-woven sponges 4x4 4000/case 
DuKal 

Dukal Corporation

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

BID DATE: June 10, 2020

DESCRIPTION: IV Infusion Set (72 inch, 15-20 drops 
per ml, at least 1 injection site)

Jorgensen Labs 

One-Dox - Vet One

NO BID 

Butler Animal Health Holding 
Company, LLC dba Covetrus 
North America/Butler Animal 

Health Supply, LLC                                              
Chicago, IL

Anesthesia bags 1liter 
Jorgensen Labs 

Vedco Inc.



APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          

DATE: _ 6/23/2020                ____  2020-559 Zoo Veterinary Medical Supplies 12

BID ITEM: Zoo Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-559
DEPARTMENT: Zoo

BRAND: 
GENERIC/BRAND SUBSTITUTION ALLOWED (Y/N) YES
BIDDER'S BRAND:
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $50.17
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $50.17

BRAND: 
GENERIC/BRAND SUBSTITUTION ALLOWED (Y/N) NO
BIDDER'S BRAND:
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $27.16
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $25.80

BRAND: 
GENERIC/BRAND SUBSTITUTION ALLOWED (Y/N) NO
BIDDER'S BRAND:
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $22.83
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $19.41

BRAND: 
GENERIC/BRAND SUBSTITUTION ALLOWED (Y/N) NO
BIDDER'S BRAND:
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $167.39
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $159.29

Cardinal Health

Clipper Distributing Co LLC
ITEM

9

DESCRIPTION:

DESCRIPTION: Cohesive Flexible Bandage, 2” x 
5yd, case of 36

Andover/2200PC-036

Monoject/520657

Andover Healthcare Inc.

ITEM
6

Butler Animal Health Holding 
Company, LLC dba Covetrus 
North America/Butler Animal 

Health Supply, LLC                                              
Chicago, IL

Accelerated Hydrogen Peroxide 
Concentrate, 5 gal

DESCRIPTION: Syringes, 20cc, luer lock tip, Box of 
50

Rescue - Virox

Vedco Inc.

DESCRIPTION: Syringes 1 ml, 25G, 100 CT/box 5/8" 
needle

Terumo/100280

ITEM
7

ITEM
8

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:June 10, 2020



APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          

DATE: _ 6/23/2020                ____  2020-559 Zoo Veterinary Medical Supplies 13

BID ITEM: Zoo Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-559
DEPARTMENT: ZOO

BRAND: 

GENERIC/BRAND SUBSTITUTION ALLOWED (Y/N) NO

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $281.76

CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $281.76

BRAND: 
GENERIC/BRAND SUBSTITUTION ALLOWED (Y/N) YES
BIDDER'S BRAND:
PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $20.60

CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $11.11

Anprolene - Anderson

Butler Animal Health Holding 
Company, LLC dba Covetrus 
North America/Butler Animal 

Health Supply, LLC                                              
Chicago, IL

Anderson Products Inc.

BID DATE: June 10, 2020

U-100 Insulin Syringe 0.5cc, 28g x 
0.5"

UltiCare VetRx - Ultimed

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

Ultimed Inc

ITEM
10

DESCRIPTION: Ethylene Oxide Gas Refill Kit for 
AN74i/AN74ix, 14/box

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

TOTAL COST (ITEMS 1 –11) $590.55

ITEM
11

DESCRIPTION:



APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          

DATE: _ 6/23/2020                ____  2020-559 Zoo Veterinary Medical Supplies 14

BID ITEM: Zoo Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-559
DEPARTMENT: ZOO

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
Within  consecutive calendar days.
Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal
order in cases of emergency

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

BID DATE: June 10, 2020

Butler Animal Health Holding 
Company, LLC dba Covetrus 
North America/Butler Animal 

Health Supply, LLC                                              
Chicago, IL

1 - 3 
(excludes special order and equipment)  

LEFT BLANK

N/AAMENDMENTS ACKNOWLEGED:

BIDS SOLICITED:    11      LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED:   1       BIDS RECEIVED:   1           LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED:     0         NO BID:    

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS 
CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS 
BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE 
CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO 
EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

Net - 30 daysPAYMENT TERMS:

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION


	2020-708

