Project Name: Rebuilt Electrical Components
Bid Opening Date: February 19, 2020

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM (REVISED)

Achievement of

S

‘)I!ncimcuremenl’
2019 Award Winner

pi

Bid No. 2020-652

Department: Mass Transit (Sun Metro)

Kirk's Automotive, Inc.

Muncie Reclamation and
Supply DBA Muncie Transit

The Aftermarket Parts
Company, LLC

Detroit, Ml Supply
GROUP | Muncie. IN Delaware, OH
ITEM EST g_ll\_ll;lUAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL
DESCRIPTION
NO. MIN | MAX
@) (8) (©) (8) ©) (8) ©)
Motor, Evaporator, Rotron [Long Shaft] Carrier
1. Tansicold 54-00532-00/2L410 R6334012 5 20 $1,900.00 $38,000.00 $1,538.00 $30,760.00 $1,867.30 $37,346.00
EA EA
Motor, Condenser, Rotron [Short Shaft] Carrier
2. Transicold #54-00533-00/2L410 R6320641 5 20 $1,900.00 $38,000.00 $1,765.00 $35,300.00 $1,965.72 $39,314.40
EA EA
Motor Drivers Blower [Long Blade ASM]
3. # 2899-006-033 R6309980 10 30 $450.00 $13,500.00 $154.95 $4,648.50 $126.99 $3,809.70
EA EA
Blower 24V
4. MCC#15-0584 6341385 1 5 $1,600.00 $8,000.00 $920.60 $4,603.00 $1,076.65 $5,383.25
EA EA
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: Isl
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Project Name: Rebuilt Electrical Components
Bid Opening Date: February 19, 2020

Achievement of

CITY OF EL PASO

&
BID TABULATION FORM (REVISED)

ﬂ)lrncProcurementf
2019 Award Winner ;

Bid No. 2020-652
Department: Mass Transit (Sun Metro)

Muncie Reclamation and
. . . . The Aftermarket Parts
Kirk's Automotive, Inc. Supply DBA Muncie Transit
. Company, LLC
Detroit, Ml Supply Delaware. OH
GROUP | Muncie, IN '
TEM EST g?”;'UAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL
DESCRIPTION
NO. MIN | MAX
) (8) ©) (8) ©) (8) ©
Blower 24V
5. MCC#15-1982 6342389 1 5 $1,500.00 $7,500.00 $760.35 $3,801.75 $843.15 $4,215.75
EA EA
Booster Blower 24V
6. MCC# 150512 218 1 5 $1,800.00 $9,000.00 $1,132.55 $5,662.75 $1,324.46 $6,622.30
EA EA
ANNUAL TOTAL GROUP I (Items 1-6): $114,000.00 $84.776.00 $96,691.40
3-YEAR TOTAL GROUP I (Items 1-6): $342,000.00 $254,328.00 $290,074.20
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: Isl
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Project Name: Rebuilt Electrical Components
Bid Opening Date: February 19, 2020

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM (REVISED)

Achievement of

&

m)ltncchureem
2019 Award Winner

fm

Bid No. 2020-652

Department: Mass Transit (Sun Metro)

Kirk's Automotive, Inc.

Muncie Reclamation and
Supply DBA Muncie Transit

The Aftermarket Parts
Company, LLC

Detroit, Ml Supply
GROUP I Muncie, IN Delaware, OH
TEM EST g?”;'UAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL
NO. DESCRIPTION
MIN | MAX
A (B) © (B) © (B) ©
Pump Water Heater Roton 24V, 4.8 AMP
7. EG&G #071042C00 R051306508 4 12 $550.00 $6,600.00 $969.75 $11,637.00 $1,050.15 $12,601.80
EA EA
Water Pumpn Heater, MP Pumps INC
8. G1074854/29473 24V 10 25 $495.00 $12,375.00 $698.00 $17,450.00 $965.52 $24,138.00
EA EA
9. Water Pump Heater Rotron 24V 10 30 $595.00 $17,850.00 $969.75 $29,092.50 $1,050.15 $31,504.50
150178-21
EA EA
Water Pump; EMP Booster;
10. |[WP32-24V-CV-A; MM 4/12 10 25 $829.00 $20,725.00 $460.22 $11,505.50 $497.35 $12,433.75
Part # 571300°
EA EA
ANNUAL TOTAL GROURP II (Items 7-10): $57,550.00 $69,685.00 $80,678.05
3-YEAR TOTAL GROUP II (Items 7-10): $172,650.00 $209,055.00 $242,034.15
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: Isl
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Project Name: Rebuilt Electrical Components
Bid Opening Date: February 19, 2020

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM (REVISED)

Achievement of

g)ltlfis;ggremenl’
2019 Award Winner 4,

Bid No. 2020-652

Department: Mass Transit (Sun Metro)

Kirk's Automotive, Inc.
Detroit, Ml

Muncie Reclamation and Supply
DBA Muncie Transit Supply

The Aftermarket Parts Company,
LLC

GROUP Il Muncie, IN Delaware, OH
TEM EST éwUAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL
NO. DESCRIPTION
MIN | MAX
) (8) ©) (8) ©) (8) ©
Battery Equalizer Vanner 60-50A
11. R041021503 1 5 Left Blank Left Blank $407.84 $2,039.20 $523.63 $2,618.15
EA EA
Multiplex Module VMM Vansco . .
12. Model 233660 1 5 Left Blank Left Blank Discontinued Manufacturer $649.82 $3,249.10
EA EA
13. Battery Equalizer Vanner 1 3 Left Blank Left Blank $479.10 $1,437.30 $359.27 $1,077.81
Model 65-80
EA EA
14. Controller Motor Thermo King 1 3 Left Blank Left Blank $2,690.00 $8,070.00 $3,254.08 $9,762.24
41-3590
EA EA
PSV Valve Woodward
15. VM7986.9200 3 10 Left Blank Left Blank $1,672.80 $16,728.00 $5,565.04 $55,650.40
EA EA $533.00 core is included. Will be refunded once
core has been returned to us.
Dinex I/0O Module
16. T2-D10-888-K 3 10 Left Blank Left Blank $1,201.25 $12,012.50 $1,391.24 $13,912.40
EA EA
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: /sl
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Project Name: Rebuilt Electrical Components
Bid Opening Date: February 19, 2020

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM (REVISED)

Achievement of

&

ﬁ)ltnci'rucuremenl'
2019 Award Winner

Bid No. 2020-652

Department. Mass Transit (Sun Metro)

Kirk's Automotive, Inc.

Muncie Reclamation and Supply
DBA Muncie Transit Supply

The Aftermarket Parts Company,
LLC

Detroit, Mi Muncie, IN Delaware, OH
GROUP Il
EST g?”;'UAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL
15 DESCRIPTION
' MIN | MAX
(A) (B) © (B) © (B) ©
17 Dinex 3 10 Left Blank Left Blank $1,829.59 $18,295.90 $2,041.36 $20,413.60
" IG2A-MBC-32 D R T T
EA EA
18 Dinex 1 5 Left Blank Left Blank $1,059.95 $5,299.75 $1,227.54 $6,137.70
" IT2-32LED-R-NB1 R T Y U
EA EA
Group lll Annual Total (Items 11-18): Left Blank $63,882.65 $112,821.40
Group Il 3-Year Total (Items 11-18) Left Blank $191,647.95 $338,464.20
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: Isl
50f9
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Project Name: Rebuilt Electrical Components
Bid Opening Date: February 19, 2020

Achievement of

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM (REVISED)

&

E)I'n‘--in:ucuremenl=
2019 Award Winner

Bid No. 2020-652
Department: Mass Transit (Sun Metro)

Muncie Reclamation and
- . . . The Aftermarket Parts
Kirk's Automotive, Inc. Supply DBA Muncie Transit
. Company, LLC
Detroit, Ml Supply Delaware. OH
GROUP IV Muncie, IN ’
ANNUAL TOTAL
EST ngAL UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL
1 DESCRIPTION
: MIN MAX
) (B) © (B8) © (B) ©
Shift Selector
21. ZF 6006-017-208 1 5 Left Blank Left Blank NO BID Left Blank $649.67 $3,248.35
EA EA
Shift Selector
22. 23048153 1 6 Left Blank Left Blank NO BID Left Blank $5,334.78 $32,008.68
EA EA
Shift Selector
23. 29507949 3 9 Left Blank Left Blank NO BID Left Blank $2,138.79 $19,249.11
EA EA
Group IV Annual Total (Items 21-23): Left Blank NO BID $54,506.14
Group IV 3-Year Total (Items 21-23) : Left Blank NO BID $163,518.42

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 4/29/2020
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Project Name: Rebuilt Electrical Components
Bid Opening Date: February 19, 2020

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM (REVISED)

Achievement of

2019 Award Winner -

Bid No. 2020-652

Department: Mass Transit (Sun Metro)

Kirk's Automotive, Inc.

Muncie Reclamation and
Supply DBA Muncie Transit

The Aftermarket Parts
Company, LLC

Detroit, Ml Supply
GROUP V Muncie, IN Delaware, OH
TEM EST ngAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL
NO. DESCRIPTION
MIN | MAX
) (8) ©) (8) ©) (8) ©
ISO-Output Card Allen Bradley
24. 1746-OX8 R037215 1 5 Left Blank Left Blank NO BID Left Blank $753.99 $3,769.95
EA EA
SLC-Output Card Allen Bradley
25. 1746-OW16 R0O37214 5 15 Left Blank Left Blank NO BID Left Blank $838.82 $12,582.30
EA EA
SLC-Input Card Allen Bradley
26. 1746-1B16 RO37212 1 5 Left Blank Left Blank NO BID Left Blank $639.39 $3,196.95
EA EA
1/0 Block Allen Bradley
27. 1791-24BR R037430 1 5 Left Blank Left Blank NO BID Left Blank Obsolete No replacement
EA EA
BDC Relay Broad Allen Bradley
28. [[1791-8BR 3 10 Left Blank Left Blank NO BID Left Blank $3,149.14 $31,491.40
R037425 EA EA 872.36 core is included. Will be refunded once
core has been returned to us.
Relay Card Allen Bradley
29. 1747-1524 RO37217 3 10 Left Blank Left Blank NO BID Left Blank $5,430.19 $54,301.90
EA EA
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: /sl
DATE: 4/29/2020 2020-652 Rebuilt Electrical Components 70f9




EAcIli:lﬁénent of
ﬂ)ltnt--in:ucuremenl=
2019 Award Winner 4

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM (REVISED)

Project Name: Rebuilt Electrical Components Bid No. 2020-652
Bid Opening Date: February 19, 2020 Department: Mass Transit (Sun Metro)
Muncie Reclamation an
N . uncie Recia a_ ona d. The Aftermarket Parts
Kirk's Automotive, Inc. Supply DBA Muncie Transit
. Company, LLC
Detroit, Ml Supply Del OH
GROUP V Muncie, IN elaware,
ITEM EST A$$UAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL
o DESCRIPTION Q
MIN MAX
A (B) ©) (B) ©) (B) (C)
Remote I/O Scanner Allen Bradley
30. 1747-SN R037216 1 5 Left Blank Left Blank NO BID Left Blank $3,129.74 15648.70
EA EA
Power Pack Allen Bradley
31. 1746-A7 RO37828 1 5 Left Blank Left Blank NO BID Left Blank $1,052.42 $5,262.10
EA EA
J-Box Assy SEP-Deploy
32. LUL2 371-0317 LIFT-U 3 8 Left Blank Left Blank NO BID Left Blank $1,448.98 $11,591.84
EA EA
J-Box Assy Lift-U
33. D371-0184 3 8 Left Blank Left Blank NO BID Left Blank $1,839.58 $14,716.64
EA EA
Group V Annual Total (Items 24-33) : Left Blank NO BID $152,561.78
Ggroup V 3-Year Total (Items 24-33) : Left Blank NO BID $457,685.34

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 4/29/2020 2020-652 Rebuilt Electrical Components 8of 9




Project Name: Rebuilt Electrical Components
Bid Opening Date: February 19, 2020

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM (REVISED)

Achievement of

g)ltlf:Ps;ggremenl’
2019 Award Winner 4

dei.

Bid No. 2020-652

Department: Mass Transit (Sun Metro)

Kirk's Automotive, Inc.
Detroit, Ml

Muncie Reclamation and
Supply DBA Muncie Transit
Supply
Muncie, IN

The Aftermarket Parts
Company, LLC
Delaware, OH

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED
ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT
SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER
THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR
DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

NO OPTION OFERRED

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

Within consecutive calendar days

Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of

verbal order in cases of emergency.

48

48

48

OEM Documentation submitted:

YES

NO

NO

AMENDMENT ACKNOWLEDGED:

YES

YES

YES

[FBIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 4/29/2020
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