
BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

NET NET NET
ITEM     - ____ % DISCOUNT     - ____ % DISCOUNT     - _10_ % DISCOUNT

1:   +       _ % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)

List Number_____________________
Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER
DISTRIBUTOR
JOBBER
DEALER
RETAILER
OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

                   Price List or Catalog

_____ _____ _____
_____ Catalog*_____

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

BID DATE: April 15, 2020
Butler Animal Health Holding 
Company, LLC dba Covetrus 

North America               
Dallas, TX

Intervet Inc.
dba Merck Animal Health

Midwest Veterinary 
Supply, Inc.

Lakesville, MN 

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

Medical Supply Catalog

*discount applies to all non manufacture 
price locked items

X

APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          

DATE: _          04/28/2020        ____  2020-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies 1



APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          

DATE: _          04/28/2020        ____  2020-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies 2



BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

NET NET NET
ITEM     - ____ % DISCOUNT     - ____ % DISCOUNT     - ____ % DISCOUNT

2:   +         % MARKUP   +         % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)

List Number_____________________
Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER
DISTRIBUTOR
JOBBER
DEALER
RETAILER
OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

BID DATE: April 15, 2020

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION

Medical Supply Catalog

                   Price List or Catalog

NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

Butler Animal Health Holding 
Company, LLC dba Covetrus 

North America               
Dallas, TX

Intervet Inc.
dba Merck Animal Health

Midwest Veterinary 
Supply, Inc.

Lakesville, MN 

NET OR % DISCOUNT
OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

_____ _____
_____ _____

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          

DATE: _          04/28/2020        ____  2020-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies 3



BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

NET NET NET
ITEM     - ____ % DISCOUNT     - ____ % DISCOUNT     - ____ % DISCOUNT

3:   +   _      % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)

List Number_____________________
Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER
DISTRIBUTOR
JOBBER
DEALER
RETAILER
OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

_____

Intervet Inc.
dba Merck Animal Health

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

Midwest Veterinary 
Supply, Inc.

Lakesville, MN 

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP

                   Price List or Catalog

_____ _____

OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

_____

Medical Supply Catalog

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

BID DATE: April 15, 2020
Butler Animal Health Holding 
Company, LLC dba Covetrus 

North America               
Dallas, TX

APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          

DATE: _          04/28/2020        ____  2020-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies 4



BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

NET NET NET

ITEM     - ____ % DISCOUNT     - ____ % DISCOUNT     - ____ % DISCOUNT

4:   +   _       % MARKUP   +   __     % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)

List Number_____________________
Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER
DISTRIBUTOR
JOBBER
DEALER
RETAILER
OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

_______

NET OR % DISCOUNT
OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

_____

Medical Supply Catalog

_____

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

Midwest Veterinary 
Supply, Inc.

Lakesville, MN 

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

NET OR % DISCOUNT

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

_______

BID DATE: April 15, 2020
Butler Animal Health Holding 
Company, LLC dba Covetrus 

North America               
Dallas, TX

Intervet Inc.
dba Merck Animal Health

ITEM DESCRIPTION
NET OR % DISCOUNT

                   Price List or Catalog

APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          

DATE: _          04/28/2020        ____  2020-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies 5



BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

NET NET NET
ITEM     - ____ % DISCOUNT     - ____ % DISCOUNT     - ____ % DISCOUNT

5:   +   _       % MARKUP   +   _       % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)

List Number_____________________
Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER
DISTRIBUTOR
JOBBER
DEALER
RETAILER
OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

_____

OR MARKUPOR MARKUP OR MARKUP

Midwest Veterinary 
Supply, Inc.

Lakesville, MN 

NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
ITEM DESCRIPTION

BID DATE: April 15, 2020

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

Intervet Inc.
dba Merck Animal Health

Butler Animal Health Holding 
Company, LLC dba Covetrus 

North America               
Dallas, TX

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

Medical Supply Catalog

                    Price List or Catalog

_______

_______

_____

APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          

DATE: _          04/28/2020        ____  2020-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies 6



BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $104.90 NO BID NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $72.76 NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $6.12 NO BID NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $4.71 NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $7.80  NO BID NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $5.91  NO BID NO BID

Pentobarbital sodium 6 grains/ml - 
250ml

Pentobarbital sodium 6 grains/ml - 
250ml

PI-HS-030-250-0 NO BID NO BID

BID DATE: April 15, 2020
Butler Animal Health Holding 
Company, LLC dba Covetrus 

North America               
Dallas, TX

Intervet Inc.
dba Merck Animal Health

Midwest Veterinary 
Supply, Inc.

Lakesville, MN 

Group I: Controlled Substances

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

DESCRIPTION: Pentobarbital sodium 6 grains/ml - 
250ml

NO BID NO BID

Vedco Inc. NO BID

NO BID

DESCRIPTION: Ketamine 100 mg/ml 10ml/bottle Ketamine 100 mg/ml 10ml/bottle Ketamine 100 mg/ml 10ml/bottle

VINB-KETO-7021 NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

J0553 sku: 055781

NO BID

Med Pharmex Inc. NO BID

Soda lime bag 3 lbs/bagDESCRIPTION:

NO BID

Group II: Veterinary Supplies

NO BID

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

Jorgensen Laboratories Inc.
ITEM

1.

ITEM
1.

ITEM
2.

Soda lime bag 3 lbs/bag Soda lime bag 3 lbs/bag

TOTAL COST (ITEMS 1 – 2) $77.47 (no qty 
provided) NO BID

APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          

DATE: _          04/28/2020        ____  2020-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies 7



BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $27.83 NO BID NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $20.49 NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $5.69 NO BID NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $3.76 NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)
$6.00

Bidders cost: 
$6.00, $6.00

NO BID NO BID

CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)
$5.28

Bidders cost: 
$5.28, $5.28

NO BID NO BID

ITEM
2. NO BID

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

BID DATE: April 15, 2020
Butler Animal Health Holding 
Company, LLC dba Covetrus 

North America               
Dallas, TX

Intervet Inc.
dba Merck Animal Health

Midwest Veterinary 
Supply, Inc.

Lakesville, MN 

Piramal Critical Care Inc. NO BID

STLF24MMHS sku: 037283 NO BID
ITEM

3.

NO BID

Crosstex International NO BID NO BID

Jorgensen Laboratories Inc. NO BID NO BID

DESCRIPTION: Autoclave indicator tape 1" Autoclave indicator tape 1" Autoclave indicator tape 1"

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

DESCRIPTION: Isoflurane gas 250 ml/bottle Isoflurane gas 250 ml/bottle Isoflurane gas 250 ml/bottle

11695067772 sku:029405 NO BID NO BID

DESCRIPTION: Anesthesia bags 
.5, 1, 2 & 3 liter

Anesthesia bags 
.5, 1, 2 & 3 liter

Anesthesia bags 
.5, 1, 2 & 3 liter

J0249A, J0294B, J0249C
sku: 016062, 016065, 016068 NO BID NO BID

ITEM
4.

APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          

DATE: _          04/28/2020        ____  2020-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies 8



BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $18.63 NO BID NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $14.39 NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $101.17 NO BID NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $89.03 NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $18.85 NO BID NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $12.06 NO BID NO BID

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

Autoclave indicator strips 100/box Autoclave indicator strips 100/box

DESCRIPTION: Vetbond-3M Surgical glue 3 ml/bottle Vetbond-3M Surgical glue 3 
ml/bottle Vetbond-3M Surgical glue 3 ml/bottle

1469SB sku: 001505 NO BID NO BID

3M NO BID NO BID

Parvo Test Kits

BID DATE: April 15, 2020
Butler Animal Health Holding 
Company, LLC dba Covetrus 

North America               
Dallas, TX

Intervet Inc.
dba Merck Animal Health

Midwest Veterinary 
Supply, Inc.

Lakesville, MN 

264101 sku: 005138 NO BID NO BID
Propper Manufacturing Co. 

Inc. NO BID NO BID

DESCRIPTION: Autoclave indicator strips 100/box

VINV-MODE-0007 sku: 068701

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

ITEM
7.

DESCRIPTION: Parvo Test Kits Parvo Test Kits

ITEM
5.

ITEM
6. Vedco Inc. NO BID

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          

DATE: _          04/28/2020        ____  2020-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies 9



BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $34.17 NO BID NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)  $25.23 NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $6.01 NO BID NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $4.73 NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $1.49 NO BID NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $1.31 NO BID NO BID

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

BID DATE: April 15, 2020

NO BID NO BID

DESCRIPTION: Elizabeth collar size 20

NO BID NO BID

Midwest Veterinary 
Supply, Inc.

Lakesville, MN 

273350 sku: 001106 NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

Epiq Animal Health NO BID NO BID

Andis Company

J0400 sku: 008464 NO BID NO BID

Jorgensen Laboratories Inc.

DESCRIPTION: IV Admin Set (length, drops, # of sites or a 
manufacturer and P/N of what is preferred)

IV Admin Set (length, drops, # of sites or a 
manufacturer and P/N of what is preferred)

IV Admin Set (length, drops, # of sites or a 
manufacturer and P/N of what is preferred)

Elizabeth collar size 21 Elizabeth collar size 22

DESCRIPTION: Electric clipper blade #40 Electric clipper blade #41 Electric clipper blade #42

64265 sku: 033368

Butler Animal Health Holding 
Company, LLC dba Covetrus 

North America               
Dallas, TX

Intervet Inc.
dba Merck Animal Health

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

ITEM
9.

ITEM
10.

ITEM
8.

APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          

DATE: _          04/28/2020        ____  2020-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies 10



BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $1.58 NO BID NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $1.06 NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $4.78 NO BID NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $2.54 NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $40.22 NO BID NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $28.41 NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $59.71 NO BID NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $52.54 NO BID NO BID

Midwest Veterinary 
Supply, Inc.

Lakesville, MN 

Vedco Inc. NO BID NO BID

VINV-CAT2-225V sku: 050605 NO BID NO BID

DESCRIPTION: IV catheter 22 gage / Box of 50

DESCRIPTION: Non-woven sponges 4 x 4 
Case of ten boxes

Non-woven sponges 4 x 4 
Case of ten boxes

Non-woven sponges 4 x 4 
Case of ten boxes

Surgical gloves latex/PF 
4 box/case; Size 6

NO BID NO BID1014336 sku: 019925

IV catheter 22 gage / Box of 51 IV catheter 22 gage / Box of 52

NO BID NO BID

DESCRIPTION: Surgical gloves latex/PF 
4 box/case; Size 7

Surgical gloves latex/PF 
4 box/case; Size 8

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

NO BID
Ansell Healthcare Products 

LLC NO BID NO BID

Suture Sorbocryl 3/0 FS-2, 36", 12 
CT/Box NFS-2

BID DATE: April 15, 2020
Butler Animal Health Holding 
Company, LLC dba Covetrus 

North America               
Dallas, TX

Intervet Inc.
dba Merck Animal Health

DESCRIPTION: Suture Sorbocryl 3/0 FS-2, 36", 12 
CT/Box NFS-3

CP Medical Corp. NO BID

L943 sku: 029293

NO BID

ITEM
11.

ITEM
12.

ITEM
13.

ITEM
14. NO BID

Suture Sorbocryl 3/0 FS-2, 36", 12 
CT/Box NFS-4

NO BID NO BID

5787003 sku: 068956

Dukal Corporation

APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          

DATE: _          04/28/2020        ____  2020-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies 11



BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $59.71 NO BID NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $52.54 NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $15.71 NO BID NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $13.82 NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $37.07 NO BID NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $32.39 NO BID NO BID

L943 sku: 029293

DESCRIPTION: Syringes 3 ml, 21G, 100 CT/box 1" 
needle

Syringes 3 ml, 21G, 100 CT/box 1" 
needle

NO BID

CP Medical Corp.

BID DATE: April 15, 2020

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

Butler Animal Health Holding 
Company, LLC dba Covetrus 

North America               
Dallas, TX

Intervet Inc.
dba Merck Animal Health

Midwest Veterinary 
Supply, Inc.

Lakesville, MN 

Group III: Veterinary Medication 

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

NO BID NO BID

Bacton Dickinson & Company NO BID NO BID

$230.68
$230.68 

WITHOUT 
MAND ITEMS

TOTAL COST (ITEMS 1 – 16)

ITEM
1.

DESCRIPTION: Cephalexin 500 mg/tabs/500 
tab/bottle

Cephalexin 500 mg/tabs/500 
tab/bottle

Cephalexin 500 mg/tabs/500 
tab/bottle

68180012202 sku: 067798 NO BID NO BID

DESCRIPTION: Suture Sorbocryl 2/0 FS-2, 36", 12 
CT/Box

NO BID

Suture Sorbocryl 2/0 FS-2, 36", 12 
CT/Box

ITEM
15.

ITEM
16.

Suture Sorbocryl 2/0 FS-2, 36", 12 
CT/Box

NO BID

NO BID

Syringes 3 ml, 21G, 100 CT/box 1" 
needle

309575 sku: 017266

$333.10
Bidders cost:

$343.68

(no qty 
provided) NO BID

$1,757.47 
cost at Each 

no cs/bx 
Except as 

Lupin Pharmaceuticals NO BID NO BID

APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          

DATE: _          04/28/2020        ____  2020-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies 12



BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 
BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $37.91 NO BID NO BID

CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $31.25 NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 
BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $15.87 NO BID NO BID

CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $13.84 NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 
BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $66.71 NO BID NO BID

CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $56.70 NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 
BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $23.06 NO BID NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $19.70 NO BID NO BID

Avet Pharmaceuticals NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

Xylazine 100 mg/ml 50 ml/bottle

NO BID

Bimeda Animal Health Inc.
ITEM

5.

DESCRIPTION: Xylazine 100 mg/ml 50 ml/bottle

NO BID

NO BID

DESCRIPTION: Doxycline 100 mg/tabs/500 
tabs/bottle

Doxycline 100 mg/tabs/500 
tabs/bottle

Doxycline 100 mg/tabs/500 
tabs/bottle

67405055005 sku: 065765 NO BID NO BID

23155065105 sku: 061808 NO BID NO BID

Harris Pharmaceuticals NO BID NO BID

DESCRIPTION: Enrofloxin (Baytril) tablets 68 mg. Enrofloxin (Baytril) tablets 68 mg. Enrofloxin (Baytril) tablets 68 mg.
VINV-ETB3-0605 sku: 068802 NO BID NO BID

ITEM
3.

ITEM
4.

Metronidazole 250 mg/tab 500 
tab/bottle

Metronidazole 250 mg/tab 500 
tab/bottle

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

BID DATE: April 15, 2020
Butler Animal Health Holding 
Company, LLC dba Covetrus 

North America               
Dallas, TX

Intervet Inc.
dba Merck Animal Health

Midwest Veterinary 
Supply, Inc.

Lakesville, MN 

Vedco Inc.

ITEM
2.

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

Xylazine 100 mg/ml 50 ml/bottle

DESCRIPTION: Metronidazole 250 mg/tab 500 
tab/bottle

1XYL006 sku: 061035

NO BID

APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          

DATE: _          04/28/2020        ____  2020-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies 13



BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 
BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $177.05 NO BID NO BID

CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $177.05 NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 
BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $324.35 NO BID NO BID
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $324.35 NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 
BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $27.83 $162.14 *tray
*$6.49/dose NO BID

CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $20.49 $56.75 *tray
*$2.27/dose NO BID

ITEM
1.

Zoetis Inc.

Group IV: Vaccines

NO BID

10001498 sku: 045533 NO BID NO BID

TOTAL COST (ITEMS 1 – 7)

Zoetis Inc.

$655.28 (no qty 
provided) NO BID

Rimadyl 75 mg/tab 180 tabs/bottle

NO BID

NO BID

Covenia inj. 10 ml/bottle Covenia inj. 10 ml/bottleCovenia inj. 10 ml/bottle

NO BID
ITEM

6.

DESCRIPTION:

ITEM
7.

DESCRIPTION:

NO BID

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

BID DATE: April 15, 2020
Butler Animal Health Holding 
Company, LLC dba Covetrus 

North America               
Dallas, TX

Intervet Inc.
dba Merck Animal Health

Midwest Veterinary 
Supply, Inc.

Lakesville, MN 

Rimadyl 75 mg/tab 180 tabs/bottle

10000316 sku: 024736

Rimadyl 75 mg/tab 180 tabs/bottle

DESCRIPTION: Bordetella 25 doses/tray (Nabivac 
Intra Trac, ADT)

Bordetella 25 doses/tray (Nabivac 
Intra Trac, ADT)

Bordetella 25 doses/tray (Nabivac 
Intra Trac, ADT)

11695067772 sku: 029405 065313 NO BID

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

Piramal Critical Care Inc. Nobivac Intra Trac 3 NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          

DATE: _          04/28/2020        ____  2020-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies 14



BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 
BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $147.00 $147.00 *tray
*$5.88/dose NO BID

CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $147.00 $51.50 *tray
*$2.06/dose NO BID

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 
BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $162.00 $177.19 *tray
*$7.09/dose NO BID

CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $162.00 $56.75 *tray
*$2.27/dose NO BID

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 
BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $149.88 $150.00 *tray
*$3.00/dose NO BID

CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $149.88 $52.50 *tray
*$1.05/dose NO BID

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

BID DATE: April 15, 2020

ITEM
2.

DESCRIPTION: Feline Nobivac HCPCH 25 doses/tray Feline Nobivac HCPCH 25 
doses/tray Feline Nobivac HCPCH 25 doses/tray

065288 sku: 006427 065266

Butler Animal Health Holding 
Company, LLC dba Covetrus 

North America               
Dallas, TX

Intervet Inc.
dba Merck Animal Health

Midwest Veterinary 
Supply, Inc.

Lakesville, MN 

NO BID
Merck Animal Health Nobivac Feline HCPLH NO BID

065448 sku: 065448 065488 NO BID
Merck Animal Health Nobivac 3 year Rabies NO BID

065288 NO BID
Merck Animal Health

$217.50 *per tray
*$7.65/dose NO BID

Nobivac DAPPV NO BID

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

TOTAL COST (ITEMS 1 –4) $149.88 (no qty 
provided)

ITEM
4.

DESCRIPTION: RAB K9 RABVAC 3 50 doses/tray RAB K9 RABVAC 3 50 doses/tray RAB K9 RABVAC 3 50 doses/tray

ITEM
3.

DESCRIPTION: K9 Nobivac DAPPV 25 doses/tray K9 Nobivac DAPPV 25 doses/tray K9 Nobivac DAPPV 25 doses/tray

065288 sku: 011276

APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          
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BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-708

DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
Within ___ consecutive calendar days.
Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal
order in cases of emergency

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

BID DATE: April 15, 2020
Butler Animal Health Holding 
Company, LLC dba Covetrus 

North America               
Dallas, TX

X

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS 
CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS 
BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE 
CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO 
EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

Intervet Inc.
dba Merck Animal Health

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

1 - 3 
(excludes special order and equipment)  

5 1 - 2 Business 

24 Left Blank

Yes YesAMENDMENTS ACKNOWLEGED: No

BIDS SOLICITED:    10      LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED:   1       BIDS RECEIVED:   5           LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED:     0         NO BID:    

Left Blank

Net - 30 daysNet - 30 daysPAYMENT TERMS:

Midwest Veterinary 
Supply, Inc.

Lakesville, MN 

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

x x

APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          
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APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          
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BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

NET X NET NET
ITEM     - ____ % DISCOUNT     - ____ % DISCOUNT     - ____ % DISCOUNT

1:   +       _ % MARKUP   +       _ % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)

List Number_____________________
Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER
DISTRIBUTOR
JOBBER
DEALER
RETAILER
OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

BID DATE: April 15, 2020

MVI Veterinary Supply Co dba 
MVI Animal Health

Boise, ID

Premier Scientific, LLC
Grand Prairie, TX

Medical Supply Catalog

                   Price List or Catalog

_____ _____ _____

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

_____ _____ _____

X

APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          
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BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

NET X NET NET
ITEM     - ____ % DISCOUNT     - ____ % DISCOUNT     - ____ % DISCOUNT

2:   +         % MARKUP   +         % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)

List Number_____________________
Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER
DISTRIBUTOR
JOBBER
DEALER
RETAILER
OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

Medical Supply Catalog

                   Price List or Catalog

_____ _____ _____

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

BID DATE: April 15, 2020

MVI Veterinary Supply Co dba 
MVI Animal Health

Boise, ID

Premier Scientific, LLC
Grand Prairie, TX

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

_____ _____ _____

X

APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          
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BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

NET X NET NET
ITEM     - ____ % DISCOUNT     - ____ % DISCOUNT     - ____ % DISCOUNT

3:   +   _      % MARKUP   +   _      % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)

List Number_____________________
Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER
DISTRIBUTOR
JOBBER
DEALER
RETAILER
OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

Medical Supply Catalog

                   Price List or Catalog

_____ _____ _____

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

BID DATE: April 15, 2020
MVI Veterinary Supply Co dba 

MVI Animal Health
Boise, ID

Premier Scientific, LLC
Grand Prairie, TX

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

_____ _____ _____

X

APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          

DATE: _          04/28/2020        ____  2020-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies 20



BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

NET X NET NET
ITEM     - ____ % DISCOUNT     - ____ % DISCOUNT     - ____ % DISCOUNT

4:   +   _       % MARKUP   +   _       % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)

List Number_____________________
Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER
DISTRIBUTOR
JOBBER
DEALER
RETAILER
OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

Medical Supply Catalog

                   Price List or Catalog

_____ _____ _______

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

BID DATE: April 15, 2020
MVI Veterinary Supply Co dba 

MVI Animal Health
Boise, ID

Premier Scientific, LLC
Grand Prairie, TX

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

_____ _____ _______

X

APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          

DATE: _          04/28/2020        ____  2020-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies 21



BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

NET X NET NET
ITEM     - ____ % DISCOUNT     - ____ % DISCOUNT     - ____ % DISCOUNT

5:   +   _       % MARKUP   +   _       % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)

List Number_____________________
Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER
DISTRIBUTOR
JOBBER
DEALER
RETAILER
OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

Medical Supply Catalog

                   Price List or Catalog

_____ _____ _______

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

BID DATE: April 15, 2020
MVI Veterinary Supply Co dba 

MVI Animal Health
Boise, ID

Premier Scientific, LLC
Grand Prairie, TX

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

_____ _____ _______

X

APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          
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BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $88.00
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $88.00

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $6.95
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $6.15

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $7.45
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $6.14

ITEM
2.

DESCRIPTION: Ketamine 100 mg/ml 10ml/bottle Ketamine 100 mg/ml 10ml/bottle

13985-05-8410 NO BID

VetOne NO BID

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

BID DATE: April 15, 2020
MVI Veterinary Supply Co dba 

MVI Animal Health
Boise, ID

Premier Scientific, LLC
Grand Prairie, TX

Group I: Controlled Substances

ITEM
1.

DESCRIPTION: Pentobarbital sodium 6 grains/ml - 
250ml

Pentobarbital sodium 6 grains/ml - 
250ml

51311-0103-25 NO BID

Virbac NO BID

Group II: Veterinary Supplies

ITEM
1.

DESCRIPTION: Soda lime bag 3 lbs/bag Soda lime bag 3 lbs/bag

50119 NO BID

VetOne NO BID

TOTAL COST (ITEMS 1 – 2) $94.15 NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          
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BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $24.11
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $24.11

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $6.74
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $5.89

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $137.93
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $118.91

3060 NO BID

VetOne NO BID

ITEM
4.

DESCRIPTION: Anesthesia bags 
.5, 1, 2 & 3 liter

Anesthesia bags 
.5, 1, 2 & 3 liter

0, 91316041, 9131642, 91316043 NO BID
Midmark

*Not sold as a set NO BID

ITEM
3.

DESCRIPTION: Autoclave indicator tape 1" Autoclave indicator tape 1"

1322-24MM NO BID

3M NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

BID DATE: April 15, 2020
MVI Veterinary Supply Co dba 

MVI Animal Health
Boise, ID

Premier Scientific, LLC
Grand Prairie, TX

ITEM
2.

DESCRIPTION: Isoflurane gas 250 ml/bottle Isoflurane gas 250 ml/bottle

APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          

DATE: _          04/28/2020        ____  2020-708 Veterinary Medical Supplies 24



BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $17.39
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $14.99

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $149.95
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $149.95

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $41.38
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $38.05

MVI Veterinary Supply Co dba 
MVI Animal Health

Boise, ID

Premier Scientific, LLC
Grand Prairie, TX

DESCRIPTION: Vetbond-3M Surgical glue 3 ml/bottle Vetbond-3M Surgical glue 3 
ml/bottle

1469SB NO BID

3M NO BID

ITEM
7.

DESCRIPTION: Autoclave indicator strips 100/box Autoclave indicator strips 100/box

SSI 100 NO BID

Cross NO BID

ITEM
6.

DESCRIPTION: Parvo Test Kits Parvo Test Kits

ITEM
5.

230-0000-10
*Predetermined by Mfr pack of 10

NO BID

Zoetis NO BID

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

BID DATE: April 15, 2020

APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          
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BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $21.97
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $18.44

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $2.83
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $2.11

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $132.09 *Box of 40

CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $106.28

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

BID DATE: April 15, 2020
MVI Veterinary Supply Co dba 

MVI Animal Health
Boise, ID

ITEM
8.

DESCRIPTION: Electric clipper blade #40 Electric clipper blade #40

64076 NO BID

Andis NO BID

Premier Scientific, LLC
Grand Prairie, TX

NO BID
NO BID

ITEM
10.

DESCRIPTION: IV Admin Set (length, drops, # of 
sites or a manufacturer and P/N of 

IV Admin Set (length, drops, # of 
sites or a manufacturer and P/N of 

TruCare Biomedix IV NO BID

Medline NO BID

ITEM
9.

DESCRIPTION: Elizabeth collar size 20 Elizabeth collar size 20

Clinic Collar NO BID

VetOne NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          
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BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $174.29
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $140.23

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $58.19 *Case of 12

CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $46.82

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $35.23
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $32.39

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $60.08 *Price locked

CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $60.08

ITEM
12.

DESCRIPTION: Non-woven sponges 4 x 4 
Case of ten boxes

Non-woven sponges 4 x 4 
Case of ten boxes

Avant Sterile NO BID

Medline NO BID

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

BID DATE: April 15, 2020
MVI Veterinary Supply Co dba 

MVI Animal Health
Boise, ID

ITEM
11.

DESCRIPTION: IV catheter 22 gage / Box of 50 IV catheter 22 gage / Box of 50

Introcan Safety NO BID

Medline NO BID

Premier Scientific, LLC
Grand Prairie, TX

ITEM
14.

DESCRIPTION: Suture Sorbocryl 3/0 FS-2, 36", 12 
CT/Box NFS-2

Suture Sorbocryl 3/0 FS-2, 36", 12 
CT/Box NFS-2

8032 Securocry 1 NO BID

Securos NO BID

ITEM
13.

DESCRIPTION: Surgical gloves latex/PF 
4 box/case; Size 6

Surgical gloves latex/PF 
4 box/case; Size 6

Sensi Encore NO BID

Ansel NO BID

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          
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BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $60.08 *Price locked

CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $60.08

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $12.80
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $12.21

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $42.03
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $38.65

ITEM
16.

DESCRIPTION: Syringes 3 ml, 21G, 100 CT/box 1" 
needle

Syringes 3 ml, 21G, 100 CT/box 1" 
needle

8881513132 NO BID

CARDL NO BID

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

BID DATE: April 15, 2020
MVI Veterinary Supply Co dba 

MVI Animal Health
Boise, ID

ITEM
15.

DESCRIPTION: Suture Sorbocryl 2/0 FS-2, 36", 12 
CT/Box

Suture Sorbocryl 2/0 FS-2, 36", 12 
CT/Box

8031 Securocry 1 NO BID

Securos NO BID

Group III: Veterinary Medication 

ITEM
1.

DESCRIPTION: Cephalexin 500 mg/tabs/500 
tab/bottle

Cephalexin 500 mg/tabs/500 
tab/bottle

65862-0019-05 NO BID

AuroB NO BID

TOTAL COST (ITEMS 1 – 16)
$836.68

Bidder's Price
$836.69

NO BID

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

Premier Scientific, LLC
Grand Prairie, TX

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          
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BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $52.16
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $41.97

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $16.18
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $15.80

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $222.03 *Price locked

CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $222.03 *for B200

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $29.39
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $26.18

ITEM
3.

DESCRIPTION: Metronidazole 250 mg/tab 500 
tab/bottle

Metronidazole 250 mg/tab 500 
tab/bottle

Left Blank NO BID

UNICH NO BID

BID DATE: April 15, 2020
MVI Veterinary Supply Co dba 

MVI Animal Health
Boise, ID

Premier Scientific, LLC
Grand Prairie, TX

ITEM
2.

DESCRIPTION: Doxycline 100 mg/tabs/500 
tabs/bottle

Doxycline 100 mg/tabs/500 
tabs/bottle

42806-0312-05 NO BID

EPICP NO BID

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

NO BID
NO BID

ITEM
5.

DESCRIPTION: Xylazine 100 mg/ml 50 ml/bottle Xylazine 100 mg/ml 50 ml/bottle

13985-0704-10 Anased NO BID

VetOne NO BID

ITEM
4.

DESCRIPTION: Enrofloxin (Baytril) tablets 68 mg. Enrofloxin (Baytril) tablets 68 mg.

Enrosite Chewable NO BID

VetOne NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

NO BID
NO BID

APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          
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BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $81.00 *Price locked

CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $81.00

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $324.35
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $324.35

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $162.14
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $162.14

ITEM
7.

DESCRIPTION: Covenia inj. 10 ml/bottle Covenia inj. 10 ml/bottle
10001498

*Predetermined by Mfr 
NO BID

Zoetis NO BID

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

BID DATE: April 15, 2020
MVI Veterinary Supply Co dba 

MVI Animal Health
Boise, ID

Premier Scientific, LLC
Grand Prairie, TX

ITEM
6.

DESCRIPTION: Rimadyl 75 mg/tab 180 tabs/bottle Rimadyl 75 mg/tab 180 tabs/bottle

Ostifen Chew NO BID

VetOne NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

Group IV: Vaccines

ITEM
1.

DESCRIPTION: Bordetella 25 doses/tray (Nabivac 
Intra Trac, ADT)

Bordetella 25 doses/tray (Nabivac 
Intra Trac, ADT)

1391-04 Price determined by Mfr NO BID

Merck NO BID

TOTAL COST (ITEMS 1 – 7) $749.98 NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          
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BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $147.00
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $147.00

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $177.19
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $177.19

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

BIDDER'S BRAND:

PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up) $136.22
CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up) $136.22

NO BID

NO BID

*Please note MWI will honor shelter pricing 
agreements between vendors and City of 
El Paso.

ITEM
3.

DESCRIPTION: K9 Nobivac DAPPV 25 doses/tray K9 Nobivac DAPPV 25 doses/tray

LEFT BLANK Price determined by Mfr NO BID

Merck NO BID

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

BID DATE: April 15, 2020
MVI Veterinary Supply Co dba 

MVI Animal Health
Boise, ID

Premier Scientific, LLC
Grand Prairie, TX

ITEM
2.

DESCRIPTION: Feline Nobivac HCPCH 25 doses/tray Feline Nobivac HCPCH 25 
doses/tray

1444-01 Price determined by Mfr NO BID

Merck NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$622.55 NO BID

ITEM
4.

DESCRIPTION: RAB K9 RABVAC 3 50 doses/tray RAB K9 RABVAC 3 50 doses/tray

140082 Price determined by Mfr NO BID

Merck NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

TOTAL COST (ITEMS 1 –4)

APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          
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BID ITEM: Veterinary Medical Supplies BID # 2020-708
DEPARTMENT: Animal Services

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
Within ___ consecutive calendar days.
Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal
order in cases of emergency

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

AMENDMENTS ACKNOWLEGED: Yes No

BIDS SOLICITED:    10      LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED:   1       BIDS RECEIVED:   5           LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED:     0         NO BID:    
NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

PAYMENT TERMS: Net - 30 days Net - 30 days
2-4 7

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS 
CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS 
BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE 
CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO 
EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

Left Blank 48

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

BID DATE: April 15, 2020

MVI Veterinary Supply Co dba 
MVI Animal Health

Boise, ID

Premier Scientific, LLC
Grand Prairie, TX

X X

APPROVED BY:      _/s/_          
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