CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

Achicvement of

o

ence-

In Procurement

2019 Award Winner

PROJECT NAME: PEST CONTROL SERVICES - ZOO
BID OPENING DATE: June 2, 2020

BID NO: 2020-763

Department: ZOO

Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. El Valle Pest Control LLC
St. Charles, IL El Paso, TX
GROUP 1: MONTHLY PEST CONTROL SERVICES
(B) (A) (€ (A) () ESTIMATED
ESTIMATED EXTENDED (3) THREE
YEARLY UNIT PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED EXTENDED (3) UNIT PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED YEAR TOTAL
ITEM ESTIMATED COSTPERYEAR | THREE YEAR TOTAL COSTPERYEAR | (C)X 3 =ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION
FREQUENCIES (A)X (B)=TOTAL | (C)X 3 =ESTIMATED (A) X (B) = TOTAL EXTENDED (3) THREE
EXTENDED COSTPER | EXTENDED (3) THREE EXTENDED COST PER YEAR TOTAL
YEAR YEAR TOTAL YEAR
NO.
1. |Develop/maintain an Integrated Pest Management Plan LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK NO BID LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK
(If included in the basic service, then circle 1
" " FEE PER VISIT FEE PER VISIT
INCLUDED") INCLUDED INCLUDED
Monthly Pest Control Services: Vendor shall provide all
personnel, materials, transportation, and equipment
necessary to provide two site visits/services/per month,
which will include:
. P . 24 LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK NO BID 280.00 6,720.00 20,160.00
2 *Spraying, in accordance with (IAW) Scope of Work. s $ $
*Rodent bait station maintenance IAW Scope of Work
. : :
Inspection for pest detection IAW Scope of Work PER SERVICE PER SERVICE
CALL CALL
Additional Site Visits (as needed): Fee per visit (if
3. included in the basic service, then circle IN.CLUDED ) 8 LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK NO BID LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK
Normal turnaround response time after receipt of order:
24 HOLII'S YRLY ESTIMATED
rrRequencies || FEE PER VISIT FEE PER VISIT
INCLUDED INCLUDED
After Hours OR Urgent/Emergency Service-Fee per visit
(if included in the basic service, then circle
4. |« INCLUDED”) 4 NO BID NO BID NO BID LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK
Maximum turnaround response time after receipt of
emergency order: 4 Hours VALY ESTIMATED
Frequencies || FEE PER VISIT FEE PER VISIT
INCLUDED INCLUDED
SUB-TOTAL GROUP 1 (ITEMS 1-4) LEFT BLANK NO BID $6,720.00 $20,160.00

PPROVED B

NOTE: Ihg inf rm@tiolrélcontained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract

DATE: 6/18/2020

2020-763 PEST CONTROL - ZOO
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2019 Award Winner

PROJECT NAME: PEST CONTROL SERVICES - ZOO
BID OPENING DATE: JUNE 2, 2020

BID NO: 2020-763
Department: ZOO

Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc.

El Valle Pest Control LLC

St. Charles, IL El Paso, TX
GROUP 2: PEST CONTROL SUPPLIES
(B) (A) (©) (A) () ESTIMATED
ITEM ESTIMATED EXTENDED (3) THREE
YEARLY UNITPRICE | TOTALExTENDED |_ EXTENDED(3) UNITPRICE | TOTALEXTENDED |  YEARTOTAL
DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED COST PER YEAR T:"C'TE(ESY_EQSRTIL‘:IQ)L COSTPERYEAR | (C)X3=ESTIMATED
UNITS (A) X (B) = TOTAL = (A) X (B) = TOTAL EXTENDED (3) THREE
EXTENDED COSTPER | XTENDED (5) THREE EXTENDED COST PER YEAR TOTAL
NO. YEAR YEAR
1. |Rat Snap Traps 240 NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.00 $480.00 $1,440.00
YRLY ESTIMATED
UNITS PER TRAP PER TRAP
2. . . 96 NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.00 $288.00 $864.00
Rat Bait Stations
YRLY ESTWATED! PER GLUE BOARD PER GLUE BOARD
3. |Rat Glue Boards 72 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.60 $43.20 $129.60
YRLY ESTIMATED
UNITS PER GLUE STICK PER GLUE STICK
4. |Mouse Snap Traps 72 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.60 $43.20 $129.60
VRLY ES TIVATED PER BAG PER BAG

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract

APPROVED BY:__/S/

DATE: 6/18/2020

2020-763 PEST CONTROL - ZOO
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PROJECT NAME: PEST CONTROL SERVICES - ZOO
BID OPENING DATE: JUNE 2, 2020

BID NO: 2020-763
Department: ZOO

Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc.

El Valle Pest Control LLC

St. Charles, IL El Paso, TX
GROUP 2: PEST CONTROL SUPPLIES
ITEM (B) (A) (C) (A) (C) ESTIMATED
ESTIMATED EXTENDED (3) THREE
YEARLY UNITPRICE | TOTALEXTENDED | EXTENDED (3) UNITPRICE | TOTALEXTENDED |  YEARTOTAL
DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED COST PER YEAR | THREE YEAR TOTAL COSTPERYEAR | (C) X3 =ESTIMATED
UNITS (A)X (B)=TOTAL | (C)X 3 =ESTIMATED (A) X (B) = TOTAL EXTENDED (3) THREE
EXTENDED COSTPER | EXTENDED (3) THREE EXTENDED COST PER YEAR TOTAL
YEAR YEAR TOTAL YEAR
NO.
5. |Mouse Glue Boards 72 LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK NO BID $0.35 $25.20 $75.60
UNITS PER GLUE BOARD PER GLUE BOARD
YRLY ESTIMATED
AMOUNTS
6. Fly Glue Sticks 280 LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK NO BID $4.00 $1,120.00 $3,360.00
UNITS
PER GLUE STICK PER GLUE STICK
YRLY ESTIMATED
AMOUNTS
Fly Bags
7. 120 LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK NO BID $5.00 $600.00 $1,800.00
UNITS PER BAG PER BAG
YRLY ESTIMATED
UNITS
8. |Gentrol (IGR) Roach Control Device 144 LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK NO BID $1.80 $259.20 $777.60
UNITS PER DEVICE PER DEVICE
YRLY ESTIMATED
UNITS

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE:
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6/18/2020

2020-763 PEST CONTROL - ZOO



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

Achicvement of

E wam

L)Itn Procurement:
2019 Award Winner

bl

PROJECT NAME: PEST CONTROL SERVICES - ZOO
BID OPENING DATE: JUNE 2, 2020

BID NO: 2020-763
Department: ZOO

Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. El Valle Pest Control LLC
St. Charles, IL El Paso, TX
GROUP 2: PEST CONTROL SUPPLIES
ITEM (B) (A) (C) (A) (C) ESTIMATED
ESTIMATED EXTENDED (3) THREE
YEARLY UNIT PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED EXTENDED (3) UNIT PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED YEAR TOTAL
DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED COSTPER YEAR | THREE YEAR TOTAL COSTPERYEAR | (C)X 3 =ESTIMATED
UNITS (A)X (B)=TOTAL | (C)X 3 =ESTIMATED (A)X (B)=ToTAL | EXTENDED (3) THREE
EXTENDED COST PER | EXTENDED (3) THREE EXTENDED COST PER YEAR TOTAL
YEAR YEAR TOTAL YEAR
NO.
9 |Roach Bait Stations 24 LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK NO BID $0.80 $19.20 $57.60
UNITS PER GLUE BOARD PER GLUE BOARD
YRLY ESTIMATED
UNITS
10. 12 LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK NO BID $11.00 $132.00 $396.00
Wasp Freeze (spray can) UNITS
PER GLUE STICK PER GLUE STICK
YRLY ESTIMATED
UNITS
11. [[BTI Dunks 12 $0.75 $9.00 $27.00 $1.50 $18.00 $54.00
UNITS PER BAG PER BAG
YRLY B TWATED Bidders Cost $75.00 | Bidders Cost $225.00
12, [Altosid Briquettes 12 $0.84 $10.08 $30.24 $1.50 $18.00 $54.00
UNITS . Bidders Cost
PER BAG Bidders Cost $476.00 $1.425.00 PER BAG
13. . . 24 LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK NO BID $18.00 432.00 $1,296.00
3 565 XLO Insecticide $
UNITS
PER 200z CAN PER 200z CAN
YRLY ESTIMATED
UNITS

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:__/S/

DATE: 6/18/2020

2020-763 PEST CONTROL - ZOO
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PROJECT NAME: PEST CONTROL SERVICES - ZOO BID NO: 2020-763
BID OPENING DATE: JUNE 2, 2020

Department: ZOO
Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. El Valle Pest Control LLC
St. Charles, IL El Paso, TX
GROUP 2: PEST CONTROL SUPPLIES
ITEM (B) (A) (C) (A) (C.) ESTIMATED
ESTIMATED EXTENDED (3) THREE
YEARLY UNIT PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED EXTENDED (3) UNIT PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED YEAR TOTAL

DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED COST PER YEAR | THREE YEAR TOTAL COST PER YEAR (C) X 3 = ESTIMATED
FREQUENCIES (A) X (B) = TOTAL (C) X 3 = ESTIMATED (A) X (B) = TOTAL EXTENDED (3) THREE

EXTENDED COST PER | EXTENDED (3) THREE EXTENDED COST PER YEAR TOTAL

YEAR YEAR TOTAL YEAR
NO.

SUB-TOTAL GROUP 2 (1-13) NO BID NO BID $3,478.00 $10,434.00

ITEM (B) (A) (c) (A) () ESTIMATED
ESTIMATED EXTENDED (3) THREE

YEARLY UNIT PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED |  ExteNDED (3) UNITPRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED YEAR TOTAL

DESCRIPTION FREQUENCIES (MX(B)=TOTAL | ()X 3= EsTIMATED (A)X (B)=TOTAL | EXTENDED (3) THREE
EXTENDED COSTPER | ExTENDED (3) THREE EXTENDED COST PER YEAR TOTAL
YEAR YEAR TOTAL YEAR
NO.
GRAND TOTAL (GROUP 1 AND GROUP 2) $10.08 $30.24 $10,198.00 $30,594.00
Bidders Gost $551.00 Bigf:;%gs‘

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:__/S/

DATE: 6/18/2020

2020-763 PEST CONTROL - ZOO



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

‘Achicvement of

Coecell

L)I‘- Procurement*
2019 Award Winner

PROJECT NAME: PEST CONTROL SERVICES - ZOO
BID OPENING DATE: JUNE 2, 2020

BID NO: 2020-763
Department: ZOO

Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc.
St. Charles, IL

El Valle Pest Control LLC
El Paso, TX

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND
THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN
NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

x]

NO OPTION OFFERED

[]

[]

1%-10 Days

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS 0.5%- 20 DAYS
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

Within consecutive calender days 5 5
Within hours or overnight after receipt 24 3
AMENDMENTS ACKNOWLEDGED: YES NO [ x YES | X NO
BIDS SOLICITED: 15 LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED: 11 BIDS RECEIVED: 2 LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED: 1 NO BID: 0

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:__/S/

DATE: 6/18/2020

2020-763 PEST CONTROL - ZOO
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