
ITEM MODEL # EST. ANN. ANNUAL 36 MONTH UNIT ANNUAL 36 MONTH UNIT ANNUAL 36 MONTH

NO. OEM NUMBER DESCRIPTION QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
91

1. 15526689 60 $107.75 $6,465.00 $19,395.00 $46.98 $2,818.80 $8,456.40 $41.07 $2,464.20 $7,392.60
LINING #4665X EA

1A 40 $114.00 $4,560.00 $13,680.00 NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED $42.37 $1,694.80 $5,084.40
EA

91
2 15533465 60 $128.00 $7,680.00 $23,040.00 $51.96 $3,117.60 $9,352.80 $55.80 $3,348.00 $10,044.00

LINING #4666X EA
91

2A LINING 40 $134.50 $5,380.00 $16,140.00 NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED $58.17 $2,326.80 $6,980.40
#4666XX EA

94
3 6314056 30 $106.25 $3,187.50 $9,562.50 $59.93 $1,797.90 $5,393.70 $27.74 $832.20 $2,496.60

LINING #4228 EA
94

4 6315782 30 $139.25 $4,177.50 $12,532.50 $78.99 $2,369.70 $7,109.10 $44.63 $1,338.90 $4,016.70
LINING #4592 EA

04/06/09
5 6336644 80 $171.75 $13,740.00 $41,220.00 $94.66 $7,572.80 $22,718.40 $38.19 $3,055.20 $9,165.60

LINING #4715 EA
04/06/09

6 6336641 80 $195.00 $15,600.00 $46,800.00 $114.89 $9,191.20 $27,573.60 $47.94 $3,835.20 $11,505.60
LINING #4728 EA

FLEET PRIDE
EL PASO, TX

YES                 NO    

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

YES                 NO    YES                 NO    OEM CERTIFICATIONS/DOCUMENTATION SUBMITTED

$182,370.00 $80,604.00 $56,685.90

(*)UNIT PRICE (* 
PRICED PER SHOE 

(NEW))

AXLETECH INTERNATIONAL
HOLDINGS, INC.

TROY, MI

SHOE & LINING
 ASSY FRONT

SHOE & LINING
 ASSY FRONT

SHOE & LINING
 ASSY REAR

GROUP I - BRAKE SHOE & LINING KIT

91
LINING #4665XX

CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION

AMERICAN BRAKE +
CLUTCH, INC.

CHESTERFIELD, MI

Department:  Mass Transit (Sun Metro)
Solicitation #:  2012-102Bid Opening Date:  January 11, 2012

Project Name:  Bus Brake Friction

SHOE & LINING
 ASSY REAR

ABEXMARATHON LINING AXLETECH(SHOES)/FEDERAL MOGUL(LINING)STATE BRAND/MANUFACTURER

SHOE & LINING
 ASSY FRONT

SHOE & LINING
 ASSY REAR

SHOE & LINING
 ASSY FRONT

SHOE & LINING
 ASSY REAR

GROUP I TOTAL

X X X

APPROVED BY:______/s/_____

DATE:______01/19/2012____  2012-102 BUS BRAKE FRICTION - SUN METRO 1



ITEM MODEL # AND EST. ANN. UNIT ANNUAL 36 MONTH UNIT ANNUAL 36 MONTH UNIT ANNUAL 36 MONTH
NO. OEM NUMBER DESCRIPTION QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

0800 BRAKE PADS 70 $24.25 $1,697.50 $5,092.50 NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED $39.56 $2,769.20 $8,307.60
1 PGD655M (MDX655) FRONT EA

0800 BRAKE PADS 70 $29.95 $2,096.50 $6,289.50 NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED $60.85 $4,259.50 $12,778.50
2 PGD411M (MDX411) REAR EA

1139 BRAKE PADS 10 $71.25 $712.50 $2,137.50 NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED $39.56 $395.60 $1,186.80
3 MKD-655 FRONT EA

1139 BRAKE PADS 10 $21.25 $212.50 $637.50 NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED $38.11 $381.10 $1,143.30
4 PGD802M (MDX802) REAR EA

0880 FRONT BRAKE 40 $69.50 $2,780.00 $8,340.00 NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED $33.94 $1,357.60 $4,072.80
5 8C2Z-2001-C (MKD1328) KIT EA (OEM SD1328)

0880 REAR BRAKE 40 $99.75 $3,990.00 $11,970.00 NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED $41.63 $1,665.20 $4,995.60
6 8C2Z-2200-B (MKD1330) KIT EA (OEM SD 1330)

551 BRAKE PADS 10 $71.25 $712.50 $2,137.50 NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED $47.20 $472.00 $1,416.00
7 MKD702 FRONT EA

551 BRAKE PADS 10 $71.25 $712.50 $2,137.50 NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED $44.51 $445.10 $1,335.30
8 MDK711 REAR EA

145 BRAKE PADS 10 $67.50 $675.00 $2,025.00 NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED $38.64 $386.40 $1,159.20
9 MKD748 FRONT EA

145 BRAKE PADS 10 $21.50 $215.00 $645.00 NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED $39.74 $397.40 $1,192.20
10 PGD674M (MDX674) REAR EA

149 BRAKE PADS 10 $57.75 $577.50 $1,732.50 NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED $36.10 $361.00 $1,083.00
11 MKD659 EA

149 BRAKE PADS 10 $22.75 $227.50 $682.50 NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED $39.74 $397.40 $1,192.20
12 PGD-674A (MDX674A) FRT EA

FLEET PRIDE
EL PASO, TX

AMERICAN BRAKE +
CLUTCH, INC.

CHESTERFIELD, MI
GROUP II - BRAKE SHOES & PADS

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

Project Name:  Bus Brake Friction Department:  Mass Transit (Sun Metro)
Bid Opening Date:  January 11, 2012 Solicitation #:  2012-102

AXLETECH INTERNATIONAL
HOLDINGS, INC.

TROY, MI

APPROVED BY:______/s/_____

DATE:______01/19/2012____  2012-102 BUS BRAKE FRICTION - SUN METRO 2



ITEM MODEL # AND EST. ANN. UNIT ANNUAL 36 MONTH UNIT ANNUAL 36 MONTH UNIT ANNUAL 36 MONTH
NO. OEM NUMBER DESCRIPTION QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

557 BRAKE PADS 10 $71.25 $712.50 $2,137.50 NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED $60.85 $608.50 $1,825.50
13 V1013267 FRT EA (OEM SD411)

11 BRAKE PADS 10 $71.25 $712.50 $2,137.50 NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED $33.94 $339.40 $1,018.20
14 8C2Z-2V001-A FRT EA (OEM SD1328)

11 BRAKE PADS 10 $95.00 $950.00 $2,850.00 NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED $34.00 $340.00 $1,020.00
15 8C2Z-2200-A(MKD 1329) REAR EA (OEM SD1329)

THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (A) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF
THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

FLEET PRIDE
EL PASO, TX

BENDIX

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

STATE BRAND/MANUFACTURER ABEX

YES                 NO          YES                     NO   OEM CERTIFICATIONS/DOCUMENTATION SUBMITTED

$43,726.20

 YES                 NO

NONE STATED

NONE STATED

CLUTCH, INC.
CHESTERFIELD, MI

Bid Opening Date:  January 11, 2012 Solicitation #:  2012-102
Project Name:  Bus Brake Friction Department:  Mass Transit (Sun Metro)

AMERICAN BRAKE +

$50,952.00GROUP II TOTAL

AXLETECH INTERNATIONAL
HOLDINGS, INC.

TROY, MI

X

X

X

X X

APPROVED BY:______/s/_____

DATE:______01/19/2012____  2012-102 BUS BRAKE FRICTION - SUN METRO 3



BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD:
CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY:  Delivery shall be made within ___7__ 
consecutive calendar days subsequent to the receipt by the contractor of
a written notice of award, or purchase order, as evidenced by the date of

In cases of emergency delivery must be made within __24___ hours or the
next morning.
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:  Within ___ consecutive calendar days.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

NET - 30 DAYS

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

receipt shown on the Postal Service domestic return receipt or facsimile.

1

48 NONE STATED 2Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in cases
of emergency.

14 NONE STATED

Bid Opening Date:  January 11, 2012

PAYMENT TERMS:

       YES                     NO          YES                     NO          YES                     NO   

Solicitation #:  2012-102
Project Name:  Bus Brake Friction

NET - 30 DAYS
2%-10 DAYS, 1%-20 DAYS, 0%-30 

DAYS, NET 30 DAYS

AMERICAN BRAKE +
CLUTCH, INC.

CHESTERFIELD, MI TROY, MI

AXLETECH INTERNATIONAL
HOLDINGS, INC.

Department:  Mass Transit (Sun Metro)

FLEET PRIDE
EL PASO, TX

X X X

APPROVED BY:______/s/_____

DATE:______01/19/2012____  2012-102 BUS BRAKE FRICTION - SUN METRO 4



ITEM MODEL # EST. ANN. UNIT ANNUAL 36 MONTH UNIT ANNUAL 36 MONTH UNIT ANNUAL 36 MONTH
NO. OEM NUMBER DESCRIPTION QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

91
1. 15526689 60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED NO BID NO BID NO BID

LINING #4665X EA

1A 40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED NO BID NO BID NO BID
EA

91
2 15533465 60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED NO BID NO BID NO BID

LINING #4666X EA
91

2A LINING 40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED NO BID NO BID NO BID
#4666XX EA

94
3 6314056 30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED NO BID NO BID NO BID

LINING #4228 EA
94

4 6315782 30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED NO BID NO BID NO BID
LINING #4592 EA

04/06/09
5 6336644 80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED NO BID NO BID NO BID

LINING #4715 EA
04/06/09

6 6336641 80 NO BID NO BID NO BID $644.13 $51,530.40 $154,591.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID
LINING #4728 EA

SUPPLY dba MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY
MUNCIE, IN

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract

WINNIPEG, MB

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

GROUP I - BRAKE SHOE & LINING KIT

Bid Opening Date:  January 11, 2012 Solicitation #:  2012-102
Project Name:  Bus Brake Friction Department:  Mass Transit (Sun Metro)

MUNCIE RECLAMATION AND NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES UNI-SELECT
CANADA ULC

SHOE & LINING
 ASSY FRONT

91
LINING #4665XX

SHOE & LINING
 ASSY FRONT

SHOE & LINING
 ASSY REAR

SHOE & LINING
 ASSY REAR

SHOE & LINING
 ASSY FRONT

SHOE & LINING
 ASSY REAR

SHOE & LINING
 ASSY FRONT

SHOE & LINING
 ASSY REAR

GROUP I TOTAL NONE STATED $154,591.20

(OEM REPLACED BY 6388314NFA)

STATE BRAND/MANUFACTURER NONE STATED NONE STATED

OEM CERTIFICATIONS/DOCUMENTATION SUBMITTED YES                 NO    YES                 NO    YES                 NO    

USA, INC.
MOORESTOWN, NJ

NO BID

X X

APPROVED BY:______/s/_____

DATE:______01/19/2012____  2012-102 BUS BRAKE FRICTION - SUN METRO 5



ITEM MODEL # AND EST. ANN. UNIT ANNUAL 36 MONTH UNIT ANNUAL 36 MONTH UNIT ANNUAL 36 MONTH
NO. OEM NUMBER DESCRIPTION QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

0800 BRAKE PADS 70 $32.40 $2,268.00 $6,804.00 NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED $32.44 $2,270.80 NO OFFER
1 PGD655M FRONT EA ($2,271.12)

0800 BRAKE PADS 70 $62.49 $4,374.30 $13,122.90 NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED $51.69 $3,618.30 NO OFFER
2 PGD411M REAR EA ($3,618.23)

1139 BRAKE PADS 10 $38.45 $384.50 $1,153.50 NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED $32.44 $324.40 NO OFFER
3 MKD-655 FRONT EA ($324.45)

1139 BRAKE PADS 10 $30.21 $302.10 $906.30 NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED $28.32 $283.20 NO OFFER
4 PGD802M REAR EA

0880 FRONT BRAKE 40 $63.99 $2,559.60 $7,678.80 NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED $32.72 $1,308.80 NO OFFER
5 8C2Z-2001-C KIT EA ($1,308.78)

0880 REAR BRAKE 40 $63.99 $2,559.60 $7,678.80 NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED $40.14 $1,605.60 NO OFFER
6 8C2Z-2200-B KIT EA ($1,605.78)

551 BRAKE PADS 10 $44.30 $443.00 $1,329.00 NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED $29.69 $296.90 NO OFFER
7 MKD702 FRONT EA ($296.95)

551 BRAKE PADS 10 $35.74 $357.40 $1,072.20 NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED $25.84 $258.40 NO OFFER
8 MDK711 REAR EA ($258.45)

145 BRAKE PADS 10 $37.99 $379.90 $1,139.70 NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED $24.74 $247.40 NO OFFER
9 MKD748 FRONT EA ($247.45)

145 BRAKE PADS 10 $35.96 $359.60 $1,078.80 NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED $24.74 $247.40 NO OFFER
10 PGD674M REAR EA ($247.45)

149 BRAKE PADS 10 $29.38 $293.80 $881.40 NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED $24.74 $247.40 NO OFFER
11 MKD659 EA ($247.45)

149 BRAKE PADS 10 $49.37 $493.70 $1,481.10 NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED $24.74 $247.40 NO OFFER
12 PGD-674A FRT EA ($4,937.00) ($247.45)

MUNCIE RECLAMATION AND
SUPPLY dba MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY

Bid Opening Date:  January 11, 2012 Solicitation #:  2012-102
Project Name:  Bus Brake Friction Department:  Mass Transit (Sun Metro)

MUNCIE, IN

NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES
CANADA ULC

UNI-SELECT

WINNIPEG, MB
USA, INC.

MOORESTOWN, NJ
GROUP II - BRAKE SHOES & PADS

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract

APPROVED BY:______/s/_____

DATE:______01/19/2012____  2012-102 BUS BRAKE FRICTION - SUN METRO 6



ITEM MODEL # AND EST. ANN. UNIT ANNUAL 36 MONTH UNIT ANNUAL 36 MONTH UNIT ANNUAL 36 MONTH
NO. OEM NUMBER DESCRIPTION QTY. PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

557 BRAKE PADS 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED $31.34 $313.40 NO OFFER
13 V1013267 FRT EA ($313.45)

11 BRAKE PADS 10 $63.99 $639.90 $1,919.70 NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED $32.72 $327.20 NO OFFER
14 8C2Z-2V001-A FRT EA

11 BRAKE PADS 10 $53.19 $531.90 $1,595.70 NONE STATED NONE STATED NONE STATED $30.79 $307.90 NO OFFER
15 8C2Z-2200-A REAR EA ($307.95)

THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (A) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF
THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

$47,841.90

($51,297.80)

LINES 1,2,3,4,7,8,9,10,11,12 BENDIX, 
LINES 5,6,14,15 BROADWAY FORD

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract

GROUP II TOTAL NONE STATED

Bid Opening Date:  January 11, 2012 Solicitation #:  2012-102
Project Name:  Bus Brake Friction Department:  Mass Transit (Sun Metro)

MUNCIE RECLAMATION AND
SUPPLY dba MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY

PLEASE CONTACT NEW FLYER AT OPTION TIME
TO SEE IF PRICING CAN STILL BE HONORED

STATE BRAND/MANUFACTURER

NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES
CANADA ULC
WINNIPEG, MBMUNCIE, IN

NONE STATED

UNI-SELECT
USA, INC.

OEM CERTIFICATIONS/DOCUMENTATION SUBMITTED YES                 NO          YES                     NO    YES                 NO

$0.00

($11,905.30)

WAGNER

MOORESTOWN, NJ

X X X

X X

APPROVED BY:______/s/_____

DATE:______01/19/2012____  2012-102 BUS BRAKE FRICTION - SUN METRO 7



BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD:
CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY:  Delivery shall be made within ___7__ 
consecutive calendar days subsequent to the receipt by the contractor of
a written notice of award, or purchase order, as evidenced by the date of

In cases of emergency delivery must be made within __24___ hours or the
next morning.
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:  Within ___ consecutive calendar days.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

BIDS RECEIVED:     6 BIDS LOCAL:        18 NO BIDS:     0

MUNCIE RECLAMATION AND
SUPPLY dba MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY

MUNCIE, IN

UNI-SELECT

Bid Opening Date:  January 11, 2012 Solicitation #:  2012-102
Project Name:  Bus Brake Friction Department:  Mass Transit (Sun Metro)

USA, INC.
MOORESTOWN, NJ

NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES
CANADA ULC
WINNIPEG, MB

PAYMENT TERMS:

       YES                     NO          YES                     NO          YES                     NO   
NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYSNET - 30 DAYS

receipt shown on the Postal Service domestic return receipt or facsimile.

7 NONE STATED IN STOCK-1/NON-STOCK-2
Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in cases N/A NONE STATED 24of emergency.

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.
BIDS SOLICITED:  33
NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract

X X X

APPROVED BY:______/s/_____

DATE:______01/19/2012____  2012-102 BUS BRAKE FRICTION - SUN METRO 8


