CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

\l”l’

2010

BID ITEM: NEW ALTERNATORS
BID OPENING DATE: MAY 23, 2012

Solicitation #: 2012-214
Department: Sun Metro

ALTERNATOR SERVICE INC.

DIESEL EQUIPMENT SALES &
SERVICE

ELREG DISTRIBUTORS LTD
BUFFALO, NY

TOTAL 36 MONTHS FOR ITEMS 1-2

VENDORS PRICE $230,210.00

DALLAS, TX POTTERVILLE, Ml
ITEM DESCRIPTION ANNUAL UNIT 12 MONTHS | 36 MONTHS UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS
NO. EST QTY PRICE EXTENDED EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED EXTENDED
YEAR 1 $324,106.80
ALTERNATOR 200 AMP (6.8L V10 ENGINE) $2.700.89 VENDORS
PENNTEX, MODEL #PX-5RD OR EQUAL 40 EA $494.00 $19,760.00 | $59,280.00 $547.09 $21,883.60 | $65,650.80 VEAR 2-3 $108,035.60 *leilgg.s
$2,836.00 $226,800.00
STATE BRAND KEI PENNTEX PENNTEX
STATE PART # KGL 240E PX5RD230 PX-5RD-230
YEAR 1 $60,092.10
ALTERNATOR 450 AMP AIR COOLED POWERS $667.69 VENDORS
2 . . ,550. ,030.
PART #1370028069 OR EQUAL 30 EA $1,895.00 | $56,850.00 | $170,550.00 NO BID YEAR 2-3 $20,030.70 *leilgg.s
$701.08 $42 064 80
STATE BRAND DELL- TEX EMP
STATE PART # D50-203 1370028069
TOTAL 12 MONTHS FOR ITEMS 1-2 $76,610.00 $21,883.60 $128,066.30
$229.830.00 $384,198.90
' . $65,650.80 VENDORS PRICE $268,864.80

*YEAR 2-3 QUOTED SEPARTE OF YEAR 1*

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:__06/05/12

2012-212 BUS TURBOCHARGERS - SUN METRO

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

\l”l’

2010

BID ITEM: NEW ALTERNATORS
BID OPENING DATE: MAY 23, 2012

Solicitation #: 2012-214
Department: Sun Metro

ALTERNATOR SERVICE INC.
DALLAS, TX

DIESEL EQUIPMENT SALES &
SERVICE
POTTERVILLE, Ml

ELREG DISTRIBUTORS LTD
BUFFALO, NY

THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF
THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

]
]

]
]

YEARS 2-3 QUOTED WITH ESCALATION*

PAYMENT TERMS:

NET - 30 DAYS

NET - 30 DAYS

(-1)%-10 DAYS / NET - 30 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD:

YES NO D

YES NO D

YES NO |:|

VISA OR MASTERCARD

|BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

Within ___ consecutive calendar days.

2 DAYS

10 DAYS

10 DAYS

*APPLICABLE AIR FREIGHT CHARGES WOULD
APPLY

Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in cases

of emergency.

1 HOUR

24 HOURS

24 HOURS
* APPLICABLE AIR FREIGHT CHARGES EXTRA

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:__06/05/12

2012-212 BUS TURBOCHARGERS - SUN METRO




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

\l”ll

2010

BID ITEM: NEW ALTERNATORS

BID OPENING DATE: MAY 23, 2012

Solicitation #: 2012-214
Department: Sun Metro

MUNCIE RECLAMATION & SUPPLY DBA

FLEET PRIDE GILLIGLLC MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY
EL PASO, TX HAYWARD, CA MUNCIE, IN
ITEM DESCRIPTION ANNUAL UNIT 12 MONTHS | 36 MONTHS UNIT 12 MONTHS | 36 MONTHS UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS
NO. EST QTY PRICE EXTENDED | EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED | EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED EXTENDED
ALTERNATOR 200 AMP (6.8L V10 ENGINE)
PENNTEX, MODEL #PX-5RD OR EQUAL 40 EA $718.00 | $28,720.00 | $86,160.00 $729.29 $29,171.60 | $87,514.80 $649.80 $25,992.00 | $77,976.00
STATE BRAND SAME PENNTEX PENNTEX
STATE PART # SAME PX-5RD S/S # PX-5RD 230 AMP
ALTERNATOR 450 AMP AIR COOLED POWERS
2 2 . 4,150. 450. ,142. 4,285. ,857. 2,695. ,850. 242,550.
PART #1370028069 OR EQUAL 30 EA $2,805.00 | $84,150.00 | $252,450.00 | $3 86 | $94,285.80 | $282,857.40 | $2,695.00 | $80,850.00 | $242,550.00
STATE BRAND SAME EMP EMP POWER
STATE PART # SAME 1370028069 1370028069
TOTAL 12 MONTHS FOR ITEMS 1-2 $112,870.00 $123,457.40 $106,842.00
TOTAL 36 MONTHS FOR ITEMS 1-2 $338,610.00 $370,372.20 $320,526.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:

06/05/12

2012-212 BUS TURBOCHARGERS - SUN METRO




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

\l”l’

2010

BID ITEM: NEW ALTERNATORS
BID OPENING DATE: MAY 23, 2012

Solicitation #: 2012-214
Department: Sun Metro

FLEET PRIDE
EL PASO, TX

GILLIG LLC
HAYWARD, CA

MUNCIE RECLAMATION & SUPPLY DBA
MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY
MUNCIE, IN

THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF
THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

o ]

]
]

PAYMENT TERMS:

of emergency.

NET 30- DAYS NET 30- DAYS NET 30- DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD: YES NO D YES I:' NO YES NO I:I
IBIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: 1 DAY 10 DAYS 10 DAYS
Within ___ consecutive calendar days.
Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in cases 1 HOUR 24 HOURS N/A

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:__06/05/12

2012-212 BUS TURBOCHARGERS - SUN METRO



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

\l”l’

2010

BID ITEM: NEW ALTERNATORS
BID OPENING DATE: MAY 23, 2012

Solicitation #: 2012-214
Department: Sun Metro

NATIONAL BUS SALES &
LEASING INC.
MARIETTA, GA

NATIONAL BUS SALES &
LEASING INC. (ALTERNATE)

MARIETTA, GA

NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES CANADA
uLcC
WINNIPEG, CANANDA

ITEM DESCRIPTION ANNUAL UNIT 12 MONTHS | 36 MONTHS UNIT 12 MONTHS | 36 MONTHS UNIT 12 MONTHS 36 MONTHS
NO. EST QTY PRICE EXTENDED | EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED | EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED EXTENDED
T e al o e i ESSLNLE) 40EA | $657.99 |$26319.60 | NOBID | $47232 |$18,80280 | NOBID NO BID
STATE BRAND PENNTEX KEI
STATE PART # PX-5RD-200 KGL240E
2 ALTERNQZS_?;E???Q?)AZF;;QQR SF?E(SEE;EOWERS 30 EA $1,719.13 | $51,573.90 NO BID $1,719.13 | $51,573.90 NO BID $2,592.73 | $77,781.90 | $233,345.70
STATE BRAND DELL TEX DELL TEX EMP
STATE PART # D50-203 D50-203 1370028069
TOTAL 12 MONTHS FOR ITEMS 1-2 $77,893.50 $70,466.70 $77,781.90
TOTAL 36 MONTHS FOR ITEMS 1-2 NO BID NO BID $233,345.70

APPROVED BY:

Is/

DATE:__06/05/12

2012-212 BUS TURBOCHARGERS - SUN METRO

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

\l”l’

2010

BID ITEM: NEW ALTERNATORS
BID OPENING DATE: MAY 23, 2012

Solicitation #: 2012-214
Department: Sun Metro

NATIONAL BUS SALES &
LEASING INC.
MARIETTA, GA

NATIONAL BUS SALES &
LEASING INC. (ALTERNATE)
MARIETTA, GA

NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES CANADA
uLcC
WINNIPEG, CANANDA

THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF
THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

]

]

PAYMENT TERMS:

NET - 30 DAYS

NET - 30 DAYS

NET - 30 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD:

YES N [ ]

YES NO | ]

YES No | |

IBIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
Within ___ consecutive calendar days.

10 DAYS

10 DAYS

10 DAYS

Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in cases
of emergency.

24 HOURS

24 HOURS

72 HOURS

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:__06/05/12

2012-212 BUS TURBOCHARGERS - SUN METRO



El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO reo
BID TABULATION 1))

2010

BID ITEM: NEW ALTERNATORS

Solicitation #: 2012-214
BID OPENING DATE: MAY 23, 2012

Department: Sun Metro

NORTH AMERICAN BUS PEARLAND ALTERNATOR
INDUSTRIES, INC COMPANY, INC
DELAWARE, OH PEARLAND, TX
ITEM DESCRIPTION ANNUAL UNIT 12 MONTHS | 36 MONTHS UNIT 12 MONTHS | 36 MONTHS UNIT 12MONTHS | 36 MONTHS
NO. EST QTY PRICE | EXTENDED | EXTENDED | PRICE EXTENDED | EXTENDED PRICE EXTENDED | EXTENDED
$23,820.00 | $71,460.00
1 ALTERNATOR 200 AMP (6.8L V10 ENGINE) 40 EA NO BID $595.50 | VENDORS | VENDORS $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
PENNTEX, MODEL #PX-5RD OR EQUAL PR o0 | PR st 50
STATE BRAND PENNTEX
STATE PART # PX5RD
ALTERNATOR 450 AMP AIR COOLED POWERS
PART #1370028069 OR EQUAL 30 EA | $2,471.91 |$74,157.30 | $222.471.90 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
STATE BRAND EMP
STATE PART # 1370028069
TOTAL 12 MONTHS FOR ITEMS 1-2 $74,157.30 $23,820.00 $0.00
TOTAL 36 MONTHS FOR ITEMS 1-2 $222,471.90 $71,460.00 $0.00
VENDORS PRICE §2§i§20'00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:__06/05/12 2012-212 BUS TURBOCHARGERS - SUN METRO



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

\l”l’

2010

BID ITEM: NEW ALTERNATORS
BID OPENING DATE: MAY 23, 2012

Solicitation #: 2012-214
Department: Sun Metro

NORTH AMERICAN BUS
INDUSTRIES, INC
DELAWARE, OH

PEARLAND ALTERNATOR
COMPANY, INC
PEARLAND, TX

THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF
THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

]

]

HaE

PAYMENT TERMS:

NET - 30 DAYS

NET - 30 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD:

IBIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

YES No [ ]

*P-CARD PURCHASES ARE SUBJECT
TO A 4.5% SERVICE CHARGE

YES NO | ]

YES D

No | |

STK-10 DAYS

5 DAYS
Within ___ consecutive calendar days. (STOCK ITEM FOR NABI)
Within ___hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in cases 48 HOURS 24 HOURS
of emergency.
IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.
BIDS SOLICITED: 21 BIDS RECEIVED: 11 BIDS LOCAL: 12 NO BID: 0

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:__06/05/12

2012-212 BUS TURBOCHARGERS - SUN METRO



