CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM
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Bid O Opening Date: JUNE 2 20, 2012
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Solicitation # 2012-259]

Department: GENERAL SERVICES

POE AUTOMOTIVE
CASA FORD INC. CRAWFORD BUICK GMC L.P. PHILPOTT MOTORS DBA EL PASO HONDA
,. L . EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX NEDERLAND, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1. COMPACT SEDAN 4 - DOOR $25,5621.54 NO BID $18,963.00 $22,422.66
YEAR/MAKE 2013 FORD 2012 TOYOTA 2012 HONDA
NIODEL NUMBER FUSION SE PRIUS C CIVIC HYBRID IMA
ONLY FIVE (5) VEHICLES AVAILABLE
COMMENTS: DURING BID SOLICITATION
NO 2012-258 DATES.
2. COMPACT SEDAN 4 - DOOR $25,521.54 NO BID NO BID NO BID
YEAR/MAKE 2013 FORD
MODEL NUMBER FUSION SE
3. MID-SIZE SEDAN 4 - DOOR $25,521.54 $28,956.00 $23,949.00 NO BID
YEAR/MAKE 2013 FORD 2013 BUICK LACROSSE 2012 TOYOTA
MODEL NUMBER FUSION SE 4GB69 CAMEREL
4. MID-SIZE SEDAN 4 - DOGOR $25,5621.54 $29,240.88 NO BID NO BID
YEAR/MAKE 2013 FORD 2013 BUICK LACROSSE
MODEL NUMBER FUSION SE B8 WITH SPARE ﬁmﬁ ™
e = PR R T S = = S
AUTOMOBILES COMPACT MID-SIZE OO_<_v>O._. MID-SIZE COMPACT MID-SIZE COMPACT MID-SIZE
POWER SEATS STD STD NO BID STD NO YES N/A NO BID
CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL STD STD NO BID STD NO/YES YES STD NO BID
FRONT mcnxmwwmb,._.m STD STD NO BID STD BUCKET BUCKET STD NO BID

zO,_.m The information co

APPROVED BY:

DATE:_ &, Muw 200 2

ACTORS SHALL BE EVALUATED 10 DETERMINE AN AWARDEE.

ined in ==w bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2012-258 CITY HYBRID VEHICLES- GENERAL SERVICES
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

2010

Bid Opening Date: JUNE 20, 2012
Project Name: CITY HYBRID VEHICLES

Solicitation #: 2012-258
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

POE AUTOMOTIVE
CASA FORD INC. CRAWFORD BUICK GMC L.P. PHILPOTT MOTORS DBA EL PASO HONDA
_ .. EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX NEDERLAND, TX EL PASO, TX
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY
GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.
BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:
A. SIXTY [60] DAYS FROM DATE OF AWARD OF THE CONTRACT. YES H NO [ ] YES [ | NO[] YES [X] NO [] YES H No [
|B. NINETY [90] DAYS FROM DATE OF AWARD OF THE CONTRACT. YES [X] No [] YES [X] NO [ ] YES [ | No [] YES [_| No [X]
C. ONE-HUNDRED AND EIGHTY [180] DAYS FROM DATE OF YES H NO _H_ YES @ NOo [ | YES D NO [ | YES D NO H
AWARD OF THE CONTRACT
|D. NO OPTION OFFERED. i D . D
100% - 30 DAYS
PAYMENT TERMS: NET- 30 DAYS 100 % - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD: YES [] NO[X] YES [] NO[ YES [] NOX7] YES [] NO[X ]
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY IS: 84 DAYS 45 DAYS 90-120 DAYS 4 DAYS
Within consecutive calendar davs

_=u BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. PRICE AND OTHER FACTORS SHALL BE EVALUATED TO DETERMINE AN AWARDEE.
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:
oate. 6/2572012_

2012-258 CITY HYBRID VEHICLES- GENERAL SERVICES




CITY OF EL PASO
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Bid Opening Date: JUNE 20, 2012

Solicitation # 2012-259)

Department: GENERAL SERVICES

Project Name: CITY HYBRID VEHICLES

| RUDOLPH CHEVROLET LLC
o ... EL PASO, TX
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1. COMPACT SEDAN 4 - DOOR NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
YEAR/MAKE
MODEL NUMBER
2, COMPACT SEDAN 4 - DOOR NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
YEAR/MAKE
MODEL NUMBER
3. MID-SIZE SEDAN 4 - DOOR $23.853.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
YEAR/MAKE 2013 CHEVROLET
MODEL NUMBER 1GC69
4. MID-SIZE SEDAN 4 - DOOR NQO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
YEAR/MAKE
MODEL NUMBER . . — ‘ * _
AUTOMOBILES o.o,_<__u>3 | ;_U-W_Nm | COMPACT MID-SIZE COMPACT MID-SIZE COMPACT MID-SIZE
POWER SEATS NO BID INC $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL NO BID INC $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
FRONT BUCKET SEATS NO BID INC $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
/
/

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. PRICE AND OTHER FACTORS SHALL BE EVALUATED TO DETERMINE AN AWARDEE.

NOTE: The information coptdined in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

paTE:_6/25/200 2

2012-258 CITY HYBRID VEHICLES- GENERAL SERVICES




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM
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Bid Opening Date: JUNE 20, 2012

Solicitation #: 2012-259
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

Project Name: CITY HYBRID VEHICLES

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF +Im AGREEMENT, BY
GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

A. SIXTY [60] DAYS FROM DATE OF AWARD OF THE CONTRACT.

C. ONE-HUNDRED AND EIGHTY [180] DAYS FROM DATE OF
AWARD OF THE CONTRACT

ID. NO OPTION OFFERED.

RUDOLPH CHEVROLET LLC
EL PASO, TX

B. NINETY [90] DAYS FROM DATE OF AWARD OF THE CONTRACT.

YES [X] NO []

YEs [X] No []

YEs [_] No K]
[ ]

YEs [ | No []
ves [_| no [

vEs [_] nNol] ves [_] NO —
L] []

ves [} no [l

T

ves [_] no []

PAYMENT TERMS: NET 30 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY

PROCUREMENT CARD: YES ] NO[X] YES [] zoET YES (] No[ ]
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY IS: 45 - 60 DAYS

Within consecutive calendar davs

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PRE

VAIL. ADELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

BIDS SOLICITED:

BIDS RECEIVED:

BIDS LOCAL:

NO BIDS:

NOTE: THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT. PRICE AND OTHER FACTORS SHALL BE EVALUATED TO DETERMINE AN AWARDEE.
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:
DATE: &/ 25/ 20/ 2

2012-258 CITY HYBRID VEHICLES- GENERAL SERVICES




