Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 12, 2012
Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-083
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

BARON CHEMICAL CO., INC. CHEMRITE, INC.
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
T exrevoro T e
iTEM || ESTIMATED | UNIT OF TOTAL 3-YEARTOTAL|  yNIT OF TOTAL 3-YEAR TOTAL
NO ANNUAL DESCRIPTION MEASURE UNIT PRICE (ANNUAL MEASURE UNIT PRICE (ANNUAL
| QUANTITY (ESTIMATED EXTENDED (ESTIMATED EXTENDED
E— ANNUAL QTY x TOTAL x 3) ANNUAL QTY x TOTAL x 3)
UNIT PRICE) UNIT PRICE)
3 INCH TRI CHLOR TABLES W/STABILIZER
1. 110 | SLOW DISSOLVING For ouTboOR POOLS 50 50 LBS/PAIL $94.50 $10,395.00 $31,185.00 50 LBS/PAIL $114.50 $12,595.00 $37,785.00
LB. (TO BE DELIVERED ON AS NEEDED BASIS BIDDER'S AMOUNT:
TO CHELSEA AQUATIC FACILITY) 40 LBS.
CARBOYS OF ACID FOR BOTH INDOOR AND 15
2. 100 OUTDOOR POOLS 15 GAL/CARBOY (TOBE | . . ooy $68.60 $6,860.00 $20,580.00 | 15 GAL/CARBOY NO BID NO BID NO BID
DELIVERED ON AS NEEDED BASIS TO EACH
AQUATIC FACILITY)
SODIUM BICARBONATE FOR ALL POOLS 50
3. 100 LB. BAG (TO BE DELIVERED ON AS NEEDED || 50 LBS/BAG $20.00 $2,000.00 $6,000.00 50 LBS/ BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID
BASIS TO CHELSEA AQUATIC FACILITY) BAG
SODIUM THIOSULFATE TO LOWER CHLORINE
4 2 LEVELS WHEN TOO HIGH ONE (50) LB 50 LBS /BAG $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 50 LBS /BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID
CONTAINERS (AS NEEDED BASIS)
LIGHT SODA ASH 50 LB. BAG (TO BE
5 20 DELIVERED ON AS NEEDED BASIS TO 50 LBS/ BAG $21.00 $420.00 $1,260.00 50 LBS/ BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID
CHELSEA AQUATIC FACILITY)
POWER POWDER PLUS (DRY CHLORINE) FOR
6. ALL POOLS STABILIZER FOR OUTDOOR (| 100 LBS./PAIL $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 100 LBS./PAIL $139.00 $5,560.00 $16,680.00
40 POOLS 100 LB. PAIL (TO BE DELIVERED ON AS
NEEDED BASIS TO CHELSEA AQUATIC
FACILITY)
20 CLARIFIER OR EQUIVALENT FOR ALL POOLS 12 BTL/CS.
7. 1 QT. BOTTLE (AS NEEDED BASIS) 1 QT BOTTLE $7.80 $156.00 $468.00 1 QT BOTTLE NO BID NO BID NO BID
QT BTL.
QTS. 12/CS.
ALGAECIDE OR EQUIVALENT FOR ALL POOLS
8. 140 | GAL. (AS NEEDED BASIS) 1 GALLON $14.50 $2,088.00 $6,264.00 1 GALLON NO BID NO BID NO BID
QT BTL. 144 (12 C/S)

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulat

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

/sl

2/14/13

on is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contraci

2013-083 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION




Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 12, 2012
Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010
Solicitation #: 2013-083
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

BARON CHEMICAL CO., INC. CHEMRITE, INC.
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
e enenes e
ITEM | ESTIMATED UNIT OF 3-YEAR TOTAL UNIT OF 3-YEAR TOTAL
NO. | ANNUAL DESCRIPTION MEASURE | UNIT PRICE TOTAL (ANNUAL MEASURE | UNIT PRICE TOTAL (ANNUAL
* | QuANTITY (ESTIMATED EXTENDED (ESTIMATED EXTENDED
ANNUAL QTY x TOTAL x 3) ANNUAL QTY x TOTAL x 3)
UNIT PRICE) UNIT PRICE)
DPD #1 CHLORINE, TEST TABLETS
9 20 1000 TABLETS PER BOX (AS NEEDED | 1000 TABLETS | $122.00 $2,440.00 $8,052.00 | 1000 TABLETS $91.00 $1,820.00 $5,460.00
BASIS) PERBOX | 250 TBLT/BOX = PER BOX
8/CS=2,-000/CS
PHENOL RED, Ph, TEST TABLETS 1000 (1000 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS
10. 20 TABLES PER BOX (AS NEEDED BASIS) PER BOX NO BID $0.00 $0.00 PER BOX $91.00 $1,820.00 $5,460.00
DPD #3, TOTAL CHLORINE TEST,
11. 10 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX (AS 1000 TABLETS $65.50 $655.00 $1,965.00 1000 TABLETS $91.00 $910.00 $2,730.00
PER BOX 50 TABLET/PAC/12 PER BOX
NEEDED BASIS) PKS/BOX = 600
TABS/BOX
ALK. M/2 LOW RANGE, TOTAL ALKALITY,
12. 3 TEST TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX waLA:c';)ETS $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 waLA:c';)ETS $91.00 $273.00 $819.00
(AS NEEDED BASIS)
BOX (CS) 240 TABLETS/PACK
13. 0 o e ben ooy | 1000 TABLETS | $24.95 $49.90 $149.70 | 1000 TABLETS | $91.00 $182.00 $546.00
(AS NEEDED BASIS) PER BOX 240 TABLETS PER CS/12 PER BOX
PACKS/CS =240 TABS
CyA, CYANURIC ACID, TEST TABLETS 600 TABLETS
14. 1 1000 TABLETS PER BOX (AS NEEDED ‘°";’ELABBL§TS $99.00 $99.00 $297.00 ‘°";’ELABBL§TS $142.00 $142.00 $426.00
BASIS) o 12 PACS/50 = o
600/BOX
INSTRUMENTAL DPD #1, CHLORINE, TEST
15. 5 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX (AS waLA:c';)ETS $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 waLA:c';)ETS NO BID NO BID NO BID
NEEDED BASIS)
INSTRUMENTAL PHENOL RED, Ph, TEST
16. 5 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX (AS 100:ELA:;§TS $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 1°?ELA:§TS NO BID NO BID NO BID
NEEDED BASIS)

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulat

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

/sl

2/14/13

on is for information only and does not

2013-083 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION

onstitute actual award/execution of contracl



Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 12, 2012
Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-083
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

BARON CHEMICAL CO., INC. CHEMRITE, INC.
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
omont | extenoeo aoons | exrenceo
iTEm || ESTIMATED UNIT OF TOTAL 3-YEAR TOTAL UNIT OF TOTAL 3-YEAR TOTAL
ANNUAL DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE (ANNUAL UNIT PRICE (ANNUAL
NO. I quaNTITY MEASURE (ESTIMATED EXTENDED MEASURE (ESTIMATED EXTENDED
_ ANNUAL QTY x TOTAL X 3) ANNUAL QTY x TOTAL x 3)
UNIT PRICE) UNIT PRICE)
INSTRUMENTAL DPD #3, TOTAL
17. 5  |CHLORINE TEST, TABLETS 1000 TABLETs| 1000 TABLETS $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 1000 TABLETS | NO BID NO BID NO BID
PER BOX (AS NEEDED BASIS) PER BOX PER BOX
INSTRUMENTAL ALK. M/2 LOW RANGE,
18. 5 TOTAL ALKALITY, TEST TABLETS 1000 1000 TABLETS $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 1000 TABLETS NO BID NO BID NO BID
TABLETS PER BOX (AS NEEDED BASIS) PER BOX PER BOX
19. ] 'NSTE;’,';";':;QSL ﬁ:gﬁ.‘:ﬁ;‘fﬁfsfo“gf'”” 1000 TABLETS|  $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 1000 TABLETS | NO BID NO BID NO BID
TABLETS PER BOX (AS NEEDED BASIS) PER BOX PER BOX
INSTRUMENTAL CyA, CYANURIC ACID,
20. 1 TEST TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX 1°?ELA:$TS $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 waLA:c';)ETS NO BID NO BID NO BID
(AS NEEDED BASIS)
21. Co2 CANISTERS, 50 LB CANISTERS (TO | 55| g $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 50 LB NO BID NO BID NO BID
48 BE DELIVERED ON AS NEEDED BASISTO|| .\ \cor oo CANISTERS
PAT O'ROURKE AQUATIC FACILITY)
PHOSPHATE REMOVER (AS NEEDED
22, 10 BASIS) ( QT/BOTTLE $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 QT/BOTTLE NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 INCH CHLORINE TABLETS (SLOW
23. 416 RELEASE CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE 50LBS $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 S0LBS $92.00 $38,272.00 | $114,816.00
TABLETS FOR EROSION FEEDER) PAIL/BUCKET PAIL/BUCKET
$25,162.90 $76,220.70 $61,574.00 | $184,722.00
GRAND TOTAL - ITEMS 1-23 BIDDER'S PRICE: BIDDER'S PRICE: | BIDDER'S PRICE:
NONE $59,754.00 $179,262.00
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contracti
APPROVED BY:___/s/
DATE: 2/14/13 2013-083 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION 3




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 12, 2012
Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS

El Paso

All-America City

2010
Solicitation #: 2013-083
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

BARON CHEMICAL CO., INC.
EL PASO, TX

CHEMRITE, INC.
EL PASO, TX

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT
THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING |
THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. I
BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM
OF THE CONTRACT FOR: |

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), " X
EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE

CONTRACT: || PLUS PRICE INCREASE OF 5% PER ITEM.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXIPRATION OF THE ORIGINAL |z|
TERM OF THE CONTRACT: PLUS PRICE INCREASE AGAIN OF 5%.

[]

NO OPTION OFFERED |:|

[ ]

PAYMENT TERMS: 11/2% - 10 DAYS

NET 30 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY YES E qu
PROCUREMENT CARD:

YES N0|:|

ADDITIONAL 3.5% CHARGE WILL APPLY
IF PROCUREMENT CARD IS USED

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
Within ___ consecutive calendar days.

14

5

Within ____ hours or overnight after receipt of verba 24
order in cases of emergency.

24

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/14/13 2013-083 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION



Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 12, 2012
Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

"1

'V

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-083
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

ENVIRONMENTAL COMPLIANCE RESOSURCES, LLC

LESLIE'S POOLMART, INC.

CHEYENNE, WY PHOENIX, AZ
ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXTENDED ANNUAL EXTENDED
ITEM | =0 | UNIT OF EXTENDED | 3-YEAR TOTAL UNIT OF EXTENDED | 3-YEAR TOTAL
ANNUAL
NO. | ANWUAL DESCRIPTION MEASURE UNIT PRICE TOTAL (ANNUAL MEASURE UNIT PRICE TOTAL (ANNUAL
(ESTIMATED EXTENDED (ESTIMATED EXTENDED
3 INCH TRI CHLOR TABLES W/STABILIZER 35 LBS/PAIL
SLOW DISSOLVING FOR OUTDOOR POOLS 50
1. 110 |5 (10 BE DELIVERED ON AS NEEDED BAsIs| 59 LBS/PAIL NO BID NO BID NO BID 50 LBS/PAIL $72.95 $11,453.15 | $34,359.45
TO CHELSEA AQUATIC FACILITY)
CARBOYS OF ACID FOR BOTH INDOOR AND
OUTDOOR POOLS 15 GAL./CARBOY (TO BE 15
2. 100 | o1 1veRED ON AS NEEDED BASIS To EACH | caLcareoy |  NO BID NO BID NOBID | 15GALCARBOY | NO BID NO BID $0.00
AQUATIC FACILITY)
SODIUM BICARBONATE FOR ALL POOLS 50
3. 100 | LB.BAG (TO BE DELIVERED ON AS NEEDED | 50 LBS/ BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID 50 LBS/ BAG $15.49 $1,549.00 $4,647.00
BASIS TO CHELSEA AQUATIC FACILITY)
SODIUM THIOSULFATE TO LOWER CHLORINE
4. 2 LEVELS WHEN TOO HIGH ONE (50) LB 50 LBS /BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID 50 LBS /BAG $39.95 $79.90 $239.70
CONTAINERS (AS NEEDED BASIS)
LIGHT SODA ASH 50 LB. BAG (TO BE
5. 20 DELIVERED ON AS NEEDED BASIS TO 50 LBS/ BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID 50 LBS/ BAG $15.49 $309.80 $929.40
CHELSEA AQUATIC FACILITY)
POWER POWDER PLUS (DRY CHLORINE) FOR
ALL POOLS STABILIZER FOR OUTDOOR
6. 40 POOLS 100 LB. PAIL (TO BE DELIVERED ON AS| 100 LBS./PAIL NO BID NO BID NO BID 100 LBS./PAIL $128.95 $5,158.00 $15,474.00
NEEDED BASIS TO CHELSEA AQUATIC
FACILITY)
CLARIFIER OR EQUIVALENT FOR ALL POOLS
7. 20 1 QT. BOTTLE (AS NEEDED BASIS) 1QT BOTTLE NO BID NO BID NO BID 1 QT BOTTLE $5.45 $109.00 $327.00
ALGAECIDE OR EQUIVALENT FOR ALL POOLS
8. 140 1 GAL. (AS NEEDED BASIS) 1 GALLON NO BID NO BID NO BID 1 GALLON $49.95 $6,993.00 $20,979.00
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY:___/s/
DATE: 2/14/13 2013-083 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION 5




Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 12, 2012
Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-083
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

ENVIRONMENTAL COMPLIANCE RESOSURCES, LLC

LESLIE'S POOLMART, INC.

CHEYENNE, WY PHOENIX, AZ
ESTIMATED ANNUAL =ATEINUEL ANNUAL =ATENDELD
'L%M ANNUAL DESCRIPTION MUE'\LI;L?:E UNITPRICE | EXTENDED | 3-YEAR TOTAL MUE':\';L?:E UNITPRICE | EXTENDED | 3YEAR TOTAL
) w TOTAL I:(VTI:L?nI:n TOTAL |=(VT|='\|n|=n
DPD #1 CHLORINE, TEST TABLETS
’ 1000 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS
9. | 20 | 1000 TABLETS PER BOX (ASNEEDED | "L o' NO BID NO BID NO BID PER BOX $77.95 | $1,550.00 | $4,677.00
BASIS)
PHENOL RED, Ph, TEST TABLETS 1000 | 1000 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS
10. | 20 | 7.5 Es PER BOX (AS NEEDED BASIS) | | PER BOX NO BID NO BID NO BID e $77.95 | $1,559.00 | $4,677.00
DPD #3, TOTAL CHLORINE TEST,
11.| 10 | TaBLETS 1000 TABLETS PERBOX (as | °h TPL°TS | NO BID NO BID NoBID | NIELTS | $77.95 $779.50 | $2,338.50
NEEDED BASIS)
ALK. M/2 LOW RANGE, TOTAL ALKALITY
? ’| 1000 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS
12. | 3 | TESTTABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX | Lo NO BID NO BID NO BID PER BOX $77.95 $233.85 $701.55
(AS NEEDED BASIS)
Ca HARDNESS, CALCIUM HARDNESS,
13.| 2 | TesTTABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX | "R ELETS | NO BID NO BID NnoBID | NS | s77.95 $155.90 $467.70
(AS NEEDED BASIS)
CyA, CYANURIC ACID, TEST TABLETS
14, 1 1000 TABLETS PER BOX (AS NEEDED | "% TASLETS | o gip NO BID NOBID | Moo s | $113.95 $113.95 $341.85
BASIS)
INSTRUMENTAL DPD #1, CHLORINE, TEST
2 ) 1000 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS
15. | 5 | TABLETS1000 TABLETS PERBOX (AS | ' popoy NO BID NO BID NO BID PER BOX $77.95 $389.75 | $1,160.25
NEEDED BASIS)
INSTRUMENTAL PHENOL RED, Ph, TEST
16. | 5 | TABLETS1000TABLETS PERBOX (as | "% "B TS| NO BID NO BID NOBID | NS | $77.95 $389.75 | $1,169.25
NEEDED BASIS)
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract. o
APPROVED BY: /sl
DATE: 2/14/13 2013-083 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION 6



Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 12, 2012
Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

'l

2010

IV

Solicitation #: 2013-083
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

ENVIRONMENTAL COMPLIANCE RESOSURCES, LLC

LESLIE'S POOLMART, INC.

CHEYENNE, WY PHOENIX, AZ
ANNUAL EXTENDED ANNUAL EXTENDED
ESTIMATED EXTENDED 3-YEAR TOTAL EXTENDED 3-YEAR TOTAL
Mo | ANNuAL DESCRIPTION \easome | UNIT PRICE TOTAL (ANNUAL eASORE | UNIT PRICE TOTAL (ANNUAL
) QUANTITY (ESTIMATED EXTENDED (ESTIMATED EXTENDED
ANNUAL QTY x TOTAL x 3) ANNUAL QTY x TOTAL x 3)
INSTRUMENTAL DPD #3, TOTAL
’ 1000 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS
17. 5 |CHLORINE TEST, TABLETS 1000 TABLETS| " o'~ NO BID NO BID NO BID DER BOX $77.95 $389.75 $1,169.25
PER BOX (AS NEEDED BASIS)
INSTRUMENTAL ALK. M/2 LOW RANGE,
18. 5 | TOTALALKALITY, TEST TABLETS 1000 | "% TERMETS | o BID NO BID NOBID | “mroor' > | $109.95 $549.75 $1,649.25
TABLETS PER BOX (AS NEEDED BASIS)
INSTRUMENTAL Ca HARDNESS, CALCIUM
19. | 1 HARDNESS, TESTTABLETS 1000 | "% TAPLETS | No BID NO BID NnoBID | NI | $100.95 | $100.95 $320.85
TABLETS PER BOX (AS NEEDED BASIS)
INSTRUMENTAL CyA, CYANURIC ACID, 1000 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS
20. 1 | TEST TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX NO BID NO BID NO BID 100.95 100.95 329.85
(AS NEEDED BASIS) PER BOX PER BOX $ $ $
Co2 CANISTERS, 50 LB CANISTERS (TO 50 LB 50 LB
21. 48 BE DELIVERED ON AS NEEDED BASIS TO NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.00
PAT O'ROURKE AQUATIC FACILITY) CANISTERS CANISTERS
3 LITER
22. | 10 | PHOSATER e (o TS0 | QUEOTTLE | NO BID NO BID NOBID | OTBOTILE | $42.95 $128.85 $386.55
3 INCH CHLORINE TABLETS (SLOW 50 LBS EQUIVALENT TO 50 LBS
23. | 416 | RELEASECALCIUMHYPOCHLORITE | .. "or s | $98.50 $40,976.00 | $122,928.00 | pansucker | NO BID NO BID $0.00
TABLETS FOR EROSION FEEDER) SEE ATTACHED
GRAND TOTAL - ITEMS 1-23 $40,976.00 | $122,928.00 $32,120.80 | $96,362.40
BIDDER'S PRICE: BIDDER'S PRICE:
NONE NONE

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

/sl

2/14/13

2013-083 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 12, 2012
Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS

El Paso

All-America City

11K
2010

Solicitation #: 2013-083
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

ENVIRONMENTAL COMPLIANCE RESOSURCES, LLC
CHEYENNE, WY

LESLIE'S POOLMART, INC.
PHOENIX, AZ

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT
THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING |
THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. I
BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM
OF THE CONTRACT FOR: |

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), || X
EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE
CONTRACT: || PLUS PRICE INCREASE OF 5% PER ITEM

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXIPRATION OF THE ORIGINAL |:|
TERM OF THE CONTRACT: PLUS PRICE INCREASE AGAIN OF 5%

]

NO OPTION OFFERED |:|

X

PAYMENT TERMS: NET 30 DAYS

NET 30 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY YES [ | NO x |
PROCUREMENT CARD:

YES NO[]

ADDITIONAL 3.5% CHARGE WILL APPLY
IF PROCUREMENT CARD IS USED

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
Within ____ consecutive calendar days.

5

3-5

Within ____ hours or overnight after receipt of verba 48

. ALL EXPENSES FOR THIS SPECIAL HANDLING AND ALL EXPIDITED
order in cases of emergency. FREIGHT WILL BE CHARGED TO THE CITY OF EL PASO, TX.

24

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/14/13 2013-083 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION



El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO

All-America City

BID TABULATION FORM N |
2010
Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 12, 2012 Solicitation #: 2013-083
Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS Department: PARKS AND RECREATION
MAYFIELD POOL SUPPLY, LP PROGRRESSIVE POOL SYSTEMS
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
TEM ESTIMATED UNIT OF ANNUAL EXTENDED UNIT OF ANNUAL EXTENDED

T EXTENDED 3-YEAR TOTAL EXTENDED 3-YEAR TOTAL

NO. % DESCRIPTION MEASURE UNIT PRICE TOTAL (ANNUAL MEASURE UNIT PRICE TOTAL (ANNUAL

(ESTIMATED EXTENDED (ESTIMATED EXTENDED

3 INCH TRI CHLOR TABLES W/STABILIZER

1. 110 | e T0 be DELERED On A NEEDED BAGS| 50LBSPPAIL | $104.00 $11,440.00 | $34,320.00 | 50LBS/PAIL $100.67 | $11,073.70 | $33,221.10

TO CHELSEA AQUATIC FACILITY)

CARBOYS OF ACID FOR BOTH INDOOR AND

2. | 100 | ou/\VeRED ON AS NEEDED BASIS 10 £ACH | GALCARBOY |  NO BID NO BID NOBID |[15GALCARBOY| $84.15 $8,415.00 | $25,245.00
AQUATIC FACILITY)

SODIUM BICARBONATE FOR ALL POOLS 50

3. 100 LB. BAG (TO BE DELIVERED ON AS NEEDED | 50 LBS/ BAG $23.10 $2,310.00 $6,930.00 50 LBS/ BAG $35.70 $3,570.00 $10,710.00
BASIS TO CHELSEA AQUATIC FACILITY)

SODIUM THIOSULFATE TO LOWER CHLORINE

4. 2 LEVELS WHEN TOO HIGH ONE (50) LB 50 LBS /BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID 50 LBS /BAG $87.00 $174.00 $522.00
CONTAINERS (AS NEEDED BASIS)

LIGHT SODA ASH 50 LB. BAG (TO BE

5. 20 DELIVERED ON AS NEEDED BASIS TO 50 LBS/ BAG $30.19 $603.80 $1,811.40 50 LBS/ BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID
CHELSEA AQUATIC FACILITY)

POWER POWDER PLUS (DRY CHLORINE) FOR
ALL POOLS STABILIZER FOR OUTDOOR
6. 40 POOLS 100 LB. PAIL (TO BE DELIVERED ON As| 100 LBS./PAIL $139.95 $5,598.00 $16,794.00 100 LBS./PAIL $131.60 $5,263.20 $15,789.60
NEEDED BASIS TO CHELSEA AQUATIC
FACILITY)

CLARIFIER OR EQUIVALENT FOR ALL POOLS
20 1 QT. BOTTLE (AS NEEDED BASIS) 1 QT BOTTLE $547 $1 09.44 $32832 1 QT BOTTLE $730 $1 45.80 $43740

ALGAECIDE OR EQUIVALENT FOR ALL POOLS
8. | 140 | GAL. (AS NEEDED BASIS) 1 GALLON $45.60 $6,384.00 | $19,152.00 | 1GALLON $41.00 $5,712.00 | $17,136.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY:___/s/

DATE: 2/14/13 2013-083 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION 9



Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 12, 2012
Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-083
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

MAYFIELD POOL SUPPLY, LP

PROGRRESSIVE POOL SYSTEMS

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXTENDED ANNUAL EXTENDED
ITEM | =0 | UNIT OF EXTENDED | 3-YEAR TOTAL UNIT OF EXTENDED | 3-YEAR TOTAL
NO. % DESCRIPTION MEASURE UNIT PRICE TOTAL (ANNUAL MEASURE UNIT PRICE TOTAL (ANNUAL
(ESTIMATED EXTENDED (ESTIMATED EXTENDED
DPD #1 CHLORINE, TEST TABLETS 999 - 1000
y 1000 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS
9. 20 1000 TABLETS PER BOX (AS NEEDED | 0 o0 o $58.63 $1,172.60 | $3,517.80 PER BOX $42.00 $840.00 $2,520.00
BASIS)
o s . . 6915A-M s
PHENOL RED, Ph, TEST TABLETS 1000 | 1000 TABLET 1000 TABLET
10. | 20 | 1a5iEs PER BOX (AS NEEDED BASIS) | PER BOX $58.63 $1,172.60 | $3,517.80 DER BOX $42.00 $840.00 $2,520.00
DPD #3, TOTAL CHLORINE TEST B197e (100
#3, , COUNT)
1000 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS
11. | 10 | TABLETS1000 TABLETS PERBOX (AS | ""ppp oy $119.16 $1,191.60 | $3,574.80 PER BOX $42.00 $420.00 $1,260.00
NEEDED BASIS)
ALK. M/2 LOW RANGE, TOTAL ALKALITY 3920A-M
) ’| 1000 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS
12, 3 TEST TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PERBOX | [ o0 o $58.625 $175.88 $527.64 PER BOX $92.00 $276.00 $828.00
(AS NEEDED BASIS)
Ca HARDNESS, CALCIUM HARDNESS 68163 (100
a \ . COUNT)
1000 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS
2 TEST TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX 1 2 184 2
13. (AS NEEDED BASIS) PER BOX $56.50 $113.00 $339.00 PER BOX $92.00 $184.00 $552.00
6994-J (100
CyA, CYANURIC ACID, TEST TABLETS |/ o oo COUNT) 1000 TABLETS
14. 1 1000 TABLETS ';'i';‘;;’" (ASNEEDED | "pep gox $56.50 $56.50 $169.50 PER BOX $92.00 $92.00 $276.00
INSTRUMENTAL DPD #1, CHLORINE, TEST
’ ’ 1000 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS
15. 5 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PERBOX (AS || oo o'0 o NO BID NO BID NO BID PER BOX $92.00 $460.00 $1,380.00
NEEDED BASIS)
INSTRUMENTAL PHENOL RED, Ph, TEST
16. | 5 | TABLETS1000TABLETS PERBOX (as | "% "B TS| NO BID NO BID NoBID | NIRRT | $92.00 $460.00 | $1,380.00
NEEDED BASIS)
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY:___/s/
DATE: ___ 2/14/13 2013-083 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION 10



Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 12, 2012
Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

'l

2010

'V

Solicitation #: 2013-083
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

MAYFIELD POOL SUPPLY, LP

PROGRRESSIVE POOL SYSTEMS

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ANNUAL EXTENDED ANNUAL EXTENDED
ESTIMATED EXTENDED 3-YEAR TOTAL EXTENDED 3-YEAR TOTAL
Mo | ANNuAL DESCRIPTION \easone | UNIT PRICE TOTAL (ANNUAL eASORE | UNIT PRICE TOTAL (ANNUAL
) QUANTITY (ESTIMATED EXTENDED (ESTIMATED EXTENDED
ANNUAL QTY x TOTAL x 3) ANNUAL QTY x TOTAL x 3)
INSTRUMENTAL DPD #3, TOTAL
’ 1000 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS
17. 5  |CHLORINE TEST, TABLETS 1000 TABLETS| '~ 0~ NO BID NO BID NO BID DER BOX 92.00 $460.00 $1,380.00
PER BOX (AS NEEDED BASIS)
INSTRUMENTAL ALK. M/2 LOW RANGE,
18.| 5 | ToTALALKALTY,TESTTABLETS 1000 | "% TABLTS| NG BID NO BID NoBID | N TAETS | $92.00 $460.00 | $1,380.00
TABLETS PER BOX (AS NEEDED BASIS)
INSTRUMENTAL Ca HARDNESS, CALCIUM
19. 1 HARDNESS, TEST TABLETS 1000 10?ELA:§TS NO BID NO BID NO BID 10?ELA:§TS $92.00 $92.00 $276.00
TABLETS PER BOX (AS NEEDED BASIS)
INSTRUMENTAL CyA, CYANURIC ACID, 1000 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS
20. 1 | TEST TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX NO BID NO BID NO BID 92.00 92.00 276.00
(AS NEEDED BASIS) PER BOX PER BOX $ $ $
Co2 CANISTERS, 50 LB CANISTERS (TO 50 LB 50 LB
21. | 48 |BEDELIVERED ON AS NEEDED BASIS TO NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PAT O'ROURKE AQUATIC FACILITY) CANISTERS CANISTERS
22. | 10 | PHOSATER e o TS0 | QUBOTTLE | $26.43 $264.30 $792.90 | OTBOTTLE |  $29.60 $296.00 $888.00
3 INCH CHLORINE TABLETS (SLOW 50 LBS 50 LBS
23. | 416 | RELEASE CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE $110.00 | $45,760.00 | $137,280.00 $110.16 | $45,826.56 | $137,479.68
TABLETS FOR EROSION FEEDER) PAIL/BUCKET PAIL/BUCKET
GRAND TOTAL - ITEMS 1-23 $76,351.72 | $229,055.16 $85,152.26 | $255,456.78

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

/sl

2/14/13

2013-083 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION

1




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 12, 2012
Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-083
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

MAYFIELD POOL SUPPLY, LP
EL PASO, TX

PROGRRESSIVE POOL SYSTEMS
EL PASO, TX

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT
THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING |
THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. I
BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM
OF THE CONTRACT FOR: |

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), |
EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE [:
CONTRACT: ||

L]

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXIPRATION OF THE ORIGINAL |:|
TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

NO OPTION OFFERED

[ ]

PAYMENT TERMS: NET 30 DAYS

NET 30 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY YES [ | NO x |
PROCUREMENT CARD:

YES [ ] NO[x]

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
Within ____ consecutive calendar days.

LEFT BLANK

Within ____ hours or overnight after receipt of verba 48
order in cases of emergency.

LEFT BLANK

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/14/13

2013-083 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION

12




Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 12, 2012

Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-083
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

TRIPLE-S JANITORIAL SUPPLIES

TRIPLE-S JANITORIAL SUPPLIES

EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX .
(ALTERNATE)
ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXTENDED ANNUAL EXTENDED
ITEM | = S -== UNIT OF EXTENDED | 3-YEAR TOTAL UNIT OF EXTENDED | 3-YEAR TOTAL
NO. (m—uﬁ.h DESCRIPTION MEASURE UNIT PRICE TOTAL (ANNUAL MEASURE UNIT PRICE TOTAL (ANNUAL
(ESTIMATED EXTENDED (ESTIMATED EXTENDED
3 INCH TRI CHLOR TABLES W/STABILIZER
SLOW DISSOLVING FOR OUTDOOR POOLS 50
1. 110 |5 (70 BE DELIVERED ON AS NEEDED BASIs| 50 LBS/PAIL $98.70 $10,857.00 | $32,571.00 | 50LBS/PAIL NO BID NO BID NO BID
TO CHELSEA AQUATIC FACILITY)
DEPOSIT OF $30.00 PER
DRUM; MIN 4 HR PER
CARBOYS OF ACID FOR BOTH INDOOR AND LOCATION DELIVERY
100 OUTDOOR POOLS 15 GAL./CARBOY (TO BE 15
2. DELIVERED ON AS NEEDED BASIS TO EACH | ~r) /cARBOY $82.50 $8,250.00 $24,750.00 |/ 15 GAL/CARBOY NO BID NO BID NO BID
AQUATIC FACILITY)
$15 CHARGE PER
MISSING LID
SODIUM BICARBONATE FOR ALL POOLS 50
3. 100 LB. BAG (TO BE DELIVERED ON AS NEEDED || 50 LBS/ BAG $35.00 $3,500.00 $10,500.00 50 LBS/ BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID
BASIS TO CHELSEA AQUATIC FACILITY)
SODIUM THIOSULFATE TO LOWER CHLORINE
4 2 LEVELS WHEN TOO HIGH ONE (50) LB 50 LBS /BAG $85.00 $170.00 $510.00 50 LBS /BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID
CONTAINERS (AS NEEDED BASIS)
LIGHT SODA ASH 50 LB. BAG (TO BE
5 20 DELIVERED ON AS NEEDED BASIS TO 50 LBS/ BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID 50 LBS/ BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID
CHELSEA AQUATIC FACILITY)
PUWER PUWDUER PLUS (DRY bHLUI'ﬂ'NI:) FUR
ALL POOLS STABILIZER FOR OUTDOOR
6 40 (PoOLS 100 LB. PAIL (TO BE DELIVERED ON AS| 100 LBS./PAIL $129.00 $5,160.00 $15,480.00 100 LBS./PAIL NO BID NO BID NO BID
NEEDED BASIS TO CHELSEA AQUATIC
EACILITV)
CLARIFIER OR EQUIVALENT FOR ALL POOLS
7 20 1 QT. BOTTLE (AS NEEDED BASIS) 1 QT BOTTLE $7.15 $143.00 $429.00 1QT BOTTLE NO BID NO BID NO BID
ALGAECIDE OR EQUIVALENT FOR ALL POOLS
8. 140 1 GAL. (AS NEEDED BASIS) 1 GALLON $40.00 $5,600.00 $16,800.00 1 GALLON $69.90 $9,786.00 $29,358.00
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY:___/s/
DATE: 2/14/13 2013-083 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION 13




Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 12, 2012
Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-083
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

TRIPLE-S JANITORIAL SUPPLIES

TRIPLE-S JANITORIAL SUPPLIES

Eoson
'L':')'\_" % DESCRIPTION MUE':;S:E UNIT PRICE EQT':EE;[?FD 3'i%§§§f“- MUE':;S:E UNIT PRICE EQT':EE;[?FD 3'i%§§§f“-
9. | 20 135007?;:;22%5‘55%\? NEEDED O ook | $41.00 $820.00 | $2,460.00 | mnmox .| NOBID | NOBID NO BID
)
.| 2 |nmemmmmmmess oo o | s | sanco | TISST | womp | wosn | oso
11.| 10 | TasLersioon TasLErs pen Box ias O x| $41.00 $410.00 | $1,23000 | "N | NoBID | NOBID NO BID
NEEDED BASIS)
12.| 3 ATLEIETMT/iIé%%25%355:{::: Box 1000TRBLETS | $90.00 $270.00 $810.00 | remmox . | NOBID NO BID NO BID
13.| 2 | TesTTaBLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX O mbox | $90.00 $180.00 $540.00 | W™ | NOBID | NOBID NO BID
(AS NEEDED BASIS)
14 1| S ‘T:ZQ[lg:slc:%gllgo;E;TsTrf:ELDEgs O ERBOx |  $90.00 $90.00 $27000 | “reex S| NOBID | NOBID NO BID
SIS)
15| 5 | Tamterst t:?)Ei/':E%%éEE(;R&i oS ERBOX | $90.00 $450.00 | $1,350.00 | ‘prrsox | NOBID | NOBID NO BID
)
16.| 5 | TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX (A6 1000TRBLETS | $90.00 $450.00 | $1,350.00 | “hneox . | NOBID NO BID NO BID
NEEDED BASIS)

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

/sl

2/14/13

2013-083 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION

14



Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 12, 2012
Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

up’
2010

Solicitation #: 2013-083
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

TRIPLE-S JANITORIAL SUPPLIES

TRIPLE-S JANITORIAL SUPPLIES

EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX (ALTERNATE)
TEM ESTIMATED UNIT OF ANNUAL EXTENDED UNIT OF ANNUAL EXTENDED
RPTTTTOR EXTENDED 3-YEAR TOTAL EXTENDED 3-YEAR TOTAL
NO. % DESCRIPTION MEASURE UNIT PRICE TOTAL (ANNUAL MEASURE UNIT PRICE TOTAL (ANNUAL
(ESTIMATED EXTENDED (ESTIMATED EXTENDED
INSTRUMENTAL DPD #3, TOTAL
> 1000 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS
17. 5  |CHLORINE TEST, TABLETS 1000 TABLETS| ' o0 b o $90.00 $450.00 $1,350.00 DER BOX NO BID NO BID NO BID
PER BOX (AS NEEDED BASIS)
INSTRUMENTAL ALK. M/2 LOW RANGE,
18. | 5 | TOTALALKALITY, TESTTABLETS 1000 | *N HELETS | 990,00 $450.00 | $1,350.00 | NPT | NOBID NO BID NO BID
TABLETS PER BOX (AS NEEDED BASIS)
INSTRUMENTAL Ca HARDNESS, CALCIUM
19, 1 HARDNESS, TESTTABLETS 1000 | 'Ch /ooC 0| $90.00 $90.00 $27000 | DTEETS | NOBID NO BID NO BID
TABLETS PER BOX (AS NEEDED BASIS)
INSTRUMENTAL CyA, CYANURIC ACID,
1000 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS
20. 1 | TEST TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX $90.00 $90.00 $270.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
(AS NEEDED BASIS) PER BOX PER BOX
Co2 CANISTERS, 50 LB CANISTERS (TO 50 LB 50 LB
21.| 48 |BEDELIVERED ONASNEEDEDBASISTO| . ° =2 | NOBID NO BID NO BID canarens | NOBID NO BID NO BID
PAT O'ROURKE AQUATIC FACILITY)
22. | 10 | PRSI (o PEC | QUBOTTLE | $28.95 $289.50 $868.50 | QUBOTTLE | $425.00 | $425.00 | $1,275.00
ACCUTAB 40 NSF -
NON NSF. 50
3 INCH CHLORINE TABLETS (SLOW 50 LBS 50 ‘_‘r':';f“:l’ED 50 LBS TABLET
41 6 RELEASE CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE
23. TABLETS FOR EROSION FEEDER) PAIL/BUCKET $116.40 $43,888.00 | $131,664.00 | PAIL/BUCKET $108.00 $44,928.00 | $134,784.00
GRAND TOTAL - ITEMS 1-23 $82,427.50 | $247,282.50 $55,139.00 | $165,417.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

/sl

2/14/13

2013-083 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION

15



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 12, 2012
Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS

El Paso

All-America City

‘\J
2010

Solicitation #: 2013-083
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

TRIPLE-S JANITORIAL SUPPLIES
EL PASO, TX

TRIPLE-S JANITORIAL SUPPLIES
EL PASO, TX
(ALTERNATE)

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT
THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING |

THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. |
BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM
OF THE CONTRACT FOR: |

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), |
EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE D

CONTRACT: || PLUS PRICE INCREASE OF 5% PER ITEM

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXIPRATION OF THE ORIGINAL
TERM OF THE CONTRACT: PLUS PRICE INCREASE AGAIN OF 5%

NO OPTION OFFERED |:|

]

PAYMENT TERMS: NET 30 DAYS

NET 30 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY YES [ | NO[x |
PROCUREMENT CARD:

YES [ ] NO[x]

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
Within ___ consecutive calendar days.

LEFT BLANK

Within ____ hours or overnight after receipt of verba 4
order in cases of emergency.

LEFT BLANK

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/14/13 2013-083 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION

16



Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 12, 2012
Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

'l

'V

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-083
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

W. M. SMITH & ASSOCIATES, INC. dba WMS AQUATICS
ELLENSBURG, WA

ANNUAL EXTENDED ANNUAL EXTENDED
ESTIMATED EXTENDED 3-YEAR TOTAL EXTENDED 3-YEAR TOTAL
TEM | anuaL DESCRIPTION \easone | UNITPRICE | ToTAL annuaL | EPRCT | UNITPRICE | TOTAL (ANNUAL
* | QUANTITY (ESTIMATED EXTENDED (ESTIMATED EXTENDED
ANNUAL QTY x TOTAL x 3) ANNUAL QTY x TOTAL x 3)
3 INCH TRI CHLOR TABLES W/STABILIZER
SLOW DISSOLVING FOR OUTDOOR POOLS 50
1. 110 | & (TO BE DELIVERED ON AS NEEDED BAsis| 50 LBS/PAIL NO BID NO BID NO BID 50 LBS/PAIL
TO CHELSEA AQUATIC FACILITY)
CARBOYS OF ACID FOR BOTH INDOOR AND
OUTDOOR POOLS 15 GAL./CARBOY (TO BE 15
2. 100 DELIVERED ON AS NEEDED BASIS TO EACH | GAL/CARBOY NO BID NO BID NO BID 15 GAL/CARBOY
AQUATIC FACILITY)
SODIUM BICARBONATE FOR ALL POOLS 50
3. 100 LB. BAG (TO BE DELIVERED ON AS NEEDED | 50 LBS/ BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID 50 LBS/ BAG
BASIS TO CHELSEA AQUATIC FACILITY)
SODIUM THIOSULFATE TO LOWER CHLORINE
4 2 LEVELS WHEN TOO HIGH ONE (50) LB 50 LBS /BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID 50 LBS /BAG
CONTAINERS (AS NEEDED BASIS)
LIGHT SODA ASH 50 LB. BAG (TO BE
5. 20 DELIVERED ON AS NEEDED BASIS TO 50 LBS/ BAG NO BID NO BID NO BID 50 LBS/ BAG
CHELSEA AQUATIC FACILITY)
PUWER PUWDUER PLUS (DRY bHLUrﬂ'NI:) FUR
ALL POOLS STABILIZER FOR OUTDOOR
6 40 POOLS 100 LB. PAIL (TO BE DELIVERED ON AS|| 100 LBS./PAIL NO BID NO BID NO BID 100 LBS./PAIL
NEEDED BASIS TO CHELSEA AQUATIC
EACILITV)
CLARIFIER OR EQUIVALENT FOR ALL POOLS
7 20 1 QT. BOTTLE (AS NEEDED BASIS) 1QT BOTTLE $15.93 $318.76 $956.28 1QT BOTTLE
ALGAECIDE OR EQUIVALENT FOR ALL POOLS
8. 140 1 GAL. (AS NEEDED BASIS) 1 GALLON $85.70 $11,998.60 $35,995.80 1 GALLON
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY:___/s/
DATE: 2/14/13 2013-083 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION 17




Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 12, 2012

Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

'

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-083
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

W. M. SMITH & ASSOCIATES, INC. dba WMS AQUATICS
ELLENSBURG, WA

RNINUARL ANNUAL
EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED
iTEM | ESTIMATED. UNIT OF TOTAL 3-YEAR TOTAL UNIT OF o 3-YEAR TOTAL
ANNUAL DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE (ANNUAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL (ANNUAL
NO. MEASURE (ESTIMATED MEASURE (ESTIMATED
QUANTITY EXTENDED EXTENDED
ANNUAL QTY x TOTAL x 3) ANNUAL QTY x TOTAL x3)
LINIT PRICE) LINIT PRICF)
DPD #1 CHLORINE, TEST TABLETS
’ 1000 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS
20 1000 TABLETS PER BOX (AS NEEDED PER BOX $75.19 $1,503.94 $4,511.82 PER BOX
BASIS)
PHENOL RED, Ph, TEST TABLETS 1000 (1000 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS
10. 20 TABLES PER BOX (AS NEEDED BASIS) PER BOX $75.19 $1,503.94 $4,511.82 PER BOX
DPD #3, TOTAL CHLORINE TEST,
11. 10 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX (AS 1°?ELA:$§TS $75.19 $751.97 $2,255.91 1°?ELA:$§TS
NEEDED BASIS)
ALK. M/2 LOW RANGE, TOTAL ALKALITY,
12. 3 TEST TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX 1°?ELA:$§TS $75.19 $225.57 $676.71 10%?:35“
(AS NEEDED BASIS)
Ca HARDNESS, CALCIUM HARDNESS,
13. 2 TEST TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX 1°?ELA:$TS $75.19 $150.39 $451.17 1°?ELA:$TS
(AS NEEDED BASIS)
CyA, CYANURIC ACID, TEST TABLETS
14. 1 1000 TABLETS PER BOX (AS NEEDED | 'CC0 TABLETS | ¢100.15 $100.15 $327.45 1000 TABLETS
PER BOX PER BOX
BASIS)
INSTRUMENTAL DPD #1, CHLORINE, TEST
15. 5 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX (AS 10?ELA:c|;§TS $75.19 $375.98 $1,127.94 10?ELA:c|;§TS
NEEDED BASIS)
INSTRUMENTAL PHENOL RED, Ph, TEST
16. 5 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX (AS 100:ETRA:$§TS $72.30 $361.52 $1,084.56 10(1;)ELA:é.§TS
NEEDED BASIS)

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

/sl

2/14/13

2013-083 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
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Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 12, 2012
Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-083
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

W. M. SMITH & ASSOCIATES, INC. dba WMS AQUATICS
ELLENSBURG, WA

ANNUAL

EXTENDED EXTENDED ANNUAL EXTENDED
ITEM ESTIMATED UNIT OF TOTAL 3-YEAR TOTAL UNIT OF EXTENDED TOTAL | 3-YEAR TOTAL
NO. | ANNUAL DESCRIPTION MEASURE | UNIT PRICE (ESTIMATED (ANNUAL MEASURE UNIT PRICE | (ESTIMATED (ANNUAL
* || QUANTITY ANNUAL QTY EXTENDED ANNUAL QTY x EXTENDED
X TOTAL x 3) UNIT PRICE) TOTAL x 3)
LINIT DRICE)
INSTRUMENTAL DPD #3, TOTAL
’ 1000 TABLETS 1000 TABLETS
17. 5 CHLORINE TEST, TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX $75.19 $375.98 $1,127.94 PER BOX
PER BOX (AS NEEDED BASIS)
INSTRUMENTAL ALK. M/2 LOW RANGE,
18. 5 TOTAL ALKALITY, TEST TABLETS 1000 mo:ETRA: c')‘)ETS $105.67 $528.30 $1,584.90 wo:ETRA:c';ETS
TABLETS PER BOX (AS NEEDED BASIS)
INSTRUMENTAL Ca HARDNESS, CALCIUM
19. 1 HARDNESS, TESTTABLETS 1000 | '*0 o0ET> | $105.63 $105.63 $316.89 | 'O T ETS
TABLETS PER BOX (AS NEEDED BASIS)
INSTRUMENTAL CyA, CYANURIC ACID,
20. 1 TEST TABLETS 1000 TABLETS PER BOX mo:ETRA: c')‘)ETS $104.97 $104.97 $314.91 mo:ETRA: c')‘)ETS
(AS NEEDED BASIS)
Co2 CANISTERS, 50 LB CANISTERS (TO 50 LB 50 LB
21. 48 BE DELIVERED ON AS NEEDED BASISTO| .\ 1o oe NO BID NO BID NO BID CANISTERS
PAT O'ROURKE AQUATIC FACILITY)
PHOSPHATE REMOVER (AS NEEDED
22. 1 10 BASIS) ( QT/BOTTLE $43.98 $439.80 $1,319.40 | QUBOTTLE
3 INCH CHLORINE TABLETS (SLOW 50 LBS 50 LES
23. 416 RELEASE CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE NO BID NO BID NO BID
TABLETS FOR EROSION FEEDER) PAIL/BUCKET PAIL/BUCKET
GRAND TOTAL - ITEMS 1-23 $18,854.50 | $56,563.50
BIDDER'S PRICE: | BIDDER'S PRICE:
BLANK BLANK
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY:___/s/
DATE: 2/14/13 2013-083 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION 19



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 12, 2012
Project Name: POOL CHEMICALS

El Paso
i\lli\merica City
2010

Solicitation #: 2013-083
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

W. M. SMITH & ASSOCIATES, INC. dba WMS AQUATICS
ELLENSBURG, WA

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT
THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING |

THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. |
BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM
OF THE CONTRACT FOR: |

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), |
EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE D
CONTRACT: || PLUS PRICE INCREASE OF 5% PER ITEM

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXIPRATION OF THE ORIGINAL |:|
TERM OF THE CONTRACT: PLUS PRICE INCREASE AGAIN OF 5%

i

NO OPTION OFFERED E

]

PAYMENT TERMS: NET 30 DAYS

NET 30 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY YES NO[ ]
PROCUREMENT CARD:

YES [X] NO[ ]

ADDITIONAL 3.5% CHARGE WILL APPLY
IF PROCUREMENT CARD IS USED

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
Within ___ consecutive calendar days.

Within ____ hours or overnight after receipt of verba 24
order in cases of emergency.

BIDS SOLICITED: 12 BIDS RECEIVED: 9 BIDS LOCAL: 11

NO BIDS: 1

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/14/13 2013-083 POOL CHEMICALS - PARKS RECREATION

20



