
BID ITEM:  PARTS WASHER RENTAL SERVICE (RE-BID)

300 per unit

9 $996.17 $107,586.36 $35,862.00 $2,700.00 $32,400.00 $97,200.00 $135.00 $14,580.00 $43,740.00

BIDDER'S PRICE: 

$11,954.04

BIDDER'S PRICE: 

N/A

1 $100.00 $1,200.00 $3,600.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $140.00 $1,680.00 $5,040.00

BIDDER'S PRICE: 

N/A

BIDDER'S 

PRICE: $140.00

BIDDER'S 

PRICE: $420.00

$108,786.36 $39,462.00 $32,400.00 $97,200.00 $16,260.00 $48,780.00 

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$13,154.00

BIDDER'S PRICE: 

N/A

BIDDER'S 

PRICE 

$14,720.00

BIDDER'S 

PRICE: 

$44,160.00

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

MONTHLY 

PRICE

GRAND TOTAL (ITEMS A & B):

B.  PAINT GUN CLEANING UNIT @ UNION 

DEPOT

(700A SAN FRANCISCO)

EXTENDED 

ANNUAL AMOUNT

EXTENDED

 3 YEAR AMOUNT

A.  PARTS WASHERS @ UNION DEPOT

(700A SAN FRANCISCO)

DESCRIPTION

SAFETY-KLEEN SYSTEMS, INC.

RICHARDSON, TX

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

Solicitation #:  2013-145

BID OPENING DATE:   APRIL 10, 2013 Department:  Mass Transit (Sun Metro)

NCH CORPORATION 

CHEMSEARCH DIVISION

IRVING, TX

NCH CORPORATION 

dba PARTSMASTER

DALLAS, TX

PLEASE INCLUDE ANY ENVIRONMENTAL, FUEL OR OTHER CHARGES IN MONTHLY PRICES.

EXTENDED 

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT

EXTENDED

 3 YEAR 

AMOUNT

EXTENDED 

3 YEAR 

AMOUNT

MONTHLY 

PRICE
QUANTITIY

MONTHLY 

PRICE

EXTENDED 

ANNUAL AMOUNT

APPROVED BY:__/s/___

DATE:  __4/22/2013_  2013-145 PARTS WASHER RENTAL SERVICE - MASS TRANSIT DEPARTMENT (SUN METRO) 1



BID ITEM:  PARTS WASHER RENTAL SERVICE (RE-BID)

THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION

TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE

CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD

NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE

TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE

OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE

ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF

THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE

ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY

PROCUREMENT CARD:

7

24

SAFETY-KLEEN SYSTEMS, INC.

RICHARDSON, TX

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

       YES                     NO         YES                     NO          YES                     NO    

PAYMENT TERMS:

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:                                               

Within ____consecutive calendar days.

Within _____ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal                                 

order in cases of emergency                            

2 DAYS
 - ALL HAZARDOUS INCLUDING ORMD & LIMITED 

QUANTITY ARE NOT ALLOWED TO GO WITHOUT 

PRIOR APPROVAL.

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET- 30 DAYS

Solicitation #:  2013-145

BID OPENING DATE:   APRIL 10, 2013 Department:  Mass Transit (Sun Metro)

5-7

NCH CORPORATION 

CHEMSEARCH DIVISION

IRVING, TX

NCH CORPORATION 

dba PARTSMASTER

DALLAS, TX

7

24

X 

X X 

X  X X 

APPROVED BY:__/s/___

DATE:  __4/22/2013_  2013-145 PARTS WASHER RENTAL SERVICE - MASS TRANSIT DEPARTMENT (SUN METRO) 2



BID ITEM:  PARTS WASHER RENTAL SERVICE (RE-BID)

9 $2,088.00 $225,504.00 $676,512.00

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$25,056.00

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$75,168.00

1 $248.00 $2,976.00 $8,928.00

$228,480.00 $685,440.00 

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$28,032.00

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$84,096.00

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

Solicitation #:  2013-145

BID OPENING DATE:   APRIL 10, 2013 Department:  Mass Transit (Sun Metro)

THERMO FLUIDS, INC.

SCOTTSDALE, AZ

PLEASE INCLUDE ANY ENVIRONMENTAL, FUEL OR OTHER CHARGES IN MONTHLY PRICES.

DESCRIPTION QUANTITIY
MONTHLY 

PRICE

EXTENDED 

ANNUAL AMOUNT

EXTENDED 

3 YEAR AMOUNT

MONTHLY 

PRICE

EXTENDED 

ANNUAL AMOUNT

EXTENDED

 3 YEAR 

AMOUNT

MONTHLY 

PRICE

EXTENDED 

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT

EXTENDED

 3 YEAR 

AMOUNT

A.  PARTS WASHERS @ UNION DEPOT

(700A SAN FRANCISCO)

B.  PAINT GUN CLEANING UNIT @ UNION 

DEPOT

(700A SAN FRANCISCO)

GRAND TOTAL (ITEMS A & B):

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

*NOTE: SPECIAL ITEMS TAKE UP TO 4 WEEKS TO 

DELIVER SUBSEQUENT TO THE RECEIPT BY THE 

CONTRACTOR.

*NOTE: SPECIAL ITEMS TAKE UP TO 4 WEEKS TO 

DELIVER SUBSEQUENT TO THE RECEIPT BY THE 

CONTRACTOR.

APPROVED BY:__/s/___

DATE:  __4/22/2013_  2013-145 PARTS WASHER RENTAL SERVICE - MASS TRANSIT DEPARTMENT (SUN METRO) 3



BID ITEM:  PARTS WASHER RENTAL SERVICE (RE-BID)

THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION

TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE

CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD

NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE

TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE

OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE

ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF

THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE

ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY

PROCUREMENT CARD:

NET -30 DAYS

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

Solicitation #:  2013-145

BID OPENING DATE:   APRIL 10, 2013 Department:  Mass Transit (Sun Metro)

       YES                     NO         YES                     NO          YES                     NO    

THERMO FLUIDS, INC.

SCOTTSDALE, AZ

Within _____ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal                                 

order in cases of emergency                            
24

BIDS SOLICITED:            3                        BIDS RECEIVED:     4                                      BIDS LOCAL:             0                                        NO BID:        0

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:                                               

Within ____consecutive calendar days.
7

PAYMENT TERMS:

X 

X 

APPROVED BY:__/s/___

DATE:  __4/22/2013_  2013-145 PARTS WASHER RENTAL SERVICE - MASS TRANSIT DEPARTMENT (SUN METRO) 4


