CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

i\lli\meﬂca City

2010

BID ITEM: ALLISON PROPRIETARY PARTS AND SERVICE
BID DATE: APRIL 3, 2013

BID # 2013-147
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

DARTCO TRANSMISSION
SALES & SERVICES, INC.

DEFEO MANUFACTURING
BROOKFIELD, CT

ANAHEIM, CA
PART A: ALLISON - PROPRIETARY PARTS PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
DESCRIPTION = = =
OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
_ NeT [ x NET [ _ NeT [
ITEM ALLISON PROPRIETARY - 28 % DISCOUNT [ X] - 9% DISCOUNT ] ~ % opiscount [
1 PARTS + % MARKUP ] + % MARKUP L] + % MARKUP ]

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the
Price List or Catalog
(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

ALLISON PRICE LIST

ALLISON PRICE LIST

ALLISON PRICE LIST

List Number
Dated

SA2187
Jan-13

TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER
DISTRIBUTOR
JOBBER
DEALER
RETAILER
OTHER
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[x]
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NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE: ___4/24/2013

2013-147 ALLISON PROPRIETARY PARTS AND SERVICE - FIRE DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City
\ l I /

2010

BID ITEM: ALLISON PROPRIETARY PARTS AND SERVICE
BID DATE: APRIL 3, 2013

BID # 2013-147
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

DARTCO TRANSMISSION
SALES & SERVICES, INC.

DEFEO MANUFACTURING

PART B: SERVICE LABOR RATES

ITEM SERVICE LABOR RATE

$90.00 /HOUR
REGULAR HOURLY RATE

$0.00 /HOUR
REGULAR HOURLY RATE

$0.00 /HOUR
REGULAR HOURLY RATE

PART C: SAMPLE PRICING

TRANS CONNECTORS TRANS CONNECTORS TRANS CONNECTORS
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER PART #29505516 PART #29505516 PART #29505516
ITEM |BIDDER'S PART NUMBER:
1. |PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP: $89.25
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $64.26 NO BID
LABOR COST, ASSUME ONE (1) HOUR LABOR from PART B $90.00
TOTAL COST (CITY'S COST + LABOR COST) $154.26
TRANS SOLENOID TRANS SOLENOID TRANS SOLENOID
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER PART #29537373 PART #29537373 PART #29537373
ITEM |BIDDER PART NUMBER: 29537373DF
2. |PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP: $98.40 $62.66
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $70.85 NO BID
LABOR COST, ASSUME ONE (1) HOUR LABOR from PART B $90.00 NO BID
TOTAL COST (CITY'S COST + LABOR COST) $160.85 $62.66

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE: ___4/24/2013

2013-147 ALLISON PROPRIETARY PARTS AND SERVICE - FIRE DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: ALLISON PROPRIETARY PARTS AND SERVICE
BID DATE: APRIL 3, 2013

BID # 2013-147
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

DARTCO TRANSMISSION
SALES & SERVICES, INC.

DEFEO MANUFACTURING

PART C: SAMPLE PRICING

HUB RETARDER ASM HUB RETARDER ASM HUB RETARDER ASM
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER PART #23011251ATD PART #23011251ATD PART #23011251ATD
ITEM |BIDDER PART NUMBER:
3. |PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP: $3,038.88
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $2,188.00 NO BID
LABOR COST, ASSUME ONE (1) HOUR LABOR from PART B $90.00
TOTAL COST (CITY'S COST + LABOR COST) $2,278.00
SPEED SENSOR SPEED SENSOR SPEED SENSOR
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER PART #29543432 PART #29543432 PART #29543432
ITEM |BIDDER PART NUMBER: 29543432DF
4. |PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP: $87.93 $51.89
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $63.31 NO BID
LABOR COST, ASSUME ONE (1) HOUR LABOR from PART B $90.00 NO BID
TOTAL COST (CITY'S COST + LABOR COST) $153.31 $51.89
TRANS FILTER KIT TRANS FILTER KIT TRANS FILTER KIT
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER PART #29545779 PART #29545779 PART #29545779
ITEM |BIDDER PART NUMBER: 29548988DF
5. |PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP: $65.83 $40.27
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $47.40 NO BID
LABOR COST, ASSUME ONE (1) HOUR LABOR from PART B $90.00 NO BID
TOTAL COST (CITY'S COST + LABOR COST) $137.40 $40.27
TOTAL COST (ITEMS 1-5) $2.883.82 $154.82 $0.00

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE: ___4/24/2013

2013-147 ALLISON PROPRIETARY PARTS AND SERVICE - FIRE DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: ALLISON PROPRIETARY PARTS AND SERVICE
BID DATE: APRIL 3, 2013

BID # 2013-147
DEPARTMENT: FIRE

DARTCO TRANSMISSION
SALES & SERVICES, INC.

DEFEO MANUFACTURING

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

PAYMENT TERMS:

NET - 30 DAYS

NET - 30 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD:

YES I:I NO I:I

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
Within consecutive calendar days.

s [x)no []
5

s [x]no []
7

Within hours or overnight after receipt of verbal
order in cases of emergency.

24

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

BIDS SOLICITED: 6 BIDS RECEIVED: 2

BIDS LOCAL: 5

NO BID: 1

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE: ___4/24/2013 2013-147 ALLISON PROPRIETARY PARTS AND SERVICE - FIRE DEPARTMENT




