El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

All-America Gity

-

2010

BID ITEM: VEHICLES - POLICE DEPARTMENT
BID OPENING DATE: JUNE 26, 20

Department: GENERAL SERVICES

Solicitation #: 2013-235

CASA FORD INC.

MASSEY AUTOMOTIVE LP

RUDOLPH CHEVROLET LLC

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM DESCRIPTION ESJL“:";ITE\? uNIT pRicE | EStimated swanfity X unir pRicE Estimated Quantity X | unir price Estimated Quantity X
NO.
POLICE VEHICLE FULL SIZE SEDAN, STANDARD $39,795.00 $1,193,850.00
MARKED UNIT, REAR WHEEL OR ALL WHEEL DRIVE $40,829.45 $1,224,883.50 8 CYLINDER $44,790.00 $1,343,700.00
1. WITH 30 : $40,714.00 $1,221,420.00
POLICE PREP PACKAGE 8 CYLINDER
MANUFACTURER / MODEL FORD / TAURUS DODGE CHARGER 2014 CHEVROLET CAPRICE
POLICE VEHICLE MID-SIZE SEDAN, STANDARD
2. MARKED UNIT, FRONT WHEEL OR ALL WHEEL 30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $36,999.00 $1,109,970.00
DRIVE WITH POLICE PACKAGE
MANUFACTURER / MODEL CHEVROLET IMPALA
POLICE VEHICLE MID-SIZE SEDAN, STANDARD '
MARKET UNIT, REAR WHEEL OR ALL WHEEL DRIVE
3. WITH 30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $36,999.00 $1,109,970.00
POLICE PREP PACKAGE FRONT WHEEL
MANUFACTURER / MODEL CHEVROLET IMPALA
POLICE VEHICLE SUV WITH K-9 MODIFICATIONS
4. AND SPECIAL 15 $41,846.45 $627,696.75 $44,170.00 $662,550.00 $42,194.00 $632,910.00
SERVICE PACKAGE
MANUFACTURER / MODEL FORD / EXPLORER DODGE DURANGO CHEVROLET TAHOE
$37,022.00 $555,330.00
POLICE VEHICLE SUV WITH SPECIAL SERVICE 6 CYLINDER
5. PACKAGE .5 $3s,146.4§ $572,196.75 $42.851.00 $642,765.00 $38,205.00 $573,075.00
8 CYLINDER
MANUFACTURER / MODEL . FORD / EXPLORER DODGE DURANGO CHEVROLET TAHOE
NOTE: Thisis a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be eva

luated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: La&w?éméy

DATE / g ‘5

2013-235 VEHICLES - POLICE DEPARTMENT - GENERAL. SERVICES



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

Al-Americacity

-

2010

BID ITEM: VEHICLES - POLICE DEPARTMENT

Solicitation #: 2013-235
BID OPENING DATE JUNE 26 2013

Department: GENERAL SERVICES
CASA FORD INC. MASSEY AUTOMOTIVE LP | RUDOLPH CHEVROLET LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM ESTIMATED Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X
o DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE Unit Price UNIT PRICE Unit Price UNIT PRICE Unit Price
POLICE VEHICLE SPORT COUPE, REAR WHEEL $44,623.00 $669,345.00
6. DRIVE MARKED FREEWAY UNIT WITH POLICE 15 $41,531.55 $622,973.25 $42,732.00 $640,980.00 *B'ZC': &TWhit:d'gasn;;ag Tran
N *Auto Tran ea.
PACKAGE WITH V8 ENGINE Aﬁi@ﬁﬁgﬁi Solid Color Deduct $500 ea.
MANUFACTURER / MODEL N FORD /| MUSTANG DODGE CHALLENGER CHEVROLET CAMARO
$19,028.00 | $380,560.00
POLICE VEHICLE MARKED COMPACT SEDAN 4 DODGE DART
7. DOOR 20 $17,411.55 $348,231.00 $20,149.00 | $402,980.00 $19,325.00 $386,500.00
DODGE AVENGER
MANUFACTURER / MODEL FORD / FOCUS DODGE AVENGER / DART CHEVROLET CRUZE
IN MOTION PACKAGE, COMPLETE AND INSTALLED
8. (SEE DETAILED SPECIFICATIONS, SECTION B, 155 $3,650.00 $565,750.00 $3,650.00 $565,750.00 $3,700.00 $573,500.00
PAGE 16, ITEM 8)
CONMUNICATIONS PACKAGE, COMPLETE AND
9. INSTALLED (SEE DETAILED SPEC[FICATIONS’ 155 $12,780.00 $1,980,900.00 $12,780.00 $1,980,900.00 $12,830.00 $1,988,650.00
SECTION B,
S — E 16 AND 17, ITEM e —
$5 979 920 00 _
ESTIMATED TOTAL (ITEMS 1-9) $5,942,631.25 {TOTAL DOES NOT INCLUDE 8 CYLINDER $8,387,620.00
PRICE AND DODGE AVENGER)
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: ‘%
DATE: 7[2 yz /\5

2013-235 VEHICLES - POLICE DEPARTMENT - GENERAL SERVICES




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: VEHICLES - POLICE DEPARTMENT
BID OPENING DATE: JUNE 26, 2013

Solicitation #: 2013-235

Department: GENERAL SERVICES

CASA FORD INC.

MASSEY AUTOMOTIVE LP

RUDOLPH CHEVROLET LLC

EL PASO, TX - EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY

PROCUREMENT GARD: YES[ | NO YES No[ | ves[ | nN{x]

120
I|BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: 120 120 *Chevrolet Caprice requires 28
weeks for us to receive. This is

Within___ consecutive calendar days. approximate.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

BIDS SOLICITED: 30 BIDS RECEIVED: 3 BIDS LOCAL: 18 NO BID: 0

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Dé

DATE:

2013-235 VEHiCLES - POLICE DEPARTMENT - GENERAL SERVICES




