
BID ITEM:   LABORATORY SUPPLIES BID # 2014-187

DEPARTMENT:  HEALTH

NET NET NET

ITEM     - ____ % DISCOUNT     -       % DISCOUNT     -____ % DISCOUNT

1:   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

List Number_____________________

Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

                   Price List or Catalog

2/25/2014

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT

CHEMICAL AND BIO REGENTS CATALOG

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:    FEBRUARY 26, 2014

FISHER SCIENTIFIC 

COMPANY LLC

HANOVER PARK, IL

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC (aka: 

THE MRI CO)

EL PASO, TX

GROUP 1 - CHEMICAL AND BIOREGENTS

NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

NO BID VWR INTERNATIONAL, LLC

WWW.US.VWR.COM

X 

X 

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:     3/12/2014     2014-187 LABORATORY SUPPLIES - HEALTH SERVICES 1



BID ITEM:   LABORATORY SUPPLIES BID # 2014-187

DEPARTMENT:  HEALTH

NET NET NET

ITEM     - ____ % DISCOUNT     -       % DISCOUNT     -____ % DISCOUNT

2:   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

List Number_____________________

Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2/25/2014

NO BID

THOMAS SCIENTIFIC / LAB 

SOURCE

WWW.THOMASSCI.COM

WWW.LABSOURCE.COM

                   Price List or Catalog

NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

CHEMICAL AND BIO REGENTS CATALOG

(Alternate Price List)

BID DATE:    FEBRUARY 26, 2014

FISHER SCIENTIFIC 

COMPANY LLC

HANOVER PARK, IL

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC (aka: 

THE MRI CO)

EL PASO, TX
GROUP 1 - CHEMICAL AND BIOREGENTS

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

NET OR % DISCOUNT

X 

X 

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:     3/12/2014     2014-187 LABORATORY SUPPLIES - HEALTH SERVICES 2



BID ITEM:   LABORATORY SUPPLIES BID # 2014-187

DEPARTMENT:  HEALTH

NET NET NET

ITEM     - ____ % DISCOUNT     -       % DISCOUNT     -____ % DISCOUNT

1:   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

List Number_____________________

Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

IDENTIFICATION KITS AND REAGENTS 

CATALOG

NO BID VWR INTERNATIONAL, LLC

WWW.US.VWR.COM
                   Price List or Catalog

ITEM DESCRIPTION
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

FISHER SCIENTIFIC 

COMPANY LLC

HANOVER PARK, IL

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC (aka: 

THE MRI CO)

EL PASO, TX

GROUP 2 - IDENTIFICATION KITS AND REAGENTS

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:    FEBRUARY 26, 2014

X 

X 

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:     3/12/2014     2014-187 LABORATORY SUPPLIES - HEALTH SERVICES 3



BID ITEM:   LABORATORY SUPPLIES BID # 2014-187

DEPARTMENT:  HEALTH

NET NET NET

ITEM     - ____ % DISCOUNT     -       % DISCOUNT     -____ % DISCOUNT

2:   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

List Number_____________________

Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2/2014

IDENTIFICATION KITS AND REAGENTS 

CATALOG

(Alternate Price List)

NO BID
THOMAS SCIENTIFIC / FISHER

WWW.THOMASSCI.COM

WWW.FISHERSCI.COM

                   Price List or Catalog

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:    FEBRUARY 26, 2014

FISHER SCIENTIFIC 

COMPANY LLC

HANOVER PARK, IL

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC (aka: 

THE MRI CO)

EL PASO, TX

GROUP 2 - IDENTIFICATION KITS AND REAGENTS

X 

X 

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:     3/12/2014     2014-187 LABORATORY SUPPLIES - HEALTH SERVICES 4



BID ITEM:   LABORATORY SUPPLIES BID # 2014-187

DEPARTMENT:  HEALTH

NET NET NET

ITEM     - ____ % DISCOUNT     -       % DISCOUNT     -____ % DISCOUNT

1:   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

List Number_____________________

Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2/2014

CLINICAL PRODUCTS CATALOG

(Items used to collect, transport, or ship samples)

NO BID VWR INTERNATIONAL, LLC

WWW.US.VWR.COM
                   Price List or Catalog

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:    FEBRUARY 26, 2014

FISHER SCIENTIFIC 

COMPANY LLC

HANOVER PARK, IL

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC (aka: 

THE MRI CO)

EL PASO, TX
GROUP 3 - CLINICAL PRODUCTS

X 

X 

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:     3/12/2014     2014-187 LABORATORY SUPPLIES - HEALTH SERVICES 5



BID ITEM:   LABORATORY SUPPLIES BID # 2014-187

DEPARTMENT:  HEALTH

NET NET NET

ITEM     - ____ % DISCOUNT     -       % DISCOUNT     -____ % DISCOUNT

2:   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

List Number_____________________

Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2/2014

CLINICAL PRODUCTS CATALOG

(Items used to collect, transport, or ship samples)

(Alternate Price List)

NO BID
THOMAS SCIENTIFIC 

WW.THOMASSCI.COM                   Price List or Catalog

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:    FEBRUARY 26, 2014

FISHER SCIENTIFIC 

COMPANY LLC

HANOVER PARK, IL

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC (aka: 

THE MRI CO)

EL PASO, TX

GROUP 3 - CLINICAL PRODUCTS

X 

X 

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:     3/12/2014     2014-187 LABORATORY SUPPLIES - HEALTH SERVICES 6



BID ITEM:   LABORATORY SUPPLIES BID # 2014-187

DEPARTMENT:  HEALTH

NET NET NET

ITEM     - ____ % DISCOUNT     -       % DISCOUNT     -____ % DISCOUNT

1:   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

List Number_____________________

Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2/2014

EQUIPMENT CATALOG

NO BID VWR INTERNATIONAL, LLC

WWW.US.VWR.COM
                   Price List or Catalog

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:    FEBRUARY 26, 2014

FISHER SCIENTIFIC 

COMPANY LLC

HANOVER PARK, IL

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC (aka: 

THE MRI CO)

EL PASO, TX

GROUP 4 - EQUIPMENT 

X 

X 

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:     3/12/2014     2014-187 LABORATORY SUPPLIES - HEALTH SERVICES 7



BID ITEM:   LABORATORY SUPPLIES BID # 2014-187

DEPARTMENT:  HEALTH

NET NET NET

ITEM     - ____ % DISCOUNT     -       % DISCOUNT     -____ % DISCOUNT

2:   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

List Number_____________________

Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2/2014

EQUIPMENT CATALOG 

(Alternate Price List)

NO BID
THOMAS SCIENTIFIC 

WW.THOMASSCI.COM                   Price List or Catalog

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:    FEBRUARY 26, 2014

FISHER SCIENTIFIC 

COMPANY LLC

HANOVER PARK, IL

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC (aka: 

THE MRI CO)

EL PASO, TX
GROUP 4 - EQUIPMENT 

X 

X 

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:     3/12/2014     2014-187 LABORATORY SUPPLIES - HEALTH SERVICES 8



BID ITEM:   LABORATORY SUPPLIES BID # 2014-187

DEPARTMENT:  HEALTH

NET NET NET

ITEM     - ____ % DISCOUNT     -       % DISCOUNT     -____ % DISCOUNT

1:   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

List Number_____________________

Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2/2014

GENERAL LABORATORY 

SUPPLIES CATALOG

NO BID VWR INTERNATIONAL, LLC

WWW.US.VWR.COM
                   Price List or Catalog

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:    FEBRUARY 26, 2014

FISHER SCIENTIFIC 

COMPANY LLC

HANOVER PARK, IL

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC (aka: 

THE MRI CO)

EL PASO, TX
GROUP 5 - GENERAL LABORATORY SUPPLIES

X 

X 

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:     3/12/2014     2014-187 LABORATORY SUPPLIES - HEALTH SERVICES 9



BID ITEM:   LABORATORY SUPPLIES BID # 2014-187

DEPARTMENT:  HEALTH

NET NET NET

ITEM     - ____ % DISCOUNT     -       % DISCOUNT     -____ % DISCOUNT

2:   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

List Number_____________________

Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2/2014

GENERAL LABORATORY SUPPLIES CATALOG

(Alternate Price List)

NO BID
THOMAS SCIENTIFIC 

WW.THOMASSCI.COM                   Price List or Catalog

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:    FEBRUARY 26, 2014

FISHER SCIENTIFIC 

COMPANY LLC

HANOVER PARK, IL

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC (aka: 

THE MRI CO)

EL PASO, TX
GROUP 5 - GENERAL LABORATORY SUPPLIES

X 

X 

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:     3/12/2014     2014-187 LABORATORY SUPPLIES - HEALTH SERVICES 10



BID ITEM:   LABORATORY SUPPLIES BID # 2014-187

DEPARTMENT:  HEALTH

NET NET NET

ITEM     - ____ % DISCOUNT     -       % DISCOUNT     -____ % DISCOUNT

1:   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

List Number_____________________

Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2/2014

SAFETY SUPPLIES CATALOG

(Gowns, Gloves, Exam gloves)

NO BID VWR INTERNATIONAL, LLC

WWW.US.VWR.COM
                   Price List or Catalog

NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:    FEBRUARY 26, 2014

FISHER SCIENTIFIC 

COMPANY LLC

HANOVER PARK, IL

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC (aka: 

THE MRI CO)

EL PASO, TX

GROUP 6 - SAFETY

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION

X 

X 

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:     3/12/2014     2014-187 LABORATORY SUPPLIES - HEALTH SERVICES 11



BID ITEM:   LABORATORY SUPPLIES BID # 2014-187

DEPARTMENT:  HEALTH

NET NET NET

ITEM     - ____ % DISCOUNT     -       % DISCOUNT     -____ % DISCOUNT

2:   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

List Number_____________________

Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

                   Price List or Catalog NO BID
THOMAS SCIENTIFIC 

WW.THOMASSCI.COM

2/2014

ITEM DESCRIPTION
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

SAFETY SUPPLIES CATALOG 

(Gowns, Gloves, Exam gloves)

(Alternate Price List)

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:    FEBRUARY 26, 2014

FISHER SCIENTIFIC 

COMPANY LLC

HANOVER PARK, IL

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC (aka: 

THE MRI CO)

EL PASO, TX
GROUP 6 - SAFETY

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

OR MARKUP

X 

X 

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:     3/12/2014     2014-187 LABORATORY SUPPLIES - HEALTH SERVICES 12



BID ITEM:   LABORATORY SUPPLIES BID # 2014-187

DEPARTMENT:  HEALTH

YES NO YES NO YES NO

NONE STATED

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

1. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $20.76 $35.39

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $16.82 $29.73 +15.00 shipping

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

2. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $43.20 $31.08

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $39.96 $30.63 +38.91shipping

TWO (2) COPIES (EITHER HARDCOPY OR CD)

OF EACH CATALOG/PRICE LIST ARE

INCLUDED WITH THE BID PACKAGE.

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

GROUP 1 - CHEMICAL AND BIOREGENTS

DESCRIPTION:

3 kg Sodium Chloride ACS GradeDESCRIPTION:

Thomas C710L50

3 kg Sodium Chloride ACS Grade 3 kg Sodium Chloride ACS Grade

1B1 15735 FROM VWR 87000-050

Thomas C710L50

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

PART B:  SERVICE LABOR RATES

AC149320010

FISHER SCIENTIFIC 

COMPANY LLC

HANOVER PARK, IL

BID DATE:    FEBRUARY 26, 2014

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC (aka: 

THE MRI CO)

EL PASO, TX

1 L bottle 70% Isopropyl Alcohol 

Nonsterile

1 L bottle 70% Isopropyl Alcohol 

Nonsterile

Thomas C710L50

2.5 kg   THOMAS SCI C710L54

IBI Scientific IB 15735 IBI Scientific IB 15735 IBI Scientific IB 15735

MSX04201

1 L bottle 70% Isopropyl Alcohol 

Nonsterile

X 

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:     3/12/2014     2014-187 LABORATORY SUPPLIES - HEALTH SERVICES 13



BID ITEM:   LABORATORY SUPPLIES BID # 2014-187

DEPARTMENT:  HEALTH

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

3. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $85.50 $79.09

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $70.92 $71.55 +15.00 shipping

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

4. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $276.50 $290.78

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $225.00 $252.55 +37.50 shipping

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

5. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $89.00 $14.15

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $75.92 $12.62 +15.00 shipping

+106.41 shipping

BIDDER'S PRICE $415.10

$397.08

BIDDER'S PRICE $415.10

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

$450.49

OXSR0172E
OXOD SR0172E FROM LAB SOURCE 

OXSR0172E

20 plates/pk Trypticase Soy Agar 

w/5% Sheep Blood

$514.96

BD 211043

GROUP 1 - Price List GRAND TOTAL (Items 1-5)

GROUP 1 - City's List GRAND TOTAL (Items 1-5)

BD 211043 BD 211043

10 vials/pk CCDA Selective 

Supplement, 10X for 500ml Medium 

(Cefoperazone 16.0 mg, 

Amphotericin 5.0 mg)

PART C:  SAMPLE PRICING

DF0075171

BD 212123

500 g Mac Conkey Agar

DESCRIPTION:

DESCRIPTION:

500 g Mac Conkey Agar

10 vials/pk CCDA Selective 

Supplement, 10X for 500ml Medium 

(Cefoperazone 16.0 mg, 

Amphotericin 5.0 mg)

BD 212123 BD 212123

BD212123 FROM THOMAS SCI C465L05

DESCRIPTION:

Oxoid SR0172E

B11043 BD 221239 FROM VWR 90001-276

10 vials/pk CCDA Selective 

Supplement, 10X for 500ml Medium 

(Cefoperazone 16.0 mg, Amphotericin 

5.0 mg)

$428.62

20 plates/pk Trypticase Soy Agar 

w/5% Sheep Blood

20 plates/pk Trypticase Soy Agar 

w/5% Sheep Blood

BID DATE:    FEBRUARY 26, 2014

Oxoid SR0172E Oxoid SR0172E

500 g Mac Conkey Agar

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC (aka: 

THE MRI CO)

EL PASO, TX

FISHER SCIENTIFIC 

COMPANY LLC

HANOVER PARK, IL

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:     3/12/2014     2014-187 LABORATORY SUPPLIES - HEALTH SERVICES 14



BID ITEM:   LABORATORY SUPPLIES BID # 2014-187

DEPARTMENT:  HEALTH

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

1. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $122.10 $122.10

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $76.50 $128.21 +15.00 shipping

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

2. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $219.50 $219.50

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $131.00 $230.48 +25.00 shipping

Remel R24250

50 tests/ph E. coli O157:h7, Latex 

Test for Identification of Serogroup 

O157:H7

50 tests/ph E. coli O157:h7, Latex Test 

for Identification of Serogroup 

O157:H7

50 tests/ph E. coli O157:h7, Latex 

Test for Identification of Serogroup 

O157:H7

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

R24250 REMEL R24250

Remel R24250

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

Remel R8311001

20 tests/pk Remel Rap ID NH System, 

Biochemical Identification of the 

Family Neisseraceae and the Genus 

20 tests/pk Remel Rap ID NH 

System, Biochemical Identification 

of the Family Neisseraceae and the 

DESCRIPTION:

Remel R8311001Remel R8311001

GROUP 2 - IDENTIFICATION KITS AND REAGENTS

DESCRIPTION:
20 tests/pk Remel Rap ID NH 

System, Biochemical Identification 

of the Family Neisseraceae and the 

BID DATE:    FEBRUARY 26, 2014

FISHER SCIENTIFIC 

COMPANY LLC

HANOVER PARK, IL

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC (aka: 

THE MRI CO)

EL PASO, TX

Remel R24250

R8311001 REMEL R8311001

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:     3/12/2014     2014-187 LABORATORY SUPPLIES - HEALTH SERVICES 15



BID ITEM:   LABORATORY SUPPLIES BID # 2014-187

DEPARTMENT:  HEALTH

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

3. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $25.35 $18.47

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $21.70 $16.84 +15.00 shipping

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

4. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $79.20 $73.05

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $70.96 $72.12 +15.00 shipping

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

5. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $18.82 $18.82

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $12.80 $19.76 +15.00 shipping

+85.00 shipping
$467.41

1491022
BD 261193 FROM THOMAS SCI 

0195A75

GROUP 2 - Price List GRAND TOTAL (Items 1-5) $464.97 $451.94 $0.00

GROUP 2 - City's List GRAND TOTAL (Items 1-5) $312.96 $0.00

15 ml Vial Remel RapID Nitrate A 

Reagent

15 ml Vial Remel RapID Nitrate A 

Reagent

BD230725 FROM THOMAS SCI 0190B15

DESCRIPTION:
50 discs/cartridge Dephalothin

 30 ug Antimicrobial Susceptibility 

Test (Test Discs)

50 discs/cartridge Dephalothin

 30 ug Antimicrobial Susceptibility 

Test (Test Discs)

50 discs/cartridge Dephalothin

 30 ug Antimicrobial Susceptibility 

Test (Test Discs)
BD 230725

(4330725)

BD 230725

(4330725)

BD 230725

(4330725)

DESCRIPTION:

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

R8309003 REMEL R8309003

50 vials/pk Voges Proskauer B Test

Remel R8309003 Remel R8309003

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BD 261193 BD 261193 BD 261193

B30725

15 ml Vial Remel RapID Nitrate A 

Reagent
DESCRIPTION:

Remel R8309003

FISHER SCIENTIFIC 

COMPANY LLC

HANOVER PARK, IL

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC (aka: 

THE MRI CO)

EL PASO, TX

50 vials/pk Voges Proskauer B Test 50 vials/pk Voges Proskauer B Test

BID DATE:    FEBRUARY 26, 2014

GROUP 2 - IDENTIFICATION KITS AND REAGENTS

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:     3/12/2014     2014-187 LABORATORY SUPPLIES - HEALTH SERVICES 16



BID ITEM:   LABORATORY SUPPLIES BID # 2014-187

DEPARTMENT:  HEALTH

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

1. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $53.40 $18.20

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $42.69 $16.31 +10.90 shipping

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

2. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $226.50 $203.82

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $182.09 $182.63 +11.41 shipping

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

2203115 BD 220221

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

DESCRIPTION:
Pack of 50 Universal Viral Transport 

Standard Kit w/swab 

(BD220221 or equivalent)

Pack of 50 Universal Viral Transport 

Standard Kit w/swab 

(BD220221 or equivalent)

Pack of 50 Universal Viral Transport 

Standard Kit w/swab 

(BD220221 or equivalent)

BD 220221 BD 220221 BD 220221

BID DATE:    FEBRUARY 26, 2014

FISHER SCIENTIFIC 

COMPANY LLC

HANOVER PARK, IL

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC (aka: 

THE MRI CO)

EL PASO, TX

GROUP 3 - CLINICAL PRODUCTS

DESCRIPTION:
Pack of 100 Specimen Collection 

Swab, Dacron Sterile, Plastic Shaft

FISHER

L4363000 VWR 22222046 FITZCO 08069

FISHER

Pack of 100 Specimen Collection 

Swab, Dacron Sterile, Plastic Shaft

Pack of 100 Specimen Collection 

Swab, Dacron Sterile, Plastic Shaft

FISHER

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:     3/12/2014     2014-187 LABORATORY SUPPLIES - HEALTH SERVICES 17



BID ITEM:   LABORATORY SUPPLIES BID # 2014-187

DEPARTMENT:  HEALTH

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

3. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $108.70 $102.02

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $87.90 $91.41 +11.41 shipping

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

4. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $58.28 $56.34

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $50.12 $43.38 +12.76 shipping

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

5. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $52.50 $92.50

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $35.12 $80.50 +15.00 shipping

+61.48$414.23

$472.88

GROUP 3 - City's List GRAND TOTAL (Items 1-5) $397.92 $0.00
BIDDER'S PRICE $407.92

14375152 THERAPAK 74802

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

GROUP 3 - Price List GRAND TOTAL (Items 1-5) $499.38 $0.00

DESCRIPTION:
Case of 500 Specimen Containers 

Polypropylene, 60 mL

Case of 500 Specimen Containers 

Polypropylene, 60 mL

Case of 500 Specimen Containers 

Polypropylene, 60 mL

COVIDIEN 8889207026 COVIDIEN 8889207026 COVIDIEN 8889207026

MERIDIAN BIOSCIENCE 9000612 MERIDIAN BIOSCIENCE 9000612 MERIDIAN BIOSCIENCE 9000612

23290147
MERIDIAN BIOS. 900612 FROM VWR 

15157-024

1491054 BD261510

DESCRIPTION:
Pack of 20 Para-Pak Stool Transport 

C&S (or equivalent)

Pack of 20 Para-Pak Stool Transport 

C&S (or equivalent)

Pack of 20 Para-Pak Stool Transport 

C&S (or equivalent)

DESCRIPTION:
Pack of 50 BD Bio-Bag Type C, 

CO2 Enriched Disposable

 Environmental System

Pack of 50 BD Bio-Bag Type C, 

CO2 Enriched Disposable

 Environmental System

Pack of 50 BD Bio-Bag Type C, 

CO2 Enriched Disposable

 Environmental System

BD 261510 BD 261510 BD 261510

FISHER SCIENTIFIC 

COMPANY LLC

HANOVER PARK, IL

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC (aka: 

THE MRI CO)

EL PASO, TX

GROUP 3 - CLINICAL PRODUCTS

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:    FEBRUARY 26, 2014

APPROVED BY:         /s/        
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BID ITEM:   LABORATORY SUPPLIES BID # 2014-187

DEPARTMENT:  HEALTH

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

1. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $968.50 $691.90

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $621.94 $587.52 +16.95 shipping

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

2. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $1,709.00 $1,782.22

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $1,387.71 $1,401.05 +70.00 shipping

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

THERMO SCIENTIFIC M79735Q THERMO SCIENTIFIC M79735Q THERMO SCIENTIFIC M79735Q

09047113Q
THERMO SCIENTIFIC M79735Q FROM 

VWR 57020-092

11474470

VWR15156-120 MFT: MH6616X1 

MADE FOR FISHER TOO

 AS 11-474-470

DESCRIPTION:
1 each Platform Rocker, Variable 

Speed Includes 5 to 60 rpm

1 each Platform Rocker, Variable 

Speed Includes 5 to 60 rpm

1 each Platform Rocker, Variable 

Speed Includes 5 to 60 rpm

DESCRIPTION:
1 each Slide Warmer. Capacity at 

Least 20 Slides. Maximum Temp. at 

Least 100° C. 110-120V

1 each Slide Warmer. Capacity at 

Least 20 Slides. Maximum Temp. at 

Least 100° C. 110-120V

1 each Slide Warmer. Capacity at 

Least 20 Slides. Maximum Temp. at 

Least 100° C. 110-120V

FISHER 11-474-470 FISHER 11-474-470 FISHER 11-474-470

BID DATE:    FEBRUARY 26, 2014

FISHER SCIENTIFIC 

COMPANY LLC

HANOVER PARK, IL

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC (aka: 

THE MRI CO)

EL PASO, TX

GROUP 4 - EQUIPMENT

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

APPROVED BY:         /s/        
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BID ITEM:   LABORATORY SUPPLIES BID # 2014-187

DEPARTMENT:  HEALTH

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

3. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $1,006.50 $643.50

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $771.20 $537.45 +25.00 shipping

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

4. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $437.75 $297.33

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $259.22 $185.58 +42.00 shipping

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

5. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $663.50 $694.43

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $306.73 $446.87 +27.00 shipping

+180.95 shipping
$3,158.47 $0.00

GROUP 4 - Price List GRAND TOTAL (Items 1-5) $4,785.25 $4,109.38 $0.00

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

GROUP 4 - City's List GRAND TOTAL (Items 1-5) $3,346.80

FISHER 02-215-375 FISHER 02-215-375 FISHER 02-215-375

02215375 FROM VWR 12620-862

12006901 MFT H510020 FROM THOMSCI 1210C70

DESCRIPTION:
1 each Pulsing Vortex Mixer. Speed 

Range Includes 500-3000rpm. 120V

1 each Pulsing Vortex Mixer. Speed 

Range Includes 500-3000rpm. 120V

1 each Pulsing Vortex Mixer. Speed 

Range Includes 500-3000rpm. 120V

DESCRIPTION:
1 each Mini Centrifuge. Six-place 

Rotor for 1.5 - 2mL Tubes

1 each Mini Centrifuge. Six-place 

Rotor for 1.5 - 2mL Tubes

1 each Mini Centrifuge. Six-place 

Rotor for 1.5 - 2mL Tubes

FISHER 12-006-901 FISHER 12-006-901 FISHER 12-006-901

OAKTON Ph 700 OAKTON Ph 700 OAKTON Ph 700

13620464
THOMAS SCIENTIFIC 122342 WD-

35419-10 OAKTON PH700

GROUP 4 - EQUIPMENT

DESCRIPTION:
1 each Benchtop pH Meter, 

Automatic Temperature 

Compensation (ATC) Probe

1 each Benchtop pH Meter, Automatic 

Temperature Compensation (ATC) 

Probe

1 each Benchtop pH Meter, 

Automatic Temperature 

Compensation (ATC) Probe

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:    FEBRUARY 26, 2014

FISHER SCIENTIFIC 

COMPANY LLC

HANOVER PARK, IL

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC (aka: 

THE MRI CO)

EL PASO, TX

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:     3/12/2014     2014-187 LABORATORY SUPPLIES - HEALTH SERVICES 20



BID ITEM:   LABORATORY SUPPLIES BID # 2014-187

DEPARTMENT:  HEALTH

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

1. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $349.50 $352.19

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $301.62 $300.72 +26.24 shipping

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

2. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $419.29 $615.54

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $148.84 $299.16 +27.14 shipping

01814C VWR 14220-052

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

DESCRIPTION:
200/case

Autoclave bags, 25" x 35",

 at least 2 mil

200/case

Autoclave bags, 25" x 35",

 at least 2 mil

200/case

Autoclave bags, 25" x 35",

 at least 2 mil

VWR 14220-052 VWR 14220-052 VWR 14220-052

THERMO SCIENTIFIC  339652 THERMO SCIENTIFIC  339652 THERMO SCIENTIFIC  339652

12565270
SAME AS: VWR 89174-472 THERMO 

SCIENTIFIC 339652

GROUP 5 - GENERAL LABORATORY SUPPLIES

DESCRIPTION:
500/case

 Conical Sterile Polypropylene 

Centrifuge Tubes, 50 ml

500/case

 Conical Sterile Polypropylene 

Centrifuge Tubes, 50 ml

500/case

 Conical Sterile Polypropylene 

Centrifuge Tubes, 50 ml

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:    FEBRUARY 26, 2014

FISHER SCIENTIFIC 

COMPANY LLC

HANOVER PARK, IL

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC (aka: 

THE MRI CO)

EL PASO, TX

APPROVED BY:         /s/        
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BID ITEM:   LABORATORY SUPPLIES BID # 2014-187

DEPARTMENT:  HEALTH

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

3. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $25.15 $24.73

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $20.40 $14.24 +11.00 shipping

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

4. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $653.47 $194.80

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $448.63 $131.05 +25.00 shipping

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

5. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $81.29 $51.64

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $21.21 $28.40 +10.90 shipping

+100.28 shipping
$773.57

GROUP 5 - Price List GRAND TOTAL (Items 1-5) $1,528.70 $1,238.90

02707504 VWR 37001-532

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

GROUP 5 - City's List GRAND TOTAL (Items 1-5) $940.70GROUP 5 - City's List GRAND TOTAL (Items 1-5)

BIDDER'S PRICE $1,179.20

DESCRIPTION:
1000/pk 200ul Pipets Tips Bulk 

Nonsterile

1000/pk 200ul Pipets Tips Bulk 

Nonsterile

1000/pk 200ul Pipets Tips Bulk 

Nonsterile

VWR 37001-532 VWR 37001-532 VWR 37001-532

KIMAX 45066A-20123 KIMAX 45066A-20123 KIMAX 45066A-20123

1493010G
THOMAS SCIENTIFIC 122342 KIM AX 

45066A-20125

1599912A ½ " x 41.7' VWR 89176-298

DESCRIPTION:
48/pk Kimax Reusable Tubes with 

Rubber-Lined Screw Cap, 

O.D. X L 20 X 125mm

48/pk Kimax Reusable Tubes with 

Rubber-Lined Screw Cap, 

O.D. X L 20 X 125mm

48/pk Kimax Reusable Tubes with 

Rubber-Lined Screw Cap, 

O.D. X L 20 X 125mm

DESCRIPTION:
6/pk Autoclave Tape,

W x L 0.5 x 500 in. Word 

"AUTOCLAVED" Appears When 

6/pk Autoclave Tape,

W x L 0.5 x 500 in. Word 

"AUTOCLAVED" Appears When 

6/pk Autoclave Tape,

W x L 0.5 x 500 in. Word 

"AUTOCLAVED" Appears When 

VWR 89176304 VWR 89176304 VWR 89176304

FISHER SCIENTIFIC 

COMPANY LLC

HANOVER PARK, IL

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC (aka: 

THE MRI CO)

EL PASO, TX

GROUP 5 - GENERAL LABORATORY SUPPLIES

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:    FEBRUARY 26, 2014

APPROVED BY:         /s/        
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BID ITEM:   LABORATORY SUPPLIES BID # 2014-187

DEPARTMENT:  HEALTH

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

1. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $18.01 $259.19

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $18.01 $107.81 +50.00 shipping

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

2. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $135.39 $192.53

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $135.39 $112.10 +25.00 shipping

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

3. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $16.31 $109.30

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $16.31 $80.45 +47.34 shipping

DESCRIPTION:
6/box PDI Super Sani-Cloth Wipes 

HB Canister

6/box PDI Super Sani-Cloth Wipes HB 

Canister

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

PDI Q86984 FROM VWR 15648-99323100126

Professional Disposables, Inc 

Q86984

Professional Disposables, Inc 

Q86984

Professional Disposables, Inc 

Q86984

Cardinal Health 2100PG Cardinal Health 2100PG Cardinal Health 2100PG

19160257 FROM THOMAS SCI CV2100PG

6/box PDI Super Sani-Cloth Wipes 

HB Canister

19166708 CARDINAL HEALTH 8896N

DESCRIPTION:
Case of 100 Fluid-Resistant Cover 

Gowns nonsterile

Case of 100 Fluid-Resistant Cover 

Gowns nonsterile

Case of 100 Fluid-Resistant Cover 

Gowns nonsterile

DESCRIPTION:
Case of 10 Pack Powder-Free Nitrile 

Exam Gloves 100 Gloves Per Pack

Case of 10 Pack Powder-Free Nitrile 

Exam Gloves 100 Gloves Per Pack

Case of 10 Pack Powder-Free Nitrile 

Exam Gloves 100 Gloves Per Pack

Cardinal Health 8896N Cardinal Health 8896N Cardinal Health 8896N

BID DATE:    FEBRUARY 26, 2014

FISHER SCIENTIFIC 

COMPANY LLC

HANOVER PARK, IL

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC (aka: 

THE MRI CO)

EL PASO, TX

GROUP 6 - SAFETY

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

APPROVED BY:         /s/        
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BID ITEM:   LABORATORY SUPPLIES BID # 2014-187

DEPARTMENT:  HEALTH

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

4. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $166.80 $223.74

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $127.27 $171.92 +21.85 shipping

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

5. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $23.15 $29.00

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $16.30 $17.61 +3.00 shipping

+147.19 shipping

+681.31 shipping

$813.76

BIDDER'S PRICE $7,803.42

BIDDER'S PRICE $5,750.28

$489.89

BIDDER'S PRICE $7,501.96

BIDDER'S PRICE $5,670.92

GROUP 1-6  GRAND TOTAL 

Price List

City's List
$5,740.28

$8,152.92

GROUP 6 - Price List GRAND TOTAL (Items 1-5) $359.66

GROUP 6 - City's List GRAND TOTAL (Items 1-5) $313.28

$5,700.65

14375268
WHITNEY MEDICAL BH2002 FROM VWR 

11214-+708

DESCRIPTION:
3 Containers/Case Clorox 

Germicidal Bleach. 1 Gallon

 (121 oz.) Per Container,

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

Clorox Part No 30966 Clorox Part No 30966 Clorox Part No 30966

23100126 CLOROX 30966

$7,537.35

3 Containers/Case Clorox Germicidal 

Bleach. 1 Gallon

 (121 oz.) Per Container,

3 Containers/Case Clorox 

Germicidal Bleach. 1 Gallon

 (121 oz.) Per Container,

DESCRIPTION:
Case of 100 Biohazard Bench Top 

Keeper Dimensions: 4x4x7 in., 

Capacity: 1400cc

Case of 100 Biohazard Bench Top 

Keeper Dimensions: 4x4x7 in., 

Capacity: 1400cc

Case of 100 Biohazard Bench Top 

Keeper Dimensions: 4x4x7 in., 

Capacity: 1400cc

Whitney Medical BH2006 Whitney Medical BH2006 Whitney Medical BH2006

GROUP 6 - SAFETY

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:    FEBRUARY 26, 2014

FISHER SCIENTIFIC 

COMPANY LLC

HANOVER PARK, IL
A001 & A002 Not Acknow ledge

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC (aka: 

THE MRI CO)

EL PASO, TX
A001 & A002 Not Acknow ledge

APPROVED BY:         /s/        
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BID ITEM:   LABORATORY SUPPLIES BID # 2014-187

DEPARTMENT:  HEALTH

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION

TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE

CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD

NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE

TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

PROCUREMENT CARD:
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

Within ___ consecutive hours.

Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal

order in cases of emergency

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

NONE STATED NEXT AM

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

BIDS SOLICITED:            9                       BIDS RECEIVED:            2                           BIDS LOCAL:                   1                         NO BID:              0

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC (aka: 

THE MRI CO)

EL PASO, TX

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

FISHER SCIENTIFIC 

COMPANY LLC

HANOVER PARK, IL

NET-30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

           NO        YES

PAYMENT TERMS:

        YES            NO            NO

BID DATE:    FEBRUARY 26, 2014

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
        YES

7-10 10

X 

X 

X X 

X 

APPROVED BY:         /s/        
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