
Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID II) Solicitation #:  2014-419

Department:  ZOO

ITEM

NO.

1. 8,750 Per LB. $0.5966 $5,220.25 $15,660.75 $33.10 $289,625.00 $868,875.00

LBS.

18,000 Per GRAM $0.16666 $2,999.88 $8,999.64 $236.23 $4,252,140.00 $12,756,420.00

2. GRAMS

3. 3,000 Per LB. $1.339 $4,017.00 $12,051.00 $78.66 $235,980.00 $707,940.00

LBS.

4. 3,000 Per LB. $1.545 $4,635.00 $13,905.00 $91.31 $273,930.00 $821,790.00

LBS.

Bidder's Price

$2,999.99

Bidder's Price

$8,999.96

Bidder's Price

$4,636.20

Bidder's Price

$13,908.60

50 LB. BAG

Bidder's Price

$5,792.50

Bidder's Price

$17,377.50

Bidder's Price

$11,812.50

Bidder's Price

$35,437.50

Bidder's Price

$4,719.60

Bidder's Price

$14,158.80

LEFT BLANK

LEFT BLANK

LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC.

HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX

VALLEY FEED & SUPPLY INC.

EL PASO, TX

LEFT BLANK

MAZURI

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

LEFT BLANK

5645 LEFT BLANK

PKG SIZE: 50 LB. BAG LEFT BLANK

BRAND: MAZURI

Bidder's Price

$5,478.60

Bidder's Price

$16,435.80

LEFT BLANK

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

MAZURI

50 LBS.

LEFT BLANK

LEFT BLANK

BRAND:

PKG SIZE: 

PKG SIZE: 

STOCK# 5Z8W

LEFT BLANK

LEFT BLANK

MAZURIBRAND:

STOCK#

STOCK# 5644

PKG SIZE: 

Flamingo Breeder

MAZURI #5645

LEFT BLANK

STOCK#

Flamingo Complete

MAZURI #5644

ANNUAL 

ESTIMATED 

TOTAL 
(Qty. X Unit Price)

ANNUAL

EST. QTY.
UNIT PRICE

ANNUAL 

ESTIMATED 

TOTAL 
(Qty. X Unit Price)

ITEM DESCRIPTION

WILD HERBIVORE PLUS

MAZURI #5Z8W

UNIT PRICE

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED TOTAL
(Annual Total Price X 3 

yrs.)

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED TOTAL
(Annual Total Price X 3 

yrs.)

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

5TWX

LEFT BLANK

Marine Tabs

MAZURI #5TWX

BRAND:

Bid Opening Date:  JUNE 25, 2014

APPROVED BY: _____/s/______

DATE:  ______7/10/14________  2014-419 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID II) - EL PASO ZOO 1



Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID II) Solicitation #:  2014-419

Department:  ZOO

ITEM

NO.

5. 5,000 Per LB. $0.5168 $2,584.00 $7,752.00 $28.20 $141,000.00 $423,000.00

LBS.

6. 6,250 Per LB. $0.6872 $4,295.00 $12,885.00 $19.33 $120,812.50 $362,437.50

LBS.

7. 300 Per LB. $1.4024 $420.72 $1,262.16 $41.26 $12,378.00 $37,134.00

LBS.

8. 40 Per Litter $132.72 $5,308.80 $15,926.40 $137.95 $5,518.00 $16,554.00

LITERS

LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC.

HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX

VALLEY FEED & SUPPLY INC.

EL PASO, TX

25 LB. BAG

LEFT BLANK

PKG SIZE: LEFT BLANK

BRAND: MAZURI LEFT BLANK

PKG SIZE: 1 LITER BOTTLE LEFT BLANK

STOCK# 10111

STOCK# 5M08 LEFT BLANK

ANNUAL 

ESTIMATED 

TOTAL 
(Qty. X Unit Price)

25  LB. BAG

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

LEFT BLANK

LEFT BLANK

LEFT BLANK

STOCK#

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED TOTAL
(Annual Total Price X 3 

yrs.)

5647

BRAND: MAZURI

LEFT BLANK

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

Emcelle

MAZURI #10111

Rodent Diet

MAZURI #5663

PKG SIZE: 50 LB. BAG

Ratite+B767

MAZURI #5647

PKG SIZE: 

BRAND: MAZURI

ITEM DESCRIPTION

ANNUAL 

ESTIMATED 

TOTAL 
(Qty. X Unit Price)

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

STOCK#

UNIT PRICE

5663 LEFT BLANK

ANNUAL

EST. QTY.

Bid Opening Date:  JUNE 25, 2014

UNIT PRICE

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED TOTAL
(Annual Total Price X 3 

yrs.)

Ferret Diet

MAZURI #5M08

MAZURIBRAND:

Bidder's Price

$2,820.00

Bidder's Price

$8,460.00

Bidder's Price

$4,832.50

Bidder's Price

$14,497.50

Bidder's Price

$495.12

Bidder's Price

$1,485.36

LEFT BLANK

LEFT BLANK

APPROVED BY: _____/s/______

DATE:  ______7/10/14________  2014-419 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID II) - EL PASO ZOO 2



Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID II) Solicitation #:  2014-419

Department:  ZOO

ITEM

NO.

9. 12,500 Per LB. $0.4618 $5,772.50 $17,317.50 $24.82 $310,250.00 $930,750.00

LBS.

10. 1,500 Per LB. $0.4968 $745.20 $2,235.60 $26.97 $40,455.00 $121,365.00

LBS.

11. 17,500 Per LB. $0.5266 $9,215.50 $27,646.50 $30.15 $527,625.00 $1,582,875.00

LBS.

12. 375 Per LB. $3.778 $1,416.75 $4,250.25 $100.35 $37,631.25 $112,893.75

LBS.

LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC.

HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX

VALLEY FEED & SUPPLY INC.

EL PASO, TX

STOCK# 5M38 LEFT BLANK

PKG SIZE: 25 LB. BAG LEFT BLANK

PKG SIZE: 50 LB. BAG LEFT BLANK

BRAND: MAZURI LEFT BLANK

Cricket Food, Hi Calcium

MAZURI #5M38 Bidder's Price

$1,505.25

Bidder's Price

$4,515.75

Bid Opening Date:  JUNE 25, 2014

ANNUAL 

ESTIMATED 

TOTAL 
(Qty. X Unit Price)

MAZURI LEFT BLANK

5648

PKG SIZE: 

LEFT BLANK

5666 LEFT BLANK

LEFT BLANK

LEFT BLANK

ANNUAL

EST. QTY.

Llama Supplement

MAZURI #5M17

STOCK#

Herbivore ADF 16

MAZURI #5648

BRAND:

STOCK#

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

STOCK# 5M17

Elephant Supplement

MAZURI #5666

ITEM DESCRIPTION

50 LB. BAG

BRAND: MAZURI LEFT BLANK

UNIT PRICE

ANNUAL 

ESTIMATED 

TOTAL 
(Qty. X Unit Price)

PKG SIZE: 50 LB. BAG

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

MAZURI LEFT BLANK

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED TOTAL
(Annual Total Price X 3 

yrs.)

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED TOTAL
(Annual Total Price X 3 

yrs.)

LEFT BLANK

BRAND:

UNIT PRICE

Bidder's Price

$6,205.00

Bidder's Price

$18,615.00

Bidder's Price

$809.10

Bidder's Price

$2,427.30

Bidder's Price

$10,552.50

Bidder's Price

$31,657.50

Bidder's Price

$1,431.75

Bidder's Price

$4,295.25

APPROVED BY: _____/s/______

DATE:  ______7/10/14________  2014-419 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID II) - EL PASO ZOO 3



Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID II) Solicitation #:  2014-419

Department:  ZOO

ITEM

NO.

13. 875 Per LB. $0.63 $551.25 $1,653.75 $17.57 $15,373.75 $46,121.25

LBS.

14. 150 Per LB. $12.00 $1,800.00 $5,400.00 $57.20 $8,580.00 $25,740.00

LBS.

15. 15 $38.99 $584.85 $1,754.55 $26.44 $396.60 $1,189.80

Kilogram

16. 1,500 Per LB. $0.5396 $809.40 $2,428.20 $28.37 $42,555.00 $127,665.00

LBS.

Per 

Kilogram

PKG SIZE: 50 LB. BAG LEFT BLANK

BRAND: PURINA LEFT BLANK

STOCK# ENRICHPLUS LEFT BLANK

STOCK# 58QC LEFT BLANK

PKG SIZE: 1 KG BOXES LEFT BLANK

PKG SIZE: 5 LB. CONTAINER LEFT BLANK

BRAND: MAZURI LEFT BLANK

BRAND: ZOO MED LEFT BLANK

Reptovite Mineral Supplement

Bidder's Price

$614.95

STOCK# REPTOVITE LEFT BLANK

ANNUAL 

ESTIMATED 

TOTAL 
(Qty. X Unit Price)

MAZURI LEFT BLANK

STOCK# 5664

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE

PKG SIZE: 

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

ANNUAL

EST. QTY.

ANNUAL 

ESTIMATED 

TOTAL 
(Qty. X Unit Price)

Guinea Pig diet

MAZURI #5664

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

BRAND:

Carnivore Supplement

MAZURI #58QC

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED TOTAL
(Annual Total Price X 3 

yrs.)

25 LB. BAG

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

Bid Opening Date:  JUNE 25, 2014

Enrich 32 Horse

PURINA

LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC.

HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX

VALLEY FEED & SUPPLY INC.

EL PASO, TX

Bidder's Price

$1,844.85

Bidder's Price

$1,716.00

Bidder's Price

$5,148.00

LEFT BLANK

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED TOTAL
(Annual Total Price X 3 

yrs.)

UNIT PRICE

LEFT BLANK

Bidder's Price

$851.10

Bidder's Price

$2,553.30

APPROVED BY: _____/s/______

DATE:  ______7/10/14________  2014-419 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID II) - EL PASO ZOO 4



Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID II) Solicitation #:  2014-419

Department:  ZOO

ITEM

NO.

17. 150 Per LB. $0.6672 $100.08 $300.24 $18.71 $2,806.50 $8,419.50

LBS.

18. 1,250 Per LB. $1.3472 $1,684.00 $5,052.00 $39.58 $49,475.00 $148,425.00

LBS.

19. 5,000 Per LB. $0.407 $2,035.00 $6,105.00 $20.80 $104,000.00 $312,000.00

LBS.

20. 7,500 Per LB. $0.4082 $3,061.50 $9,184.50 $19.98 $149,850.00 $449,550.00

LBS.

LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC.

HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX

VALLEY FEED & SUPPLY INC.

EL PASO, TX

ANNUAL 

ESTIMATED 

TOTAL 
(Qty. X Unit Price)

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED TOTAL
(Annual Total Price X 3 

yrs.)

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED TOTAL
(Annual Total Price X 3 

yrs.)

PKG SIZE: 50 LB. BAG LEFT BLANK

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

Senior Equine

PURINA

BRAND: PURINA LEFT BLANK

STOCK# 352Q LEFT BLANK

STOCK# 5438 LEFT BLANK

PKG SIZE: 50 LB. BAG LEFT BLANK

Gamebird Layena Crumbles

PURINA #5438

BRAND: PURINA LEFT BLANK

Bidder's Price

$2,080.00

Bidder's Price

$6,240.00

STOCK# 5MK8 LEFT BLANK

PKG SIZE: 25 LB. BAG LEFT BLANK

PKG SIZE: 25 LB. BAG LEFT BLANK

Insectivore

MAZURI #5MK8

BRAND: MAZURI LEFT BLANK

UNIT OF 

MEASURE
UNIT PRICE

ANNUAL 

ESTIMATED 

TOTAL 
(Qty. X Unit Price)

STOCK# 5M01 LEFT BLANK

UNIT PRICE

Chinchilla Diet

MAZURI #5M01

BRAND: MAZURI LEFT BLANK

ITEM DESCRIPTION
ANNUAL

EST. QTY.

Bid Opening Date:  JUNE 25, 2014

Bidder's Price

$112.26

Bidder's Price

$336.78

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bidder's Price

$1,979.00

Bidder's Price

$5,937.00

Bidder's Price

$2,997.00

Bidder's Price

$8,991.00

APPROVED BY: _____/s/______

DATE:  ______7/10/14________  2014-419 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID II) - EL PASO ZOO 5



Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID II) Solicitation #:  2014-419

Department:  ZOO

ITEM

NO.

21. 600 Per LB. $0.2348 $140.88 $422.64 $10.48 $6,288.00 $18,864.00

LBS.

22. 3,500 Per LB. $1.433 $5,015.50 $15,046.50 $24.78 $86,730.00 $260,190.00

LBS.

23. 3,750 Per LB. $0.7202 $2,700.75 $8,102.25 $40.68 $152,550.00 $457,650.00

LBS.

24. 35,000 Per LB. $0.5222 $18,277.00 $54,831.00 $28.53 $998,550.00 $2,995,650.00

LBS.

Bidder's Price

$5,017.25

Bidder's Price

$15,051.75

LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC.

HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX

VALLEY FEED & SUPPLY INC.

EL PASO, TX

BRAND: PURINA LEFT BLANK

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

PKG SIZE: 

PKG SIZE: 50 LB. BAG LEFT BLANK

ZUPREEM LEFT BLANK

50 LB. BAG

Wild Herbivore Diet, Hi Fiber

MAZURI #5ZF1, 

LEFT BLANK

BRAND: MAZURI LEFT BLANK

BRAND:

ANNUAL 

ESTIMATED 

TOTAL 
(Qty. X Unit Price)

STOCK# L52M LEFT BLANK

STOCK# 5642 LEFT BLANK

PKG SIZE: 20 LB. BAG

Water Fowl Maintenance

MAZURI #5642,

BRAND:

Bidder's Price

$3,051.00

Bidder's Price

$9,153.00

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED TOTAL
(Annual Total Price X 3 

yrs.)

UNIT PRICE

LEFT BLANK

MAZURI LEFT BLANK

STOCK# ZUPREEM OMNIVOVE LEFT BLANK

Omnivore Chow

ZUPREEM

UNIT PRICEITEM DESCRIPTION
ANNUAL

EST. QTY.

PKG SIZE: 50 LB. BAG

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED TOTAL
(Annual Total Price X 3 

yrs.)

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

ANNUAL 

ESTIMATED 

TOTAL 
(Qty. X Unit Price)

Corn, Cracked

Bid Opening Date:  JUNE 25, 2014

Bidder's Price

$125.76

Bidder's Price

$377.28

Bidder's Price

$4,336.50

Bidder's Price

$13,009.50

Bidder's Price

$19,971.00

Bidder's Price

$59,913.00

LEFT BLANK

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

STOCK# 5ZF1 LEFT BLANK

APPROVED BY: _____/s/______

DATE:  ______7/10/14________  2014-419 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID II) - EL PASO ZOO 6



Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID II) Solicitation #:  2014-419

Department:  ZOO

ITEM

NO.

25. 2,750 Per LB. $1.03 $2,832.50 $8,497.50 $38.46 $105,765.00 $317,295.00

LBS.

26. 2,500 Per LB. $0.7042 $1,760.50 $5,281.50 $39.70 $99,250.00 $297,750.00

LBS.

27. 250 Per LB. $0.9056 $226.40 $679.20 $34.20 $8,550.00 $25,650.00

LBS.

28. 1,800 Per LB. $1.048 $1,886.40 $5,659.20 $30.49 $54,882.00 $164,646.00

LBS.

Bidder's Price

$2,856.00

Bidder's Price

$8,568.00

MAZURI

LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC.

HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX

VALLEY FEED & SUPPLY INC.

EL PASO, TX

ANNUAL

EST. QTY.
UNIT PRICE

ANNUAL 

ESTIMATED 

TOTAL 
(Qty. X Unit Price)

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED TOTAL
(Annual Total Price X 3 

yrs.)

Exotic Canine

MAZURI #5M52

ITEM DESCRIPTION

Bid Opening Date:  JUNE 25, 2014

BRAND:

5MN2

LEFT BLANK

PKG SIZE: 50 LB. BAG LEFT BLANK

PKG SIZE: 25 LB. BAG LEFT BLANK

BRAND: PURINA LEFT BLANK

STOCK#

Crane Maintenance

MAZURI #5646

STOCK# LEFT BLANK

PKG SIZE: 33 LB. BAG LEFT BLANK

Bidder's Price

$1,985.00

Bidder's Price

$5,955.00

BRAND: MAZURI LEFT BLANK

STOCK# 5646 LEFT BLANK

UNIT PRICE

ANNUAL 

ESTIMATED 

TOTAL 
(Qty. X Unit Price)

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED TOTAL
(Annual Total Price X 3 

yrs.)

63928 LEFT BLANK

PKG SIZE: 50 LB. BAG LEFT BLANK

BRAND: PURINA LEFT BLANK

Finch Seed Mix

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

STOCK# 62021 LEFT BLANK

Bidder's Price

$2,115.30

Bidder's Price

$6,345.90

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bidder's Price

$342.00

Bidder's Price

$1,026.00

Bidder's Price

$1,097.64

Bidder's Price

$3,292.92

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

Parrot Seed Mix

APPROVED BY: _____/s/______

DATE:  ______7/10/14________  2014-419 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID II) - EL PASO ZOO 7



Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID II) Solicitation #:  2014-419

Department:  ZOO

ITEM

NO.

29. 300 Per LB. $0.685 $205.50 $616.50 $41.24 $12,372.00 $37,116.00

LBS.

30. 2,750 Per LB. $1.75 $4,812.50 $14,437.50 $77.93 $214,307.50 $642,922.50

LBS.

31. 400 Per LB. $0.437 $174.80 $524.40 $13.43 $5,372.00 $16,116.00

LBS.

32. 100 Per LB. $2.00 $200.00 $600.00 N/A NO BID NO BID

LBS.

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

LEFT BLANK

LEFT BLANK

LEFT BLANK

10 LB. BAG

IAMS Less Active cat Food

IAMS

Bran 

PKG SIZE: 50 LB. BAG LEFT BLANK

PKG SIZE: NO BID

STOCK# LEFT BLANK

Peanuts, Raw in Shell

PKG SIZE: 50 LB. BAG

BRAND:

Sunflower Seeds

ITEM DESCRIPTION
ANNUAL

EST. QTY.
UNIT PRICE

ANNUAL 

ESTIMATED 

TOTAL 
(Qty. X Unit Price)

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED TOTAL
(Annual Total Price X 3 

yrs.)

Bid Opening Date:  JUNE 25, 2014

ANNUAL 

ESTIMATED 

TOTAL 
(Qty. X Unit Price)

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED TOTAL
(Annual Total Price X 3 

yrs.)

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC.

HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX

VALLEY FEED & SUPPLY INC.

EL PASO, TX

BRAND: PURINA

TONESSEED LEFT BLANK

STOCK#

BRAND: PURINA LEFT BLANK

PEANUT

STOCK# 1459

LEFT BLANK

LEFT BLANK

IAMS NO BID

PKG SIZE: 

BRAND:

STOCK#

2671026-106

IAMS LESS ACTIVE NO BID

50 LB. BAG

Bidder's Price

$247.44

Bidder's Price

$742.32

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

UNIT PRICE

Bidder's Price

$4,286.15

Bidder's Price

$12,858.45

Bidder's Price

$107.44

Bidder's Price

$322.32

APPROVED BY: _____/s/______

DATE:  ______7/10/14________  2014-419 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID II) - EL PASO ZOO 8



Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID II) Solicitation #:  2014-419

Department:  ZOO

ITEM

NO.

33. 3,000 Per LB. $1.3364 $4,009.20 $12,027.60 $38.56 $115,680.00 $347,040.00

LBS.

34. 600 Per LB. $0.8524 $511.44 $1,534.32 $23.71 $14,226.00 $42,678.00

LBS.

35. 90 Per LB. $5.033 $452.97 $1,358.91 $49.68 $4,471.20 $13,413.60

LBS.

36. 80 Per LB. $1.4355 $114.84 $344.52 $32.48 $2,598.40 $7,795.20

LBS.

Bidder's Price

$453.00

Bidder's Price

$1,359.00

5MA4

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC.

HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX

VALLEY FEED & SUPPLY INC.

EL PASO, TX

LEFT BLANK

STOCK# 5M78 LEFT BLANK

PKG SIZE: 20 LB. BAG LEFT BLANK

PKG SIZE: 6 / CASE LEFT BLANK

BRAND: MAZURI LEFT BLANK

BRAND: MAZURI LEFT BLANK

STOCK# 5.00E+07 LEFT BLANK

LEFT BLANK

PKG SIZE: 25 LB. BAG LEFT BLANK

PKG SIZE: 25 LB. BAG LEFT BLANK

5MA1

Bidder's Price

$1,707.12

Growth & Repro. Primate

MAZURI #5MA1

LEFT BLANK

Browse Biscuits

MAZURI #5MA4

ITEM DESCRIPTION
ANNUAL

EST. QTY.
UNIT PRICE

ANNUAL 

ESTIMATED 

TOTAL 
(Qty. X Unit Price)

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED TOTAL
(Annual Total Price X 3 

yrs.)

UNIT PRICE

Bidder's Price

$6,940.80

Bidder's Price

$20,822.40

BRAND: MAZURI

STOCK#

BRAND: MAZURI LEFT BLANK

STOCK#

Bidder's Price

$569.04

Bid Opening Date:  JUNE 25, 2014

ANNUAL 

ESTIMATED 

TOTAL 
(Qty. X Unit Price)

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED TOTAL
(Annual Total Price X 3 

yrs.)

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

Koi Pond Nuggets

MAZURI #5M78

Iguana Diet

MAZURI #5M07 Bidder's Price

$496.80

Bidder's Price

$1,490.40

Bidder's Price

$129.92

Bidder's Price

$389.76

APPROVED BY: _____/s/______

DATE:  ______7/10/14________  2014-419 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID II) - EL PASO ZOO 9



Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID II) Solicitation #:  2014-419

Department:  ZOO

ITEM

NO.

37. 80 Per LB. $0.75 $60.00 $180.00 $3.78 $302.40 $907.20

LBS.

38. 3,000 Per LB. $0.5414 $1,624.20 $4,872.60 $29.71 $89,130.00 $267,390.00

LBS.

39. 2,000 Per LB. $1.094 $2,188.00 $6,564.00 $31.13 $62,260.00 $186,780.00

LBS.

40. 2,500 Per LB. $0.7616 $1,904.00 $5,712.00 $43.22 $108,050.00 $324,150.00

LBS.

LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC.

HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX

VALLEY FEED & SUPPLY INC.

EL PASO, TX

LEFT BLANK

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED TOTAL
(Annual Total Price X 3 

yrs.)

PKG SIZE: 50 LB. BAG LEFT BLANK

BRAND: MAZURI LEFT BLANK

STOCK# 5640 LEFT BLANK

STOCK# 5M21 LEFT BLANK

PKG SIZE: 25 LB. BAG LEFT BLANK

PKG SIZE: 50 LB. BAG LEFT BLANK

BRAND: MAZURI LEFT BLANK

BRAND: MAZURI LEFT BLANK

STOCK# 5655 LEFT BLANK

BRAND: MORTORS LEFT BLANK

UNIT PRICE

Bid Opening Date:  JUNE 25, 2014

ANNUAL 

ESTIMATED 

TOTAL 
(Qty. X Unit Price)

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

LEFT BLANK

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

Water Fowl Breeder

MAZURI #5640

Tortoise Diet

MAZURI #5M21

Sheep Loco

MAZURI #5655

PKG SIZE: LEFT BLANK

Plain Salt Bricks

ITEM DESCRIPTION
ANNUAL

EST. QTY.
UNIT PRICE

ANNUAL 

ESTIMATED 

TOTAL 
(Qty. X Unit Price)

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED TOTAL
(Annual Total Price X 3 

yrs.)

STOCK# 5B4

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bidder's Price

$75.60

Bidder's Price

$226.80

Bidder's Price

$1,782.60

Bidder's Price

$5,347.80

Bidder's Price

$2,490.40

Bidder's Price

$7,471.20

Bidder's Price

$2,161.00

Bidder's Price

$6,483.00

APPROVED BY: _____/s/______

DATE:  ______7/10/14________  2014-419 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID II) - EL PASO ZOO 10



Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID II) Solicitation #:  2014-419

Department:  ZOO

ITEM

NO.

41. 300 Per LB. $0.305 $91.50 $274.50 N/A NO BID NO BID

LBS.

42. 100 Per LB. $0.50 $50.00 $150.00 N/A NO BID NO BID

LBS.

43. 300 Per LB. $0.304 $91.20 $273.60 $23.46 $7,038.00 $21,114.00

LBS.

44. 150 $22.72 $3,408.00 $10,224.00 $23.61 $3,541.50 $10,624.50

Kilograms

LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC.

HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX

VALLEY FEED & SUPPLY INC.

EL PASO, TX

PKG SIZE: 1 KG LEFT BLANK

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

BRAND: MAZURI LEFT BLANK

STOCK# 5ME4 LEFT BLANK

LEFT BLANK

PKG SIZE: 50 LB. BAG LEFT BLANK

Gel, Bird Zulife

MAZURI #5ME4

Per 

Kilogram

OATMEAL NO BID

PKG SIZE: 50 LB. BAG NO BID

Oyster Shell

STOCK#

Bidder's Price

$140.76

Bidder's Price

$422.28

NO BID

PKG SIZE: 50 LB. BAG NO BID

Oatmeal

BRAND: OATMEAL NO BID

STOCK#

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

BRAND: CALCIUM NO BID

Calcium Carbonate Powder

ITEM DESCRIPTION
ANNUAL

EST. QTY.

ANNUAL 

ESTIMATED 

TOTAL 
(Qty. X Unit Price)

CALCIUM CARBONATE

PURINA LEFT BLANK

STOCK# 2653340

BRAND:

ANNUAL 

ESTIMATED 

TOTAL 
(Qty. X Unit Price)

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED TOTAL
(Annual Total Price X 3 

yrs.)

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED TOTAL
(Annual Total Price X 3 

yrs.)

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

Bid Opening Date:  JUNE 25, 2014

APPROVED BY: _____/s/______

DATE:  ______7/10/14________  2014-419 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID II) - EL PASO ZOO 11



Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID II) Solicitation #:  2014-419

Department:  ZOO

ITEM

NO.

45. 150 Per $22.26 $3,339.00 $10,017.00 $16.99 $2,548.50 $7,645.50

Kilogram Kilogram

46. 760 Per GRAM $0.16446 $124.99 $374.97 $116.95 $88,882.00 $266,646.00

GRAMS

47. 150 Per LB. $1.666 $249.90 $749.70 $48.69 $7,303.50 $21,910.50

LBS.

48. 140 Per LB. $7.556 $1,057.84 $3,173.52 $54.71 $7,659.40 $22,978.20

LBS.

Bidder's Price

LEFT BLANK

Bidder's Price

LEFT BLANK

LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC.

HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX

VALLEY FEED & SUPPLY INC.

EL PASO, TX

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

STOCK# VIONATE 10 LEFT BLANK

PKG SIZE: 10 LB. CONTAINER LEFT BLANK

PKG SIZE: 25 LB. BAG LEFT BLANK

Vionate Mineral Supplements

BRAND: VIONATE LEFT BLANK

Bidder's Price

$765.94

Bidder's Price

$2,297.82

BRAND: MAZURI LEFT BLANK

STOCK# 5M87 LEFT BLANK

5M25 LEFT BLANK

PKG SIZE: 1 CANISTER LEFT BLANK

Turtle Diet, Freshwater

MAZURI #5M87 Bidder's Price

$249.96

Bidder's Price

$749.88

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

BRAND: MAZURI LEFT BLANK

UNIT PRICE

Bid Opening Date:  JUNE 25, 2014

LEFT BLANK

LEFT BLANK

5M15

BRAND: MAZURI LEFT BLANK

STOCK#

STOCK#

PKG SIZE: 1 KG

Tablets, Vita Zu Bird

MAZURI #5M25

Gel, Callitrichid Diet

MAZURI #5M15

ITEM DESCRIPTION
ANNUAL

EST. QTY.
UNIT PRICE

ANNUAL 

ESTIMATED 

TOTAL 
(Qty. X Unit Price)

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED TOTAL
(Annual Total Price X 3 

yrs.)

ANNUAL 

ESTIMATED 

TOTAL 
(Qty. X Unit Price)

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED TOTAL
(Annual Total Price X 3 

yrs.)

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bidder's Price

$1,169.50

Bidder's Price

$3,588.50

Bidder's Price

$292.14

Bidder's Price

$876.42

APPROVED BY: _____/s/______

DATE:  ______7/10/14________  2014-419 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID II) - EL PASO ZOO 12



Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID II) Solicitation #:  2014-419

Department:  ZOO

ITEM

NO.

49. 13,750 Per LB. $0.5442 $7,482.75 $22,448.25 $29.88 $410,850.00 $1,232,550.00

LBS.

50. 5,000 Per LB. $0.701 $3,505.00 $10,515.00 $31.60 $158,000.00 $474,000.00

LBS.

51. 1 $15.75 $15.75 $47.25 N/A NO BID NO BID

Kilogram

52. 4 $25.93 $103.72 $311.16 $34.95 $139.80 $419.40

Kilogram

LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC.

HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX

VALLEY FEED & SUPPLY INC.

EL PASO, TX

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

STOCK# 5Z94 LEFT BLANK

PKG SIZE: 1 KG LEFT BLANK

1 KG NO BID

Gel, Aquatic Omnivore Diet

MAZURI #5Z94, KG

BRAND: MAZURI LEFT BLANK

Per 

Kilogram

PKG SIZE: 

5Z95 LEFT BLANK

PKG SIZE: 40 LB. BAG LEFT BLANK

Ce De Egg
Per 

Kilogram

CE DE EGG

50 LB. BAG LEFT BLANK

Petting Zoo

MAZURI #5Z95

BRAND: MAZURI LEFT BLANK

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

BRAND: MAZURI LEFT BLANK

STOCK# 5662 LEFT BLANK

ITEM DESCRIPTION
ANNUAL

EST. QTY.

ANNUAL 

ESTIMATED 

TOTAL 
(Qty. X Unit Price)

BRAND: CE DE EGG NO BID

STOCK#

PKG SIZE: 

STOCK#

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

UNIT PRICE

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED TOTAL
(Annual Total Price X 3 

yrs.)

UNIT PRICE

Bid Opening Date:  JUNE 25, 2014

ANNUAL 

ESTIMATED 

TOTAL 
(Qty. X Unit Price)

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED TOTAL
(Annual Total Price X 3 

yrs.)

Zebra Pellets

MAZURI #5662 Bidder's Price

$8,217.00

Bidder's Price

$24,651.00

Bidder's Price

$3,950.00

Bidder's Price

$11,850.00

NO BID

APPROVED BY: _____/s/______

DATE:  ______7/10/14________  2014-419 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID II) - EL PASO ZOO 13



Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID II) Solicitation #:  2014-419

Department:  ZOO

ITEM

NO.

53. 13,050 Per OZ $0.20269 $2,645.10 $7,935.31 $18.25 $238,162.50 $714,487.50

OZ /CASE

54. 8,700 Per oz. $0.20269 $1,763.40 $5,290.21 $1.52 $13,224.00 $39,672.00

OZ /CAN

55. 1,500 Per LB. $1.9235 $2,885.25 $8,655.75 $34.78 $52,170.00 $156,510.00

LBS.

56. 200 Per LB. $3.8145 $762.90 $2,288.70 $31.71 $6,342.00 $19,026.00

LBS.

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC.

HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX

VALLEY FEED & SUPPLY INC.

EL PASO, TX

Bid Opening Date:  JUNE 25, 2014

STOCK# ZUPREEM FRUIT LEFT BLANK

PKG SIZE: 20 LB. BAG LEFT BLANK

20 LB. BAG LEFT BLANK

Fruit Blend Bird Food 

Parrot/Conure/Softbill

ZUPREEM

BRAND: ZUPREEM LEFT BLANK

1 CAN 14.5 OZ LEFT BLANK

Primate Dry Maintenance

ZUPREEM

BRAND: ZUPREEM LEFT BLANK

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

BRAND: ZUPREEM LEFT BLANK

STOCK# ZUPREEM LEFT BLANK

UNIT PRICEUNIT PRICE

ANNUAL 

ESTIMATED 

TOTAL 
(Qty. X Unit Price)

PKG SIZE: 1 CAN 14.5 OZ

BRAND: ZUPREEM

STOCK# ZUPREEM

Canned Marmoset

ZUPREEM

PKG SIZE: 

STOCK# ZUPREEM PRIMATE

ANNUAL

EST. QTY.

LEFT BLANK

PKG SIZE: 

LEFT BLANK

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Canned Primate

MAZUPREEM

ITEM DESCRIPTION

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED TOTAL
(Annual Total Price X 3 

yrs.)

Bidder's Price

$693.50

ANNUAL 

ESTIMATED 

TOTAL 
(Qty. X Unit Price)

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED TOTAL
(Annual Total Price X 3 

yrs.)

Bidder's Price

$2,080.50

Bidder's Price

$912.00

Bidder's Price

$2,736.00

Bidder's Price

$2,608.50

Bidder's Price

$7,825.50

Bidder's Price

$317.10

Bidder's Price

$951.30

LEFT BLANK

LEFT BLANK

Bidder's Price

$2,645.11

APPROVED BY: _____/s/______

DATE:  ______7/10/14________  2014-419 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID II) - EL PASO ZOO 14



Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID II) Solicitation #:  2014-419

Department:  ZOO

ITEM

NO.

57. 2,000 Per LB. $2.3825 $4,765.00 $14,295.00 $35.85 $71,700.00 $215,100.00

LBS.

58. 500 Per LB. $2.4825 $1,241.25 $3,723.75 $35.85 $17,925.00 $53,775.00

LBS.

59. 1,750 Per LB. $0.5996 $1,049.30 $3,147.90 $28.37 $49,647.50 $148,942.50

LBS.

60. 1,250 Per LB. $0.4044 $505.50 $1,516.50 $22.70 $28,375.00 $85,125.00

LBS.

LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC.

HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

VALLEY FEED & SUPPLY INC.

EL PASO, TX

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

STOCK# 597J LEFT BLANK

PKG SIZE: 50 LB. BAGS LEFT BLANK

PKG SIZE: 50 LB. BAGS LEFT BLANK

Goat, Honor Show Chow

PURINA #597J

BRAND: PURINA LEFT BLANK

Equine Enrich Plus

PURINA #35ML

BRAND: PURINA LEFT BLANK

STOCK# ENRICH PLUS LEFT BLANK

STOCK# NATURAL PARROT LEFT BLANK

PKG SIZE: 20 LB. BAG LEFT BLANK

BRAND: ZUPREEM LEFT BLANK

STOCK# NATURAL CANARIES LEFT BLANK

ANNUAL 

ESTIMATED 

TOTAL 
(Qty. X Unit Price)

Bid Opening Date:  JUNE 25, 2014

ANNUAL

EST. QTY.
UNIT PRICE

20 LB. BAG LEFT BLANK

Natural Bird Diet - Parrot/Conure/Softbill

(Low Iron)

ZUPREEM

PKG SIZE: 

Natural Bird Diet-Canaries/Finch/Softbill

(Low Iron)

ZUPREEM

UNIT PRICE

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

BRAND: ZUPREEM

ANNUAL 

ESTIMATED 

TOTAL 
(Qty. X Unit Price)

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED TOTAL
(Annual Total Price X 3 

yrs.)

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED TOTAL
(Annual Total Price X 3 

yrs.)

Bidder's Price

$3,585.00

Bidder's Price

$10,755.00

ITEM DESCRIPTION

Bidder's Price

$896.25

Bidder's Price

$2,688.75

Bidder's Price

$992.95

Bidder's Price

$2,978.85

Bidder's Price

$567.50

Bidder's Price

$1,702.50

LEFT BLANK

APPROVED BY: _____/s/______

DATE:  ______7/10/14________  2014-419 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID II) - EL PASO ZOO 15



Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID II) Solicitation #:  2014-419

Department:  ZOO

ITEM

NO.

61. 8,750 Per LB. $0.5552 $4,858.00 $14,574.00 $18.65 $163,187.50 $489,562.50

LBS.

62. 7,500 Per LB. $0.5552 $4,164.00 $12,492.00 $15.28 $114,600.00 $343,800.00

LBS.

63. 250 Per LB. $2.80 $700.00 $2,100.00 $5.53 $1,382.50 $4,147.50

LBS.

64. 3,750 Per LB. $1.4464 $5,424.00 $16,272.00 $41.94 $157,275.00 $471,825.00

LBS.

LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC.

HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX

VALLEY FEED & SUPPLY INC.

EL PASO, TX

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  JUNE 25, 2014

BRAND: MAZURI LEFT BLANK

STOCK#

PKG SIZE: 

STOCK# LEFT BLANK

PKG SIZE: 

25 LB. BAG LEFT BLANK

LEFT BLANK5Z92

OXBOW40

UNIT OF 

MEASURE
UNIT PRICE

ANNUAL 

ESTIMATED 

TOTAL 
(Qty. X Unit Price)

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED TOTAL
(Annual Total Price X 3 

yrs.)

ITEM DESCRIPTION
ANNUAL

EST. QTY.

BRAND: MAZURI

UNIT PRICE

ANNUAL 

ESTIMATED 

TOTAL 
(Qty. X Unit Price)

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED TOTAL
(Annual Total Price X 3 

yrs.)

Mini-Pig, Adult

MAZURI #5 Z91

25 LB.

Mini-Pig, Elder

MAZURI #5Z92

STOCK# 5M1S LEFT BLANK

LEFT BLANK

Bagged Timothy Hay for small mammals

BRAND: OXBOW LEFT BLANK

LEFT BLANK

BRAND: MAZURI

40 OZ. BAG

PKG SIZE: 

STOCK# 5Z91

Primate Low Starch Cinnamon

MAZURI #5M1S

PKG SIZE: 25 LB. BAG LEFT BLANK

LEFT BLANK

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

Bidder's Price

$6,527.50

Bidder's Price

$19,582.50

Bidder's Price

$4,584.00

Bidder's Price

$13,752.00

LEFT BLANK

LEFT BLANK

Bidder's Price

$3,145.50

Bidder's Price

$9,436.50

APPROVED BY: _____/s/______

DATE:  ______7/10/14________  2014-419 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID II) - EL PASO ZOO 16



Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID II) Solicitation #:  2014-419

Department:  ZOO

ITEM

NO.

65. 1,000 Per LB. $0.3426 $342.60 $1,027.80 N/A NO BID NO BID

LBS.

66. 50 Per LB. $0.2402 $12.01 $36.03 N/A NO BID NO BID

LBS.

67. 25 $28.25 $706.25 $2,118.75 $29.28 $732.00 $2,196.00

Kilograms

68. 150 Per LB. $0.344 $51.60 $154.80 $18.36 $2,754.00 $8,262.00

LBS.

LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC.

HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX

VALLEY FEED & SUPPLY INC.

EL PASO, TX

50 LB. BAG NO BID

Alfalfa Cubes

1" cube

BRAND:

ITEM DESCRIPTION
ANNUAL

EST. QTY.

UNIT OF 

MEASURE
UNIT PRICE

ANNUAL 

ESTIMATED 

TOTAL 
(Qty. X Unit Price)

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED TOTAL
(Annual Total Price X 3 

yrs.)

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  JUNE 25, 2014

ANNUAL 

ESTIMATED 

TOTAL 
(Qty. X Unit Price)

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED TOTAL
(Annual Total Price X 3 

yrs.)

UNIT PRICE

STOCK# 59ZM NO BID

PKG SIZE: 50 LB. BAG NO BID

Timothy Cubes

1" cube

BRAND: PURINA

PURINA NO BID

Gel, Aquatic

MAZURI #5M70

BRAND: MAZURI LEFT BLANK

STOCK# 1580

NO BID

PKG SIZE: 

NO BID

STOCK# 5M70 LEFT BLANK

PKG SIZE: PER KG LEFT BLANK

50 LB. BAG LEFT BLANK

Rabbit Chow Complete

PURINA #53OJ

BRAND: PURINA LEFT BLANK

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

STOCK# 530J LEFT BLANK

PKG SIZE: 

Per 

Kilogram

Bidder's Price

$342.40

Bidder's Price

$1,027.20

Bidder's Price

$55.08

Bidder's Price

$165.24

APPROVED BY: _____/s/______

DATE:  ______7/10/14________  2014-419 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID II) - EL PASO ZOO 17



Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID II) Solicitation #:  2014-419

Department:  ZOO

ITEM

NO.

69. 1,000 Per LB. $1.66 $1,660.00 $4,980.00 $59.23 $59,230.00 $177,690.00

LBS.

70. 2,000 Per LB. $1.664 $3,328.00 $9,984.00 $59.23 $118,460.00 $355,380.00

LBS.

71. 800 Per LB. $1.8745 $1,499.60 $4,498.80 $67.41 $53,928.00 $161,784.00

LBS.

Bidder's Price

$1,664.00

Bidder's Price

$4,992.00

LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC.

HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX

VALLEY FEED & SUPPLY INC.

EL PASO, TX

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  JUNE 25, 2014

UNIT PRICE

ANNUAL 

ESTIMATED 

TOTAL 
(Qty. X Unit Price)

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED TOTAL
(Annual Total Price X 3 

yrs.)

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED TOTAL
(Annual Total Price X 3 

yrs.)

ANNUAL 

ESTIMATED 

TOTAL 
(Qty. X Unit Price)

75600 LEFT BLANK

ITEM DESCRIPTION
ANNUAL

EST. QTY.

UNIT OF 

MEASURE
UNIT PRICE

LEFT BLANK

Avian Breeder Natural ML (parrot/conure)

ZUPREEM #75600

BRAND: ZUPREEM LEFT BLANK

STOCK#

Avian Breeder Natural M (cockatiel)

ZUPREEM #76600

BRAND: ZUPREEM LEFT BLANK

PKG SIZE: 40 LB. BAGS

40 LB. LEFT BLANK

Avian Breeder Fruit Blend ML 

(parrot/conure)

ZUPREEM #78600

STOCK# 76600

PKG SIZE: 40 LB. LEFT BLANK

BRAND: ZUPREEM LEFT BLANK

STOCK# 78600 LEFT BLANK

LEFT BLANK

PKG SIZE: 

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

Bidder's Price

$2,961.50

Bidder's Price

$8,884.50

Bidder's Price

$2,369.20

Bidder's Price

$7,107.60

Bidder's Price

$1,348.20

Bidder's Price

$4,044.60

APPROVED BY: _____/s/______

DATE:  ______7/10/14________  2014-419 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID II) - EL PASO ZOO 18



Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID II) Solicitation #:  2014-419

Department:  ZOO

ITEM

NO.

72. 480 Per LB. $0.30625 $147.00 $441.00 $8.92 $4,281.60 $12,844.80

LBS.

73. 2,880 Per $0.24412 $703.07 $2,109.20 $19.84 $57,139.20 $171,417.60

GRAMS GRAM Bidder's Price

$703.08

Bidder's Price

$2,109.24

LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC.

HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX

VALLEY FEED & SUPPLY INC.

EL PASO, TX

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

ITEM DESCRIPTION
ANNUAL

EST. QTY.

Trace Mineral

BLOCK

BRAND: PURINA LEFT BLANK

STOCK# MB40 LEFT BLANK

LEFT BLANK

PKG SIZE: 80 GRAMS LEFT BLANK

PKG SIZE: 40 LB. LEFT BLANK

Thiamine-E

MAZURI #10112, 

80 grams

BRAND:

STOCK# 10112 LEFT BLANK

MAZURI

UNIT PRICE

ANNUAL 

ESTIMATED 

TOTAL 

(Qty. X Unit Price)

UNIT PRICE

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED TOTAL
(Annual Total Price X 3 

yrs.)

Bid Opening Date:  JUNE 25, 2014

ANNUAL 

ESTIMATED 

TOTAL 
(Qty. X Unit Price)

3 YEAR 

ESTIMATED TOTAL

(Annual Total Price 

X 3 yrs.)

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bidder's Price

$714.24

Bidder's Price

$2,142.72

Bidder's Price

$1,070.40

Bidder's Price

$3,211.20

APPROVED BY: _____/s/______

DATE:  ______7/10/14________  2014-419 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID II) - EL PASO ZOO 19



Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID II) Solicitation #:  2014-419

Department:  ZOO

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO

EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT,  BY GIVING THE

CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON

THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF

THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), 

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION 

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), 

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION 

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

NO OPTION OFFERED

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT

BY PROCUREMENT CARD:

LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC.

HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX

VALLEY FEED & SUPPLY INC.

EL PASO, TX

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

Bid Opening Date:  JUNE 25, 2014

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.  A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

                    NO         YES                    NO                  YES

NET - 30 DAYSPAYMENT TERMS:

BIDS SOLICITED:   16              LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED:     7            BIDS RECEIVED:   2               LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED:   1           NO BID:   0

X 

X X 

APPROVED BY: _____/s/______

DATE:  ______7/10/14________  2014-419 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID II) - EL PASO ZOO 20


