El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO Exoexs
BID TABULATION 'l

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-444
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

BID ITEM: TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARY 14, 2015

CASA FORD INC. DICK POE DODGE LP E(Ij_bZASSU?\Iﬁ}AJIII-g QEISEISSIID%I\IIES
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM ESTIMATED Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X
‘o DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE Unit Price UNIT PRICE Unit Price UNIT PRICE Unit Price
3/4 TON PICKUP TRUCKS
34 TON PICKUP, EXTENDED CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE,
4X4, GAS, V8, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE
EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR
1. LOCKS, POWER WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR 1 $26,551.59 $26,551.59 $27,064.00 $27,064.00 $25,607.03 $25,607.03
COVERING, SPOTLIGHT ON BOTH SIDES, TOWING
PACKAGE, HITCH
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 FORD F-250 RAM 2500 2015 CREW CAB DJ7L91 2015 2500 REG CAB 4x4
1/2 TON PICKUP TRUCKS
% TON PICKUP, EXTENDED CAB, LONG 8' BOX SIZE, 4X4,
GAS, V8, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR,
2. || STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, MANUAL WINDOWS, SEATS, 2 $26,296.62 $52,593.24 $25,450.77 $50,901.54 NO BID
VINYL FLOOR COVERING, TOWING PACKAGE, HITCH
LIGHTBAR-AMBER
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 FORD F-150 2015 RAM 1500 4x4 QUAD CAB D56L41
145 TON PICKUP, EXTENDED CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE,
4X2, GAS, V8 AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE
EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR
3. LOCKS, POWER WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR 3 $23,198.94 $69,596.82 $22,419.27 $67,257.81 $24,884.03 $74,652.09
COVERING, SPOTLIGHTS BOTH FRONT PILLARS,
TOWING PACKAGE
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 FORD F-150 2015 RAM, 1500 4x2 QUAD CAB DS1L98 2015 QUAD CAB 1500
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement.

Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/17/15

2015-444 TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS - GENERAL SERVICES




CITY OF EL PASO v

All-America City

BID TABULATION 'l

2010
BID ITEM: TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS Solicitation #: 2015-444
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARY 14, 2015 Department: GENERAL SERVICES
CASA FORD INC. DICK POE DODGE LP E(;_bZASSU?\Iﬁ,LAJI-I\I-g sgg;lsglljoel\és
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
1/2 TON PICKUP TRUCKS
ITEM ESTIMATED Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X
‘o DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE Unit Price UNIT PRICE Unit Price UNIT PRICE Unit Price
15 TON PICKUP, EXTENDED CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE,
4X2, GAS, V8, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE
4. EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR 1 $22,594.25 $22,594.25 $21,802.00 $21,802.00 $21,421.75 $21,421.75
LOCKS, POWER WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR
COVERING, TOWING PACKAGE, HITCH
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 FORD F-150 2015 RAM 1?)()801?42 QUAD CAB 2015 QUAD CAB 1500 4x2
15 TON PICKUP, EXTENDED CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE,
4X4, GAS, V8 AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE
5. EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, MANUAL 1 $24,652.85 $24,652.85 $24,145.00 $24,145.00 $23,498.75 $23,498.75
WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR COVERING, TOWING
PACKAGE
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 FORD F-150 2015 RAM 1500 4X4 QUAD CAB 2015 QUAD CAB 4x4
DS6L41 6.4 BED
15 TON PICKUP, CREW CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE, 4X4,
GAS, V8, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR,
6. | STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR LOCKS, POWER 2 $27,810.85 $55,621.70 $27,122.00 $54,244.00 $26,227.75 $52,455.50
WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR COVERING, TOWING
PACKAGE, HITCH
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 FORD F-150 RAM 1500 2015 4x4 CREW CAB 2015 1500 CREW CAB 4x4
D56L91 5.7 BED
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/17/15

2015-444 TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS - GENERAL SERVICES



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

‘l”l'

2010

BID ITEM: TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARY 14, 2015

Department: GENERAL SERVICES

Solicitation #: 2015-444

CASA FORD INC.

DICK POE DODGE LP

EL PASO AUTO ACQUISITIONS
dba SUNLAND PARK DODGE

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
1/2 TON PICKUP TRUCKS
ITEM ESTIMATED Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X
‘o DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE Unit Price UNIT PRICE Unit Price UNIT PRICE Unit Price
15 TON PICKUP, CREW, CAB, LONG 8' BOX SIZE, 4X2,
GAS, V8, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR,
7. STANDARD INTERIOR, AC AUTO DOOR LOCKS, POWER 2 $24,802.88 $49,605.76 $24,317.00 $48,634.00 NO BID
WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR COVERING
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 FORD F-150 2015 RAM 1500 4x2 DS1L91
12 TON PICKUP, CREW CAB, LONG BOX SIZE, 4X4, GAS,
V8, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR,
8. || STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR LOCKS, POWER 2 $28,590.85 $57,181.70 $27,515.00 $55,030.00 $26,775.75 $53,551.50
WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR COVERING, TOWING
PACKAGE, HITCH, SYNC OR EQUIVALENT BIDDER'S PRICE
$80,327.50
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 FORD F-150 2015 RAM 1500 4x4 CREW DSL91 2015 CREW CAB 1500 4x4
15 TON PICKUP, CREW CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE, 4X4,
GAS, V8 AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR,
9. || STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR LOCKS, POWER 3 $28,326.85 $84,980.55 $27,515.00 $82,545.00 $26,493.75 $79,481.25
WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR COVERING, TOWING
PACKAGE, HITCH SYNC OR EQUIVALENT

YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL

2015 FORD F-150

2015 RAM 1500 4x4 DS6L91

2015 CREW CAB 4x4

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement.

Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/17/15

2015-444 TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS - GENERAL SERVICES



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARY 14, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-444
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

CASA FORD INC.

DICK POE DODGE LP

EL PASO AUTO ACQUISITIONS
dba SUNLAND PARK DODGE

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
1/2 TON PICKUP TRUCKS
ITEM ESTIMATED Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X
‘o DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE Unit Price UNIT PRICE Unit Price UNIT PRICE Unit Price
12 TON PICKUP, REGULAR CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE,
4X2, GAS, V6, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE
10. EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AD, AUTO DOOR 6 $19,834.28 $119,005.68 $21,544.00 $129,264.00 $22,367.75 $134,206.50
LOCKS, POWER WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR
COVERING BIDDER'S PRICE
$129,624.00
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 FORD F-150 2015 RAM :LDSS??LA;XZZ REG CAB 2015 REG CAB 1500
12 TON PICKUP, REGULAR CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE,
4X2, GAS, V6, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE
11. EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR 2 $20,106.25 $40,212.50 $22,282.00 $44,564.00 $22,449.75 $44,899.50
LOCKS, POWER WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR
COVERING, TOWING PACKAGE, HITCH
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 FORD F-150 2015 RAM ]IS5SOJ?LAG;);2 REG CAB 2015 REG CAB 4x2
15 TON PICKUP, REGULAR CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE,
4X2, GAS, V6, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE
12. EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR 6 $19,834.28 $119,005.68 $21,844.00 $131,064.00 $22,367.75 $134,206.50
LOCKS, POWER WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR
COVERING BIDDER'S PRICE
$133,106.00
2015 RAM 1500 4x2 REG CAB

YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL

2015 FORD F-150

DS1L61

2015 REG CAB 1500

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement.

Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/17/15

2015-444 TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS - GENERAL SERVICES




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

‘l"l'

2010

BID ITEM: TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARY 14, 2015

Department: GENERAL SERVICES

Solicitation #: 2015-444

CASA FORD INC.

DICK POE DODGE LP

EL PASO AUTO ACQUISITIONS
dba SUNLAND PARK DODGE

LOCKS, POWER WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR
COVERING, TOWING PKG, HITCH, DUEL WHEELS

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
1/2 TON PICKUP TRUCKS

ITEM ESTIMATED Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X
‘o DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE Unit Price UNIT PRICE Unit Price UNIT PRICE Unit Price

12 TON PICK UP, REGULAR CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE,

4X2, GAS, V6, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE
13. EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR 2 $19,834.28 $39,668.56 $21,844.00 $43,688.00 $22,367.75 $44,735.50
LOCKS, POWER WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR
COVERING
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 FORD F-150 2015 RAM ]I-DSSJ(_)L46X12 REG CAB 2015 REG CAB 1500
12 TON PICK UP, REGULAR CAB, LONG 8 BOX SIZE, 4X2,
GAS, V8, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR,

14. STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, POWER WINDOWS, SEATS. 2 $21,641.85 $43,283.70 $21,544.00 $43,088.00 $20,338.75 $40,677.50

VINYL FLOOR COVERING, TOWING PACKAGE, HITCH

2015 RAM 1500 4x2
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 FORD F-150 REG CAB V-8 DS1L61 2015 REG CAB 4x2
1 TON PICKUP

1 TON PICKUP, CREW CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE, 4X2,

DIESEL, V8 6.6L, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE
15. EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, A/C, AUTO DOOR 1 $34,963.90 $34,963.90 $38,206.00 $38,206.00 $40,405.75

$40,405.75

YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL

2015 FORD F-150

RAM 3500 4x2 CREW CAB DIESEL

2015 RAM 3500

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement.

Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/17/15

2015-444 TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS - GENERAL SERVICES



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

'l

2010

BID ITEM: TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARY 14, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-444

Department: GENERAL SERVICES

CASA FORD INC. DICK POE DODGE LP E(!l_bZASSU?\Jﬁ:LS Q:gﬁlsgé%hés
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO. TX
ITEM ESTIMATED Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X
. DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT PRICE et o UNIT PRICE et o UNIT PRICE et Prics
5 PASSENGER SUV
5 PASSENGER SUB, 4 DOOR, 4X2 GAS, V6 AUTOMATIC
16. TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR, STANDARD 11 | $22,892.64 | $251,819.04 |[$26,049.00 | $286,539.00 $26,039.75 $286,437.25
INTERIOR, A/C, SEATS VINYL FLOOR COVERING, ALL
WEATHER FLOOR MATS
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 FORD ESCAPE 2015 DURAN?A?D‘T’DEE'AL SERVICE 2015 JEEP GRAND CHEROKEE
1/2 TON CARGO VAN
15 TON CARGO VAN, 2 DOOR, SLIDING SIDE CARGO
DOOR, REAR CARGO DOOR, 50/50, SPLIT WITH
WINDOWS, 4X2, GAS, V6, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION,
17. | WHITE EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, POWER DOOR 2 $21,907.33 $43,814.66 | $26,138.00 $52,276.00 NO BID
LOCKS, POWER WINDOWS, A/C, REAR A/C, BUCKET 2
SEAT, VINYL FLOOR COVERING, BULKHEAD WITHOUT
DOOR
2015 RAM 1500 PROMASTER 1500
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 FORD TRANSIT 150 RGO VAN 136w v 2
3/4 TON CARGO VAN
34 TON CARGO VAN, 2 DOOR, SLIDING SIDE CARGO
DOOR, REAR CARGO DOOR 50/50 SPLIT WITH WINDOWS,
18. 4X2, GAS, V8 AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE 1 $24,990.94 $24,990.94 $26,768.00 $26,768.00 NO BID
EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, TOWING
PACKAGE, HITCH, SYNC OR EQUIVALENT
2015 RAM 1500 PROMASTER CARGO
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 FORD TRANSIT 250 AN 156 WE VoL 13
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD: YES I:I NO IZI YES D NO[x ] YES IZI NO |:|

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information onlv and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/17/15

2015-444 TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS - GENERAL SERVICES 6



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARY 14, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-444
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

GUNN CHEVROLET, LTC RUDOLPH CHEVROLET LLC SOUTHWEST TRUCK SALES
SELMA, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM ESTIMATED Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X
‘o DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE Unit Price UNIT PRICE Unit Price UNIT PRICE Unit Price
3/4 TON PICKUP TRUCKS
34 TON PICKUP, EXTENDED CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE,
4X4, GAS, V8, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE
1. EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR 1 NO BID $28,524.00 |  $28,524.00 $27,407.80 $27,407.80
LOCKS, POWER WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR
COVERING, SPOTLIGHT ON BOTH SIDES, TOWING ADD $272.00
REMOTE
PACKAGE, HITCH KEYLESS
2015 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500 2015 FORD F250 LWB 158"WB
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL CK 25753 2015 CHEV CK25753 SUPERCAB
1/2 TON PICKUP TRUCKS
% TON PICKUP, EXTENDED CAB, LONG 8' BOX SIZE, 4X4,
GAS, V8, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR,
2. STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, MANUAL WINDOWS, SEATS, 2 NO BID $25,779.00 $51,558.00 NO BID
VINYL FLOOR COVERING, TOWING PACKAGE, HITCH
LIGHTBAR-AMBER
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 2015 CHEV CK15753
CK 15753
15 TON PICKUP, EXTENDED CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE,
4X2, GAS, VB AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE
EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR
s LOCKS, POWER WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR 3 NO BID $22,512.00 $67,536.00 NO BID
COVERING, SPOTLIGHTS BOTH FRONT PILLARS, ADD $272.00
REMOTE
TOWING PACKAGE eI e
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 CHEVR%IEI;”S';/ERADO 1500 2015 CHEV CC15753
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/17/15

2015-444 TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS - GENERAL SERVICES



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARY 14, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-444

Department: GENERAL SERVICES

15743

GUNN CHEVROLET, LTC RUDOLPH CHEVROLET LLC SOUTHWEST TRUCK SALES
SELMA, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
1/2 TON PICKUP TRUCKS
ITEM ESTIMATED Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X
‘o DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE Unit Price UNIT PRICE Unit Price UNIT PRICE Unit Price
15 TON PICKUP, EXTENDED CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE,
4X2, GAS, V8, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE
4. EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR 1 NO BID $21,611.00 $21,611.00 NO BID
LOCKS, POWER WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR ADD $272.00
COVERING, TOWING PACKAGE, HITCH REMOTE
KEYLESS
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 CHEVROEE;’;ILVERADO ce 2015 CHEV CC15753
15 TON PICKUP, EXTENDED CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE,
4X4, GAS, V8 AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE
5. EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, MANUAL 1 NO BID $24,473.00 $24,473.00 NO BID
WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR COVERING, TOWING
PACKAGE
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2015 CHEV CC15753
CK 15753
15 TON PICKUP, CREW CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE, 4X4,
GAS, V8, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR,
6. || STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR LOCKS, POWER 2 NO BID $26,657.00 $53,314.00 NO BID
WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR COVERING, TOWING
PACKAGE, HITCH ADD #272.00
REMOTE
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 CHEVROLET SILVERADO  CK 2015 CHEV CK15743

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement.

Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/17/15

2015-444 TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS - GENERAL SERVICES




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO Exrres
BID TABULATION "W

BID ITEM: TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS Solicitation #: 2015-444
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARY 14, 2015 Department: GENERAL SERVICES

2010

GUNN CHEVROLET, LTC RUDOLPH CHEVROLET LLC SOUTHWEST TRUCK SALES

SELMA, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
1/2 TON PICKUP TRUCKS
ITEM ESTIMATED Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X
o DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT PRICE Unit Price UNIT PRICE Unit Price UNIT PRICE Unit Price
6.5' BOX
15 TON PICKUP, CREW, CAB, LONG 8' BOX SIZE, 4X2,
7 | GAS, V8, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR, 9 NO BID $24.241.00 $48,482.00 NO BID
STANDARD INTERIOR, AC AUTO DOOR LOCKS, POWER
WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR COVERING ADD $272.00
REMOTE
KEYLESS
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2015 CHEV CC15743
CK 15743
6.5' BOX
15 TON PICKUP, CREW CAB, LONG BOX SIZE, 4X4, GAS,
V8, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR,
8. | STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR LOCKS, POWER 2 NO BID $26,785.00 $53,570.00 NO BID
WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR COVERING, TOWING ADD $§272.00
PACKAGE, HITCH, SYNC OR EQUIVALENT REMOTE
KEYLESS
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2015 CHEV CK15743
CK15743
15 TON PICKUP, CREW CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE, 4X4,
GAS, V8 AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR,
9. | STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR LOCKS, POWER 3 NO BID $26,785.00 $80,355.00 NO BID
WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR COVERING, TOWING ADD &272.00
PACKAGE, HITCH SYNC OR EQUIVALENT REMOTE
KEYLESS
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 CHEVE%SELE'LVERADO 2015 CHEV CK15743

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/17/15 2015-444 TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS - GENERAL SERVICES 9




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

‘l”l'

2010

BID ITEM: TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARY 14, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-444
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

GUNN CHEVROLET, LTC RUDOLPH CHEVROLET LLC SOUTHWEST TRUCK SALES
SELMA, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
1/2 TON PICKUP TRUCKS
ITEM ESTIMATED Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X
‘o DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE Unit Price UNIT PRICE Unit Price UNIT PRICE Unit Price
12 TON PICKUP, REGULAR CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE,
4X2, GAS, V6, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE
10. EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AD, AUTO DOOR 6 $18,681.61 $112,089.66 $19,338.00 $116,028.00 NO BID
LOCKS, POWER WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR
COVERING
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2015 CHEV CC15703
CC15703
12 TON PICKUP, REGULAR CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE,
4X2, GAS, V6, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE
11. EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR 2 $19,025.36 $38,050.72 $19,631.00 $39,262.00 NO BID
LOCKS, POWER WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR
COVERING, TOWING PACKAGE, HITCH
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2015 CHEV CC15703
CC15703
12 TON PICKUP, REGULAR CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE,
4X2, GAS, V6, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE
12. EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR 6 $18,681.61 $112,089.66 $19,338.00 $116,028.00 NO BID
LOCKS, POWER WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR
COVERING

YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL

2015 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500
CC 15703

2015 CHEV CC15703

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement.

Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/17/15

2015-444 TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS - GENERAL SERVICES

10




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

'

2010

BID ITEM: TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARY 14, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-444
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

GUNN CHEVROLET, LTC

RUDOLPH CHEVROLET LLC

SOUTHWEST TRUCK SALES

SELMA, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
1/2 TON PICKUP TRUCKS
ITEM ESTIMATED Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X
‘o DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE Unit Price UNIT PRICE Unit Price UNIT PRICE Unit Price
12 TON PICK UP, REGULAR CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE,
4X2, GAS, V6, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE
13. EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, AUTO DOOR 2 $18,681.61 $37,363.22 $19,338.00 $38,676.00 NO BID
LOCKS, POWER WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR
COVERING
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 2015 CHEV CC15703
CK15703
12 TON PICK UP, REGULAR CAB, LONG 8' BOX SIZE, 4X2,
GAS, V8, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR,
14. STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, POWER WINDOWS, SEATS, 2 NO BID $20,951.00 $41,902.00 NO BID
VINYL FLOOR COVERING, TOWING PACKAGE, HITCH
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 2015 CHEV CC15903
CC15903
1 TON PICKUP
1 TON PICKUP, CREW CAB, REGULAR BOX SIZE, 4X2,
DIESEL, V8 6.6L, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE
15. EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, A/C, AUTO DOOR 1 $36,212.45 $36,212.45 $35,767.00 $35,767.00 $36,031.03 $36,031.03
LOCKS, POWER WINDOWS, SEATS, VINYL FLOOR ADD $510.00
COVERING, TOWING PKG, HITCH, DUEL WHEELS REMOTE
KEYLESS
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 3500 2015 CHEV CC35943 2015 FORD F350 DRW DIESEL 6.7 LUG

CC35943

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement.

Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/17/15

2015-444 TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS - GENERAL SERVICES

11




CITY OF EL PASO e

BID TABULATION L[

Solicitation #: 2015-444
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

BID ITEM: TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARY 14, 2015

GUNN CHEVROLET, LTC RUDOLPH CHEVROLET LLC SOUTHWEST TRUCK SALES

SELMA, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM ESTIMATED Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X Estimated Quantity X
\o DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE Unit Price UNIT PRICE Unit Price UNIT PRICE Unit Price
5 PASSENGER SUV

5 PASSENGER SUB, 4 DOOR, 4X2 GAS, V6 AUTOMATIC
16. TRANSMISSION, WHITE EXTERIOR, STANDARD 11 NO BID $22.612.00 $248,732.00 NO BID

INTERIOR, A/C, SEATS VINYL FLOOR COVERING, ALL

WEATHER FLOOR MATS VINTL =OOR
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2015 CHEV EQUINOX ILH26

1/2 TON CARGO VAN

152 TON CARGO VAN, 2 DOOR, SLIDING SIDE CARGO
DOOR, REAR CARGO DOOR, 50/50, SPLIT WITH
WINDOWS, 4X2, GAS, V6, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION,
17. | WHITE EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, POWER DOOR 2 NO BID $22,321.00 $44,642.00 $23,115.40 $46,230.80
LOCKS, POWER WINDOWS, A/C, REAR A/C, BUCKET 2
SEAT, VINYL FLOOR COVERING, BULKHEAD WITHOUT
DOOR

BIDDER'S PRICE
$46,230.88

2015 CHEV 2500 EXPRESS
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 23405
3/4 TON CARGO VAN

34 TON CARGO VAN, 2 DOOR, SLIDING SIDE CARGO
DOOR, REAR CARGO DOOR 50/50 SPLIT WITH WINDOWS,
18. 4X2, GAS, V8 AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, WHITE 1 $20,555.96 $20,555.96 $22,266.00 $22,266.00 $25,432.04 $25,432.04
EXTERIOR, STANDARD INTERIOR, AC, TOWING

PACKAGE, HITCH, SYNC OR EQUIVALENT

2015 FORD TRANSIT 150 LR

2015 CHEVROLET EXPRESS VAN
YEAR / MAKE AND MODEL 2500 CG23405 2015 CHEV 2500 EXPRESS CG23405 2015 FORD TRANSIT 250 LR
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD: YES I:I NO IZI YES |:| NO IZI YES I:I NO E
BIDS SOLICITED: 23 LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED: 17 BIDS RECEIVED: 6 LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED: 5 NO BID: 0

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information onlv and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/17/15 2015-444 TRUCKS, SMALL SUVS AND VANS - GENERAL SERVICES 12



