CITY OF EL PASO i

BID TABULATION |

Solicitation #: 2015-568
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015

GVMI INC MUNCIE RECLAMATION AND SUPPLY dba
EL PASO '|:X MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY
’ MUNCIE, IN
GROUP | - BRAKE SHOE & LINING KIT MODEL 91 - TMC BUS
EST ANNUAL ANNUALPRICE | 3 YEARPRICE ANNUALPRICE | 3 YEARPRICE
ITEw DESCRIPTION oemNo. | MODELL __QTY e o ) e o )
NO. | MIN | MAX ' (BxC=D) (Dx3=E) : (BxC=D) (Dx3=E)
NO. (A) | (B)
15526689
1. SHOE & LINING ASSY FRONT LINING #4665X 91 5 30 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2, SHOE & LINING ASSY FRONT LINING 91 5 20 | EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
#4665XX
15533465
3. SHOE & LINING ASSY REAR |\ vy et | ot 5 30 | EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4, SHOE & LINING ASSY REAR  |[LINING #4666X| 91 5 20 | EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER:
GROUP | TOTAL: NO BID NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/16/15 2015-568 BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 1




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-568
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

MUNCIE RECLAMATION AND SUPPLY dba

Ef\;XLIgCTX MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY
’ MUNCIE, IN
GROUP Il - BRAKE SHOE & LINING KIT MODEL 04 NEW FLYER, 06/09 NABI
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE
ITEM DESCRIPTION OEM NO. MODEL QTY UNIT gRICE 0) E) UNIT (I:’RICE D) ()
NO. | MIN | MAX ©) (BxC=D) (Dx3=E) ©) (BxC=D) (Dx3=E)
NO. (A) | (B)
5 SHOE & LINING ASSY FRONT 6336644 04/06/09 20 80 EA NO BID NO BID $250.21 $20,016.80 $60,050.40
' LINING #4715 ) e e
BIDDER'S PRICE
$60.482.40
6. SHOE & LINING ASSY REAR 6336641 04/06/09 20 80 EA NO BID NO BID $297.71 $23,816.80 $71,450.40
LINING #4728
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER: HALDEX
GROUP Il TOTAL: NO BID $131,500.80
BIDDER'S PRICE
$131,832.80

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

Is/

2/16/15

2015-568 BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-568
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

MUNCIE RECLAMATION AND SUPPLY dba

VMIINC.
EEPASOCTX MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY
’ MUNCIE, IN
GROUP il - BRAKE SHOE & PADS MODEL 800 - FORD PARATRANSIT BUS
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE
ITEM DESCRIPTION OEM NO. MODEL QTY UNIT (I;RICE 0) (€) UNIT cPRlCE 0) €)
NO. | MIN | MAX (C) (BxC=D) (Dx3=E) (€ (BXxC=D) (Dx3=E)
NO. (A) | (B)
1. BRAKE PADS FRONT PGD655M 0800 20 70 EA $51.04 $3,572.80 $10,718.40 $34.58 $2,420.60 $7,261.80
2. BRAKE PADS REAR PGD411M 0800 20 70 EA $60.43 $4,230.10 $12,690.30 $71.90 $5,033.00 $15,099.00
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER; NAPA BENDIX
GROUP Il TOTAL: $23,408.70 $22,360.80

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:

2/16/15

2015-568 BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

‘I

2010

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-568
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

MUNCIE RECLAMATION AND SUPPLY dba

VMIINC.
EEPASOCTX MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY
’ MUNCIE, IN
GROUP IV - BRAKE SHOE & PADS MODEL 1139 -FORD VAN
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE
ITEM DESCRIPTION OEM NO. MODEL QTY UNIT (I;RICE 0) (€) UNIT cPRlCE 0) €)
NO. | MIN | MAX ©) (BxC=D) (Dx3=E) ) (BxC=D) (Dx3=E)
NO. (A) | (B)
3. BRAKE PADS FRONT MKD-655 1139 2 10 EA $51.04 $510.40 $1,531.20 $43.20 $432.00 $1,296.00
4. BRAKE PADS REAR PGD802M 1139 2 10 EA $48.35 $483.50 $1,450.50 $32.25 $322.50 $967.50
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER; NAPA BENDIX
GROUP IV TOTAL: $2,981.70 $2,263.50

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:

2/16/15

2015-568 BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-568
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

MUNCIE RECLAMATION AND SUPPLY dba

EE\FCXISIQICTX MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY
’ MUNCIE, IN
GROUP V - BRAKE SHOE & PADS MODEL 800 - FORD PARATRANSIT BUS
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE
ITEM DESCRIPTION OEM NO. MODEL QTY UNIT (I;RICE 0) (€) UNIT cPRlCE 0) €)
NO. | MIN | MAX ©) (BxC=D) (Dx3=E) ) (BxC=D) (Dx3=E)
NO. (A) (B)
5. FRONT BRAKE KIT 8C2Z-2001-C 0880 10 40 EA $53.05 $2,122.00 $6,366.00 $46.13 $1,845.20 $5,535.60
6. REAR BRAKE KIT 8C2z-2200-B 0880 10 40 EA $50.36 $2,014.40 $6,043.20 $59.50 $2,380.00 $7,140.00
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER; NAPA RAYBESTOS & FORD/MOTORCRAFT
GROUP V TOTAL: $12,409.20 $12,675.60

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:

2/16/15

2015-568 BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)



El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-568
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015

GVMI INC MUNCIE RECLAMATION AND SUPPLY dba
EL PASO 'I:X MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY
’ MUNCIE, IN
GROUP VI - BRAKE SHOE & PADS MODEL 551 - FORD P/U
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE
ITEM MODEL QTY UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
DESCRIPTION OEM NO. D E. D E.
NO. | MIN | MAX ©) B vCn D) ) s ) (€ (B yCn D) ) ‘o )
NO. (A) (B)
7. BRAKE PADS FRONT MKD702 551 2 10 EA $50.36 $503.60 $1,510.80 $47.42 $474.20 $1,422.60
8. BRAKE PADS RAR MKD711 551 2 10 || EA $43.64 $436.40 $1,309.20 $38.25 $382.50 $1,147.50
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER: NAPA BENDIX
GROUP VI TOTAL: $2,820.00 $2,570.10

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/16/15

2015-568 BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-568
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

MUNCIE RECLAMATION AND SUPPLY dba

EE\F/’XISI(':CTX MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY
’ MUNCIE, IN
GROUP VIl - BRAKE SHOE & PADS MODEL 145 - FORD CROWN VICTORIA
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE
ITEM MODEL QTY UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
DESCRIPTION OEM NO. (D) (E) (D) (E.)
NO. | MIN | MAX () (BxC=D) (Dx3=E) (c) (BxC=D) (Dx3=E)
NO. (A) | (B)
9. BRAKE PADS FRONT MKD748 145 2 10 | EA $43.64 $436.40 $1,309.20 $40.66 $406.60 $1,219.80
10. BRAKE PADS REAR PGD674M 145 2 10 | EA $40.28 $402.80 $1,208.40 $37.59 $375.90 $1,127.70
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER: NAPA BENDIX
GROUP VII TOTAL: $2,517.60 $2,347.50

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:

2/16/15

2015-568 BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)



El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO Exeas
BID TABULATION ‘|

2010
Solicitation #: 2015-568
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015

GVMI INC MUNCIE RECLAMATION AND SUPPLY dba
EL PASO 'I:X MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY
’ MUNCIE, IN
GROUP VIl - BRAKE SHOE & PADS MODEL 149 - FORD CROWN VICTORIA
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE
ITEM MODEL QTY UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
DESCRIPTION OEM NO. D E. D E.
NO. | MIN | MAX ©) B yCn D) ) Jan ) (€ (B yCn D) ) can )
NO. (A) | (B)
11. BRAKE PADS MKD659 149 2 10 EA $43.64 $436.40 $1,309.20 $31.44 $314.40 $943.20
12. BRAKE PADS FRT PDG-674A 149 2 10 EA $37.61 $376.10 $1,128.30 $41.29 $412.90 $1,238.70
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER; NAPA BENDIX
GROUP VIII TOTAL: $2,437.50 $2,181.90

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/16/15

2015-568 BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)



El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-568
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015

GVMI INC MUNCIE RECLAMATION AND SUPPLY dba
EL PASO 'I:X MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY
’ MUNCIE, IN
GROUP IX - BRAKE SHOE & PADS MODEL 557 - DODGE RAM P/U
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE
ITEM MODEL QTY UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
DESCRIPTION OEM NO. D E. D E.
NO. | MIN | MAX ©) B vCn D) ) s ) (€ (B yCn D) ) ‘o )
NO. (A) (B)
13. BRAKE PADS FRT V1013267 557 2 10 EA $43.64 $436.40 $1,309.20 NO BID NO BID
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER: NAPA
GROUP IX TOTAL: $1,309.20 NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/16/15 2015-568 BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 9




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO S
BID TABULATION 'l

2010

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-568
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

GVMI INC MUNCIE RECLAMATION AND SUPPLY dba
EL PASO 'I:X MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY
’ MUNCIE, IN
GROUP X - BRAKE SHOE & PADS MODEL 11 - FORD VAN
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE
ITEM MODEL QTY UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
DESCRIPTION OEM NO. D E. D E.
NO. | MIN | MAX () (B x(C)= D) D x( 3)= E) (c) (B x(C)= D) D x( 3)= E)
NO. (A) | (B)
14. BRAKE PADS FRT 8C2Z-2V001-A 1 2 10 | EA NO BID NO BID $63.49 $634.90 $1,904.70
15. BRAKE PADS REAR 8C2Z-2200-A 1 2 10 || EA NO BID NO BID $47.60 $476.00 $1,428.00
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER: FORD / MOTORCRAFT
GROUP X TOTAL: NO BID $3,332.70

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/16/15

2015-568 BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 10



El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO S
BID TABULATION 'l

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-568
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015

GVMIINC MUNCIE RECLAMATION AND SUPPLY dba
EL PASO 'I:X MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY
’ MUNCIE, IN
GROUP XI - BRAKE SHOE & PADS MODEL 14000, 14200, 14400, 14600 - ARBOC
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE
ITEM MODEL QTY UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
DESCRIPTION OEM NO. D E. D E.
NO. | MIN | MAX () (B x(C)= D) D x( 3)= E) (c) (B x(C)= D) D x( 3)= E)
NO. (A) | (B)
16. BRAKE PADS FRT 1921078 14000 2 10 | EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
17. BRAKE PADS REAR 20850250 14000 2 10 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
18.|| BRAKE SHOES PARKING BRAKE 20778485 14000 2 10 | EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER:
GROUP XI TOTAL: NO BID NO BID
3YEAR TOTAL GROUPS I - XI: $47,883.90 $179,232.90

BIDDER'S PRICE $179,564.90

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/16/15 2015-568 BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 11




El Paso

All-America City

CITY OF EL PASO "ll"
BID TABULATION FORM 2010

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL Solicitation #: 2015-568
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015 Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

MUNCIE RECLAMATION AND SUPPLY dba
MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY
MUNCIE, IN

YES NO YES NO
X X

GVMIINC.
EL PASO, TX

OEM DOCUMENTATION SUBMITED

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND
THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN
NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS
BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS.
THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

NO OPTION OFFERED X X

PAYMENT TERMS: (NONE STATED) NET - 30 DAYS

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
Within ___ consecutive calendar days.
Within __ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in

cases of emergency. 48 48
IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

z

I~

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/16/15 2015-568 BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 12




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO Exeas
BID TABULATION ‘|

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-568
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015

NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES CANADA ULC RJ BORDER INTERNATIONAL LLC
WINNIPEG, MANITOBA EL PASO, TX
GROUP | - BRAKE SHOE & LINING KIT MODEL 91 - TMC BUS
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE
ITEM DESCRIPTION oEmno, |MODELL _QTY UN PRICE o) ) N PRICE 0) py
NO. | MIN | MAX (C) (BxC=D) (Dx3=E) (€ (BXxC=D) (Dx3=E)
NO. (A) | (B)
1. SHOE & LINING ASSY FRONT LIN1I§SGZ?#32%5X 91 5 30 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2. SHOE & LINING ASSY FRONT LINING 91 5 20 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
#4665XX
3. SHOE & LINING ASSY REAR L|N1If1563;jggsx 91 5 30 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4. SHOE & LINING ASSY REAR LINING #4666X 91 5 20 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER:
GROUP | TOTAL: NO BID NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/16/15 2015-568 BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 13




CITY OF EL PASO e
BID TABULATION

2010
BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL Solicitation #: 2015-568
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015 Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)
NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES CANADA ULC RJ BORDER INTERNATIONAL LLC
WINNIPEG, MANITOBA EL PASO, TX
GROUP Il - BRAKE SHOE & LINING KIT MODEL 04 NEW FLYER, 06/09 NABI
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE
ITEM DESCRIPTION oEmNo. | MODELL _QT¥ e o ) e o )
NO. MIN | MAX . (BxC=D) (Dx3=E) . (BxC=D) (Dx3=E)
NO. (A) | (B)
5 SHOE & LINING ASSY FRONT 6336644 04/06/09 | 20 80 EA 263.50 21,080.00 NO BID
. LINING #4715 $263.5 $21,080. $63,240.00 NO BID
6. SHOE & LINING ASSY REAR 6336641 04/06/09 | 20 80 EA $755.29 $60,423.20 $181,269.60 NO BID NO BID
LINING #4728 BIDDER'S PRICE |BIDDER'S PRICE
$60,463.20 $181,389.60
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER: (NONE STATED)
GROUP Il TOTAL: $244,509.60 NO BID
LEFT BLANK
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/16/15

2015-568 BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 14



El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

All-America City

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL

2010

BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-568

Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)
NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES CANADA ULC RJ BORDER INTERNATIONAL LLC
WINNIPEG, MANITOBA EL PASO, TX
GROUP Il - BRAKE SHOE & PADS MODEL 800 - FORD PARATRANSIT BUS
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE
ITEM DESCRIPTION OEM NO. MODEL QTY UNIT LI:RICE 0) €) UNIT (I:RICE D) ()
NO. | MIN | MAX () (BxC=D) (Dx3=E) (c) (BxC=D) (Dx3=E)
NO. (A) | (B)
1. BRAKE PADS FRONT PGD655M 0800 20 70 EA NO BID NO BID $60.33 $4,223.10 $12,669.30
2. BRAKE PADS REAR PGD411M 0800 20 70 EA NO BID NO BID $115.01 $8,050.70 $24,152.10
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER: BENDIX
GROUP Il TOTAL.: NO BID $36,821.40
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/16/15

2015-568 BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 15



El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-568

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015

Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)
NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES CANADA ULC RJ BORDER INTERNATIONAL LLC
WINNIPEG, MANITOBA EL PASO, TX
GROUP IV - BRAKE SHOE & PADS MODEL 1139 -FORD VAN
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE

ITEM DESCRIPTION OEM NO. MODEL QTY UNIT LI:RICE 0) €) UNIT (I:RICE D) ()

NO. | MIN | MAX ©) (BxC=D) (Dx3=E) ) (BxC=D) (Dx3=E)
NO. (A) | (B)
3. BRAKE PADS FRONT MKD-655 1139 2 10 EA NO BID NO BID $60.33 $603.30 $1,809.90
4. BRAKE PADS REAR PGD802M 1139 2 10 EA NO BID NO BID $39.50 $395.00 $1,185.00
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER: BENDIX
GROUP IV TOTAL.: NO BID $2,994.90
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/16/15

2015-568 BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 16



CITY OF EL PASO Exsins
BID TABULATION

2010
BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL Solicitation #: 2015-568
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015 Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)
NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES CANADA ULC RJ BORDER INTERNATIONAL LLC
WINNIPEG, MANITOBA EL PASO, TX
GROUP V - BRAKE SHOE & PADS MODEL 800 - FORD PARATRANSIT BUS
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE
ITEM DESCRIPTION OEM NO. MODEL QTY UNIT LI:RICE 0) €) UNIT (I:RICE D) ()
NO. | MIN | MAX ©) (BxC=D) (Dx3=E) ) (BxC=D) (Dx3=E)
NO. (A) | (B)
5. FRONT BRAKE KIT 8C22-2001-C 0880 10 40 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
6. REAR BRAKE KIT 8C22-2200-B 0880 10 40 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER:
GROUP V TOTAL.: NO BID NO BID
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/16/15

2015-568 BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 17



CITY OF EL PASO Exsins
BID TABULATION

2010
BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL Solicitation #: 2015-568
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015 Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)
NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES CANADA ULC RJ BORDER INTERNATIONAL LLC
WINNIPEG, MANITOBA EL PASO, TX
GROUP VI - BRAKE SHOE & PADS MODEL 551 - FORD P/U
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE
ITEM DESCRIPTION OEM NO. MODEL QTY UNIT LI:RICE 0) €) UNIT (I:RICE D) ()
NO. | MIN | MAX () (BxC=D) (Dx3=E) (c) (BxC=D) (Dx3=E)
NO. (A) | (B)
7. BRAKE PADS FRONT MKD702 551 2 10 EA NO BID NO BID $66.22 $662.20 $1,986.60
8. BRAKE PADS RAR MKD711 551 2 10 EA NO BID NO BID $53.42 $534.20 $1,602.60
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER: BENDIX
GROUP VI TOTAL.: NO BID $3,589.20
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/16/15

2015-568 BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 18



El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-568
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015

NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES CANADA ULC RJ BORDER INTERNATIONAL LLC
WINNIPEG, MANITOBA EL PASO, TX
GROUP Vil - BRAKE SHOE & PADS MODEL 145 - FORD CROWN VICTORIA
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE
ITEM MODEL QTY UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
DESCRIPTION OEM NO. D E. D E.
NO. | MIN | MAX (C) B x(C)= D) D x( 3)= E) (€ (B x(C)= D) D x( 3)= E)
NO. (A) (B)
9. BRAKE PADS FRONT MKD748 145 2 10 EA NO BID NO BID $49.81 $498.10 $1,494.30
10. BRAKE PADS REAR PGD674M 145 2 10 EA NO BID NO BID $44.38 $443.80 $1,331.40
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER; BENDIX
GROUP VII TOTAL: NO BID $2,825.70

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:

2/16/15

2015-568 BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)
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CITY OF EL PASO Exsins
BID TABULATION

2010
BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL Solicitation #: 2015-568
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015 Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES CANADA ULC RJ BORDER INTERNATIONAL LLC
WINNIPEG, MANITOBA EL PASO, TX
GROUP VIIl - BRAKE SHOE & PADS MODEL 149 - FORD CROWN VICTORIA
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE
ITEM MODEL QTY UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
DESCRIPTION OEM NO. D E. D E.
NO. | MIN | MAX () (B x(C)= D) D x( 3)= E) (c) (B x(C)= D) D x( 3)= E)
NO. (A) | (B)
11. BRAKE PADS MKD659 149 2 10 | EA NO BID NO BID $38.51 $385.10 $1,155.30
12. BRAKE PADS FRT PDG-674A 149 2 10 | EA NO BID NO BID $47.18 $471.80 $1,415.40
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER: BENDIX
GROUP VIII TOTAL: NO BID $2,570.70

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/16/15 2015-568 BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 20



CITY OF EL PASO i
BID TABULATION

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-568
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015

NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES CANADA ULC RJ BORDER INTERNATIONAL LLC
WINNIPEG, MANITOBA EL PASO, TX
GROUP IX - BRAKE SHOE & PADS MODEL 557 - DODGE RAM P/U
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE
ITEM MODEL QTY UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
DESCRIPTION OEM NO. D E. D E.
NO. | MIN | MAX (c) (B x(C)= D) D x( 3)= E) (c) (B x(C)= D) D x( 3)= E)
NO. (A) | (B)
13. BRAKE PADS FRT V1013267 557 2 10 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER:

GROUP IX TOTAL: NO BID NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/16/15 2015-568 BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)
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CITY OF EL PASO e
BID TABULATION

2010

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL

Solicitation #: 2015-568
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015 Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES CANADA ULC RJ BORDER INTERNATIONAL LLC
WINNIPEG, MANITOBA EL PASO, TX
GROUP X - BRAKE SHOE & PADS MODEL 11 - FORD VAN
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE
ITEM MODEL QTY UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
DESCRIPTION OEM NO. D E. D E.
NO. | MIN | MAX (C) B x(C)= D) D x( 3)= E) (€ (B x(C)= D) D x( 3)= E)
NO. (A) (B)
14. BRAKE PADS FRT 8C2Z-2V001-A 11 2 10 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
15. BRAKE PADS REAR 8C2Z-2200-A 11 2 10 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER:
GROUP X TOTAL: NO BID NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/16/15 2015-568 BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 22



El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL Solicitation #: 2015-568
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015 Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)
NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES CANADA ULC RJ BORDER INTERNATIONAL LLC
WINNIPEG, MANITOBA EL PASO, TX
GROUP XI - BRAKE SHOE & PADS MODEL 14000, 14200, 14400, 14600 - ARBOC
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE
ITEM MODEL QTY UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
DESCRIPTION OEM NO. (D) (E.) (D) (E.)
NO. | MIN | MAX (C) (BxC=D) (Dx3=E) (€ (BXxC=D) (Dx3=E)
NO. (A) (B)
16. BRAKE PADS FRT 1921078 14000 2 10 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
17. BRAKE PADS REAR 20850250 14000 2 10 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
18. BRAKE SHOES PARKING BRAKE 20778485 14000 2 10 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER:
GROUP XI TOTAL: NO BID NO BID
3YEAR TOTAL GROUPS |- XI: $244,509.60 $48,801.90
(LEFT BLANK) (LEFT BLANK)

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 2/16/15 2015-568 BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 23




El Paso

All-America City

CITY OF EL PASO ‘l”"
BID TABULATION FORM 2010

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL Solicitation #: 2015-568
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015 Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES CANADA ULC RJ BORDER INTERNATIONAL LLC
WINNIPEG, MANITOBA EL PASO, TX

YES NO YES NO
X X

OEM DOCUMENTATION SUBMITED

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND
THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN
NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS
BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS.
THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

NO OPTION OFFERED X X

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS 2% - 10 DAYS

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: 7

Within __ consecutive calendar days. (30 BUSINESS DAYS START UP PERIOD)
Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in

cases of emergency. 48 48
IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

I~

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/16/15 2015-568 BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 24




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO Exeas
BID TABULATION ‘|

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-568
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015

RUSH TRUCK CENTERS OF TEXAS L.P.
dba RUSH TRUCK CENTER EL PASO anlggégg.}roﬁﬁ’ :‘I‘fjc
EL PASO, TX ’
GROUP | - BRAKE SHOE & LINING KIT MODEL 91 - TMC BUS
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE
ITEM MODEL QTY UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
DESCRIPTION OEM NO. (D) (E.) (D) (E.)
NO. | MIN | MAX ©) (BxC=D) (Dx3=E) ) (BxC=D) (Dx3=E)
NO. (A) | (B)
1. SHOE & LINING ASSY FRONT LIN1I§SGZ?#32%5X 91 5 30 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2. SHOE & LINING ASSY FRONT LINING 91 5 20 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
#4665XX
3. SHOE & LINING ASSY REAR L|N1If1563;jggsx 91 5 30 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4. SHOE & LINING ASSY REAR LINING #4666X 91 5 20 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER:

GROUP I TOTAL: NO BID NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/16/15 2015-568 BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 25




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-568
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

RUSH TRUCK CENTERS OF TEXAS L.P.

dba RUSH TRUCK CENTER EL PASO

UNI-SELECT USA, INC.
MOORESTOWN, NJ

(LEFT BLANK)

EL PASO, TX
GROUP Il - BRAKE SHOE & LINING KIT MODEL 04 NEW FLYER, 06/09 NABI
EST ANNUAL ANNUALPRICE | 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUALPRICE | 3 YEAR PRICE
ITEM DESCRIPTION oEmNo. | MODELL _QT¥ e o ) e o )
NO. | MIN | MAX : (BxC=D) (Dx3=E) : (BXxC=D) (Dx3=E)
NO. (A) | (B)
5 SHOE & LINING ASSY FRONT 6336644 04/06/09 20 80 EA 138.61 33,266.40 NO BID
. LINING #4715 $ . $11,088.80 $33, . NO BID
6. SHOE & LINING ASSY REAR 6336641 04/06/09 | 20 80 EA $141.32 $11,305.60 $33,916.80 NO BID NO BID
LINING #4728
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER: (NONE STATED)
GROUP Il TOTAL: $67,183.20 NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

Is/

2/16/15

2015-568 BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)
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CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-568
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

RUSH TRUCK CENTERS OF TEXAS L.P.
dba RUSH TRUCK CENTER EL PASO

UNI-SELECT USA, INC.
MOORESTOWN, NJ

EL PASO, TX
GROUP lil - BRAKE SHOE & PADS MODEL 800 - FORD PARATRANSIT BUS
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE
ITEM DESCRIPTION OEM NO. MODEL QTY UNIT LI:RICE 0) €) UNIT (I:RICE D) ()
NO. | MIN | MAX () (BxC=D) (Dx3=E) (c) (BxC=D) (Dx3=E)
NO. (A) | (B)
1. BRAKE PADS FRONT PGD655M 0800 20 70 EA NO BID NO BID $32.20 $2,254.00 $6,762.00
BIDDER'S PRICE
MX655 "NO OFFER"
2. BRAKE PADS REAR PGD411M 0800 20 70 | EA NO BID NO BID $53.57 $3,749.90 $11,249.70
BIDDER'S PRICE
SXa11 "NO OFFER"
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER: WAGNER
GROUP Ill TOTAL: NOBID $18,011.70
BIDDER'S PRICE
$6,003.90

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

Is/

2/16/15

2015-568 BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
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El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-568
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015

RUSH TRUCK CENTERS OF TEXAS L.P.
dba RUSH TRUCK CENTER EL PASO anlosgégg.}roﬁﬁ’ :‘I‘fjc
EL PASO, TX ’
GROUP IV - BRAKE SHOE & PADS MODEL 1139 -FORD VAN
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE
ITEM MODEL QTY UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
DESCRIPTION OEM NO. (D) (E.) (D) (E)
NO. | MIN | MAX (C) (BxC=D) (Dx3=E) (€ (BXxC=D) (Dx3=E)
NO. (A) (B)
3. BRAKE PADS FRONT MKD-655 1139 2 10 EA NO BID NO BID $32.20 $322.00 $966.00
sooemsPrce
4. BRAKE PADS REAR PGD802M 1139 2 10 EA NO BID NO BID $28.21 $282.10 $846.30
soomsPrce
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER; WAGNER
GROUP IV TOTAL: $0.00 $1,812.30
BIDDER'S PRICE
$604.10

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

DATE:

APPROVED BY: /sl

2/16/15

2015-568 BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-568

Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

RUSH TRUCK CENTERS OF TEXAS L.P.
dba RUSH TRUCK CENTER EL PASO

UNI-SELECT USA, INC.
MOORESTOWN, NJ

EL PASO, TX
GROUP V - BRAKE SHOE & PADS MODEL 800 - FORD PARATRANSIT BUS
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE
ITEM DESCRIPTION oEmNo. | MODELL _QT¥ e o ) e o )
NO. | MIN | MAX : (BxC=D) (Dx3=E) : (BXxC=D) (Dx3=E)
NO. (A) (B)
5. FRONT BRAKE KIT 8C22-2001-C 0880 10 40 EA NO BID NO BID $36.42 $1,456.80 $4,370.40
'S C
sooes Fce
6. REAR BRAKE KIT 8C2z-2200-B 0880 10 40 EA NO BID NO BID $35.39 $1,415.60 $4,246.80
'S Cl
sooces Fce
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER: WAGNER
GROUP V TOTAL: NO BID $8,617.20
BIDDER'S PRICE
$2,872.40

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

Is/

2/16/15

2015-568 BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-568
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

RUSH TRUCK CENTERS OF TEXAS L.P.
dba RUSH TRUCK CENTER EL PASO

UNI-SELECT USA, INC.

MOORESTOWN, NJ

EL PASO, TX
GROUP VI - BRAKE SHOE & PADS MODEL 551 - FORD P/U
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE | 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE | 3 YEAR PRICE
ITEM DESCRIPTION oEmNo. |MODEL| __QTY e (D) (E) e (D) (E)
NO. | MIN | MAX : (BxC=D) (Dx3=E) : (BXxC=D) (Dx3=E)
NO. (A) (B)
7. BRAKE PADS FRONT MKD702 551 2 10 EA NO BID NO BID $28.44 $284.40 $853.20
BIDDER'S PRICE
MX702 "NO OFFER"
8. BRAKE PADS RAR MKD711 551 2 10 EA NO BID NO BID $24.28 $242.80 $728.40
BIDDER'S PRICE
MX711 "NO OFFER"
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER;: WAGNER
NO BID $1,581.60

GROUP VI TOTAL:

BIDDER'S PRICE
$527.20

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

DATE:

APPROVED BY: /sl

2/16/15

2015-568 BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)
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El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-568
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015

RUSH TRUCK CENTERS OF TEXAS L.P.
dba RUSH TRUCK CENTER EL PASO anlosoliégg;l'olﬁﬁ, :‘I‘fjc
EL PASO, TX ’
GROUP Vil - BRAKE SHOE & PADS MODEL 145 - FORD CROWN VICTORIA
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE
ITEM MODEL QTY UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
DESCRIPTION OEM NO. (D) (E.) (D) (E)
NO. | MIN | MAX ©) (BxC=D) (Dx3=E) (€ (BxC=D) (Dx3=E)
NO. (A) (B)
9. BRAKE PADS FRONT MKD748 145 2 10 EA NO BID NO BID $27.24 $272.40 $817.20
soomsPrce
10. BRAKE PADS REAR PGD674M 145 2 10 EA NO BID NO BID $25.64 $256.40 $769.20
soomsPrce
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER; WAGNER
GROUP VII TOTAL: NOBID $1,586.40
BIDDER'S PRICE
$528.80

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

DATE:

APPROVED BY: /sl

2/16/15

2015-568 BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-568
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

RUSH TRUCK CENTERS OF TEXAS L.P.

dba RUSH TRUCK CENTER EL PASO

UNI-SELECT USA, INC.

MOORESTOWN, NJ

EL PASO, TX
GROUP VIl - BRAKE SHOE & PADS MODEL 149 - FORD CROWN VICTORIA
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE
ITEM DESCRIPTION OEM NO. MODEL QTY UNIT (I;RICE 0) (€) UNIT cPRlCE 0) €)
NO. | MIN | MAX (C) (BxC=D) (Dx3=E) (€ (BXxC=D) (Dx3=E)
NO. (A) (B)
11. BRAKE PADS MKD659 149 2 10 EA NO BID NO BID $25.64 $256.40 $769.20
'S C
sooemsPrce
12. BRAKE PADS FRT PDG-674A 149 2 10 EA NO BID NO BID $25.64 $256.40 $769.20
'S Cl
MX674A o oreamn e
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER; WAGNER
NO BID $1,538.40

GROUP VIII TOTAL:

BIDDER'S PRICE
$512.80

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

Is/

2/16/15

2015-568 BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)
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CITY OF EL PASO i

BID TABULATION |

Solicitation #: 2015-568
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015

RUSH TRUCK CENTERS OF TEXAS L.P.
dba RUSH TRUCK CENTER EL PASO UwIIIOSOEIIQ-Eg'IOL:I?ﬁ, mjc
EL PASO, TX ’
GROUP IX - BRAKE SHOE & PADS MODEL 557 - DODGE RAM P/U
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE
ITEM MODEL QTY UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
DESCRIPTION OEM NO. D E. D E.
NO. | MIN | MAX () (B x(C)= D) D x( 3)= E) (c) (B x(C)= D) D x( 3)= E)
NO. (A) | (B)
13. BRAKE PADS FRT V1013267 557 2 10 EA NO BID NO BID $29.35 $293.50 $880.50
B et
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER: WAGNER
GROUP IX TOTAL: NO BID $880.50
BIDDER'S PRICE
$293.50

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/16/15 2015-568 BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

33



El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

All-America City

'

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-568
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015

RUSH TRUCK CENTERS OF TEXAS L.P.
dba RUSH TRUCK CENTER EL PASO U:IIOS(EIIQ-ESIOLWQ, mjc
EL PASO, TX ’
GROUP X - BRAKE SHOE & PADS MODEL 11 - FORD VAN
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE
ITEM MODEL QTY UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
DESCRIPTION OEM NO. D E. D E.
NO. | MIN | MAX () (B x(C)= D) D x( 3)= E) (c) (B x(C)= D) D x( 3)= E)
NO. (A) | (B)
14. BRAKE PADS FRT 8C2Z-2V001-A 1 2 10 EA NO BID NO BID $36.42 $364.20 $1,092.60
DS o
15. BRAKE PADS REAR 8C2Z-2200-A 1 2 10 EA NO BID NO BID $34.71 $347.10 $1,041.30
DS o
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER: WAGNER
GROUP X TOTAL: NO BID $2,133.90
BIDDER'S PRICE
$711.30

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

Is/

2/16/15

2015-568 BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)
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El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

All-America City

2010
BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL Solicitation #: 2015-568
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015 Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)
RUSH TRUCK CENTERS OF TEXAS L.P.
dba RUSH TRUCK CENTER EL PASO Um:gésgloﬁﬁ’ m’c
EL PASO, TX '
GROUP XI - BRAKE SHOE & PADS MODEL 14000, 14200, 14400, 14600 - ARBOC
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE
ITEM DESCRIPTION OEM NO. MODEL QTY UNIT LI:RICE 0) €) UNIT (I:RICE D) ()
NO. | MIN | MAX () (BxC=D) (Dx3=E) (c) (BxC=D) (Dx3=E)
NO. (A) | (B)
16. BRAKE PADS FRT 1921078 14000 2 10 EA NO BID NO BID $33.62 $336.20 $1,008.60
BIDDER'S PRICE
QC784 "NO OFFER"
17. BRAKE PADS REAR 20850250 14000 2 10 EA NO BID NO BID $33.62 $336.20 $1,008.60
BIDDER'S PRICE
SX1411 "NO OFFER"
18.| BRAKE SHOES PARKING BRAKE 20778485 14000 2 10 EA NO BID NO BID $17.66 $176.60 $529.80
BIDDER'S PRICE
PAB973 "NO OFFER"
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER: WAGNER
GROUP XI TOTAL: NO BID $2,547.00
BIDDER'S PRICE
$849.00
3YEAR TOTAL GROUPS |- Xl : $67,183.20 $38,709.00
(LEFT BLANK) BIDDER'S PRICE $12,903.00
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: Isl
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El Paso

All-America City

CITY OF EL PASO "ll"
BID TABULATION FORM 2010

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL Solicitation #: 2015-568
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015 Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

RUSH TRUCK CENTERS OF TEXAS L.P.
dba RUSH TRUCK CENTER EL PASO
EL PASO, TX

YES NO YES NO
X

UNI-SELECT USA, INC.
MOORESTOWN, NJ

OEM DOCUMENTATION SUBMITED

LEFT BLANK

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND
THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN
NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS
BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS.
THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION X
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

NO OPTION OFFERED X

PAYMENT TERMS: 100% - 10 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: 7 IN STOCK 1
Within ___ consecutive calendar days. = NON-STOCK 2
Within __ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in

cases of emergency. 48 4

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: Isl
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El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO

All-America City

BID TABULATION 1
2010
BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL Solicitation #: 2015-568
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015 Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)
WOFFORD TRUCK PARTS, INC
EL PASO, TX
GROUP | - BRAKE SHOE & LINING KIT MODEL 91 - TMC BUS
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE
TEM DESCRIPTION oEmNo, | MODELL _QTY e o ) e o )
NO. | MIN | MAX ' (BxC=D) (Dx3=E) : (BxC=D) (Dx3=E)
NO. (A) | (B)
15526689
1. SHOE & LINING ASSY FRONT LINING #4665X 91 5 30 EA NO BID NO BID
2. SHOE & LINING ASSY FRONT LINING 91 5 20 EA NO BID NO BID
#4665XX
15533465
3. SHOE & LINING ASSY REAR LINING #4666X 91 5 30 EA NO BID NO BID
4, SHOE & LINING ASSY REAR LINING #4666X 91 5 20 EA NO BID NO BID
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER:
GROUP | TOTAL: NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-568
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

WOFFORD TRUCK PARTS, INC

EL PASO, TX
GROUP Il - BRAKE SHOE & LINING KIT MODEL 04 NEW FLYER, 06/09 NABI
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE
ITEM DESCRIPTION oEmNo. | MODELL _QT¥ e o ) e o )
NO. | MIN | MAX : (BxC=D) (Dx3=E) : (BxC=D) (Dx3=E)
NO. (A) | (B)
5 SHOE & LINING ASSY FRONT 6336644 04/06/09 20 80 EA 130.03 31,207.20 0.00
: LINING #4715 $130. $10,402.40 $31,207. $0. $0.00
6. SHOE & LINING ASSY REAR 6336641 04/06/09 | 20 80 EA $772.62 $61,809.60 $185,428.80 $0.00 $0.00
LINING #4728
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER:
GROUP Il TOTAL: $216,636.00 $0.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

Is/

2/16/15
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-568
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

WOFFORD TRUCK PARTS, INC

EL PASO, TX
GROUP il - BRAKE SHOE & PADS MODEL 800 - FORD PARATRANSIT BUS
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE
ITEM DESCRIPTION OEM NO. MODEL QTY UNIT LI:RICE 0) €) UNIT (I:RICE D) ()
NO. | MIN | MAX () (BxC=D) (Dx3=E) (c) (BxC=D) (Dx3=E)
NO. (A) | (B)
1. BRAKE PADS FRONT PGD655M 0800 20 70 | EA $33.41 $2,338.70 $7,016.10 $0.00 $0.00
2. BRAKE PADS REAR PGD411M 0800 20 70 | EA $69.46 $4,862.20 $14,586.60 $0.00 $0.00
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER:
GROUP Il TOTAL: $21,602.70 $0.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:

2/16/15
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-568
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

WOFFORD TRUCK PARTS, INC

EL PASO, TX
GROUP IV - BRAKE SHOE & PADS MODEL 1139 -FORD VAN
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE
ITEM DESCRIPTION OEM NO. MODEL QTY UNIT LI:RICE 0) €) UNIT (I:RICE D) ()
NO. | MIN | MAX ©) (BxC=D) (Dx3=E) ) (BxC=D) (Dx3=E)
NO. (A) | (B)
3. BRAKE PADS FRONT MKD-655 1139 2 10 EA $33.41 $334.10 $1,002.30 $0.00 $0.00
4. BRAKE PADS REAR PGD802M 1139 2 10 EA $31.15 $311.50 $934.50 $0.00 $0.00
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER:
GROUP IV TOTAL: $1,936.80 $0.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:

2/16/15

2015-568 BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-568
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

WOFFORD TRUCK PARTS, INC

EL PASO, TX
GROUP V - BRAKE SHOE & PADS MODEL 800 - FORD PARATRANSIT BUS
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE
ITEM DESCRIPTION OEM NO. MODEL QTY UNIT LI:RICE 0) €) UNIT (I:RICE D) ()
NO. | MIN | MAX () (BxC=D) (Dx3=E) (c) (BxC=D) (Dx3=E)
NO. (A) | (B)
5. FRONT BRAKE KIT 8C22-2001-C 0880 10 40 EA $87.14 $3,485.60 $10,456.80 $0.00 $0.00
6. REAR BRAKE KIT 8C2Z-2200-B | 0880 10 40 EA $84.30 $3,372.00 $10,116.00 $0.00 $0.00
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER:
GROUP V TOTAL: $20,572.80 $0.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:

2/16/15
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-568
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

WOFFORD TRUCK PARTS, INC

EL PASO, TX
GROUP VI - BRAKE SHOE & PADS MODEL 551 - FORD P/U
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE
ITEM DESCRIPTION OEM NO. MODEL QTY UNIT LI:RICE 0) €) UNIT (I:RICE D) ()
NO. | MIN | MAX ©) (BxC=D) (Dx3=E) ) (BxC=D) (Dx3=E)
NO. (A) | (B)
7. BRAKE PADS FRONT MKD702 551 2 10 EA $38.56 $385.60 $1,156.80 $0.00 $0.00
8. BRAKE PADS RAR MKD711 551 2 10 EA $30.36 $303.60 $910.80 $0.00 $0.00
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER:
GROUP VI TOTAL: $2,067.60 $0.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:

2/16/15

2015-568 BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-568
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

WOFFORD TRUCK PARTS, INC

EL PASO, TX
GROUP VIl - BRAKE SHOE & PADS MODEL 145 - FORD CROWN VICTORIA
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE
ITEM DESCRIPTION OEM NO. MODEL QTY UNIT (I;RICE 0) (€) UNIT cPRlCE 0) €)
NO. | MIN | MAX ©) (BxC=D) (Dx3=E) ) (BxC=D) (Dx3=E)
NO. (A) (B)
9. BRAKE PADS FRONT MKD748 145 2 10 EA $31.79 $317.90 $953.70 $0.00 $0.00
10. BRAKE PADS REAR PGD674M 145 2 10 EA $34.99 $349.90 $1,049.70 $0.00 $0.00
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER;
GROUP VII TOTAL: $2,003.40 $0.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:

2/16/15

2015-568 BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-568
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

WOFFORD TRUCK PARTS, INC

EL PASO, TX
GROUP VIl - BRAKE SHOE & PADS MODEL 149 - FORD CROWN VICTORIA
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE
ITEM DESCRIPTION OEM NO. MODEL QTY UNIT LI:RICE 0) €) UNIT (I:RICE D) ()
NO. | MIN | MAX () (BxC=D) (Dx3=E) (c) (BxC=D) (Dx3=E)
NO. (A) | (B)
11. BRAKE PADS MKD659 149 2 10 EA $30.13 $301.30 $903.90 $0.00 $0.00
12. BRAKE PADS FRT PDG-674A 149 2 10 EA $37.90 $379.00 $1,137.00 $0.00 $0.00
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER:
GROUP VIII TOTAL: $2,040.90 $0.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

Is/

2/16/15

2015-568 BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)
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CITY OF EL PASO o
BID TABULATION

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-568
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015

WOFFORD TRUCK PARTS, INC
EL PASO, TX
GROUP IX - BRAKE SHOE & PADS MODEL 557 - DODGE RAM P/U
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE
ITEM MODEL QTY UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
DESCRIPTION OEM NO. (D) (E.) (D) (E.)
NO. | MIN | MAX ©) (BxC=D) (Dx3=E) ) (BxC=D) (Dx3=E)
NO. (A) (B)
13. BRAKE PADS FRT V1013267 557 2 10 EA $45.97 $459.70 $1,379.10 $0.00 $0.00
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER:
GROUP IX TOTAL: $1,379.10 $0.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/16/15 2015-568 BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-568
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

WOFFORD TRUCK PARTS, INC

EL PASO, TX
GROUP X - BRAKE SHOE & PADS MODEL 11 - FORD VAN
EST ANNUAL ANNUALPRICE | 3 YEARPRICE ANNUALPRICE | 3 YEAR PRICE
TEM DESCRIPTION oEmNo, | MODELL _QTY e o ) e o )
NO. | MIN | MAX ' (BxC=D) (Dx3=E) : (BxC=D) (Dx3=E)
NO. (A) | (B)
14. BRAKE PADS FRT 8C2Z-2V001-A 11 2 10 EA $87.14 $871.40 $2,614.20 $0.00 $0.00
15. BRAKE PADS REAR 8C22-2200-A | 11 2 10 | EA $84.30 $843.00 $2,529.00 $0.00 $0.00
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER:
GROUP X TOTAL: $5,143.20 $0.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:

2/16/15
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-568
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

WOFFORD TRUCK PARTS, INC

EL PASO, TX
GROUP XI - BRAKE SHOE & PADS MODEL 14000, 14200, 14400, 14600 - ARBOC
EST ANNUAL ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE ANNUAL PRICE 3 YEAR PRICE
ITEM DESCRIPTION OEM NO. MODEL QTY UNIT (I;RICE 0) (€) UNIT cPRlCE 0) €)
NO. | MIN | MAX (C) (BxC=D) (Dx3=E) (€ (BXxC=D) (Dx3=E)
NO. (A) (B)
16. BRAKE PADS FRT 1921078 14000 2 10 EA $49.09 $490.90 $1,472.70 $0.00 $0.00
17. BRAKE PADS REAR 20850250 14000 2 10 EA $39.55 $395.50 $1,186.50 $0.00 $0.00
18. BRAKE SHOES PARKING BRAKE 20778485 14000 2 10 EA NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00
STATE BRAND / MANUFACTURER;
GROUP XI TOTAL: $2,659.20 $0.00
3YEAR TOTAL GROUPS |- XI: $276,041.70 $0.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE:

2/16/15
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El Paso

All-America City

CITY OF EL PASO "ll"
BID TABULATION FORM 2010

BID ITEM: BRAKE FRICTION MATERIAL Solicitation #: 2015-568
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 11, 2015 Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

WOFFORD TRUCK PARTS, INC
EL PASO, TX

YES NO YES NO
OEM DOCUMENTATION SUBMITED X

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND
THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN
NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS
BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS.
THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

NO OPTION OFFERED X

PAYMENT TERMS: (LEFT BLANK)

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

Within ___ consecutive calendar days.

Within __ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in
cases of emergency.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

(LEFT BLANK)

(LEFT BLANK)

BIDS SOLICITED: 33 LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED: 18 BIDS RECEIVED: 7 LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED: 4 NO BID: O
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl
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