Project Name: BUS TURBOCHARGERS

Bid Opening Date: SEPTEMBER 16, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America ity

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-981

Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

ALTERNATOR SERVICE INC B & C TRUCK ELECTRIC INC.
DALLAS, TX IRVINE, TX
ITEM ANNUAL EST. QTY.
DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURE UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL 3YRTOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL | 3YRTOTAL

NO SUBMITTING MIN MAX (B) (€) (D) (B) (C) (D)

(A)
1. REMANUFACTUEE&_? ;JNN(I;NIIEINS WITH CORE 4089445 5 10 $1,450.00 $14,500.00 $43,500.00 $1,275.95 $12,759.50 $38,278.50
EA HALSET #4035107
REMANUFACTURED CUMMINS WITHOUT

1a. CORE EXCHANGE 4089445 1 2 $200.00 $0.00

EA NEW NO CORE CHARGE
REMANUFACTURED TURBOCHARGER
2. CUMMINS WITH CORE CHARGE EXCHANGE 3799931RX 20 30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $995.00 :If:é:zt:;glz :::é::(:r:;
EA NO BID NO BID NO BID $19.900.00 $59.700.00
REMANUFACTURED TURBOCHARGER

2a. || CUMMINS WITH CORE CHARGE EXCHANGE 3799931RX 2 6 $0.00 $187.50

EA NO BID
ANNUAL AMOUNT ITEMS 1-2
Max. Est. Qty. (A) x Unit Price (B) = Annual Amount $14,500.00 $42,609.50
BIDDER'S PRICE $32,659.50
3 YEAR TOTAL ITEMS 1-2
Annual Amunt ( C ) x 3 = 3-Yearl Total (D) $43,500.00 $127,828.50
BIDDER'S PRICE $97,978.50

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Is/

DATE:

9/21/15

2015-981 BUS TURBOCHARGERS - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)




Project Name: BUS TURBOCHARGERS
Bid Opening Date: SEPTEMBER 16, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010
Solicitation #: 2015-981
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

DALLAS, TX

ALTERNATOR SERVICE INC

B & C TRUCK ELECTRIC INC.
IRVINE, TX

DID YOU SUBMIT A CERTIFIED AND/OR
AUTHORIZED LETTER?

YES

NO

[ ]

YES NO

[ ]

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO
EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE

CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON

THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED
ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND
CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION
TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF
THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

NO OPTION OFFERED

L]

L]

PAYMENT TERMS:

1% - 10 DAYS
NET - 30 DAYS

NET - 30 DAYS

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
Within consecutive calendar days

3

7

Within hours or overnight after receipt of
verbal order in cases of emergency.

24

48

|IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Is/

DATE: 9/21/15 2015-981 BUS TURBOCHARGERS - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: BUS TURBOCHARGERS
Bid Opening Date: SEPTEMBER 16, 2015

El Paso

All-America ity

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-981
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

RUSH TRUCK CENTERS OF TEXAS LP
DBA RUSH TRUCK EL PASO CENTER

EL PASO, TX
ITEM ANNUAL EST. QTY.
DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURE UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL 3YRTOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL | 3YRTOTAL

NO SUBMITTING MIN MAX (B) (C) (D) (B) (C) (D)

(A)
1. REMANUFACTURED CUMMINS WITH CORE 4089445 5 10 $1,182.06 $11,820.60 $35,461.80 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
EXCHANGE
EA RX
REMANUFACTURED CUMMINS WITHOUT

1a. CORE EXCHANGE 4089445 1 2 $199.50 $0.00

EA
REMANUFACTURED TURBOCHARGER

2. CUMMINS WITH CORE CHARGE EXCHANGE 3799931RX 20 30 $869.84 $26,095.20 $78,285.60 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

EA
REMANUFACTURED TURBOCHARGER

2a. || CUMMINS WITH CORE CHARGE EXCHANGE 3799931RX 2 6 $199.50 $0.00

EA
ANNUAL AMOUNT ITEMS 1-2 $37.915.80 $0.00
Max. Est. Qty. (A) x Unit Price (B) = Annual Amount
3 YEAR TOTAL ITEMS 1-2 $113.747.40 $0.00

Annual Amunt ( C ) x 3 = 3-Yearl Total (D)

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Is/

DATE: 9/21/15

2015-981 BUS TURBOCHARGERS - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO Rt

BID TABULATION FORM |y
Project Name: BUS TURBOCHARGERS Solicitation #: 2015-981
Bid Opening Date: SEPTEMBER 16, 2015 Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

RUSH TRUCK CENTERS OF TEXAS LP
DBA RUSH TRUCK EL PASO CENTER
EL PASO, TX

DID YOU SUBMIT A CERTIFIED AND/OR YES NO YES NO

AUTHORIZED LETTER? I:I I:I I:I

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO
EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE

CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON

THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED
ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND
CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION
TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF
THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

[]

NO OPTION OFFERED |:| |:|
PAYMENT TERMS: 100% - 10 DAYS

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: 7

Within ___ consecutive calendar days

Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of

. 48
verbal order in cases of emergency.

|IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

BIDS SOLICITED: 22 LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED: 10 BIDS RECEIVED: 3 LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED: 1 NO BID: 0

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Is/

DATE: 9/21/15 2015-981 BUS TURBOCHARGERS - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 4




APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 9/21/15 2015-981 BUS TURBOCHARGERS - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)




APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 9/21/15 2015-981 BUS TURBOCHARGERS - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)




APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 9/21/15 2015-981 BUS TURBOCHARGERS - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)




APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 9/21/15 2015-981 BUS TURBOCHARGERS - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)




