CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015

El Paso

Al e
\ll

2010

City

'V

Solicitation #: 2016-026
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

APYS COLOR SUPPY, INC.

CENTRAL AUTOMOTIVE SUPPLY,

INC.
EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX
ITEM
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER UNIT OF | ESTIMATED QUANTITY ||\ bpice ATNO’\‘T‘X*LL 3-YRTOTAL | UNIT PRICE AT’\(IDNTLXOI\_L 3-YR TOTAL
NO. PART NUMBER MEASURE MIN '\?:)X (B) (AxB=C) (Cx 3YRS) (B) (AXB=C) (Cx 3YRS)
40/30, TPO DUROMIX FLEXIBLE BUMPER | CONTAINE 10 60 NO BID NO BID NO BID $39.99 $2,399.40 | $7,198.20
L 12 OZ. CONT. R
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 5887
40/40, SIMI RIDGID DUROMIX CONTAINE 10 60 $62.19 $3,731.40 | $11,194.20 $39.99 $2,399.40 | $7,198.20
) 12 OZ. CONT. R
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 3M 8-273 4240
CONTAINE
SMC, FIBERGLASS 40/50, DUROMIX v 100 260 NO BID NO BID NO BID $69.99 $18,197.40 | $54,592.20
3. 12 OZ. CONT.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 8274
CONTAINE
40/60, METAL DUROMIX FILLER or EQUAL | “O\T 10 40 NO BID NO BID NO BID $39.99 $1,599.60 | $4,798.80
4 12 OZ. CONT.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 8115
41/88, SMC FIBERGLASS PANEL oA
ADHESIVE DUROMIX v 10 60 $64.04 $3,842.40 | $11,527.20 $39.99 $2,399.40 | $7,198.20
5 12 OZ. CONT.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 3M 8274 8115
40/56 HD SMC DUROMIX GLAZING [ __
FILLER or EQUAL v 10 60 NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.99 $1,139.40 | $3,418.20
6. 2 KG CONT.

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING

8509

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE: 11/10/15

2016-026 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - MASS TRANSIT




CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015

El Paso

TTT11
JIL

City

2010

Solicitation #: 2016-026
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

APYS COLOR SUPPY, INC.

CENTRAL AUTOMOTIVE SUPPLY,

INC.
EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX
ITEM
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER UNIT OF | ESTIMATED QUANTITY ||\ bpice ATNO’\‘T‘X*LL 3-YRTOTAL | UNIT PRICE AT’\(IDNTLXOI\_L 3-YR TOTAL
NO. PART NUMBER MEASURE MIN '\?:)X (B) (AxB=C) (Cx 3YRS) (B) (AXB=C) (Cx 3YRS)
4320, FLEXIBLE FOAM DUROMIX CONTAINE 10 60 NO BID NO BID NO BID $39.99 $2,399.40 | $7,198.20
. 12 OZ. CONT. R
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 8458
4901, TIP DUROMIX
. 13 PER PACK PACKAGES 10 60 $20.09 $1,20540 | $3,616.20 $11.99 $719.40 | $2,158.20
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 3M 8274 8193
DUROMIX CLEANER OR EQUAL
. 150 0T BOTLE BOTTLES 25 180 NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.99 $3,418.20 | $10,254.60
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 190
MASK'F'Z‘CC;‘LTLAPE 2 ROLLS 10 1000 $5.70 $5,700.00 | $17,100.00 $5.84 $5,840.00 | $17,520.00
10.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 3M 6656 3M 6656
3/n
MASK'ESLTLAPE L ROLLS 250 2000 $2.00 $4,000.00 | $12,000.00 $1.99 $3,980.00 | $11,940.00
11.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 3M 6652 3M 6652
MASKING TA';%LFL'NE LINE, 1/8 ROLLS 50 250 $3.50 $875.00 $2,625.00 $10.97 $2,742.50 | $8,227.50
12.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 3M 6343 3M 6300

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

DATE:

APPROVED BY: __/s/

11/10/15

2016-026 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - MASS TRANSIT




CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES

Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015

El Paso
el
City

TTT11
JIL

2010

Solicitation #: 2016-026

Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

APYS COLOR SUPPY, INC.

CENTRAL AUTOMOTIVE SUPPLY,

INC.
EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX
ITEM
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER UNIT OF | ESTIMATED QUANTITY ||\ bpice ATNO’\‘T‘X*LL 3-YRTOTAL | UNIT PRICE AT’\(IDNTLXOI\_L 3-YR TOTAL
NO. PART NUMBER MEASURE MIN '\?:)X (B) (AxB=C) (Cx 3YRS) (B) (AXB=C) (Cx 3YRS)
1/n
MASKING TA:S'LE'NE LINE, vz ROLLS 50 250 $2.53 $632.50 $1,897.50 $10.97 $2,742.50 | $8,227.50
13.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 3M 26344 3M 6301
L
MASKING TAFE(E’LE'NE LINE, % ROLLS 50 250 $2.58 $645.00 $1,935.00 $13.99 $3,497.50 | $10,492.50
14,
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 3M 26332 3M 6303
PLASTIC SHEETING, 36" x 1,000 ROLLS 3 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID $22.99 $459.80 $1,379.40
1,000' ROLL
15.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 30207
MASKING PAPER, 12" x 1,000’
1.000' ROLL ROLLS 3 20 $11.70 $234.00 $702.00 $11.49 $229.80 $689.40
17.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING KARDOL 12 MP12
MASKING PAPER, 18 x 1,000 ROLLS 3 20 $14.99 $299.80 $899.40 $16.99 $339.80 $1,019.40
1,000' ROLL
18.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING KARDOL 18 MP18

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE: 11/10/15

2016-026 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - MASS TRANSIT



CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015

El Paso
el
Ame City

TTT11
JIL

2010

Solicitation #: 2016-026

Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

APYS COLOR SUPPY, INC.

CENTRAL AUTOMOTIVE SUPPLY,

INC.
EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX
ITEM
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER UNIT OF | ESTIMATED QUANTITY ||\ bpice ATNO’\‘T‘X*LL 3-YRTOTAL | UNIT PRICE AT’\(IDNTLXOI\_L 3-YR TOTAL
NO. PART NUMBER MEASURE MIN I\?:)X (B) (AXB=C) (C x 3YRS) (B) (AXB=C) (C x 3 YRS)
MASKING PAPER, 36" x 1,000 ROLLS 3 25 $34.70 $867.50 $2,602.50 $34.99 $874.75 | $2,624.25
1,000' ROLL
19.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING KARDOL 36 MP36
WET DRY SANDPAPER, 8 %" x 11"
220 GRIT "A" WEIGHT PAPER ALUMINUM [PACKAGES 50 300 $34.33 $10,299.00 | $30,897.00 $38.39 $11,517.00 | $34,551.00
20. SHEETS PER PACK
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING NORTON 39389 3M 2007
WET DRY SANDPAPER, 8 5 X 11"
400 GRIT"A WE'SQLFE)APER ALUMINUM o) kaces 25 150 $34.33 $5,149.50 | $15,448.50 $38.39 $5,758.50 | $17,275.50
21. SHEETS PER PACK
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING NORTON 39385 3M 202
WET DRY SANDPAPER, 8 %2 x 11"
600 GRIT "A" WEIGHT PAPER PACKAGES 100 500 $34.33 $17,165.00 | $51,495.00 $38.39 $19,195.00 | $57,585.00
22. SHEETS PER PACK
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING NORTON 39383 3M 2002
WET DRY SANDPAPER, 8 % x 11"
1000 GRIT "A" WEIGHT PAPER PACKAGES 50 300 $67.05 $20,115.00 | $60,345.00 $31.06 $9,318.00 | $27,954.00
23, SHEETS PER PACK
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 3M 2034 3M 2021
WET DRY SANDPAPER, 8 7 x 11"
1500 GRIT "A" WEIGHT PAPER
ALUMINUM OXIDE GRIT PACKAGES 50 300 $59.95 $17,985.00 | $53,955.00 $31.06 $9,318.00 | $27,954.00
24, SHEETS PER PACK
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 3M 2032 3M 2023

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE: 11/10/15

2016-026 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - MASS TRANSIT




Project Name: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

An-America City

‘\J

2010

'V

Solicitation #: 2016-026
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

APYS COLOR SUPPY, INC.

CENTRAL AUTOMOTIVE SUPPLY,

INC.
EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX
ITEM
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER UNIT OF | ESTIMATED QUANTITY |l 3 bpice ATNO’\‘T‘X*LL 3-YRTOTAL | UNIT PRICE AT’\(IDNTLXOI\_L 3-YR TOTAL
NO. PART NUMBER MEASURE MIN I\?:)X (B) (AXB=C) (C x 3YRS) (B) (AXB=C) (C x 3 YRS)
DISPOSABLE RESPIRATOR ELEMENTS -
FOR NORTH RESPIRATOR p/n N7500-83 |PACKAGES 3 12 $16.60 $199.20 $597.60 $14.24 $170.88 $512.64
o5 PER PACK
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 3M 7192 3M 7194
DISCS, 3" 24 GRIT ROLOC or EQUAL
©1SC PER PACK PACKAGES 10 50 $39.68 $1,984.00 | $5,952.00 $38.99 $1,94950 | $5,848.50
26.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 3M 1408 3M 1408
DISCS, 2" 24 GRIT ROLOC or EQUAL |, - 1 ces 10 50 $33.49 $1,67450 | $5,023.50 $31.99 $1,599.50 | $4,798.50
DISC PER PACK
27.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 3M 1398 3M 1397
VIPER BLADE, CUT OFF DISC #77149
25,450 RPM PACKAGES 25 150 NO BID NO BID NO BID $24.68 $3,702.00 | $11,106.00
30. DISC PER PACK
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 3M 1990
DA SANDPAPER DISC, 6: 80 GRIT 100"D"
WEIGHT PAPER, SELF ADHESIVE  [PACKAGES 25 120 $44.88 $5,385.60 | $16,156.80 $35.99 $4,318.80 | $12,956.40
31 DISC PER PACK
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING NORTON 31481 3M 1213

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE: 11/10/15

2016-026 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - MASS TRANSIT




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO

An-America City

BID TABULATION FORM 'y
2010
Project Name: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES Solicitation #: 2016-026
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015 Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)
CENTRAL AUTOMOTIVE SUPPLY,
APYS COLOR SUPPY, INC. INC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ITEM
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER uniT oF | ESTIMATED QUANTITY i \)\\r ppice Shbvey 3YRTOTAL | unimprice | A0EAE | syrTOTAL
NO. PART NUMBER MEASURE MIN I\?:)X (B) (AxB=0C) (Cx 3 YRS) (B) AXB=0) (Cx 3 YRS)
DA SANDPAPER DISC, 6" 180 GRIT 100
D" WEIGHT PAPER, SELF ADHESIVE, |, oy aces 25 120 $41.46 $4,975.20 | $14,925.60 $32.99 $3,958.80 | $11,876.40
OPEN COAT
32. DISC PER PACK
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING NORTON 31477 3M 1209
DA SANDPAPER DISC, 6", 220 GRIT 100
D" WEIGHT PAPER, SELF ADHESIVE, |, o ks 25 120 $41.46 $4,975.20 | $14,925.60 $32.99 $3,958.80 | $11,876.40
OPEN COAT
33. DISC PER PACK
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING NORTON 31476 3M 1208
STICKIT DISCS, 8"
1SC PER PACK PACKAGES 3 10 $94.53 $945.30 $2,835.90 $87.60 $876.00 $2,628.00
34,
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 3M 1549 3M 1549
PAINT/LACQUER THINNER CONTAINE
PER GALLON CONT. 5 10 150 $10.99 $1,648.50 $4,945.50 $13.99 $2,09850 | $6,295.50
35.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING AXAHA 105 MS251
SANDPAPER FILE, 36 GRIT BOXES 10 100 $34.98 $3,498.00 | $10,494.00 $85.23 $8,523.00 | $25,569.00
36 50 PER BOX BIDDER'S PRICE | BIDDER'S PRICE
: $349.80 $3,498.00
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING NORTON 23622 3M 2222

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE: 11/10/15 2016-026 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - MASS TRANSIT 6




Project Name: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
el
City

TTT11
JIL

2010

Solicitation #: 2016-026

Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

APYS COLOR SUPPY, INC.

CENTRAL AUTOMOTIVE SUPPLY,

INC.
EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX
ITEM
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER UNIT OF | ESTIMATED QUANTITY ||\ bpice ATNO’\‘T‘X*LL 3-YRTOTAL | UNIT PRICE AT’\(IDNTLXOI\_L 3-YR TOTAL
NO. PART NUMBER MEASURE MIN MAX (B) (AxB=C) (Cx 3YRS) (B) (AXB=C) (Cx 3YRS)
(A)
SANDPAPER FILE, 40 GRIT BOXES 25 100 $31.29 $3,129.00 $9,387.00 $76.18 $7,618.00 | $22,854.00
37 50 PER BOX BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE
' $312.90 $31,290.00
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING NORTON 23621 3M 2221
SANDPAPER FILE, 80 GRIT BOXES 100 900 $23.72 $21,348.00 | $64,044.00 $54.89 $49,401.00 | $148,203.00
38 50 PER BOX BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE
) $237.20 $213,480.00
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING NORTON 23620 3M 2220
GR'EC?:DNE(E%%?(S' 6 BOXES 10 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID $77.04 $7,704.00 | $23,112.00
39.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 3M 1922
SINGLE Elggiggé%F;BLADEs BOXES 10 72 $4.99 $359.28 $1,077.84 $4.59 $330.48 $991.44
40.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING AMERICAN BLADE 94115 5010
DOUBLE S'EEES SXSF PADS, 8 PER PAD 10 50 $27.74 $1,387.00 $4,161.00 $25.70 $1,285.00 | $3,855.00
42.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 3M 5703 5703
SCZ?SFFTQ\,IQGB%@DS BOXES 10 60 $15.54 $932.40 $2,797.20 $17.74 $1,064.40 | $3,193.20
43.

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING

NORTON 58000

7447

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE: 11/10/15

2016-026 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - MASS TRANSIT



CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015

El Paso

An-America City

\lll"

2010

Solicitation #: 2016-026

Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

APYS COLOR SUPPY, INC.

CENTRAL AUTOMOTIVE SUPPLY,

INC.
EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX
ITEM
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER UNIT OF | ESTIMATED QUANTITY |\ \ir ppicE ATNO’\‘T‘X*LL 3-YRTOTAL | UNIT PRICE AT’\(IDNTLXOI\_L 3-YR TOTAL
NO. PART NUMBER MEASURE MIN MAX (B) (AxB=C) (Cx 3YRS) (B) (AXB=C) (Cx 3YRS)
(A)
GOGiEFE'é'X'E‘fOE%%T\IOTUND CONTAINE 5 12 $111.66 | $1,339.92 | $4,019.76 | $105.63 | $1,267.56 | $3,802.68
44, '
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 3M 6065 6065
5990 HPAE'}'QD(S’GQAQTCE'(')\'STGLAZE CONTANE 19 60 $23.30 | $1,398.00 | $4,194.00 $2159 | $1,205.40 | $3,886.20
45, '
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 3M 5990 5990
FIBERGLASS REINFORCEMENT DYNA
GLASS CONTAINE 10 96 $49.86 $4,786.56 $14,359.68 $55.99 $5,375.04 | $16,125.12
46 PER GAL LON CONT R BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE
: ) $498.60 $47,865.60
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING EVERCOAT 869 622
BF?E%YGF ALIT_LLE(?I\’I Eé%’;l\ﬁo CONTAINE 10 125 $12.25 $1,531.25 $4,593.75 $16.99 $2,123.75 | $6,371.25
47. '
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING EVERCOAT B38 156
METAL :APEEADERS EACH 5 20 $1.50 $30.00 $90.00 $0.79 $15.80 $47.40
48.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING MIS CH13 1001

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE: 11/10/15

2016-026 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - MASS TRANSIT




Project Name: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
el
City

TTT11
JIL

2010

Solicitation #: 2016-026

Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

APYS COLOR SUPPY, INC.

CENTRAL AUTOMOTIVE SUPPLY,

INC.
EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX
ITEM
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER UNIT OF | ESTIMATED QUANTITY |\ \ir ppicE ATNO’\‘T‘X*LL 3-YRTOTAL | UNIT PRICE AT’\(IDNTLXOI\_L 3-YR TOTAL
NO. PART NUMBER MEASURE MIN '\?:)X (B) (AxB=C) (Cx 3YRS) (B) (AXB=C) (Cx 3YRS)
PLAST'CEiEiEADERS EACH 5 20 $0.52 $10.40 $31.20 $0.39 $7.80 $23.40
49,
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING EVERCOAT 869 1204
CHEES;%RHATERS EACH 10 100 $1.25 $125.00 $375.00 $1.99 $199.00 $597.00
50.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING MAN 21-299A 21-299
PAINT, DURETHANE, WHITE [PPG] | conTAINE
ER GALLONG CONT. ; 10 250 $99.83 $24,957.50 | $74,872.50 $88.99 $22,247.50 | $66,742.50
51.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 2K URETHANE WHITE (NASON) WHITE
PAINT, DURETHANE, DARK BLUE [PPG] | conTAINE
DER GALLON GONT. K 10 50 $121.19 $6,059.50 | $18,178.50 $107.20 $5,360.00 | $16,080.00
52.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 2K URETHANE BLUE (NASON) DARK BLUE
PAINT, DURETHANE, MEDIUMBLUE [ __
[PPG] r 10 50 $121.19 $6,059.50 | $18,178.50 $107.20 $5,360.00 | $16,080.00
53 PER GALLON CONTAINER
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 2K URETHANE MED. BLUE (NASON) BLUE
PAINT, DURETHANE, LIGHT BLUE [PPG] [ conTang 10 50 $0-00 $0-00 $0-00 $0-00 $0.00 $0.00
54 PER GALLON-CONT: R BIDDER PRICE BIDDER PRICE BIDDER PRICE
* $121.19 $6,059.50 $18,178.50
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 2K URETHANE LT BLUE (NASON)

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE: 11/10/15

2016-026 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - MASS TRANSIT



CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015

El Paso

An-America City

\lll"

2010

Solicitation #: 2016-026

Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

APYS COLOR SUPPY, INC.

CENTRAL AUTOMOTIVE SUPPLY,

INC.
EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX
ITEM
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER UNIT OF | ESTIMATED QUANTITY |\ \ir ppicE ATNO’\‘T‘X*LL 3-YRTOTAL | UNIT PRICE AT’\(IDNTLXOI\_L 3-YR TOTAL
NO. PART NUMBER MEASURE MIN I\?:)X (B) (AXB=C) (C x 3YRS) (B) (AXB=C) (Cx 3YRS)
55 P-ER—GA—I:EQN—GQNT— R BIDDER PRICE BIDDER PRICE BIDDER PRICE
. $121.19 $6,059.50 $18,178.50
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 2K URETHANE YELLOW (NASON)
HARDENER, DURETHANE, [PPG] CONIAINE
. SER GALLON CONTAINER ! 100 400 $335.03 | $134,012.00 | $402,036.00 $36.28 $14,512.00 | $43,536.00
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING AXALTA (NASON) 483-15 MH167
4901, TIPS DUROMIX PACKAGES 10 60 $20.09 $1,205.40 $3,616.20 $11.99 $719.40 $2,158.20
57 12 PER PACKAGE BIDDER PRICE BIDDER PRICE
' $71.94 $215.82
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 3M 4901 8193
CLEAR COAT, DURETHANE DU-1001, [__
[PPG] - 25 150 $65.07 $9,760.50 | $29,281.50 $202.50 | $30,375.00 | $91,125.00
58. PER GALLON CONT.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING NASON 49800 DCU2050
TAC RAGS - BOXES 15 75 $13.98 $1,04850 | $3,145.50 $9.95 $746.25 | $2,238.75
BOX OF 24
59.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING DETRO 1200 8001

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE: 11/10/15

2016-026 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - MASS TRANSIT

10




CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015

El Paso

An-America City

\ l I I ' r
2010

Solicitation #: 2016-026

Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

APYS COLOR SUPPY, INC.

CENTRAL AUTOMOTIVE SUPPLY,

INC.
EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX
ITEM
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER UNIT OF | ESTIMATED QUANTITY |l 1 bpice ATNO’\‘T‘X*LL 3-YRTOTAL | UNIT PRICE AT’\(IDNTLXOI\_L 3-YR TOTAL
NO. PART NUMBER MEASURE MIN '\?:)X (B) (AxB=C) (Cx 3YRS) (B) (AXB=C) (Cx 3YRS)
GRAPPER ADHESIVE
0 07 BOTILES BOTTLES 25 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID $15.99 $1,599.00 | $4,797.00
60.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 8090
DUST MASK, DOUBLE STRAP EACH 100 500 $15.63 $7,815.00 | $23,445.00 $12.31 $6,155.00 | $18,465.00
XX PER BOX
63.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 3M 7048 7048
SPRAY PAINT, AEROSOL CAN [Krylon]
GLOSSY WHITE EACH 5 24 $2.45 $58.80 $176.40 $3.99 $95.76 $287.28
64. 12/ PKG
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING ZYNOLYTE 397 5 STAR
SPRAY PAINT, AEROSOL CAN [Krylon]
GLOSSY BLACK PACKAGES 10 60 $29.40 $1,764.00 | $5,292.00 $3.99 $239.40 $718.20
65. 12/ PKG
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING ZYNOLYTE 387 5 STAR
SPRAY PAINT, AEROSOL CAN [Krylon]
SEMI GLOSSY BLACK PACKAGES 10 60 $29.40 $1,764.00 | $5,292.00 $3.99 $239.40 $718.20
66. 12/ PKG
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING ZYNOLYTE 277 5 STAR
3 YEAR TOTAL $1,046,740.53 $920,929.41
BIDDER'S PRICE $1,309,198.20 BIDDER'S PRICE $918,987.03

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE: 11/10/15

2016-026 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - MASS TRANSIT
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Project Name: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Solicitation #: 2016-026

Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

APYS COLOR SUPPY, INC.
EL PASO, TX

CENTRAL AUTOMOTIVE SUPPLY,
INC.
EL PASO, TX

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO
EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED
ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL
BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE
SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE
MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

[]

[ ]

NO OPTION OFFERED

X

X

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: 2 1

Within __ consecutive calendar days

Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of NONE STATED 24

verbal order in cases of emergency.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE: 11/10/15 2016-026 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - MASS TRANSIT
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El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO

An-America City

BID TABULATION FORM 'y
2010
Project Name: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES Solicitation #: 2016-026
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015 Department. MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)
LOREN HODGES INC.
GVMI INC. 0] ODGES INC. dba
EL PASO. TX LONGHORN DISTRIBUTING
' EL PASO, TX
ITEM
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER unoF | ESTMATED QUANTITY | unimprice | ATTIUAL 3YRTOTAL | unimprice | A0EAE | syrTOTAL
NO. PART NUMBER MEASURE MIN I\?:)X (B) (AXB=C) (Cx 3 YRS) (B) (AXB=C) (Cx 3 YRS)
40/30, TPO DUROMIX FLEXIBLE BUMPER | CONTAINE 10 60 $25.47 $1.528.20 $4.584.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 OZ. CONT. R
1. 70z
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING TRANSTAR 1458
40/40, SIMI RIDGID DUROMIX CONTAINE
12 07 CONT. R 10 60 $25.47 $1,528.20 $4,584.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID
2. 70z
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING TRANSTAR 1458
CONTAINE
SMC, FIBERGLASS 40/50, DUROMIX 5 100 260 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3. 12 OZ. CONT.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
CONTAINE
40/60, METAL DUROMIX FILLER or EQUAL R 10 40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4. 12 OZ. CONT.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
41/88, SMC FIBERGLASS PANEL CONTAINE
ADHESIVE DUROMIX 5 10 60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5. 12 OZ. CONT.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
40/56 HD SMC DUROMIX GLAZING CONTAINE
FILLER or EQUAL R 10 60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
6. 2 KG CONT.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING

NOTE: Tﬁp%gg\(/)Erlgnéi&ion/S(l:ontained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

DATE: 11/10/15 2016-026 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - MASS TRANSIT 13




Project Name: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

An-America City

‘\J

2010

'V

Solicitation #: 2016-026
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

LOREN HODGES INC. dba

GVMI INC.
EL PASO. T LONGHORN DISTRIBUTING
: EL PASO, TX
ITEM
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER UNIT OF | ESTIMATED QUANTITY |l 3 bpice ATNO’\‘T‘X*LL 3-YRTOTAL | UNIT PRICE AT’\(IDNTLXOI\_L 3-YR TOTAL
NO. PART NUMBER MEASURE MIN I\?:)X (B) (AXB=C) (C x 3YRS) (B) (AXB=C) (C x 3 YRS)
4320, FLEXIBLE FOAM DUROMIX CONTAINE
, 19 07, CONT. r 10 60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
4901, TIP DUROMIX
13 PER PACK PACKAGES 10 60 $21.96 $1,317.60 | $3,952.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID
8. 12 @ 1.83
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING NAPA 3M 08193
DUROMIX CLEANER OR EQUAL
. 180 OT. BOTTLE BOTTLES 25 180 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
MASK'F':'CC;‘LTLAPE 2 ROLLS 10 1000 $6.60 $6,600.00 | $19,800.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
10.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING NAPA 3M 06656
3/n
MASK'ESLTSPE L ROLLS 250 2000 $2.38 $4,760.00 | $14,280.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
11.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING NAPA 3 M 06652
MASKING TA';E)’LF:NE LINE, 1/8 ROLLS 50 250 $9.02 $2,255.00 | $6,765.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
12.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING NAPA 3M 06404

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE: 11/10/15 2016-026 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - MASS TRANSIT
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CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES

Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015

El Paso

An-America City

\lll"

2010

Solicitation #: 2016-026

Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

LOREN HODGES INC. dba

GVMI INC.
EL PASO. TX LONGHORN DISTRIBUTING
’ EL PASO, TX
ITEM
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER UNIT OF | ESTIMATED QUANTITY |l 3 bpice ATNO’\‘T‘X*LL 3-YRTOTAL | UNIT PRICE AT’\(IDNTLXOI\_L 3-YR TOTAL
NO. PART NUMBER MEASURE MIN '\?:)X (B) (AxB=C) (Cx 3YRS) (B) (AXB=C) (Cx 3YRS)
1/ 0
MASKING TA:SI'_E'NE LINE, ¥ ROLLS 50 250 $8.60 $2,150.00 | $6,450.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
13. $0.00 $0.00
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING NAPA 3M 06405
e
MASKING TAFE(ELEINE LINE, % ROLLS 50 250 $11.86 $2,965.00 | $8,895.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
14.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING NAPA 3M 06408
PLASTIC SHEETING, 36" x 1,000 ROLLS 3 20 $43.64 $872.80 $2,618.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1,000' ROLL
15.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING NAPA MARTIN SENIOR P1036
MASKING PAPER, 12" x 1,000 ROLLS 3 20 $53.92 $1,078.40 | $3,235.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1,000' ROLL
17.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING NAPA 3M 06512
MASKING PAPER, 18 x 1,000 ROLLS 3 20 $82.11 $1,642.20 | $4,926.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1,000' ROLL
18.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING NAPA 3M 06518

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE: 11/10/15

2016-026 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - MASS TRANSIT

15




CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015

El Paso

Al e
\ll

City

'V

2010

Solicitation #: 2016-026
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

LOREN HODGES INC. dba

GVMI INC.
EL PASO. T LONGHORN DISTRIBUTING
’ EL PASO, TX
ITEM
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER UNIT OF | ESTIMATED QUANTITY ||\ bpice ATNO’\‘T‘X*LL 3-YRTOTAL | UNIT PRICE AT’\(IDNTLXOI\_L 3-YR TOTAL
NO. PART NUMBER MEASURE MIN I\?:)X (B) (AXB=C) (C x 3YRS) (B) (AXB=C) (C x 3 YRS)
MASKING PAPER, 36" x 1,000 ROLLS 3 25 $161.82 $4,04550 | $12,136.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1,000' ROLL
19.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING NAPA 3M 06536
WET DRY SANDPAPER, 8 %" x 11"
220 GRIT "A" WEIGHT PAPER ALUMINUM [PACKAGES 50 300 $19.63 $5,889.00 | $17,667.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
20. SHEETS PER PACK 50
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING B.E INDASA p 5-220
WET DRY SANDPAPER, 8 5 X 11"
400 GRIT"A WE'SQLEAPER ALUMINUM o) kaces 25 150 $19.63 $2,94450 | $8,833.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
21. SHEETS PER PACK 50
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING P.B.E INDASA 5-400
WET DRY SANDPAPER, 8 %2 x 11"
600 GRIT "A" WEIGHT PAPER PACKAGES 100 500 $19.63 $9,815.00 | $29,445.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
22 SHEETS PER PACK 50
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING B.E INDASA 5-600
WET DRY SANDPAPER, 8 % x 11"
1000 GRIT "A" WEIGHT PAPER PACKAGES 50 300 $19.63 $5,889.00 | $17,667.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
23, SHEETS PER PACK 50
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING B.E INDASA p -1000
WET DRY SANDPAPER, 8 7 x 11"
1500 GRIT "A" WEIGHT PAPER
ALUMINUM OXIDE GRIT PACKAGES 50 300 $20.55 $6,165.00 | $18,495.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
24, SHEETS PER PACK 50

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING

P.B.E. INDASA 5-1500

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE: 11/10/15

2016-026 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - MASS TRANSIT
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CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015

El Paso

An-America City

‘\J

'V

2010

Solicitation #: 2016-026
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

LOREN HODGES INC. dba

GVMI INC.
EL PASO. X LONGHORN DISTRIBUTING
’ EL PASO, TX
ITEM
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER UNIT OF | ESTIMATED QUANTITY |l 3 bpice ATNO’\‘T‘X*LL 3-YRTOTAL | UNIT PRICE AT’\(IDNTLXOI\_L 3-YR TOTAL
NO. PART NUMBER MEASURE MIN I\?:)X (B) (AXB=C) (C x 3YRS) (B) (AXB=C) (C x 3 YRS)
DISPOSABLE RESPIRATOR ELEMENTS -
FOR NORTH RESPIRATOR p/n N7500-83 [PACKAGES 3 12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
25, PER PACK
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
DISCS, 3" 24 GRIT ROLOC or EQUAL
C1SC PER PACK PACKAGES 10 50 $26.89 $1,34450 | $4,033.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
26. 25
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING P.B.E. INDASA 7303-24
DISCS, 2" 24 GRIT ROLOC or EQUAL |, e 10 50 $26.35 $1,317.50 | $3,952.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
DISC PER PACK
27. 25
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING P B.E. INDASA 7302Z-24
VIPER BLADE, CUT OFF DISC #77149
25,450 RPM PACKAGES 25 150 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
30. DISC PER PACK
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
DA SANDPAPER DISC, 6: 80 GRIT 100'D"
WEIGHT PAPER, SELF ADHESIVE  [PACKAGES 25 120 $22.00 $2,640.00 | $7,920.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
31 DISC PER PACK 100

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING

P.B.E. INDASA 60-80

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE: 11/10/15

2016-026 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - MASS TRANSIT
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CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015

El Paso

City

Al e
\ll

'V

2010

Solicitation #: 2016-026
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

LOREN HODGES INC. dba

GVMI INC.
EL PASO. TX LONGHORN DISTRIBUTING
' EL PASO, TX
ITEM
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER UNIT OF | ESTIMATED QUANTITY |\ \ir ppicE ATNO’\‘T‘X*LL 3-YRTOTAL | UNIT PRICE AT’\(IDNTLXOI\_L 3-YR TOTAL
NO. PART NUMBER MEASURE MIN I\?:)X (B) (AxB=C) (Cx 3YRS) (B) (AXB=C) (Cx 3 YRS)
DA SANDPAPER DISC, 6" 180 GRIT 100
"D" WEIGHT PAPER, SELF ADHESIVE,
OPEN COAT PACKAGES 25 120 $21.23 $2,547.60 $7,642.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID
32. DISC PER PACK 100
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING P.B.E. INDASA 60-180
DA SANDPAPER DISC, 6", 220 GRIT 100
"D" WEIGHT PAPER, SELF ADHESIVE,
OPEN COAT PACKAGES 25 120 $21.23 $2,547.60 $7,642.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID
33. DISC PER PACK 100
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING P.B.E. INDASA 60-220
STICKIT DISCS, 8"
DISC PER PACK PACKAGES 3 10 $22.47 $224.70 $674.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID
34. 50
P.B.E. INDASA 60-120 120 GRIT
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
40 GRIT # 80-40 27.38 273.80 821.40
36 GRIT # 80-36 30.44 304.40 913.20
PAINT/LACQUER THINNER CONTAINE
PER GALLON CONT. R 10 150 $14.56 $2,184.00 $6,552.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
35.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING NAPA MARTIN SONOUR GAL FT 220
SANDPAPER FILE, 36 GRIT
6 50 PER BOX BOXES 10 100 $12.49 $1,249.00 $3,747.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING

P.B.E. INDASA 90-36

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE: 11/10/15

2016-026 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - MASS TRANSIT
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CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES

Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015

El Paso
el
Ame City

TTT11
JIL

2010

Solicitation #: 2016-026

Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

LOREN HODGES INC. dba

GVMI INC.
EL PASO. T LONGHORN DISTRIBUTING
’ EL PASO, TX
ITEM
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER UNIT OF | ESTIMATED QUANTITY |\ \ir ppicE ATNO’\‘T‘X*LL 3-YRTOTAL | UNIT PRICE AT’\(IDNTLXOI\_L 3-YR TOTAL
NO. PART NUMBER MEASURE MIN '\?:)X (B) (AxB=C) (Cx 3YRS) (B) (AXB=C) (Cx 3YRS)
SANDPAPER FILE, 40 GRIT BOXES 25 100 $10.74 $1,074.00 | $3,222.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
50 PER BOX
37.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING P.B.E. INDASA 90-40
SANDPAPER FILE, 80 GRIT BOXES 100 900 $8.53 $7,677.00 | $23,031.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
38. 50 PER BOX
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING P.B.E. INDASA 90-80
GRINDING DISCS, 6 BOXES 10 100 $13.80 $1,380.00 | $4,140.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
50 PER BOX
39.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING P.B.E. INDASA 60-36
SINGLE EDGE RAZOR BLADES
100 PER BOX BOXES 10 72 $7.72 $555.84 $1,667.52 $3.69 $265.68 $797.04
40.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING NAPA MARTIN SENOUR 14232 US BLADE PART# 111-12
DOUBLE S'EEES gng PADS, 8 PER PAD 10 50 $27.32 $1,366.00 | $4,098.00 $10.99 $549.50 $1,648.50
42.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING NAPA 3M 05753 BUFF & SHINE PN# 803N
SCOFFING PADS BOXES 10 60 $13.35 $801.00 $2,403.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
25 PER BOX SRICE @ 26
43 20 PER BOX FOR 25

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING

P.B.E. INDASA 426739

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE: 11/10/15

2016-026 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - MASS TRANSIT
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Project Name: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

An-America City

\lll"

2010

Solicitation #: 2016-026

Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

LOREN HODGES INC. dba

GVMI INC.
EL PASO. TX LONGHORN DISTRIBUTING
! EL PASO, TX
ITEM
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER uniToF || ESTIMATED QUANTITY |\ ppice ATNO’\‘T‘X*LL 3-YRTOTAL | UNITPRICE AT’\(IDNTLXOI\_L 3-YR TOTAL
NO. PART NUMBER MEASURE MIN r\?:)x (B) (AXB=0C) (Cx 3YRS) (B) (AXB=C) (Cx 3YRS)
6065 PLISHING COMPOUND CONTAINE
PER GALLON CONT. R 5 12 $54.63 $655.56 $1,966.68 $18.54 $222.48 $667.44
44,
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING TRANSTAR 5361 AUTO MAGIC P# 110
5990 HAND or MACHINE GLAZE CONTAINE
PER QUART CONT. R 10 60 $25.67 $1,540.20 $4,620.60 $21.82 $1,309.20 $3,927.60
45,
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING NAPA 3M 05990 AUTO MAGIC P# 50
FIBERGLASS REINFORCEMENT DYNA CONTAINE
GLASS R 10 96 $53.87 $5,171.52 $15,514.56 NO BID NO BID NO BID
46. PER GALLON CONT.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING NAPA BK 765-3043
BODY FILLER, BONDO CONTAINE
PER GALLON CONT. R 10 125 $21.83 $2,728.75 $8,186.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID
47.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING NAPA 3M 05801
METAL SEEEADERS EACH 5 20 $6.22 $124.40 $373.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID
48. 2 PACK
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING PBE 1102

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE: 11/10/15

2016-026 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - MASS TRANSIT
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CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015

El Paso

Al e
\ll

City

'V

2010

Solicitation #: 2016-026
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

LOREN HODGES INC. dba

GVMI INC.
EL PASO. X LONGHORN DISTRIBUTING
’ EL PASO, TX
ITEM
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER UNIT OF | ESTIMATED QUANTITY ||\ bpice ATNO’\‘T‘X*LL 3-YRTOTAL | UNIT PRICE AT’\(IDNTLXOI\_L 3-YR TOTAL
NO. PART NUMBER MEASURE MIN '\?:)X (B) (AxB=C) (Cx 3YRS) (B) (AXB=C) (Cx 3YRS)
PLAST'CEiEiEADERS EACH 5 20 $1.82 $36.40 $109.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID
49, 3 PACK
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING NAPA 3M 357
CHEESISA%RHATERS EACH 10 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
50.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
PAINT, DURETHANE, WHITE [PPG] | cONTAINE
PER GALLONG CONT. r 10 250 $106.54 | $26,635.00 | $79,905.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
51.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING NAPA MARTIN SENOUR GAL 53A
PAINT, DURETHANE, DARK BLUE [PPG] [ conTaine
DER GALLON CONT. - 10 50 $118.59 $5,929.50 | $17,788.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
52.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING NAPA MARTIN SENOUR GAL 55A
PAINT, DURETHANE, MEDIUM BLUE |
[PPG] i 10 50 $106.54 $5,327.00 | $15,981.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
53, PER GALLON CONTAINER
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING NAPA MARTIN SENOUR GAL 53A
PAINT, DURETHANE, LIGHT BLUE [PPG} | containe
p 10 50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
54, ER-GALLON-CONT-

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE: 11/10/15

2016-026 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - MASS TRANSIT
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Project Name: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

An-America City

‘\J

'V

2010

Solicitation #: 2016-026
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

LOREN HODGES INC. dba

GVMI INC.
EL PASO. TX LONGHORN DISTRIBUTING
! EL PASO, TX
ITEM
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER UNIT OF | ESTIMATED QUANTITY |\ \ir ppicE ATNO’\‘T‘X*LL 3-YRTOTAL | UNIT PRICE AT’\(IDNTLXOI\_L 3-YR TOTAL
NO. PART NUMBER MEASURE MIN I\?:)X (B) (AXB=C) (C x 3YRS) (B) (AXB=C) (C x 3 YRS)
PAINT, DURETHANE, YELLOW.[PRG] [ conTame
PER GALLON.CONT p 10 25 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
55. '
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
HARDENER, DURETHANE, [PPG] CONTAINE
ER GALLON CONTAINER ! 100 400 $22427 | $89,708.00 | $269,124.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
56. QUART x 2 = GALLON
NAPA MARTIN SENOUR QTC # 253 & QT FH
611
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
QT CH253 IS FOR ALL QTFH611, QTFH612, QTFH613 ONE
GOES WITH QTCH253 THEY RANGE FROM SLOW TO
4901, TIPS DUROMIX
1 PER BACK AGE PACKAGES 10 60 $21.94 $1,316.40 $3,949.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID
57. 6 PER PACK PRICE = 12 FOR 12
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING NAPA 3M 08193
CLEAR COAT, DURETHANE DU-1001, [__
[PPG] K 25 150 $59.18 $8,877.00 | $26,631.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
58. PER GALLON CONT.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING NAPA MARTIN SENOUR GALFC720
-II—BA(SXROAI?ZS4- BOXES 15 75 $15.18 $1,138.50 | $3,415.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
59. BOX =12 X 2 PER BOX OF 24
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING NAPA MARTIN SENOUR GE 020001T

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE: 11/10/15
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Project Name: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

An-America City

\ l I I ' r
2010

Solicitation #: 2016-026

Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

LOREN HODGES INC. dba

GVMI INC.
EL PASO. TX LONGHORN DISTRIBUTING
! EL PASO, TX
ITEM
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER UNIT OF | ESTIMATED QUANTITY |\ \ir ppicE ATNO’\‘T‘X*LL 3-YRTOTAL | UNIT PRICE AT’\(IDNTLXOI\_L 3-YR TOTAL
NO. PART NUMBER MEASURE MIN I\?:)X (B) (AXB =) (C x 3YRS) (B) (AXB=C) (Cx 3YRS)
GRAPPER ADHESIVE
10 07 BOTTLES BOTTLES 25 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
60.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
DUST MASK, DOUBLE STRAP EACH 100 500 $0.72 $360.00 $1,080.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
XX PER BOX
63.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING NAPA 3M 07048
SPRAY PAINT, AEROSOL CAN [Krylon]
GLOSSY WHITE EACH 5 24 $28.20 $676.80 $2,030.40 $3.18 $76.32 $228.96
64. 12/ PKG 12 /PKG 12 @ 2.35
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING NAPA DUPLI-COLOR DC503 HI-TECH PN# HT 1802
SPRAY PAINT, AEROSOL CAN [Krylon]
GLOSSY BLACK PACKAGES 10 60 $28.20 $1,692.00 $5,076.00 $33.72 $2,023.20 $6,069.60
65. 12/ PKG 12 @ 2.35  12/PKG
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING NAPA DUPLI - COLOR DC501 HI-TECH PN# HT 1803
SPRAY PAINT, AEROSOL CAN [Krylon]
SEMI GLOSSY BLACK PACKAGES 10 60 $46.68 $2,800.80 $8,402.40 $32.76 $1,965.60 $5,896.80
66. 12/ PKG 12 @3.89 12/PKG
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING NAPA DUPLI - COLOR DA1603 HI-TECH PN# HT 1824
3 YEAR TOTAL $729,215.91 $19,235.94

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE: 11/10/15
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CITY OF EL PASO R
BID TABULATION FORM P

Project Name: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES Solicitation #: 2016-026
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015 Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

LOREN HODGES INC. dba
LONGHORN DISTRIBUTING
EL PASO, TX

GVMI INC.
EL PASO, TX

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO
EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED
ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL
BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE
SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE
MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),

NO OPTION OFFERED

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION |:|

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

PAYMENT TERMS: PAGES NOT SUBMITTED 1% - 10 DAYS
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
o . PAGES NOT SUBMITTED 7
Within __ consecutive calendar days
Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of PAGES NOT SUBMITTED 48

verbal order in cases of emergency.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE: 11/10/15 2016-026 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - MASS TRANSIT 24



Project Name: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
el
Ame City

TTT11
JIL

2010

Solicitation #: 2016-026
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

SOUTHWESTERN INDUSTRIAL
FASTERNERS aka SWIFCO
EL PASO, TX
ITEM
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER UNIT OF | ESTIMATED QUANTITY |\ \ir ppicE ATNO’\‘T‘X*LL 3-YRTOTAL | UNIT PRICE AT’\(IDNTLXOI\_L 3-YR TOTAL
NO. PART NUMBER MEASURE MIN '\?:)X (B) (AxB=C) (Cx 3YRS) (B) (AXB=C) (Cx 3YRS)
40/30, TPO DUROMIX FLEXIBLE BUMPER | cONTAINE
) 1207, CONT. K 10 60 NO BID NO BID NO BID
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
40/40, SIMI RIDGID DUROMIX CONTAINE
, 1207 CONT. ; 10 60 NO BID NO BID NO BID
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
SMC, FIBERGLASS 40/50, DUROMIX | “ONTANE 100 260 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 12 OZ. CONT.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
40/60, METAL DUROMIX FILLER or EQUAL| “ONTAMNE 10 40 NO BID NO BID NO BID
4. 12 OZ. CONT.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
41/88, SMC FIBERGLASS PANEL CONTANE
ADHESIVE DUROMIX r 10 60 NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 12 OZ. CONT.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
40/56 HD SMC DUROMIX GLAZING [
FILLER or EQUAL K 10 60 NO BID NO BID NO BID
6. 2 KG CONT.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: __/s/
DATE: 11/10/15 2016-026 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - MASS TRANSIT 25




Project Name: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
el
Ame City

TTT11
JIL

2010

Solicitation #: 2016-026
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

SOUTHWESTERN INDUSTRIAL
FASTERNERS aka SWIFCO
EL PASO, TX
ITEM
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER UNIT OF | ESTIMATED QUANTITY ||\ bpice ATNO’\‘T‘X*LL 3-YRTOTAL | UNIT PRICE AT’\(IDNTLXOI\_L 3-YR TOTAL
NO. PART NUMBER MEASURE MIN '\?:)X (B) (AxB=C) (Cx 3YRS) (B) (AXB=C) (Cx 3YRS)
4320, FLEXIBLE FOAM DUROMIX CONTAINE
, 19 07, CONT. r 10 60 NO BID NO BID NO BID
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
4901, TIP DUROMIX
. 12 PER PACK PACKAGES 10 60 NO BID NO BID NO BID
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
DUROMIX CLEANER OR EQUAL
. 180 OT. BOTTLE BOTTLES 25 180 NO BID NO BID NO BID
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
MASKING TAPE 2 ROLLS 10 1000 NO BID NO BID NO BID
ROLL
10.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
o/
MASKING TAPE % ROLLS 250 2000 NO BID NO BID NO BID
ROLL
11.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
MASKING TAPE, FINE LINE, 1/8 COLLS o 250 NG BID NO BID NO BID
ROLL
12.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE: 11/10/15

2016-026 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - MASS TRANSIT 26




CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES

Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015

El Paso

TTT11
JIL

City

2010

Solicitation #: 2016-026
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

SOUTHWESTERN INDUSTRIAL
FASTERNERS aka SWIFCO

EL PASO, TX
ITEM
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER UNIT OF | ESTIMATED QUANTITY ||\ bpice ATNO’\‘T‘X*LL 3-YRTOTAL | UNIT PRICE AT’\(IDNTLXOI\_L 3-YR TOTAL
NO. PART NUMBER MEASURE MIN I\?:)X (B) (AXB=C) (C x 3YRS) (B) (AXB=C) (C x 3 YRS)
1/n
MASKING TAPE, FINE LINE, Vs coLLS 50 250 NG BID NG BID NO BID
ROLL
13.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
e
MASKING TAPE, FINE LINE, % CoLLS o 250 NG BID NG BID NG BID
ROLL
14.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
PLASTIC SHEETING, 36" x 1,000 coLLS 2 20 NG BID NG BID NO BID
1,000' ROLL
15.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
MASKING PAPER, 12" x 1,000"
1.000' ROLL ROLLS 3 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID
17.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
MASKING PAPER, 18 x 1,000"
y ;000 ROLL ROLLS 3 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE: 11/10/15

2016-026 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - MASS TRANSIT
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CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015

El Paso

An-America City

‘\J

2010

'V

Solicitation #: 2016-026

Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

SOUTHWESTERN INDUSTRIAL
FASTERNERS aka SWIFCO

EL PASO, TX
ITEM
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER UNIT OF | ESTIMATED QUANTITY |\ \ir ppicE ATNO’\‘T‘X*LL 3-YRTOTAL | UNIT PRICE AT’\(IDNTLXOI\_L 3-YR TOTAL
NO. PART NUMBER MEASURE MIN I\?:)X (B) (AxB=C) (Cx 3 YRS) (B) (AxB=C) (Cx 3 YRS)
MASKING PAPER, 36" x 1,000'
1,000' ROLL ROLLS 3 25 NO BID NO BID NO BID
19.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
WET DRY SANDPAPER, 8 %" x 11"
220 GRIT "A" WEIGHT PAPER ALUMINUM ||PACKAGES 50 300 $90.00 $27,000.00 | $81,000.00
20. SHEETS PER PACK 100
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 9x11 C SART 84254
WET DRY SANDPAPER, 8 % x 11"
400 GRIT "A" WEIGHT PAPER ALUMINUMY | .\ o 25 150 $90.00 $13,500.00 | $40,500.00
21 OXlDE BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER' S PRICE
. SHEETS PER PACK 100 $27,000.00 $81,000.00
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 9x11 C SART 84257
WET DRY SANDPAPER, 8 % x 11"
600 GRIT "A" WEIGHT PAPER PACKAGES 100 500 $90.00 $45,000.00 | $135,000.00
BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER' S PRICE
22 SHEETS PER PACK 100 $27,000.00 $81,000.00
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING x11 C SART 84259
WET DRY SANDPAPER, 8 % x 11"
1000 GRIT "A" WEIGHT PAPER PACKAGES 50 300 NO BID NO BID NO BID
23. SHEETS PER PACK
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
WET DRY SANDPAPER, 8 % x 11"
1500 GRIT "A" WEIGHT PAPER
ALUMINUM OXIDE GRIT PACKAGES 50 300 NO BID NO BID NO BID
24, SHEETS PER PACK

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE: 11/10/15

2016-026 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - MASS TRANSIT
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Project Name: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM 'y

El Paso

An-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2016-026

Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015

Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

SOUTHWESTERN INDUSTRIAL
FASTERNERS aka SWIFCO
EL PASO, TX
ITEM
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER UNIT OF | ESTIMATED QUANTITY |l 1 bpice ATNO’\‘T‘X*LL 3-YRTOTAL | UNIT PRICE AT’\(IDNTLXOI\_L 3-YR TOTAL
NO. PART NUMBER MEASURE MIN I\?:)X (B) (AXB=C) (C x 3YRS) (B) (AXB=C) (C x 3 YRS)
DISPOSABLE RESPIRATOR ELEMENTS -
FOR NORTH RESPIRATOR p/n N7500-83 [PACKAGES 3 12 NO BID NO BID NO BID
25, PER PACK
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
DISCS, 3" 24 GRIT ROLOC or EQUAL
C1SC PER PACK PACKAGES 10 50 $103.50 $5,175.00 | $15,525.00
26. 50
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING SART 55277
DISCS, 2" 24 GRIT ROLOC or EQUAL
D I1SC PER PACK PACKAGES 10 50 $80.00 $4,000.00 | $12,000.00
27. 100
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING SART 55276
VIPER BLADE, CUT OFF DISC #77149
25,450 RPM PACKAGES 25 150 NO BID NO BID NO BID
30. DISC PER PACK
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
DA SANDPAPER DISC, 6: 80 GRIT 100"D"
WEIGHT PAPER, SELF ADHESIVE  |PACKAGES 25 120 $75.00 $9,000.00 | $27,000.00
31. DISC PER PACK 100
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING SART 36600

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE: 11/10/15

2016-026 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - MASS TRANSIT
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Project Name: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM 'y

El Paso

An-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2016-026
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

SOUTHWESTERN INDUSTRIAL
FASTERNERS aka SWIFCO
EL PASO, TX
ITEM
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER UNIT OF | ESTIMATED QUANTITY |l 3 bpice ATNO’\‘T‘X*LL 3-YRTOTAL | UNIT PRICE AT’\(IDNTLXOI\_L 3-YR TOTAL
NO. PART NUMBER MEASURE MIN I\?:)X (B) (AXB=C) (C x 3YRS) (B) (AXB=C) (C x 3 YRS)
DA SANDPAPER DISC, 6" 180 GRIT 100
"D" WEIGHT PAPER, SELF ADHESIVE,
OPEN COAT PACKAGES 25 120 $70.00 $8,400.00 | $25,200.00
32. DISC PER PACK 100
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING SART 36604
DA SANDPAPER DISC, 6", 220 GRIT 100
"D" WEIGHT PAPER, SELF ADHESIVE,
OPEN COAT PACKAGES 25 120 $70.00 $8,400.00 | $25,200.00
33. DISC PER PACK 100
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING SART 36605
STICKIT DISCS, 8"
IS PER PAGK PACKAGES 3 10 $57.50 $575.00 $1,725.00
34. 25
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING SART 34143
PAINT/LACQUER THINNER CONTAINE
PER GALLON CONT. - 10 150 $25.00 $3,750.00 | $11,250.00
35.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING KRYLON 1661800-16
SANDPAPER FILE, 36 GRIT BOXES 10 100 $70.00 $7,000.00 | $21,000.00
50 PER BOX
36.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING SART 84170

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE: 11/10/15 2016-026 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - MASS TRANSIT 30




Project Name: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015

BID TABULATION FORM "y

El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO Exsrad

City

2010

Solicitation #: 2016-026
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

SOUTHWESTERN INDUSTRIAL
FASTERNERS aka SWIFCO

EL PASO, TX
ITEM
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER UNIT OF | ESTIMATED QUANTITY ||\ bpice ATNO’\‘T‘X*LL 3-YRTOTAL | UNIT PRICE AT’\(IDNTLXOI\_L 3-YR TOTAL
NO. PART NUMBER MEASURE MIN '\?:)X (B) (AxB=C) (Cx 3YRS) (B) (AXB=C) (Cx 3YRS)
SANDPAPER FILE, 40 GRIT BOXES 25 100 $130.00 | $13,000.00 | $39,000.00
50 PER BOX
37.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING SART 84171
SANDPAPER FILE, 80 GRIT BOXES 100 900 $90.00 $81,000.00 | $243,000.00
38. 50 PER BOX 100
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING SART 84173
GRINDING DISCS, 6"
NoPER BOX BOXES 10 100 $83.75 $8,375.00 | $25,125.00
39. 415" 25per box
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING SART 20060
SINGLE EDGE RAZOR BLADES
100 PER BOX BOXES 10 72 $10.76 $774.72 $2,324.16
40.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING STANLEY 11-515
DOUBLE SIDES BUFF PADS, 8'
BER PAD PER PAD 10 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
42.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
SCOFFING PADS
o5 PER BOX BOXES 10 60 NO BID NO BID NO BID
43.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE: 11/10/15 2016-026 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - MASS TRANSIT 31



CITY OF EL PASO

El Paso

All-America City

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015

‘llll'

2010

Solicitation #: 2016-026
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

SOUTHWESTERN INDUSTRIAL
FASTERNERS aka SWIFCO
EL PASO, TX
ITEM
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER UNIT OF | ESTIMATED QUANTITY |\ \ir ppicE ATNO’\‘T‘X*LL 3-YRTOTAL | UNIT PRICE AT’\(IDNTLXOI\_L 3-YR TOTAL
NO. PART NUMBER MEASURE MIN '\?:)X (B) (AxB=C) (Cx 3YRS) (B) (AXB=C) (Cx 3YRS)
6065 PLISHING COMPOUND CONTAINE
DER GALLON CONT. ; 5 12 NO BID NO BID NO BID
44.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
5990 HAND or MACHINE GLAZE CONTAINE
PER QUART CONT, K 10 60 NO BID NO BID NO BID
45,
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
FIBERGLASS REINFORCEMENTDYNA [
GLASS i 10 26 NO BID NO BID NO BID
46. PER GALLON CONT.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
BODY FILLER, BONDO CONTAINE
CER GALLON CONT. K 10 125 NO BID NO BID NO BID
47.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
METAL SPREADERS EACH 5 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID
EACH
48.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE: 11/10/15

2016-026 MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES - MASS TRANSIT
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CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015

El Paso

Al e
\ll

2010

City

'V

Solicitation #: 2016-026

Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

SOUTHWESTERN INDUSTRIAL
FASTERNERS aka SWIFCO

EL PASO, TX
ITEM
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER UNIT OF | ESTIMATED QUANTITY ||\ bpice ATNO’\‘T‘X*LL 3-YRTOTAL | UNIT PRICE AT’\(IDNTLXOI\_L 3-YR TOTAL
NO. PART NUMBER MEASURE MIN '\?:)X (B) (AxB=C) (Cx 3YRS) (B) (AXB=C) (Cx 3YRS)
PLASTIC SPREADERS EACH 5 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID
EACH
49,
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
CHEESE GRATERS EACH 10 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID
EACH
50.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
PAINT, DURETHANE, WHITE [PPG] | coNTAINE
DER GALLONG CONT. - 10 250 NO BID NO BID NO BID
51.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
PAINT, DURETHANE, DARK BLUE [PPG] | conTAINE
o CALLON CONT. " 10 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
52.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
PAINT, DURETHANE, MEDIUM BLUE | __
[PPG] R 10 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
53. PER GALLON CONTAINER
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
PAINT DURETHANE, LIGHT BLUE [PPG} | conTaNg
™ 10 50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
54. ER-GALLON CONT-

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE: 11/10/15
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Project Name: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM 'y

El Paso

An-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2016-026
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

SOUTHWESTERN INDUSTRIAL
FASTERNERS aka SWIFCO
EL PASO, TX
ITEM
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER UNIT OF | ESTIMATED QUANTITY |l 3 bpice ATNO’\‘T‘X*LL 3-YRTOTAL | UNIT PRICE AT’\(IDNTLXOI\_L 3-YR TOTAL
NO. PART NUMBER MEASURE MIN I\?:)X (B) (AXB=C) (C x 3YRS) (B) (AXB=C) (C x 3 YRS)
PAINT, DURETHANE, YELLOW-[PPG] | conraiNg
PER CALLON.CONT p 10 25 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
55. '
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
HARDENER, DURETHANE, [PPG] CONITAINE
. DER GALLON CONTAINER ! 100 400 NO BID NO BID NO BID
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
4901, TIPS DUROMIX
1 BACKAGE PACKAGES 10 60 NO BID NO BID NO BID
57.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
CLEAR COAT, DURETHANE DU-1001,
CONTAINE
[PPG] - 25 150 NO BID NO BID NO BID
58. PER GALLON CONT.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
TAC RAGS -
o oE o BOXES 15 75 NO BID NO BID NO BID
59.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
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Project Name: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

st
Al-Ame City
\ l ' r
2010

Solicitation #: 2016-026
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

SOUTHWESTERN INDUSTRIAL
FASTERNERS aka SWIFCO
EL PASO, TX
ITEM
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER UNIT OF | ESTIMATED QUANTITY ||\ bpice ATNO’\‘T‘X*LL 3-YRTOTAL | UNIT PRICE AT’\(IDNTLXOI\_L 3-YR TOTAL
NO. PART NUMBER MEASURE MIN '\?:)X (B) (AxB=C) (Cx 3YRS) (B) (AXB=C) (Cx 3YRS)
GRAPPER ADHESIVE
0 On boTL o BOTTLES 25 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID
60.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
DUST MASK, DOUBLE STRAP
" PER BOX EACH 100 500 NO BID NO BID NO BID
63.
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING
SPRAY PAINT, AEROSOL CAN [Krylon]
GLOSSY WHITE EACH 5 24 $6.56 $157.44 $472.32
64. 12/ PKG
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING KRYLON TOUGH COAT 1800
SPRAY PAINT, AEROSOL CAN [Krylon]
GLOSSY BLACK PACKAGES 10 60 $78.72 $4,723.20 | $14,169.60
65. 12/ PKG
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING KRYLON TOUGH COAT 1770
SPRAY PAINT, AEROSOL CAN [Krylon]
SEMI GLOSSY BLACK PACKAGES 10 60 $78.72 $4,723.20 | $14,169.60
66. 12/ PKG
MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING KRYLON TOUGH COAT 3725
3 YEAR TOTAL $733,660.68
BIDDER'S PRICE $501,460.68

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE: 11/10/15
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM P

Project Name: MISCELLANEOUS BODY SHOP SUPPLIES Solicitation #: 2016-026
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 28, 2015 Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

SOUTHWESTERN INDUSTRIAL
FASTERNERS aka SWIFCO
EL PASO, TX

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO
EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED
ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL
BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE
SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE
MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION |:|

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

NO OPTION OFFERED I:I I:'

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
. . 7
Within __ consecutive calendar days
Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of 48

verbal order in cases of emergency.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

BIDS SOLICITED: 18 LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED: 17 BIDS RECEIVED: 5 LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED: 5 NO BID: 0

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __/s/
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