
Project Name: NEW BUS ALTERNATORS Solicitation #:  2016-411

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

ITEM

NO. MIN MAX

(A)

1. 5 20 $0.00 $1,409.00 $28,180.00 $84,540.00 $0.00 $1,120.00 $22,400.00 $67,200.00

EA EA

5 20 NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2,225.00 $44,500.00 $133,500.00

EA EA NO BID NO BID

CORE 

CHARGE
UNIT PRICE

(B)

GRAND TOTAL 
(GROUP 1 3 YEAR TOTAL + GROUP II  3 YEAR TOTAL)

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  DECEMBER 16, 2015

GROUP I

ANNUAL 

PRICE

( C )

3 YEAR TOTAL 

(D)

ALTERNATOR SERVICE INC.

DALLAS, TX

B & C TRUCK ELECTRIC INC.

IRVING, TX

ANNUAL 

PRICE

( C )

GROUP II    3 YEAR TOTAL

GROUP I     3 YEAR TOTAL

GROUP II

2.

$84,540.00

$0.00

3 YEAR TOTAL 

(D)

DESCRIPTION 

 ANNUAL QUANTITY

$133,500.00

$200,700.00

CORE 

CHARGE

UNIT PRICE

(B)

EMP 450AMP  24V 

ALTERNATORS

3590028150

50DN BELT DRIVE, DELCO 8600720

$84,540.00

$67,200.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

NO BID

APPROVED BY: ____/s/_______

DATE:  ___12/21/15_____________  2016-411 NEW BUS ALTERNATORS - MASS TRANSIT 1



Project Name: NEW BUS ALTERNATORS Solicitation #:  2016-411

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO

EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE 

CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED

ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL

BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE

SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE

MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING 

THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), 

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION 

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

Within ___ consecutive calendar days

Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of 

verbal order in cases of emergency.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.  A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

NO OPTION OFFERED

ALTERNATOR SERVICE INC.

DALLAS, TX

Bid Opening Date:  DECEMBER 16, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

PAYMENT TERMS:

B & C TRUCK ELECTRIC INC.

IRVING, TX

NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

3

24

7

48

X X 

APPROVED BY: ____/s/_______

DATE:  ___12/21/15_____________  2016-411 NEW BUS ALTERNATORS - MASS TRANSIT 2



Project Name: NEW BUS ALTERNATORS Solicitation #:  2016-411

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

ITEM

NO. MIN MAX

(A)

1. 5 20 $0.00 $2,845.74 $56,914.80 $170,744.40 $0.00 $1,451.20 $29,024.00 $87,072.00

EA EA

5 20 NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2,520.00 $50,400.00 $151,200.00

EA EA NO BID NO BID

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  DECEMBER 16, 2015

GVMI INC. DBA NAPA CENTER EL 

PASO

EL PASO, TX

MCADAMS GROUP, LLC DBA TEXAS 

ALTERNATOR STARTER SERVICE

AUSTIN, TX

GROUP I

DESCRIPTION 

 ANNUAL QUANTITY
CORE 

CHARGE
UNIT PRICE

(B)

ANNUAL 

PRICE

( C )

3 YEAR TOTAL 

(D)

CORE 

CHARGE
UNIT PRICE

(B)

ANNUAL 

PRICE

( C )

3 YEAR TOTAL 

(D)

50DN BELT DRIVE, DELCO 8600720

GROUP II

1.

EMP 450AMP  24V 

ALTERNATORS

3590028150

GROUP I     3 YEAR TOTAL $170,744.40 $87,072.00

GROUP II    3 YEAR TOTAL $0.00 $151,200.00

GRAND TOTAL 
(GROUP 1 3 YEAR TOTAL + GROUP II  3 YEAR TOTAL)

$170,744.40 $238,272.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

NO BID

APPROVED BY: ____/s/_______

DATE:  ___12/21/15_____________  2016-411 NEW BUS ALTERNATORS - MASS TRANSIT 3



Project Name: NEW BUS ALTERNATORS Solicitation #:  2016-411

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO

EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE 

CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED

ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL

BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE

SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE

MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING 

THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), 

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION 

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

Within ___ consecutive calendar days

Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of 

verbal order in cases of emergency.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.  A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  DECEMBER 16, 2015

GVMI INC. DBA NAPA CENTER EL 

PASO

EL PASO, TX

MCADAMS GROUP, LLC DBA TEXAS 

ALTERNATOR STARTER SERVICE

AUSTIN, TX

NO OPTION OFFERED

7 7

48 48

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

X 

X 

APPROVED BY: ____/s/_______

DATE:  ___12/21/15_____________  2016-411 NEW BUS ALTERNATORS - MASS TRANSIT 4



Project Name: NEW BUS ALTERNATORS Solicitation #:  2016-411

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

ITEM

NO. MIN MAX

(A)

1. 5 20 $0.00 $2,384.00 $47,680.00 $143,040.00 $0.00 $1,530.61 $30,612.20 $91,836.60

EA EA

5 20 $0.00 $2,930.00 $58,600.00 $175,800.00 $0.00 $3,079.66 $61,593.20 $184,779.60

EA EA

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  DECEMBER 16, 2015

MHC KENWORTH / FORD

EL PASO, TX

NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES

WINNIPEG, MB

GROUP I

DESCRIPTION 

 ANNUAL QUANTITY
CORE 

CHARGE
UNIT PRICE

(B)

ANNUAL 

PRICE

( C )

3 YEAR TOTAL 

(D)

CORE 

CHARGE
UNIT PRICE

(B)

ANNUAL 

PRICE

( C )

3 YEAR TOTAL 

(D)

50DN BELT DRIVE, DELCO 8600720

GROUP II

2.

EMP 450AMP  24V 

ALTERNATORS

3590028150

GROUP I     3 YEAR TOTAL $143,040.00 $91,836.60

GROUP II    3 YEAR TOTAL $175,800.00 $184,779.60

GRAND TOTAL 
(GROUP 1 3 YEAR TOTAL + GROUP II  3 YEAR TOTAL)

$318,840.00 $276,616.20

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: ____/s/_______

DATE:  ___12/21/15_____________  2016-411 NEW BUS ALTERNATORS - MASS TRANSIT 5



Project Name: NEW BUS ALTERNATORS Solicitation #:  2016-411

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO

EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE 

CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED

ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL

BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE

SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE

MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING 

THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), 

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION 

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

Within ___ consecutive calendar days

Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of 

verbal order in cases of emergency.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.  A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  DECEMBER 16, 2015

MHC KENWORTH / FORD

EL PASO, TX

NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES

WINNIPEG, MB

NO OPTION OFFERED

3 7

24 48

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

X X 

APPROVED BY: ____/s/_______

DATE:  ___12/21/15_____________  2016-411 NEW BUS ALTERNATORS - MASS TRANSIT 6



Project Name: NEW BUS ALTERNATORS Solicitation #:  2016-411

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

ITEM

NO. MIN MAX

(A)

1. 5 20 $0.00 $2,593.59 $51,871.80 $155,615.40 $0.00 $0.00

EA EA
BIDDER'S PRICE

$57,871.80

BIDDER'S PRICE

$173,615.40

5 20 $0.00 $4,125.58 $82,511.60 $247,534.80 $0.00 $0.00

EA EA

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  DECEMBER 16, 2015

RUSH TRUCK CENTERS OF TEXAS 

L.P. DBA RUSH TRUCK CENTER OF 

EL PASO

EL PASO, TX

GROUP I

DESCRIPTION 

 ANNUAL QUANTITY
CORE 

CHARGE
UNIT PRICE

(B)

ANNUAL 

PRICE

( C )

3 YEAR TOTAL 

(D)

CORE 

CHARGE
UNIT PRICE

(B)

ANNUAL 

PRICE

( C )

3 YEAR TOTAL 

(D)

50DN BELT DRIVE, DELCO 8600720

GROUP II

2.

EMP 450AMP  24V 

ALTERNATORS

3590028150

GROUP I     3 YEAR TOTAL
$155,615.40 $0.00

GROUP II    3 YEAR TOTAL $247,534.80 $0.00

GRAND TOTAL 
(GROUP 1 3 YEAR TOTAL + GROUP II  3 YEAR TOTAL)

$403,150.20 $0.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

BIDDER'S PRICE

$173,615.40

BIDDER'S PRICE

$421,150.20

APPROVED BY: ____/s/_______

DATE:  ___12/21/15_____________  2016-411 NEW BUS ALTERNATORS - MASS TRANSIT 7



Project Name: NEW BUS ALTERNATORS Solicitation #:  2016-411

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO

EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE 

CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED

ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL

BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE

SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE

MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING 

THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), 

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION 

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

Within ___ consecutive calendar days

Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of 

verbal order in cases of emergency.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.  A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  DECEMBER 16, 2015

RUSH TRUCK CENTERS OF TEXAS 

L.P. DBA RUSH TRUCK CENTER OF 

EL PASO

EL PASO, TX

NO OPTION OFFERED

100% - 30 DAYS

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
7

48

BIDS SOLICITED:  15       LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED:    7        BIDS RECEIVED:       7         LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED:      3         NO BID:    

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

PAYMENT TERMS:

X 

APPROVED BY: ____/s/_______

DATE:  ___12/21/15_____________  2016-411 NEW BUS ALTERNATORS - MASS TRANSIT 8


