
Project Name:  TRAFFIC SIGNAL CABLE Solicitation #:  2016-547
Department:  STREETS & MAINTENANCE

ITEM

NO.

4 $961.06 $3,844.24 $7,688.48 $1,250.00 $5,000.00 $10,000.00

EACH
BIDDER'S PRICE

$3,844.24

BIDDER'S PRICE

NO OPTION

4 $1,454.61 $5,818.44 $11,636.88 $1,850.00 $7,400.00 $14,800.00

EACH
BIDDER'S PRICE

$5,818.44

BIDDER'S PRICE

NO OPTION

2 $2,530.44 $5,060.88 $10,121.76 $3,000.00 $6,000.00 $12,000.00

EACH
BIDDER'S PRICE

$5,060.88

BIDDER'S PRICE

NO OPTION

2 $3,404.44 $6,808.88 $13,617.76 $4,100.00 $8,200.00 $16,400.00

EACH
BIDDER'S PRICE

$6,808.88

BIDDER'S PRICE

NO OPTION

2 $6,112.44 $12,224.88 $24,449.76 $7,350.00 $14,700.00 $29,400.00

EACH
BIDDER'S PRICE

$12,224.88

BIDDER'S PRICE

NO OPTION

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

5.

IMSA SPEC. 20-1 TWENTY-ONE (21) CONDUCTOR 

SIGNAL 

CABLE 5,000 FOOT SPOOLS

MANUFACTURER AND MODEL ADC #8221

3.

IMSA SPEC. 20-1 NINE (9) CONDUCTOR SIGNAL 

CABLE 5,000 FOOT

MANUFACTURER AND MODEL ADC #8209

4.

IMSA SPEC. 20-1 TWELVE (12) CONDUCTOR SIGNAL 

CABLE 5,000 FOOT SPOOLS

MANUFACTURER AND MODEL ADC #8212

1.

MANUFACTURER AND MODEL ADC #8780

2.

IMSA SPEC. 20-1 FIVE (5) CONDUCTOR SIGNAL 

CABLE 5,000 FOOT

MANUFACTURER AND MODEL ADC #8205

IMSA SPEC. 50-2 LEAD-IN (FEEDER) 

CABLE 5,000 FOOT SPOOLS

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date: MARCH 9, 2016

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

TIGER ELECTRIC DBA WILDCAT 

ELECTRIC SUPPLY

SAN MARCOS, TX

COMADE, INC.

SANTA ANA, CA

UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED 

ANNUAL 

PRICE
(Unit Price x Est. 

Annual Qty)

UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED 2 

YEAR TOTAL 

PRICE 
(Ext. Annual Price 

x 2)

DESCRIPTION

EXTENDED 

ANNUAL 

PRICE
(Unit Price x Est. 

Annual Qty)

EXTENDED 2 

YEAR TOTAL 

PRICE 
(Ext. Annual Price 

x 2)

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_________

DATE:  ____3/17/16________  2016-547 TRAFFIC SIGNAL CABLE - STREETS MAINTENANCE 1



Project Name:  TRAFFIC SIGNAL CABLE Solicitation #:  2016-547
Department:  STREETS & MAINTENANCE

ITEM

NO.

6 $3,161.00 $18,966.00 $37,932.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

EACH
BIDDER'S PRICE

$18,966.00

20 $817.22 $16,344.40 $32,688.80 $1,050.00 $21,000.00 $42,000.00

EACH
BIDDER'S PRICE

$16,344.40

BIDDER'S PRICE

NO OPTION

$69,067.72 $138,135.44 $62,300.00 $124,600.00

BIDDER'S PRICE

$69,067.72

BIDDER'S PRICE 

'NO BID'

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

7.

VIDEO COXIAL CABLE / POWER 

5,000 FOOT SPOOLS

MANUFACTURER AND MODEL ADC #9912CADB

TOTALS FOR ITEMS 1-7

EXTENDED 

ANNUAL 

PRICE
(Unit Price x Est. 

Annual Qty)

EXTENDED 2 

YEAR TOTAL 

PRICE 
(Ext. Annual Price 

x 2)

6.

IMSA SPEC. 60-2 COMMUNICATION

 CABLE 5,000 FOOT SPOOLS

MANUFACTURER AND MODEL STOCK ITEM, CONDUMEX

Bid Opening Date: MARCH 9, 2016

COMADE, INC.

SANTA ANA, CA

TIGER ELECTRIC DBA WILDCAT 

ELECTRIC SUPPLY

SAN MARCOS, TX

DESCRIPTION
ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED 

ANNUAL 

PRICE
(Unit Price x Est. 

Annual Qty)

EXTENDED 2 

YEAR TOTAL 

PRICE 
(Ext. Annual Price 

x 2)

UNIT PRICE

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_________

DATE:  ____3/17/16________  2016-547 TRAFFIC SIGNAL CABLE - STREETS MAINTENANCE 2



Project Name:  TRAFFIC SIGNAL CABLE Solicitation #:  2016-547
Department:  STREETS & MAINTENANCE

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY 

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY

GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE 

TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE

TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF 

THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS
AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY 
EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.

Within ___ consecutive calendar days

Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of 

verbal order in cases of emergency.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.  A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

48

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

COMADE, INC.

SANTA ANA, CA

Bid Opening Date: MARCH 9, 2016

TIGER ELECTRIC DBA WILDCAT 

ELECTRIC SUPPLY

SAN MARCOS, TX

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
30

NO OPTION OFFERED. X 

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_________

DATE:  ____3/17/16________  2016-547 TRAFFIC SIGNAL CABLE - STREETS MAINTENANCE 3



Project Name:  TRAFFIC SIGNAL CABLE Solicitation #:  2016-547
Department:  STREETS & MAINTENANCE

ITEM

NO.

4 $1,180.00 $4,720.00 $9,440.00 $885.00 $3,540.00 $7,080.00

EACH
BIDDER'S PRICE

$7,200.00

4 $1,925.00 $7,700.00 $15,400.00 $1,345.00 $5,380.00 $10,760.00

EACH
BIDDER'S PRICE

$10,976.00

2 $3,275.00 $6,550.00 $13,100.00 $2,340.00 $4,680.00 $9,360.00

EACH
BIDDER'S PRICE

$9,600.00

2 $4,410.00 $8,820.00 $17,640.00 $633.00 $1,266.00 $2,532.00

EACH
BIDDER'S PRICE

$2,580.00

2 $7,635.00 $15,270.00 $30,540.00 $2,262.00 $4,524.00 $9,048.00

EACH
BIDDER'S PRICE

$9,200.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

4.

IMSA SPEC. 20-1 TWELVE (12) CONDUCTOR SIGNAL 

CABLE 5,000 FOOT SPOOLS

MANUFACTURER AND MODEL FALCON WIRE 981214X20-1 ADVANCE DIGITAL CABLE PART #8212

5.

IMSA SPEC. 20-1 TWENTY-ONE (21) CONDUCTOR 

SIGNAL 

CABLE 5,000 FOOT SPOOLS

MANUFACTURER AND MODEL FALCON WIRE 982114X20-1
ADVANCE DIGITAL CABLE 

PART #8221

2.

IMSA SPEC. 20-1 FIVE (5) CONDUCTOR SIGNAL 

CABLE 5,000 FOOT

MANUFACTURER AND MODEL FALCON WIRE 980514X20-1 ADVANCE DIGITAL CABLE PART #8205

3.

IMSA SPEC. 20-1 NINE (9) CONDUCTOR SIGNAL 

CABLE 5,000 FOOT

MANUFACTURER AND MODEL FALCON WIRE 980914X20-1 ADVANCE DIGITAL CABLE PART #8209

UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED 

ANNUAL 

PRICE
(Unit Price x Est. 

Annual Qty)

EXTENDED 2 

YEAR TOTAL 

PRICE 
(Ext. Annual Price 

x 2)

1.

IMSA SPEC. 50-2 LEAD-IN (FEEDER) 

CABLE 5,000 FOOT SPOOLS

MANUFACTURER AND MODEL FALCON WIRE 98021450-2 ADVANCE DIGITAL CABLE PART #8780

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date: MARCH 9, 2016

TW CABLE LLC

FARMINGDALE, NY

WESCO DISTRIBUTION INC.

EL PASO, TX

DESCRIPTION
ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED 

ANNUAL 

PRICE
(Unit Price x Est. 

Annual Qty)

EXTENDED 2 

YEAR TOTAL 

PRICE 
(Ext. Annual Price 

x 2)

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_________

DATE:  ____3/17/16________  2016-547 TRAFFIC SIGNAL CABLE - STREETS MAINTENANCE 4



Project Name:  TRAFFIC SIGNAL CABLE Solicitation #:  2016-547
Department:  STREETS & MAINTENANCE

ITEM

NO.

6 $3,300.00 $19,800.00 $39,600.00 $3,220.00 $19,320.00 $38,640.00

EACH
BIDDER'S PRICE

$16,500.00

BIDDER'S PRICE

$33,000.00

BIDDER'S PRICE

$39,428.00

20 $1,400.00 $28,000.00 $56,000.00 $755.00 $15,100.00 $30,200.00

EACH
BIDDER'S PRICE

$7,000.00

BIDDER'S PRICE

$14,000.00

BIDDER'S PRICE

$30,800.00

$90,860.00 $181,720.00 $53,810.00 $107,620.00
BIDDER'S PRICE

$66,560.00

BIDDER'S PRICE

$133,120.00

BIDDER'S PRICE

$109,784.00
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

7.

VIDEO COXIAL CABLE / POWER 

5,000 FOOT SPOOLS

MANUFACTURER AND MODEL FALCON WIRE 342095182CWB
ADVANCE DIGITAL CABLE 

PART #9912CADB

TOTALS FOR ITEMS 1-7

UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED 

ANNUAL 

PRICE
(Unit Price x Est. 

Annual Qty)

EXTENDED 2 

YEAR TOTAL 

PRICE 
(Ext. Annual Price 

x 2)

6.

IMSA SPEC. 60-2 COMMUNICATION

 CABLE 5,000 FOOT SPOOLS

MANUFACTURER AND MODEL FALCON WIRE 986P1960-2 FALCON WIRE 986P1960-2

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date: MARCH 9, 2016

TW CABLE LLC

FARMINGDALE, NY

WESCO DISTRIBUTION INC.

EL PASO, TX

DESCRIPTION
ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED 

ANNUAL 

PRICE
(Unit Price x Est. 

Annual Qty)

EXTENDED 2 

YEAR TOTAL 

PRICE 
(Ext. Annual Price 

x 2)

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_________

DATE:  ____3/17/16________  2016-547 TRAFFIC SIGNAL CABLE - STREETS MAINTENANCE 5



Project Name:  TRAFFIC SIGNAL CABLE Solicitation #:  2016-547
Department:  STREETS & MAINTENANCE

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY 

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY

GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE 

TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE

TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF 

THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS
AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY 
EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.

Within ___ consecutive calendar days

Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of 

verbal order in cases of emergency.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.  A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

72 None stated

BIDS SOLICITED:  16     LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED:   9         BIDS RECEIVED:      4             LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED:        1          NO BID:  0

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
30 None stated

NO OPTION OFFERED.

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date: MARCH 9, 2016

TW CABLE LLC

FARMINGDALE, NY

WESCO DISTRIBUTION INC.

EL PASO, TX

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

X X 

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_________

DATE:  ____3/17/16________  2016-547 TRAFFIC SIGNAL CABLE - STREETS MAINTENANCE 6


