CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: MOSQUITO CONTROL CHEMICALS
Bid Opening Date: MAY 11, 2016

El Paso

Ail-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2016-741
Department: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

CLARKE MOSQUITO CONTROL

RENTOKIL NORTH AMERICA, INC.

ADAPCO, INC. dba TARGET SPECIALTY UNIVAR ES
SANFORD, FL z_lF\_’OCD:f;LSélSNﬁ_ PRODUCTS DALLAS, TX
' ' COPPELL, TX
ITEM EST TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
UNIT OF 36 MONTHS 36 MONTHS 36 MONTHS 36 MONTHS
DESCRIPTION ANNUAL UNIT PRICE| ANNUAL UNITPRICE [ ANNUAL UNITPRICE | ANNUAL UNITPRICE| ANNUAL
NO. QTY MEASURE PRICE TOTAL PRICE PRICE TOTAL PRICE PRICE TOTAL PRICE PRICE TOTAL PRICE
$9.50/g|
GLARVACIDE OIL
1. (98% mineral oil) 12 55 $522.50 $6,270.00 $18,810.00 || $1,008.94 | $12,107.28 | $36,321.84 $480.79 $5,769.48 | $17,308.44 $415.25 $4,983.00 $14,949.00
NO PETROLEUM DISTILLATES GALLON
DRUMS DRUM
BIDDER'S BRAND / NAME BVA2 COCO BEAR BVA-2 LARVICIDE OIL MOSTERLINE QP TROL LARVICIDE
EPA REGISTRATION NO. 70589-1 8329-93 70589-1 #73748-10
GRANUELS $8.45/p
2. (Larvacide Agent - Methoprene Growth 80 40 $338.00 $27,040.00 | $81,120.00 $338.00 $27,040.00 | $81,120.00 $338.00 |$27,040.00 | $81,120.00 $338.00 $27,040.00 $81,120.00
Regulator) EFFECTIVE FOR 21 DAYS BAGS Ib. BAG
BIDDER'S BRAND / NAME ALTOSID XRG ALTOSID XR-G ALTOSID XR-G ALTOSID XR-G
2724-451 *Manufacturer Discounts may . L
EPA REGISTRATION NO. apply, please see enclosed All Clear 2724-451 2r24 451 *pleas.e S?e pricing #2724-451
Rewards Brochure for details. notes in "Exceptions” page 22
GRANUELS $5.08/Ib
3. (Larvacide Agent - Bacillus Sphaericus) 80 40 $203.20 $16,256.00 | $48,768.00 $70.40 $5,632.00 | $16,896.00 $242.00 |$19,360.00 | $58,080.00 $81.20 $6,496.00 $19,488.00
EFFECTIVE FOR 1 to 4 WEEKS. BAGS Ib. BAG
Equivalent substitute for Vectolex manufactured by
Valent, please see attached for proof of equivalency.
BIDDER'S BRAND / NAME Spheratax SPH (50G) VECTOBAC G VECTOLEX FG VOLENT VECTO BAC G LARVICIDE
EPA REGISTRATION NO. 84268-2 (40 bags per pallet) 73049-10 73049-20 #73049
BRIQUETS
4, (Larvacide Agent - Methoprene growth 10 200 $710.60 $7,106.00 $21,318.00 $710.60 $7,106.00 | $21,318.00 $710.60 $7,106.00 | $21,318.00 $710.60 $7,106.00 $21,318.00
Regulator) EFFECTIVE FOR 150 DAYS CASES |lPER caSH
Fourstar BTI 150 Day Briquets packaged 200/case. Fourstar{[ 990
product contains Bacillus Thuringiensis subspecies israelensis- cases are per 220 per case
NOT Methoprene 686.04/cs| qty 220 case

BIDDER'S BRAND / NAME ALTOSID XR ALTOSID XR BRIQUETTE ALTOSID XR BRIQUETS ALTOSID XR-BEIQUETS
. . 2724-421
Altosid XR - 2724-421; Fourstar BTI < - .
EPA REGISTRATION NO. 150 Day Briquet - 83362-2-89459 2724-421 Please see prlcn;g;eotéezs in "Exceptions” #2724-421

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and d

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 6/1/16

oes not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
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el

All-America City

\

11

2010

Solicitation #: 2016-741
Department: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

CLARKE MOSQUITO CONTROL

RENTOKIL NORTH AMERICA, INC.

ADAPCO, INC. dba TARGET SPECIALTY UNIVAR ES
SANFORD, FL 21305:/5;35'3,\‘& PRODUCTS DALLAS, TX
' ' COPPELL, TX
ITEM EST TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
UNIT OF 36 MONTHS 36 MONTHS 36 MONTHS 36 MONTHS
DESCRIPTION ANNUAL UNITPRICE| ANNUAL UNIT PRICE | ANNUAL UNIT PRICE | ANNUAL UNITPRICE| ANNUAL
NO. Qry MEASURE PRICE TOTAL PRICE PRICE TOTAL PRICE PRICE TOTAL PRICE PRICE TOTAL PRICE
BRIQUETS
(Larvacide Agent - Combination of Bacillus
5. || sphaericus) (Soil Bacterium) and Bacillus 9 200 $688.66 $6,197.94 | $18,593.82 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
thuringiensis israelensis (Soil Bacterium)
EFFECTIVE FOR 180 DAYS CASES ||PER CASH
BIDDER'S BRAND / NAME FOURSTAR 180 DAY BRIQUETS
EPA REGISTRATION NO. 83362-3
ULTRA LOW VOLUME (ULV)
. $118.19/gl
FOGGER AEROSOL:
6. ADULTICIDE 4% - 10% (Resmethrin- 20 55 $6,500.45 [$130,009.00 | $390,027.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Piperonyl Butoxide) Ready to Use (Oil GALLON
based) DRUMS DRUM
BIDDER'S BRAND / NAME SCOURGE 4-12
EPA REGISTRATION NO. 432-716
ULTRA LOW VOLUME (ULV) |
FOGGER AEROSOL: $51.001g
7. ADULTICIDE 12 55 $2,805.00 | $33,660.00 |$100,980.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $2,805.00 | $33,660.00 | $100,980.00
96.5% (Melathion) Ready to Use (Oil GALLON
based) DRUMS DRUM

BIDDER'S BRAND / NAME

FYFANON ULV MOSQUITO

FMC FYFANON ULV AGENCY

EPA REGISTRATION NO.

67760-34

#67760-34

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 6/1/16

2016-741 MOSQUITO CONTROL CHEMICALS - ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: MOSQUITO CONTROL CHEMICALS
Bid Opening Date: MAY 11, 2016

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2016-741
Department: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

CLARKE MOSQUITO CONTROL

RENTOKIL NORTH AMERICA, INC.

ADAPCO, INC. dba TARGET SPECIALTY UNIVAR ES
SANFORD, FL z_lr\_’ocD:f;LsElsNﬁ_ PRODUCTS DALLAS, TX
' ' COPPELL, TX
ITEM EST TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
UNIT OF 36 MONTHS 36 MONTHS 36 MONTHS 36 MONTHS
DESCRIPTION ANNUAL UNIT PRICE| ANNUAL UNITPRICE| ANNUAL UNIT PRICE| ANNUAL UNIT PRICE| ANNUAL
NO. QTY MEASURE PRICE TOTAL PRICE PRICE TOTAL PRICE| PRICE TOTAL PRICE PRICE TOTAL PRICE
$9,650.40 | $88,462.00 | $265,386.00
ULTRA LOW VOLUME (ULV) $81.40/g! $22,115.50 | $88,462.00 | $265,386.00
8. FOGAGDEURL/?FCTSESOL: 20 55 $2,442.00 | $48,840.00 |$146,520.00 | NO BID NO BID NOBID | $2,442.00 |$48,840.00 |$146,520.00 | $2,442.00 | $48,840.00 | $146,520.00
(Etofenprox) Ready to Use (Oil based) || DRUMS GALLON *30 gallon
p y DRUM drum
. ) BIDDER'S BIDDER'S
1eogliniote - zenhex 4 g%gg gbltlfrﬁignlto(t)z; PRICE PRICE fggsgoii?e 120 gal. tote 30 gallon Drum
o $89.540.00 | $268.620.00 : :
BIDDER'S BRAND / NAME ZENIVEX E4 RTU ZENIVEX E4 RTU ZENIVEX E-4% RTU
2724-807 *Manufacturer Discounts may 2724-807
EPA REGISTRATION NO. appy, please see enclosed All Clear Please see pricing notes in "Exceptions” #2724-807
Rewards Brochure for details. page 22
ULTRA LOW VOLUME (ULV) $16.62/gl
FOGGER AEROSOL.:
9. ADULTICIDE 24 55 $914.10 | $21,938.40 | $65,815.20 $878.90 $21,093.60 | $63,280.80 $871.75 |$20,922.00 | $62,766.00 $788.15 $18,915.60 $56,746.80
4% (Permethrin-Piperonyl Butoxide) GALLON
Ready to Use (Oil based) DRUMS DRUM
275 Gallon Tote Pursuit 4-4 $14.43/gl or $3,968.25/tote
BIDDER'S BRAND / NAME PURSUIT 4-4 BIOMIST EVOLUER 4-4 ULV KONTROL 4-4 ULV OIL BASE
EPA REGISTRATION NO. 86291-3 8329-35 769-982 #73748-4
(ITEMS 1 - 9) ANNUAL GRAND TOTAL $297,317.34 $72,978.88 $129,037.48 $147,040.60
BIDDER'S PRICE
$169,737.48
(|TE|\/|S 1- 9) 36 MONTHS GRAND TOTAL $891,952.02 $218,936.64 $387,112.44 $441,121.80
BIDDER'S PRICE
$509,212.44

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE: 6/1/16

Isl
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Project Name: MOSQUITO CONTROL CHEMICALS

Bid Opening Date: MAY 11, 2016

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM
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2010

Solicitation #: 2016-741

Department: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

ADAPCO, INC.
SANFORD, FL

CLARKE MOSQUITO CONTROL
PRODUCTS, INC.
ST. CHARLES, IL

RENTOKIL NORTH AMERICA, INC.
dba TARGET SPECIALTY
PRODUCTS
COPPELL, TX

UNIVAR ES
DALLAS, TX

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE
ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE
AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR
WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE PERIOD NOTED

ON THE SELECTED OPTION. THE TERM OF THIS
CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE
SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME
TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANGER OR
DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF
EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT
PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO
THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE
CONTRACT:

[]

[ ]

NO OPTION OFFERED

L]

L]

in cases of emergency. hours or the next morning.

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET- 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIPI?ER S PROMISEP DELIVERY: 5.3 10 7-10 3

Within _ consecutive calendar days

Within ____hours or overnight after recept of verbal ord 12 24 48

IIF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

IBIDS SOLICITED: 9

LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED: 4

BIDS RECEIVED: 4

LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED: 0

NO BID: 0O

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 6/1/16

2016-741 MOSQUITO CONTROL CHEMICALS - ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES




